
Item #1, Four Wheel (Vacuum) or Regenerative Air Street Sweeper

Coop.
Vendor Make/Model Base Price White Paint Option 1 ARO Yes/No Districts

Burnup Equipment Johnston RT 655 $188,160.00 ($960.00) NA 120 days Yes All
Burnup Equipment Johnston VT 800 $224,000.00 ($960.00) NA 120 days Yes All
Crown Equipment Johnston RT 655 $188,160.00 ($960.00) NA 120 days Yes All
Crown Equipment Johnston VT 650 $197,120.00 ($960.00) NA 120 days Yes All
Crown Equipment Johnston VT 800 $224,000.00 ($960.00) NA 120 days Yes All
Tymco Tymco 600BAH $155,904.10 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes All
Tymco Tymco 600BAH $163,754.10 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes All
Tymco Tymco DST-6 $225,100.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes All
Tymco 600-HSP $169,017.10 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes All
Tymco 500x $192,265.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes All
Tymco Tymco 435 $109,241.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes All
Tymco Tymco 210 $89,054.50 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes All
Tymco Tymco 210 $75,554.50 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes All
Key Equipment Elgin Crosswind $179,450.00 ($1,500.00) NA 90 days Yes All
Key Equipment Elgin Whirlwind MV $209,525.00 ($1,500.00) NA 90 days Yes All
Allianz Madvac, Inc. Johnston RT 655 $188,160.00 ($960.00) NA 120 days Yes All
Allianz Madvac, Inc. Johnston VT 650 $197,120.00 ($960.00) NA 120 days Yes All
Allianz Madvac, Inc. Johnston VT 800 $224,000.00 ($960.00) NA 120 days Yes All

Item #2, Mechanical Broom with Vacuum-Assist Filtration Street Sweeper

Coop.
Vendor Make/Model Base Price White Paint Option 1 ARO Yes/No Districts

Burnup Equipment No Bid
Crown Equipment No Bid
Tymco No Bid
Key Equipment Elgin Waterless Eagle $265,595.00 ($1,500.00) NA 90 days Yes All

Item #3, Mechanical Street Sweeper, minimum 3.5 to 4 cubic yards

Coop.
Vendor Make/Model Base Price White Paint Option 1 Option 2 ARO Yes/No Districts

Burnup Equipment Johnston 3000 $132,160.00 ($960.00) N/A NA 120 days Yes All

Burnup Equipment Johnston MX450 $143,360.00 ($960.00) N/A NA 120 days Yes All
Crown Equipment Johnston 3000 $132,160.00 ($960.00) N/A NA 120 days Yes All
Crown Equipment Johnston MX450 $143,360.00 ($960.00) N/A NA 120 days Yes All
Tymco No Bid
Key Equipment Elgin Pelican P $160,496.00 ($1,500.00) NA NA 90 days Yes All
Allianz Madvac, Inc. Johnston 3000 $132,160.00 ($960.00) N/A NA 120 days Yes All
Allianz Madvac, Inc. Johnston MX450 $143,360.00 ($960.00) N/A NA 120 days Yes All
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Item #4, Four Wheel Mechanical Street Sweeper
Coop.

Vendor Make/Model Base Price White Paint Option 1 Option 2 ARO Yes/No Districts
Burnup Equipment Johnston 4000 $190,400.00 ($960.00) N/A NA 120 days Yes All
Burnup Equipment Johnston MT350 (twin engine) $196,000.00 ($960.00) N/A NA 120 days Yes All
Burnup Equipment Johnston MS350 (single engine) $198,240.00 ($960.00) N/A NA 120 days Yes All
Crown Equipment Johnston 4000 $190,400.00 ($960.00) N/A NA 120 days Yes All
Crown Equipment Johnston MT350 (twin engine) $196,000.00 ($960.00) N/A NA 120 days Yes All
Crown Equipment Johnston MS350 (single engine) $198,240.00 ($960.00) N/A NA 120 days Yes All
Tymco No Bid
Key Equipment Elgin Eagle $219,245.00 ($1,500.00) NA NA 90 days Yes All
Key Equipment Elgin Broom Bear $208,995.00 ($1,500.00) NA NA 90 days Yes All
Key Equipment Elgin Road Wizard $207,395.00 ($1,500.00) NA NA 90 days Yes All
Allianz Madvac, Inc. Johnston 4000 $190,400.00 ($960.00) N/A NA 120 days Yes All
Allianz Madvac, Inc. Johnston MT350 (twin engine) $196,000.00 ($960.00) N/A NA 120 days Yes All
Allianz Madvac, Inc. Johnston MS350 (single engine) $198,240.00 ($960.00) N/A NA 120 days Yes All

DISTRICTS

Name: Burnup Equipment Co. All
Contact name: Christy Burnup
Address Line: 1150 S. Sterling
Address Line: Independence, MO  64054
Telephone #: (816) 252-8700
Email: burnupequipment@sbcglobal.net
Vendor #: 440654985
Cooperative: Yes

Name: Crown Equipment Co. All
Contact name: James Wesbecher
Address Line: 12615 State Rt.A
Address Line: St. Genevieve, MO 
Telephone #: 800-316-5703
Email: stegen@crownequipment.com
Vendor # 4315819490-1
Cooperative: Yes

Name: Tymco All
Contact name: Bobby Johnson
Address Line: 225 E. Industrial Blvd.
Address Line: Waco, TX  76705
Telephone #: 800-258-9626
Email: tymcosales@tymco.com
Vendor # 741693738
Cooperative: Yes

Name: Key Equipment and Supply All
Contact name: Steve Hyink
Address Line: 13507 Northwest Industrial Dr.
Address Line: Bridgeton, MO
Telephone #: (800) 325-4323
Email: Steve@KeyEquipment.com
Vendor # 4307892280
Cooperative: Yes

Name: Allianz Madvac, Inc. All
Contact name: Christy Burnup
Address Line: 4651 Schaefer Avenue
Address Line: Chino, CA  91710
Telephone #: 800-862-3822
Email: dfederico@allianzmadvac.com
Vendor # 867976722
Cooperative: Yes

NOTE:

Please see the attachments on 
the Contracts Database for the 
option pricing.

VENDOR INFORMATION
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Option Description

1 Cab Raise Assist Jack
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