Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section
Pricing thru April 30, 2015

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-130326RW Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:  Altorfer, Inc COOP - YES
3520 Moberly Ave.
Hannibal, MO 63401
Contact: Chris Akright
Phone #: (573) 248-7942
cakright@altorfer.com
bmcgowan@altorfer.com
****% Service area includes these counties: Schuyler, Scotland, Clark, Adair, Knox, Lewis, Macon, Shelby, Marion,
Randolph, Monroe, Ralls, Pike

Standard Warranty: 12 months / Unlimited Hours
Begin Date: On Delivery

Extended Warranty: 36 months / 3000 Hours Powertrain
Begin Date: On Delivery

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 226B3
Base Price: $29,961

Option 1 Cold planer: PC205B $15,000
Option 2 Training Modules:  No Bid

32% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 247B3
Base Price: $40,130

Option 1 Cold planer: PC205B $15,000
Option 2 Training Modules:  No Bid

32% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 236B3 or 236D
Base Price: $34,585

Option 1 Cold planer: PC205B $15,000
Option 2 Training Modules:  No Bid

32% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Altorfer


mailto:cakright@altorfer.com
mailto:bmcgowan@altorfer.com

Make & Model: Cat 242B3 or 242D
Base Price: $33,375

Option 1 Cold planer: PC204 $14,138
Option 2 Training Modules:  No Bid

32% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 246C or 246D
Base Price: $37,815

Option 1 Cold planer: PC205B $15,000
Option 2 Training Modules:  No Bid

32% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 257B3 or 257D
Base Price: $47,265

Option 1 Cold planer: PC205B $15,000
Option 2 Training Modules:  No Bid

32% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 259B3 or 259D
Base Price: $47,635

Option 1 Cold planer: PC205B $15,000
Option 2 Training Modules:  No Bid

32% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Altorfer



Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 262C or 262D
Base Price: $40,650

Option 1 Cold planer: PC205B $15,000
Option 2 Training Modules:  No Bid

32% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 277C2 or 277D
Base Price: $58,015

Option 1 Cold planer: PC205B $15,000
Option 2 Training Modules:  No Bid

32% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 279C2 or 279D
Base Price: $55,103

Option 1 Cold planer: PC205B $15,000
Option 2 Training Modules:  No Bid

32% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 287C2 or 287D
Base Price: $60,645

Option 1 Cold planer: PC205B $15,000
Option 2 Training Modules:  No Bid

32% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Altorfer



Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 289C2 or 289D
Base Price: $57,657

Option 1 Cold planer: PC205B $15,000
Option 2 Training Modules:  No Bid

32% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 272D
Base Price: $44,517

Option 1 Cold planer: PC205B $15,000
Option 2 Training Modules:  No Bid

32% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 299D
Base Price: $64,245

Option 1 Cold planer: PC205B $15,000
Option 2 Training Modules:  No Bid

32% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Altorfer



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section
Pricing thru April 30, 2015

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-130326RW Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID
Vendor Name:  Bobcat Company COOP - YES

250 East Beaton Drive

West Fargo, ND 58078-6000

Contact: Mike Kotzbacher

Phone #: (701) 241-8700

josh.hegle@doosan.com
**x*% Service area includes: Statewide

Standard Warranty: 12 months
Begin Date: On Delivery

Extended Warranty: Protection Plus
Begin Date: After standard 12-month warranty expires
Item #1: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 25 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S70
Base Price: $13,541

Option 1 Cold planer: NA
Option 2 Training Modules: $200

30% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order
Item #2: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 35 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S100 Bobcat T110
Base Price: $16,349 $24,077

Option 1 Cold planer: NA
Option 2 Training Modules: $200

30% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Bobcat Company
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Item #3: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S130 Bobcat S510
Base Price: $18,841 $19,769

Option 1 Cold planer:  Contact vendor or MoDOT buyer for pricing
Option 2 Training Modules: $200

30% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S550 Bobcat S570
Base Price: $21,697 $23,181
Bobcat T550 Bobcat T590
$30,331 $32,904

Option 1 Cold planer:  Contact vendor or MoDOT buyer for pricing
Option 2 Training Modules: $200

30% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S630 Bobcat S650
Base Price: $25,982 $27,634
Bobcat T630 Bobcat T650
$34,147 $36,533

Option 1 Cold planer:  Contact vendor or MoDOT buyer for pricing
Option 2 Training Modules: $200

30% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Bobcat S530
$20,738

Bobcat S590
$23,922

Bobcat Company



Item #6: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S750 Bobcat S770
Base Price: $34,854 $37,524
Bobcat T770
$48,099

Option 1 Cold planer: Contact vendor or MoDOT buyer for pricing
Option 2 Training Modules: $200

30% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 85 net horsepower
Make & Model: Bobcat S850 Bobcat T870
Base Price: $45,512 $52,587

Option 1 Cold planer:  Contact vendor or MoDOT buyer for pricing
Option 2 Training Modules: $200

30% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order
Item #7: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat A770
Base Price: $45,828

Option 1 Cold planer:  Contact vendor or MoDOT buyer for pricing
Option 2 Training Modules: $200

24% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Bobcat T750
$45,860

Bobcat A770
$45,828

Bobcat Company



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section
Pricing thru April 30, 2015

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-130326RW Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:  Bobcat of St. Louis COOP - YES
1101 North Henway
Columbia, MO 65202
Contact: Rob Bristow
Phone #: (573) 886-9435
rbristow@bobcatofstl.com

**x*% Service area includes: NE, CD, SL

Standard Warranty: 2 years or 2000 hours
Begin Date: Date of warranty regisration

Extended Warranty: Contact vendor for a quote
Begin Date: Date of warranty regisration
Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Takeuchi TL230 Rops w/base bucket
Base Price: $38,584

Option 1 Cold planer: NA
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

20% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order
Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Takeuchi TL230 Cab w/base bucket
Base Price: $43,368

Option 1 Cold planer: NA
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

20% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Bobcat of St. Louis
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Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Takeuchi TL10 Cab w/base bucket
Base Price: $57,460

Option 1 Cold planer: NA
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

20% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order
Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Takeuchi TL10 Cab Hiflow w/base bucket
Base Price: $59,580

Option 1 Cold planer: NA
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

20% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order
Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Takeuchi TL10 Cab Hiflow w/base bucket
Base Price: $59,800

Option 1 Cold planer: NA
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

20% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order
Item #6: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Takeuchi TL10 Rops w/base bucket
Base Price: $52,416

Option 1 Cold planer: NA
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

20% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Bobcat of St. Louis



Item #6: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Takeuchi TL12 Cab w/base bucket
Base Price: $67,392

Option 1 Cold planer: NA
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

20% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order
Item #6: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Takeuchi TL12 Cab Hflow w/base bucket
Base Price: $69,784

Option 1 Cold planer: NA
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

20% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order
Item #6: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Takeuchi TL12 Rop w/base bucket
Base Price: $62,348

Option 1 Cold planer: NA
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

20% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Bobcat of St. Louis



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section
Pricing thru April 30, 2015

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-130326RW Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:  Crown Power and Equipment COOP - YES
1881 Prathersville Rd.
Columbia, MO 65202
Contact: Jon LaFoy
Phone #: (573) 443-4541
jlafoy@crown-power.com

**x%% Service area includes: NE and CD

Standard Warranty: 12 months Full - 2 year or 2000 hours Engine
Begin Date: On Delivery

Extended Warranty: Contact vendor for details and warranty brochure
Begin Date: On Delivery

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 45 net horsepower
Make & Model: Case SR130 w/heavy duty bucket
Base Price: $25,700

Option 1 Cold planer: NA
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

28% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR160
Base Price: $28,300

Option 1 Cold planer:  Contact vendor or MoDOT buyer for pricing
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

28% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Crown Power & Equip
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Item #4: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR175 w/HD bucket
Base Price: $28,200

Option 1 Cold planer:  Contact vendor or MoDOT buyer for pricing
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

30% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SV185 2/HD bucket
Base Price: $29,200

Option 1 Cold planer:  Conteq Universal Model AP 450 $10,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

28% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order
Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR210 w/HD bucket **replaced SR200
Base Price: $27,800

Option 1 Cold planer:  Conteq Universal Model AP 450 $10,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

28% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case TR270 w/HD bucket
Base Price: $37,200

Option 1 Cold planer: NA
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

28% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Crown Power & Equip



Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR220 w/HD bucket
Base Price: $37,200

Option 1 Cold planer:  Conteq Universal Model AP 600 $12,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

28% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order
Item #6: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Kubota SVS75-2 w/HD bucket
Base Price: $44,100

Option 1 Cold planer: Conteq Universal Model AP 600 $12,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

28% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR250 w/HD bucket
Base Price: $33,550

Option 1 Cold planer: Conteq Universal Model AP 600 HD $13,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

28% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SV250 w/HD bucket
Base Price: $32,950

Option 1 Cold planer: Conteq Universal Model AP 600 HD $13,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

28% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Crown Power & Equip



Item #6: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SV300 w/HD bucket
Base Price: $35,400

Option 1 Cold planer: Conteq Universal Model AP 600 HD $13,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

28% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case TR320 w/HD bucket
Base Price: $48,400

Option 1 Cold planer: Conteq Universal Model AP 600 HD $13,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

28% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case TV380 w/HD bucket
Base Price: $50,200

Option 1 Cold planer: Conteq Universal Model AP 600 HD $13,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

28% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Kubota SVL90-2 w/HD bucket
Base Price: $51,400

Option 1 Cold planer: Conteq Universal Model AP 1000 HD $17,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100

28% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Crown Power & Equip



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section
Pricing thru April 30, 2015

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-130326RW Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID
Vendor Name:  JCB of St. Louis COOP - YES

7978 Veterans Memorial Parkway

St. Peters, MO 63376

Contact: Mark Sievers

Phone #: (636) 281-4450

mark.sievers@sieversequipment.com

***purchase orders and payments to be issued to Sievers Equipment Company

**x*% Service area includes: Statewide

Standard Warranty: 2 years / 2000 hours Full Machine Coverage
Begin Date: On Delivery

Extended Warranty: Contact vendor for duration and level of coverage - various options
Begin Date: On Delivery
Item #3: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: JCB 135
Base Price: $26,038

Option 1 Cold planer: AP-450111 $12,612.00
Option 2 Training Modules: $50.00/student, 5 student minimum

13% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-150 days after receipt of order

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: JCB155  JCB175 JCB190 JCB205 JCB150T JCB190T JCB205T
Base Price: $26,955 $28,210  $30,935 $31,750  $35,257  $38,582  $41,068

Option 1 Cold planer:  AP-450111 ($12,612) OR AP-600 ($14,556)
Option 2 Training Modules: $50.00/student, 5 student minimum

13% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options JCB155
14% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options ~ JCB175, 190, 205
15% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options JCB150T, 190T
16% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options JCB205T

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-150 days after receipt of order

JCB of St. Louis
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Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: JCB225  JCB260 JCB280 JCB225T JCB260T
Base Price: $33,649 $34,647 $35,500 $43,889

Option 1 Cold planer: AP-1000 $19,055
Option 2 Training Modules: $50.00/student, 5 student minimum

14% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options JCB225
15% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options JCB260; 280
16% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options JCB225T; 260T

Delivery will be made approximately 120-150 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: JCB300 JCB330  JCB300T JCB320T
Base Price: $40,230 $43,562 $52,986 $55,561

Option 1 Cold planer: AP-1000 $19,055
Option 2 Training Modules: $50.00/student, 5 student minimum

15% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options JCB300
16% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options JCB330; 300T
17% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options JCB320T

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-150 days after receipt of order

JCB of St. Louis



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section
Pricing thru April 30, 2015

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-130326RW Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID
Vendor Name:  John Deere Company Construction Retail Sales COOP - YES
1515 5th Ave

Moline, IL 61265

Contact: Richard Murga
Phone #: (309) 765-0260
MurgaRichard@JohnDeere.com

OsborneJayne@JohnDeere.com
*xkxk Service area includes: Statewide

Standard Warranty: 12 months Full Machine
Begin Date: On Delivery

Extended Warranty: Contact vendor for quote
Begin Date: Varies

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: John Deere 315
Base Price: $22,661.03 3% increase on price and may apply to any builds.
Option 1: Cold planer: CP12C $9,068.00

Option 2:  Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
26.5% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 60 net horsepower

Make & Model: John Deere 318E
Base Price: $29,821.00
Option 1: Cold planer: CP12C $9,465.62

Option 2:  Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
26.5% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: John Deere 320E
Base Price: $31,796.00
Option 1: Cold planer: CP12C $9,465.62

Option 2:  Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
26.5% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

John Deere
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Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: John Deere 319E (Track)
Base Price: $39,667.00
Option 1: Cold planer: CP12C $9,373.80

Option 2:  Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
24% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: John Deere 328E
Base Price: $40,785.00
Option 1: Cold planer: CP12C $8,951.60

Option 2:  Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
26.5% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order
Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: John Deere 329E Compact Track Loader
Base Price: $56,506.00
Option 1: Cold planer: CP18C $15,581.66

Option 2:  Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
24% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

John Deere 323E (Track)
$44,245.00

John Deere



Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: John Deere 332E (Skid Steer)
Base Price: $46,584.00
Option 1: Cold planer: CP18C $15,581.66

Option 2:  Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
26.5% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: John Deere 333E (Track)
Base Price: $61,305.00
Option 1: Cold planer: CP18C $15,581.66

Option 2:  Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
24% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

John Deere



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section
Pricing thru April 30, 2015

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-130326RW Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:  Pat Kelly Equipment Co. COOP - YES
5920 N. Lindbergh Bivd.
Hazelwood, MO 63042-3124
Contact: Bob Harter
Phone #: (314) 895-9500
sales@patkelly.com

bob@patkelly.com

**x*% Service area includes: Statewide

Standard Warranty: 12 months, Unlimited Hours
Begin Date: Delivery Date

Extended Warranty: Please contact vendor for details

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L213; 49 net hp. w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $27,593

Option 1: Contact vendor for Paladin information
Option 2:  Additional training modules $1,000 (minimum of 10 students)

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 25%
Paladin Pages 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-180 days after receipt of order

Pat Kelly


mailto:sales@patkelly.com
mailto:bob@patkelly.com

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L216; 57 net hp. w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $30,273

Option 1: Contact vendor for Paladin information
Option 2:  Additional training modules $1,000 (minimum of 10 students)

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 25%
Paladin Pages 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 30-180 days after receipt of order
Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L218; 57 net hp. w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $31,107

Option 1: Contact vendor for Paladin information
Option 2:  Additional training modules $1,000 (minimum of 10 students)

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 26%
Paladin Pages 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 30-180 days after receipt of order
Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L220; 64 net hp. w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $32,910

Option 1: Contact vendor for Paladin information
Option 2:  Additional training modules $1,000 (minimum of 10 students)

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 26%
Paladin Pages 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 30-180 days after receipt of order
Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L223; 68 net hp. w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $33,420

Option 1: Contact vendor for Paladin information
Option 2:  Additional training modules $1,000 (minimum of 10 students)

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 30%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-180 days after receipt of order

Pat Kelly



Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland C227; 68 net hp. w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $43,084

Option 1: Contact vendor for Paladin information
Option 2:  Additional training modules $1,000 (minimum of 10 students)

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 26%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-180 days after receipt of order

Pat Kelly



Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L225; 76 net hp. w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $35,144

Option 1: Contact vendor for Paladin information
Option 2:  Additional training modules $1,000 (minimum of 10 students)

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 30%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 30-180 days after receipt of order
Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L230: 84 net hp w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $38,134

Option 1: Contact vendor for Paladin information
Option 2:  Additional training modules $1,000 (minimum of 10 students)

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 30%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-180 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland C232; 76 net hp w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $49,273

Option 1: Contact vendor for Paladin information
Option 2:  Additional training modules $1,000 (minimum of 10 students)

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 26%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 30-180 days after receipt of order
Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland C238: 84 net hp w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $53,126

Option 1: Contact vendor for Paladin information
Option 2: Additional training modules $1,000 (minimum of 10 students)

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 26%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-180 days after receipt of order

Pat Kelly



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section
Pricing thru April 30, 2015

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-130326RW Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID
Vendor Name:  Lauf Equipment Co. COOP - YES
541 W. Hwy 94

Jefferson City, MO 65101
Contact: Terrance LePage
Phone #: (573) 635-6836

laufequipment@embargmail.com
**x*% Service area includes: Statewide

Standard Warranty: 12 months Full / 2000 hours Engine
Begin Date: On Delivery

Extended Warranty:
Begin Date:
Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl R910
Base Price: $28,768.50

Option 1 Cold planer: AP-10011 $23,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100/hour

10% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 30-60 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl R220
Base Price: $31,466.50

Option 1 Cold planer:  AP-10011 $23,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100/hour

10% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-60 days after receipt of order

Lauf Equipment


mailto:laufequipment@embarqmail.com

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl R260
Base Price: $34,505

Option 1 Cold planer:  AP-10011 $23,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100/hour

10% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 30-60 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl V270
Base Price: $32,908.50

Option 1 Cold planer: AP-10011 $23,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100/hour

10% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-60 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl V330
Base Price: $35,792.50

Option 1 Cold planer:  AP-10011 $23,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100/hour

10% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 30-60 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl RT175
Base Price: $37,080

Option 1 Cold planer:  AP-10011 $23,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100/hour

10% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-60 days after receipt of order

Lauf Equipment



Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl RT210
Base Price: $43,775

Option 1 Cold planer:  AP-10011 $23,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100/hour

10% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 30-60 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl RT250
Base Price: $50,470

Option 1 Cold planer: AP-10011 $23,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100/hour

10% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-60 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl V400
Base Price: $50,470

Option 1 Cold planer:  AP-10011 $23,500
Option 2 Training Modules: $100/hour

10% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-60 days after receipt of order

Lauf Equipment



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section
Pricing thru April 30, 2015

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-130326RW Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:  Luby Equipment COOP - YES
2300 Cassens Dr.
Fenton, MO 63026
Contact: Jerry Jansen
Phone #: (636) 343-9970
llansen@lubyepuipment.com

**kk% Service area includes: Districts NE, SL, SE
Standard Warranty: Case (1 year) Takeuchi (2 year / 2000 hours)
Begin Date: Delivery Date
Extended Warranty: Please contact vendor for details

Item #2: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR130
Base Price: $26,550

Option 1: Cold planer Contact Vendor for Pricing

Option 2: Training Modules: $100 per student

Option 3 - 28: Contact Vendor for Pricing

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 30%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR160

Base Price: $29,100
Option 1: Cold planer Contact Vendor for Pricing
Option 2: Training Modules: $100 per student
Option 3 - 28: Contact Vendor for Pricing
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 30%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Luby Equip


mailto:jjansen@lubyepuipment.com

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR175 Case SV185
Base Price: $29,300 $30,250

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing
Option 2: Training Modules: $100 per student

Option 3 - 28: Contact Vendor for Pricing

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 30%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR210 Case TR270 (track loader)
Base Price: $30,250 $37,250

Takeuch TL8 Takeuchi TL8C

$42,000 $46,500

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2: Training Modules: $100 per student

Option 3 - 28: Contact Vendor for Pricing

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 30% for Case/15% for Takeuchi
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR220 Case SV250 (vertical lift)
Base Price: $32,700 $33,850
Case SR250 Case SV300 (vertical lift)
$34,500 $36,325
Case TR320 (track loader) Case TV380 (track loader/vertical lift)
$46,000 $49,400

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2: Training Modules: $100 per student

Option 3 - 28: Contact Vendor for Pricing

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 30% for Case/15% for Takeuchi
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Luby Equip



Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Takeuchi TL10 Takeuchi TL12

Base Price: $51,300 $61,150
Takeuchi TL10C, Cab Unit Takeuchi TL12C, Cab Unit
$56,200 $66,100
Takeuchi TL10C, Hi-Flow Takeuchi TL10C, Hi-Flow
$58,500 $68,300

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing
Option 2: Training Modules: $100 per student

Option 3 - 28: Contact Vendor for Pricing

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 15%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Luby Equip



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section
Pricing thru April 30, 2015

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-130326RW Skid Steers

Vendor Name:

Potter Equipment Co., Inc. COOP - YES
1155 S Kansas Expressway

Springfield, MO 65807

Contact: Roger Potter

Phone #: (417) 862-9275

roger@potterequip.com

**x*% Service area includes: Districts SW, SE

Standard Warranty: 12 months/unlimited hours - Full Machine / 24 months/2000 hours Engine

Begin Date: Delivery Date

MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Extended Warranty: Contact MoDOT buyer or vendor for Case Protection Plan Quote

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR130
Base Price: $25,969

Option 1: Cold planer Not available

Option 2:  Training Modules: $200

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 0%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR160 Case SR175 Case SV185

Base Price: $28,551 $28,460

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing
Option 2: Training Modules: $200 per student

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 0%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

$29,531

Potter Equipment


mailto:roger@potterequip.com

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR210
Base Price: $28,387

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2: Training Modules: $200 per student

Case TR270 (track loader)
$37,558

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 0%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR220
Base Price: $32,158.00
Case SR250

$34,101.00

Case TR320 (track loader)
$48,878.47

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2: Training Modules: $200 per student

Case SV250 (vertical lift)
$32,606.00

Case SV300 (vertical lift)
$36,011.00

Case TV380 (track loader)
$50,673.06

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 0%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Potter Equipment



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section
Pricing thru April 30, 2015
Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-130326RW Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID
Vendor Name:  The G.W. Van Keppel Co. COOP - YES
1801 N. 9th Street
Kansas City, MO 66101
Contact: Steve Phillips
Phone #: (913) 645-9849
sphillips@vankeppel.com

*** Service area includes Northwest, Kansas City, Central District (Camden, Cooper, Howard, Laclede, Moniteau, Morgan and Pulaski Only), Southwest, and Southeast (Douglas, Howell Ozark,
Texas, Wright Only) Districts

Standard Warranty: 12 Months Unlimited Hours
Begin Date: Upon Delivery
Extended Warranty: Contact vendor for details
Item #3: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Volvo MC60C (Tire)
Base Price: $25,545.00

Option 1: Cold planer, Coneqtec Universal Model AP 10011 or equiv: $9275
Option 2: Training Modules: $575
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 25%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.
Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order
Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Volvo MC70C (Tire) Volvo MC85C (Tire)
Base Price: $26,235.00 $27,299.00

Option 1: Cold planer, Coneqtec Universal Model AP 10011 or equiv: $16,232
Option 2:  Training Modules: $575

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 25%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

G.W. Van Keppel


mailto:sphillips@vankeppel.com

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Volvo MC95 (Tire) Volvo MCT85C (Track)
Base Price: $30,035.00 $38,483.00

Option 1: Cold planer, Coneqtec Universal Model AP 10011 or equiv: CONTACT DEALER FOR EXACT PRICING
Option 2: Training Modules: $575

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 25%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Volvo MC110C (Tire) Volvo MC115C(Tire) Volvo MC135C(Tire)
Base Price: $33,192.00 $35,084.00 $38,431.00

Volvo MCT125C (Track) Volvo MCT135C(Track)

$43,485.00 $50,923

Option 1: Cold planer, Coneqtec Universal Model AP 10011 or equiv: CONTACT DEALER FOR EXACT PRICING
Option 2: Training Modules: $575

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 25%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

G.W. Van Keppel



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section
Pricing thru April 30, 2015
Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-130326RW Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID
Vendor Name:  Victor L Phillips Co COOP - YES
4100 Gardner Avenue
Kansas City, MO 64120
Contact: Dan Rude
Phone #: (816) 241-9290
jbeckner@vlpco.com
sparman@vlpco.com
***** Service area includes: Districts NW, KC, CD and SW
Standard Warranty: Premier Warranty 1 year / Power Train Warranty 2 years or 2000 hours
Begin Date: Upon Delivery
Extended Warranty: Contact vendor for details

Item #2: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR130
Base Price: $25,867.22

Option 1: Cold planer Not available

Option 2: Training Modules: $100/student

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 0%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order
Item #3: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR130
Base Price: $25,867.22

Option 1: Cold planer Not available

Option 2: Training Modules: $100/student

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 0%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order

Victor L Phillips


mailto:jbeckner@vlpco.com
mailto:sparman@vlpco.com

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR160 Case SV185
Base Price: $28,497.47 $29,425.16

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2: Training Modules: $100/student

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 0%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order
Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR175 Case SR200
Base Price: $29,800.00 $29,600.00

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2: Training Modules: $100/student

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 0%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order
Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR220 Case SV250
Base Price: $33,500.00 $34,700.00

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing
Option 2: Training Modules: $100/student

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 0%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR250 Case SV300

Base Price: $35,400.00 $35,817.53
Case TR320 Case TV380
$49,100.00 $52,800.00

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing
Option 2: Training Modules: $100/student

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 0%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order

Case TR270
$37,582.78

Victor L Phillips



Company Contact(s) E-Mail

Altorfer Chris Akright cakright@altorfer.com

3520 Moberly Brian McGowan bmcgowan@altorfer.com
Hannibal, MO 63401

573-248-7942

314-677-3366 (fax)

*** Service area includes Northeast District ( excluding Audrain, Montgomery, Lincoln & Warren Counties)

Bobcat Company Josh Hegle josh.hegle@doosan.com
250 E. Beaton Dr.

West Fargo, ND 58070

701-241-8789

701-280-7860 (fax)

*** Service area is statewide

Bobcat of St. Louis Rob Bristow rbristow@bobcatofstl.com
1101 North Henway

Columbia, MO 65201

573-886-9435

573-886-9434 (fax)

*** Service area includes Northeast, Central and St. Louis Districts

Crown Power and Equipment Jon LaFoy jlafoy@crown-power.com
1881 Prathersville Rd.

Columbia, MO 65202

573-443-4541

573-442-9754 (fax)

*** Service area includes Northeast and Central Districts

John Deere Construction Retail Sales Jayne Osborne osbornejayne@johndeere.com Contract Administrator
1515 th Ave. MurgaRichard@JohnDeere.com Quotes to Customers
Moline, IL 61265

309-765-1996

309-765-3358 (fax)

*** Service area is statewide

JCB of St. Louis Mark Sievers mark.sievers@sieverseqguipment.com
Division of Sievers Equipment Co.

7978 Veterans Memorial Parkway

St. Peters, MO 63376

636-281-4450

636-281-4453 (fax)

*** Service area is statewide

Vendor Info
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Company Contact(s) E-Mail

Pat Kelly Equipment Co. Bob Harter bob@patkelly.com
5920 N. Lindbergy Blvd.

Hazelwood, MO 63042-3124

314-895-9500

314-895-4474 (fax)

*** Service area includes Northeast, Central, St. Louis and Southeast Districts

Lauf Equipment Terrance LePage laufequipment@embargmail.com

541 W. Hwy 94

Jefferson City, MO 65101
573-635-6836

573-635-8538

*** Service area is statewide

Luby Equipment Jerry Jansen jlansen@lubyequipment.com
2300 Cassens Dr.

Fenton, MO 63026

636-343-9970

217-222-5650 (fax)

*** Service area includes Northeast, St. Louis and Southeast Districts

Potter Equipment Co. Roger Potter roger@potterequip.com
1155 S. Kansas Expressway

Springfield, MO 65807

417-862-9275

417-862-2025 (fax)

*** Service area includes Southwest and Southeast Districts

The Victor L. Phillips Co. Jason Beckner jbeckner@vipco.com
4100 Gardner Ave. Susan Parman sparman@vlpco.com
Kansas City, MO 64120

816-241-9290

816-241-1738 (fax)

*** Service area includes Northwest, Kansas City, Central and Southwest Districts

The G.W. Van Keppel Co. Steve Phillips sphillips@vankeppel.com
1801 N. 9th Street

Kansas City, KS 66101

913-645-9849

913-281-4815 (fax)

*** Service area includes Northwest, Kansas City and Southwest Districts

Vendor Info


mailto:bob@patkelly.com
mailto:laufequipment@embarqmail.com
mailto:jjansen@lubyequipment.com
mailto:roger@potterequip.com
mailto:jbeckner@vlpco.com
mailto:sparman@vlpco.com
mailto:sphillips@vankeppel.com

	1
	2
	3
	4
	5
	6
	7
	8
	9
	10
	11
	12
	13

