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MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  

GENERAL SERVICES DIVISION 

FLEET SECTION 

 

NOTIFICATION OF STATEWIDE CONTRACT 
 

 

 

CONTRACT TITLE:  MOTORGRADERS   

 

CURRENT CONTRACT PERIOD:  August 23, 2011 through June 30, 2012 

 

BUYER INFORMATION:  Reva Jones 

    (573) 526-2744 

    reva.jones@modot.mo.gov 
 

 

 

RENEWAL INFORMATION 

Bid prices should be firm for purchase until June 30, 2012. One (1) one-year 

extension is available upon mutual consideration by Missouri Department of 

Transportation and the successful bidder.  Allowance for inflation increases will be 

considered at the time of offer of this extension. 

 

 

ALL PURCHASES MADE UNDER THIS CONTRACT MUST BE FOR PUBLIC USE ONLY. 

PURCHASES FOR PERSONAL USE BY PUBLIC EMPLOYEES OR OFFICIALS ARE PROHIBITED. 

 

 

 

 

CONTRACT 

NUMBER 

 

VENDOR 

NUMBER 

 

VENDOR INFORMATION 

 

District 

 

COOP 

PROCURE

-MENT 

 
3-080605 

 
371090568 

Tri-State Construction Equipment Co. 
6787 County Road 312 
Palmyra, MO  63461 
Contact:  Kevin Smyser 
573-769-2274 
kevinsmyer@meoi.com 

 
2,3, 5 

 
Yes 

3-080605 480942178 Murphy Tractor & Equipment Co. 
8600 NE Parvin Road 
Kansas City, MO  64161 
Contact:  Jim Levy 
816-483-5000 
jlevy@murphytractor.com 

 
1,4,7,8,9 

 
Yes 

3-080605 430263380 Fabick Cat 
One Fabick Drive 
Fenton, MO  63026 
Contact:  Chris Burns 
636-343-1309 
chris.burns@fabickcat.com 

 
5,6,7,8,9 

10 

 
Yes 

     

 

mailto:reva.jones@modot.mo.gov
mailto:kevinsmyer@meoi.com
mailto:jlevy@murphytractor.com
mailto:bwalker@fabickcat.com
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CONTRACT 

NUMBER 

 

VENDOR 

NUMBER 

 

VENDOR INFORMATION 

 

District 

 

COOP 

PROCURE

-MENT 

 
 

3-080605 

 
 

440650689 

 
Dean Machinery Co. 
1201 N. 31st Street 
Kansas City, MO  64108 
Contact:  Steven Phillips 
816-753-5300 
steve.phillips@deancat.com 

 
1,2,4 

 

 
Yes 

3-080605 420788540 Altorfer 
3520 Moberly Avenue 
Hannibal, MO  63401 
Contact:  Brian McGowan 
319-365-0551 
bmcgowan@altorfer.com  

 
2,3 

 
Yes 

3-060605 430698305 Erb Equipment Company 
200 Erb Industrial Drive 
Fenton, MO  63026 
Contact:  Tim Smith 
636-349-0200 
timsmith@erbequipment.com  

 
6,10 

 
Yes 

3-080605 431037077 Luby Equipment Services 
2625 North 24th St. 
Quincy, IL  62305 
Contact:   Jerry Jansen 
800-830-9970 
jjansen@lubyequipment.com  

 
3,6,10 

 
Yes 

mailto:steve.phillips@deancat.com
mailto:bmcgowan@altorfer.com
mailto:timsmith@erbequipment.com
mailto:jjansen@lubyequipment.com
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Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Tri-State Construction   

 

 

Item – 1   Outright purchase of one (1) new articulated 6x4 motorgrader meeting the attached MoDOT specification 

E731-D2, with dual/variable HP range, (140 – 185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.    

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  John Deere 670G – 145 HP   PRICE:      $181,000.00   

 

 

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 

Articulated 6x4 motorgrader (meeting same specification as E731-D2, (165-215 HP range).  

 

John Deere 770G – 165 HP     $184,200.00   

 

 

Options below are for the John Deere 670G; See the Purchasing Contracts Database for the John Deere 770G Options.

  

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (42”)    $19,965.00 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (60”)    $21,063.00 

 

Auto shift transmission      $940.00  

 

Full-Height (High Profile) Cab     $880.00 

 

 

 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 0% 

 

Delivery will be made 30 to 60 days after receipt of order.   
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Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Murphy Tractor & Equipment Co.   

 

 

Item – 1   Outright purchase of one (1) new articulated 6x4 motorgrader meeting the attached MoDOT specification 

E731-D2, with dual/variable HP range, (140 – 185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.    

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  John Deere 670G – 145 HP   PRICE:      $182,500.00  

 

Note:  Price is valid for IT 4 engine equipped machines only.   

 

 

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 

Articulated 6x4 motorgrader (meeting same specification as E731-D2, (165-215 HP range).  

 

John Deere 770G – 165 HP     $187,000.00 

 

 

Note:  Price is valid for IT 4 engine equipped machines only.   

  

 

Options below are for the John Deere 670G; See the Purchasing Contracts Database for the John Deere 770G Options. 

 

  

Hydraulic rear benching wing (42”)    $19,965.00 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (60”)    $21,064.00 

 

Auto shift transmission      $940.00  

 

Full-Height (High Profile) Cab     $880.00 

 

 

 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount Available upon request 

 

Delivery will be made 60 to 90 days after receipt of order.   
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Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Fabick Cat   

 

 

Item – 1   Outright purchase of one (1) new articulated 6x4 motorgrader meeting the attached MoDOT specification 

E731-D2, with dual/variable HP range, (140 – 185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.    

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  Cat 120M –183 HP   PRICE:      $171,913.00   

 

 

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 

Articulated 6x4 motorgrader (meeting same specification as E731-D2, (165-215 HP range).  

 

Cat 140M2 – 183 HP      $207,743.00  

 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (42”)    $24,000.00 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (60”)    $25,000.00 

 

Auto shift transmission      $1,631.00  

 

Full-Height (High Profile) Cab     Not Available 

 

Outside Mirrors       $251.00 

 

 

 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 39% 

 

Delivery will be made 150 to 180 days after receipt of order.   
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Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Dean Machinery Co.   

 

 

Item – 1   Outright purchase of one (1) new articulated 6x4 motorgrader meeting the attached MoDOT specification 

E731-D2, with dual/variable HP range, (140 – 185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.    

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  Cat 120M VHP  –183 HP   PRICE:      $171,913.00   

 

 

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 

Articulated 6x4 motorgrader (meeting same specification as E731-D2, (165-215 HP range).  

 

Cat 140M2 VHP – 183 HP     $207,743.00  

 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (42”)    $24,000.00 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (60”)    $25,000.00 

 

Auto shift transmission      $1,631.00  

 

Full-Height (High Profile) Cab     Not Available 

 

Outside Mirrors       $251.00 

 

 

 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 39% 

 

Delivery will be made 150 to 180 days after receipt of order.   
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Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Altorfer 

 

 

Item – 1   Outright purchase of one (1) new articulated 6x4 motorgrader meeting the attached MoDOT specification 

E731-D2, with dual/variable HP range, (140 – 185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.    

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  Cat 120M –183 HP   PRICE:      $171,913.00   

 

 

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 

Articulated 6x4 motorgrader (meeting same specification as E731-D2, (165-215 HP range).  

 

Cat 140M2 – 183 HP      $207,743.00  

 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (42”)    $24,000.00 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (60”)    $25,000.00 

 

Auto shift transmission      $1,631.00  

 

Full-Height (High Profile) Cab     Not Available 

 

Outside Mirrors       $251.00 

 

 

 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 39% 

 

Delivery will be made 120 to 180 days after receipt of order.   
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Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Erb Equipment Company   

 

 

Item – 1   Outright purchase of one (1) new articulated 6x4 motorgrader meeting the attached MoDOT specification 

E731-D2, with dual/variable HP range, (140 – 185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.    

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  John Deere 670G – 145 - 185 HP   PRICE:      $180,200.00   

 

 

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 

Articulated 6x4 motorgrader (meeting same specification as E731-D2, (165-215 HP range).  

 

John Deere 770G – 165 HP     $184,500.00  

 

Options below are for the John Deere 670G; See the Purchasing Contracts Database for the John Deere 770G Options. 

    

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (42”)    $19,980.00 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (60”)    $21,000.00 

 

Auto shift transmission      $950.00  

 

Full-Height (High Profile) Cab     $880.00 

 

 

 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 0% 

 

Delivery will be made 60 days after receipt of order.   
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Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Luby Equipment Services 

 

 

Item – 1   Outright purchase of one (1) new articulated 6x4 motorgrader meeting the attached MoDOT specification 

E731-D2, with dual/variable HP range, (140 – 185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.    

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  Case 845 DHP – 140 HP   PRICE:      $188,500.00   

 

 

 

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 

Articulated 6x4 motorgrader (meeting same specification as E731-D2, (165-215 HP range).  

 

Case 865 – 180 HP      $190,500.00 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (42”)    $20,000.00 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (60”)    $20,750.00 

 

Auto shift transmission      STD 

 

Full-Height (High Profile) Cab     $1,000.00 

 

Reversing fan       $1,700.00 

 

Temp controlled fan      STD 

 

 

 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 0% 

 

Delivery will be made 90 to 180 days after receipt of order.   
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        Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Tri-State Construction   

 

 

Item – 2   Straight Lease of one (1) new articulated 6x4 motorgrader meeting the attached MoDOT specification E731-

D2, with dual/variable HP range, (140 – 185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.    

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  John Deere 670G – 145 HP    

 
Note: MoDOT will return the unit at the end of lease period. 

 

 

Note: Assume 300 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $3,246.07  $2,405.45                    $2,112.64        

               
             Overage/Hr    $30.80 

    
             

Note: Assume 500 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $3,795.31  $2,765.13                     $2,289.27 

 

Overage/Hr    $30.80                  

 

           

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 12 month   End of lease 24 month End of lease 36 month End of lease 

                                               Purchase Price                                     Purchase Price                                  Purchase Price 

 

Base Unit  $3,795.31 $141,102 $2,765.13 $125,424 $2,289.27      $114,225.00 

Overage/Hr $30.80          $30.80       $30.80       

Option 2 $662.74 $12,577.95 $411.57 $11,180.40 $316.06          $10,182.15 

Option 3 $699.18 $13,269.69 $434.21 $11,795.28 $333.44          $10,742.13 

Option 4 $31.20 $592.20 $19.38 $526.40 $14.88            $479.40 

Option 5 $29.21 $554.40 $18.14 $492.80 $13.93            $448.80 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 0% 

 

Delivery will be made 30 to 60 days after receipt of order.   
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        Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Murphy Tractor & Equipment Co.   

 

 

Item – 2   Straight Lease of one (1) new articulated 6x4 motorgrader meeting the attached MoDOT specification E731-

D2, with dual/variable HP range, (140 – 185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.    

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  John Deere 670G – 145 HP    

 
Note: MoDOT will return the unit at the end of lease period. 

 

Note: Price is valid for IT 4 engine equipped machines only. 

 

 

Note: Assume 300 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $4,088.08  $2,630.21                    $2,245.58        

               
             Overage/Hr    $30.80 

    
             

Note: Assume 500 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $4,431.07  $2,882.48                    $2,355.64 

 

Overage/Hr    $30.80                  

 

           

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 12 month   End of lease 24 month End of lease 36 month End of lease 

                                               Purchase Price                                     Purchase Price                                  Purchase Price 

 

Base Unit  $4,431.07 126,165.00 $2,882.48 $115,650.00 $2,355.64      $105,130.00 

Overage/Hr $30.80          $30.80       $30.80       

Option 2 $686.95 $11,478.00 $406.95 $10,522.00 $312.66         $9,565.00 

Option 3 $705.05 $11,781.00 $417.67 $10,799.00 $320.89         $9,817.00 

Option 4 $34.87 $582.00 $20.65 $534.00 $15.87           $485.50 

Option 5 $11.31 $189.00 $6.70 $173.25 $5.15             $157.50 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount Available upon request 

 

Delivery will be made 60 to 90 days after receipt of order.   
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        Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Fabick Cat   

 

 

Item – 2    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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        Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Dean Machinery Co.   

 

 

Item – 2    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID
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Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Altorfer   

 

 

Item – 2 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Erb Equipment Company   

 

 

Item – 2    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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        Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Luby Equipment Services   

 

 

Item – 2    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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                                                                                Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Tri-State Construction   

 

 

Item – 2A   Straight Lease of one (1) new articulated 6x4 motorgrader meeting the attached MoDOT specification 

E731-D2, with dual/variable HP range, (165 – 215), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.    

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  John Deere 770G – 165 HP    

 
Note: MoDOT will return the unit at the end of lease period. 

 

 

Note: Assume 300 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $2,614.93  $2,140.57                    $1,968.81        

               
             Overage/Hr    $37.00 

    
             

Note: Assume 500 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $3,205.19  $2,527.10                     $2,158.63 

 

Overage/Hr    $37.00                  

 

           

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 12 month   End of lease 24 month End of lease 36 month End of lease 

                                               Purchase Price                                     Purchase Price                                  Purchase Price 

 

Base Unit  $3,205.19 $151,636.59 $2,527.10 $134,788.08 $2,158.63      $122,753.43 

Overage/Hr $37.00          $37.00       $37.00       

Option 2 $656.59 $12,461.40 $407.75 $11,076.80 $313.13      $10,087.80 

Option 3 $693.11 $13,154.40 $430.43 $11,692.80 $330.55      $10,648.80 

Option 4 $29.54 $560.70 $18.35 $498.40 $14.09        $453.90 

Option 5 $28.22 $535.50 $17.52 $476.00 $13.46        $433.50 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 0% 

 

Delivery will be made 30 to 60 days after receipt of order.   
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                                                                                Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Murphy Tractor & Equipment Co.   

 

 

Item – 2A   Straight Lease of one (1) new articulated 6x4 motorgrader meeting the attached MoDOT specification 

E731-D2, with dual/variable HP range, (165 – 215), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.    

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  John Deere 770G – 165 HP    

 
Note: MoDOT will return the unit at the end of lease period. 

 

Note: Price is valid for IT 4 engine equipped machines only. 

 

 

Note: Assume 300 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $3,718.55  $2,486.23                    $2,184.85        

               
             Overage/Hr    $36.30 

    
             

Note: Assume 500 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $4,089.68  $2,758.89                    $2,303.71 

 

Overage/Hr    $36.30                  

 

           

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 12 month   End of lease 24 month End of lease 36 month End of lease 

                                               Purchase Price                                     Purchase Price                                  Purchase Price 

 

Base Unit  $4,089.68 $136,415.00 $2,758.89 $131,870.00 $2,303.71      $113,680.00 

Overage/Hr $36.30          $36.30       $36.30       

Option 2 $682.24 $11,400.00 $404.16 $10,450.00 $310.52      $9,500.00 

Option 3 $700.20 $11,700.00 $414.80 $10,725.00 $318.69      $9,750.00 

Option 4 $33.54 $560.40 $19.87 $513.70 $15.26        $467.00 

Option 5 $11.85 $198.00 $7.02 $181.50 $5.40          $165.00 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount Available upon request 

 

Delivery will be made 60 to 90 days after receipt of order.   



 

Page 19 of 49 

       Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Fabick Cat   

 

 

Item – 2A    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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       Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Dean Machinery Co.   

 

 

Item – 2A    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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       Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Altorfer   

 

 

Item – 2A    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Erb Equipment Company 

 

 

Item – 2A    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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                                                                                Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Luby Equipment Services 

 

 

Item – 2A    
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Tri-State Construction   

 

 

Item – 3   Outright purchase of one (1) new 6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader meeting the attached 

 MoDOT specification E731-D2.   Front wheel with dual/variable HP range (165–185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.   

Unit shall have creeper gear function capability for running a blade mount milling attachment. 

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  John Deere 672G – 170 HP   PRICE:      $200,400.00   

 

 

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 

6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader (meeting the same specification as E731-D2, 185-230 HP range).  

 

John Deere 772G – 194 HP     $210,500.00 

 

 

 Options below are for the John Deere 672G; See the Purchasing Contracts Database for the John Deere 772G Options. 

    

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (42”)    $19,965.00 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (60”)    $21,063.00 

 

Auto shift transmission      $940.00  

 

Full-Height (High Profile) Cab     $880.00 

 

 

 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 0% 

 

Delivery will be made 30 to 60 days after receipt of order.   
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Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Murphy Tractor & Equipment Co.   

 

 

Item – 3   Outright purchase of one (1) new 6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader meeting the attached 

 MoDOT specification E731-D2.   Front wheel with dual/variable HP range (165–185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.   

Unit shall have creeper gear function capability for running a blade mount milling attachment. 

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  John Deere 672G – 170 HP   PRICE:      $202,250.00   

 

Note:  Price is valid for IT 4 engine equipped machines only. 

 

 

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 

6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader (meeting the same specification as E731-D2, 185-230 HP range).  

 

John Deere 772G – 194 HP     $213,250.00  

 

Note:  Price is valid for IT 4 engine equipped machines only. 

  

 

 Options below are for the John Deere 672G; See the Purchasing Contracts Database for the John Deere 772G Options. 

 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (42”)    $19,965.00 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (60”)    $21,063.00 

 

Auto shift transmission      $940.00  

 

Full-Height (High Profile) Cab     $880.00 

 

 

 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount Available upon request 

 

Delivery will be made 60 to 90 days after receipt of order.   
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Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Fabick Cat   

 

 

Item – 3   Outright purchase of one (1) new 6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader meeting the attached 

MoDOT specification E731-D2.   Front wheel with dual/variable HP range (165–185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.   

Unit shall have creeper gear function capability for running a blade mount milling attachment. 

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  Cat 120M AWD – 173 HP   PRICE:      $197,226.00   

 

 

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 

6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader (meeting the same specification as E731-D2, 185-230 HP range).  

 

Cat 140M2 AWD – 183 HP     $233,605.00  

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (42”)    $24,000.00 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (60”)    $25,000.00 

 

Auto shift transmission      $1,631.00  

 

Full-Height (High Profile) Cab     NA 

 

Outside Mirrors       $251.00 

 

 

 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 39% 

 

Delivery will be made 150 to 180 days after receipt of order.   
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Motorgraders (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Dean Machinery Co.   

 

 

Item – 3   Outright purchase of one (1) new 6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader meeting the attached 

 MoDOT specification E731-D2.   Front wheel with dual/variable HP range (165–185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.   

Unit shall have creeper gear function capability for running a blade mount milling attachment. 

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  Cat 120M AWD VHP – 173 HP   PRICE:      $197,226.00   

 

 

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 

6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader (meeting the same specification as E731-D2, 185-230 HP range).  

 

Cat 140M2 AWD VHP – 183 HP     $233,605.00  

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (42”)    $24,000.00 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (60”)    $25,000.00 

 

Auto shift transmission      $1,631.00  

 

Full-Height (High Profile) Cab     N/A 

 

Outside Mirrors       $251.00 

 

 

 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 39% 

 

Delivery will be made 150 to 180 days after receipt of order.   
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Altorfer   

 

 

Item – 3   Outright purchase of one (1) new 6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader meeting the attached 

 MoDOT specification E731-D2.   Front wheel with dual/variable HP range (165–185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.   

Unit shall have creeper gear function capability for running a blade mount milling attachment. 

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  Cat 120M AWD – 173 HP   PRICE:      $197,226.00   

 

 

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 

6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader (meeting the same specification as E731-D2, 185-230 HP range).  

 

Cat 140M2 AWD – 183 HP     $233,572.00  

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (42”)    $24,000.00 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (60”)    $25,000.00 

 

Auto shift transmission      $1,631.00  

 

Full-Height (High Profile) Cab     N/A 

 

Outside Mirrors       $251.00 

 

 

 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 39% 

 

Delivery will be made 120 to 180 days after receipt of order.   
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Erb Equipment Company   

 

 

Item – 3   Outright purchase of one (1) new 6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader meeting the attached 

 MoDOT specification E731-D2.   Front wheel with dual/variable HP range (165–185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.   

Unit shall have creeper gear function capability for running a blade mount milling attachment. 

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  John Deere 672G – 170 - 195 HP   PRICE:      $194,650.00   

 

 

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 

6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader (meeting the same specification as E731-D2, 185-230 HP range).  

 

John Deere 772G – 194 - 245 HP     $209,600.00 

 

Options below are for the John Deere 672D; See the Purchasing Contracts Database for the John Deere 772D Options. 

 

  

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (42”)    $19,980.00 

 

Hydraulic rear benching wing (60”)    $21,000.00 

 

Auto shift transmission      $1,005.00  

 

Full-Height (High Profile) Cab     $960.00 

 

 

 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 0% 

 

Delivery will be made 60 days after receipt of order.   
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Luby Equipment Services   

 

 

Item  -3, 4, & 4A 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

NO BID
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Tri-State Construction   

 

 

Item – 4   Straight lease of one (1) new 6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader meeting the attached MoDOT specification 

E731-D2.  Front wheel with dual/variable HP Range (165–185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.   Unit shall have creeper 

gear function capability for running a blade mount milling attachment. 

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  John Deere 672G – 170 HP    

 
Note: MoDOT will return the unit at the end of lease period. 

 

 

Note: Assume 300 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $3,928.18  $2,803.80                    $2,415.61        

               
             Overage/Hr    $40.74 

    
             

Note: Assume 500 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $4,122.88  $2,899.42                    $2,478.22 

 

Overage/Hr    $40.74                  

 

           

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 12 month   End of lease 24 month End of lease 36 month End of lease 

                                               Purchase Price                                     Purchase Price                                  Purchase Price 

 

Base Unit  $4,122.88 $157,194.84 $2,899.42 $142,904.40 $2,478.22      $128,613.96 

Overage/Hr $40.74          $40.74       $40.74       

Option 2 $662.74 $12,577.95 $411.57 $11,180.40 $316.06 $10,182.15 

Option 3 $699.18 $13,269.69 $434.21 $11,795.28 $333.44 $10,742.13 

Option 4 $31.20 $592.20 $19.38 $526.40 $14.88 $479.40 

Option 5 $29.21 $554.40 $18.14 $492.80 $13.93 $448.80 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 0% 

 

Delivery will be made 30 to 60 days after receipt of order.   
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Murphy Tractor & Equipment Co.   

 

 

Item – 4   Straight lease of one (1) new 6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader meeting the attached MoDOT specification 

E731-D2.  Front wheel with dual/variable HP Range (165–185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.   Unit shall have creeper 

gear function capability for running a blade mount milling attachment. 

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  John Deere 672G – 170 HP    

 
Note: MoDOT will return the unit at the end of lease period. 

 

 

Note: Assume 300 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $4,465.18  $3,044.70                    $2,499.40        

               
             Overage/Hr    $34.74 

    
             

Note: Assume 500 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $4,646.67  $3,133.40                    $2,557.66 

 

Overage/Hr    $34.74                  

 

           

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 12 month   End of lease 24 month End of lease 36 month End of lease 

                                               Purchase Price                                     Purchase Price                                  Purchase Price 

 

Base Unit  $4,646.67 $142,775.00 $3,133.86 $129,390.00 $2,557.66      $118,239.00 

Overage/Hr $34.74          $34.74       $34.74       

Option 2 $686.95 $11,478.00 $406.95 $10,522.00 $312.66      $9,565.00 

Option 3 $705.05 $11,781.00 $417.67 $10,799.00 $320.89      $9,817.00 

Option 4 $34.87 $582.00 $20.65 $534.00 $15.87        $485.50 

Option 5 $11.31 $189.00 $6.70 $173.25 $5.15          $157.50 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount Available upon request 

 

Delivery will be made 60 to 90 days after receipt of order.   
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Fabick Cat   

 

 

Item – 4    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Dean Machinery Co.   

 

 

Item – 4    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Altorfer   

 

 

Item – 4    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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Multiple Award 
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Erb Equipment Company   

 

 

Item – 4    
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Tri-State Construction   

 

 

Item – 4A   Straight lease of one (1) new 6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader meeting the attached MoDOT 

specification E731-D2.  Front wheel with dual/variable HP Range (165–185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.   Unit shall 

have creeper gear function capability for running a blade mount milling attachment. 

 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  John Deere 772G – 194 HP    

 
Note: MoDOT will return the unit at the end of lease period. 

 

 

Note: Assume 300 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $2,586.93  $2,256.83 $2,131.01        

               
             Overage/Hr    $37.00 

    
             

Note: Assume 500 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $2,814.41  $2,368.56 $2,204.17        

               
             Overage/Hr    $37.00 

 

           

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 12 month   End of lease 24 month End of lease 36 month End of lease 

                                               Purchase Price                                     Purchase Price                                  Purchase Price 

 

Base Unit  $2,814.41 $183,666.12 $2,368.56 $166969.20 $2,204.17 $150272.28 

Overage/Hr $37.00          $37.00       $37.00       

Option 2 $656.59 $12,461.40 $407.75 $11,076.80 $313.13 $10,087.80 

Option 3 $693.11 $13,154.40 $430.43 $11,692.80 $330.55 $10,648.80 

Option 4 $29.54 $560.70 $18.35 $498.40 $14.09 $453.90 

Option 5 $28.22 $535.50 $17.52 $476.00 $13.46 $433.50 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 0% 

 

Delivery will be made 30 to 60 days after receipt of order.   
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Murphy Tractor & Equipment Co.   

 

 

Item – 4A   Straight lease of one (1) new 6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader meeting the attached MoDOT 

specification E731-D2.  Front wheel with dual/variable HP Range (165–185), 6-cylinder inline diesel engine.   Unit shall 

have creeper gear function capability for running a blade mount milling attachment. 

 
MAKE/MODEL:  John Deere 772G – 194 HP    

 
Note: MoDOT will return the unit at the end of lease period. 

 

Note: Price is valid for IT 4 engine equipped machines only. 

 

 

Note: Assume 300 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $3,478.62 $2,671.34  $2,317.76        

               
             Overage/Hr    $37.00 

    
             

Note: Assume 500 hours usage per year per unit.   

 
             12 month       24 month                      36 month        

              

             $3,691.10 $2,775.48 $2,385.95        

               
             Overage/Hr    $37.00 

 

           

AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   

 

 12 month   End of lease 24 month End of lease 36 month End of lease 

                                               Purchase Price                                     Purchase Price                                  Purchase Price 

 

Base Unit  $3,691.10 $166,825.00 $2,775.48 $151,185.00 $2,385.95      $138,150.00 

Overage/Hr $37.00          $37.00       $37.00       

Option 2 $682.24 $11,400.00 $404.16 $10,450.00 $310.52      $9,500.00 

Option 3 $700.20 $11,700.00 $414.80 $10,725.00 $318.69      $9,750.00 

Option 4 $33.54 $560.40 $19.87 $513.70 $15.26        $467.00 

Option 5 $11.85 $198.00 $7.02 $181.50 $5.40          $165.00 

 

Notes: 

 

Additional options are available.  Contact fleet buyer for complete list. 

 

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount Available upon request 

 

Delivery will be made 60 to 90 days after receipt of order.   
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Fabick Cat   

 

 

Item – 4A    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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Multiple Award 
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Dean Machinery Co.   

 

 

Item – 4A    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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Multiple Award 
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Altorfer   

 

 

Item – 4A    
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Erb Equipment Company   

 

 

Item – 4A    
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BID 
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Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 
Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Tri-State Construction   

 

 

Item – 5   Training 
 

 
Optional training  
 

a.)  12 hour Basic Operation and Diagnostics  Price per student:   $250.00 

 

NOTE: $250.00 per person, per machine group.  MoDOT to provide machines and facility for training.  Minimum of 

13 technicians per class. 

 

Optional software 
 

a.)  Diagnostic software, cables, and interface:   Price per set:   

 

Software - $1,800.00 per year/per location 

Cables & Interface - $1,975.00 per set/per location 

 

 

Optional Maintenance 
 

a.)  Price for vendor to perform the first scheduled on-site maintenance: Price per unit:   STD 

 

Tri-State has always performed the first maintenance free of charge. 
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Murphy Tractor & Equipment Co.   

 

 

Item – 5   Training 
 

 
Optional training  
 

b.)  12 hour Basic Operation and Diagnostics  Price per student:   $250.00 

 

NOTE: $250.00 per person, per machine group.  MoDOT to provide machines and facility for training.  Minimum of 

13 technicians per class. 

 

Optional software 
 

a.)  Diagnostic software, cables, and interface:   Price per set:   

 

Software - $1,800.00 per year/per location 

Cables & Interface - $1,975.00 per set/per location 

 

 

Optional Maintenance 
 

a.)  Price for vendor to perform the first scheduled on-site maintenance: Price per unit:   STD 

 

 

 

MURPHY TRACTOR WILL PERFORM THE FIRST MAINTENANCE FREE OF CHARGE.
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Fabick Cat   

 

 

Item – 5   Training 
 

 
Optional training  
 

a.)  12 hour Basic Operation and Diagnostics  Price per student:   $250.00 

 

NOTE: Minimum of 4 technicians per class. 

 

Optional software 
 

a.)  Diagnostic software, cables, and interface:   Price per set:   

 

Software - $550.00 per year/per location 

Cables & Interface - $1,826.00 per set/per location 

 

 

Optional Maintenance 
 

a.)  Price for vendor to perform the first scheduled on-site maintenance: Price per unit:   $632.00 
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Dean Machinery Co.   

 

 

Item – 5   Training 
 

 
Optional training  
 

b.)  12 hour Basic Operation and Diagnostics  Price per student:   $250.00 

 

 

Optional software 
 

a.)  Diagnostic software, cables, and interface:   Price per set:   

 

Software - $550.00 year 

Cables & Interface - $1,826.00 

 

 

Optional Maintenance 
 

a.)  Price for vendor to perform the first scheduled on-site maintenance: Price per unit:   $632.00 
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Altorfer   

 

 

Item – 5   Training 
 

 
Optional training  
 

c.)  12 hour Basic Operation and Diagnostics  Price per student:   $250.00 

 

 

Optional software 
 

a.)  Diagnostic software, cables, and interface:   Price per set:  $1,826.00 

 

Software - $550.00 year 

 

 

 

Optional Maintenance 
 

a.)  Price for vendor to perform the first scheduled on-site maintenance: Price per unit:   $632.00 
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Erb Equipment Company 

 

 

Item – 5   Training 
 

 
Optional training  
 

d.)  12 hour Basic Operation and Diagnostics  Price per student:   $250.00 

 

NOTE: $250.00 per person, per machine group.  MoDOT to provide machines and facility for training.  Minimum of 

13 technicians per class. 

 

Optional software 
 

a.)  Diagnostic software, cables, and interface:   Price per set:   

 

Software - $1,800.00 per year/per location 

Cables & Interface - $1,975.00 per set/per location 

 

 

Optional Maintenance 
 

a.)  Price for vendor to perform the first scheduled on-site maintenance: Price per unit:   N/A 
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Contract Number:  3-080605       Vendor: Luby Equipment Services 

 

 

Item – 5   Training 
 

 
Optional training  
 

e.)  12 hour Basic Operation and Diagnostics  Price per student:   $250.00 

 

 

Optional software 
 

a.)  Diagnostic software, cables, and interface:   Price per set:   N/A 

 

 

 

Optional Maintenance 
 

a.)  Price for vendor to perform the first scheduled on-site maintenance: Price per unit:   $350.00 

 


