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8-1-13 
MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

GENERAL SERVICES DIVISION 
 

NOTIFICATION OF STATEWIDE CONTRACT 
 
CONTRACT TITLE:   Snowplows  
 
CURRENT CONTRACT PERIOD:   August 1, 2013 - July 31, 2014 
 
BUYER INFORMATION:  Beth Rodeman 
    573-526-2744 
    elizabeth.rodeman@modot.mo.gov 
 

RENEWAL INFORMATION 

Bid prices should be firm for purchase until July 31, 2014. This is the second of  
three (3) one-year  renewals available, upon mutual consideration by Missouri 
Department of Transportation and the successful bidders. Contract states that it is at 
the sole discretion of MoDOT Allowance for inflation increases will be considered at 
the time of offer of these extensions.  This makes sense when/if we should need to 
extend…

 

ALL PURCHASES MADE UNDER THIS CONTRACT MUST BE FOR PUBLIC USE ONLY. 
PURCHASES FOR PERSONAL USE BY PUBLIC EMPLOYEES OR OFFICIALS ARE PROHIBITED. 

 

 
CONTRACT 

NUMBER 

 
VENDOR 
NUMBER 

 
VENDOR INFORMATION 

COOP 
PROCU
RE-
MENT 

3-110721RJ 
 Henderson Products, Inc. Yes or 

No 
  1085 South 3rd St., P.O. Box 40  
  Manchester, IA  52057  
  800-359-4970  
  Janet Tobin  
  jtobin@hendersonproducts.com  
    

3-110721RJ 
 Viking-Cives Midwest, Inc. Yes or 

No 
  22956 Hwy. 61  
  Morley, MO  63767  
  573-262-3545  
  Steve Rider  
  srider@vikingcivesmidwest.com  
    

3-110721RJ 
 Henke Manufacturing Corporation Yes or 

No 
  3070 Wilson Avenue  
  Leavenworth, KS  66048  
  888-682-9010  
  Mike Blake  
  mblake@henkemfg.com  
  Pat Silvey  
  psilvey@henkemfg.com   
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Snowplows 
Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Henderson Products, Inc.   
 
Item # 1   Conventional Front Snowplow w/Trip Edge 
 
 
Make/Model:  Henderson RSP    
 
Price:       
 
Installed on Truck: No Bid 
           
Delivered Price: $7,622.00 (12 x 36) 
   $8,312.00 (14 x 36) 
   $7,680.00 (12 x 42) 
   $8,381.00 (14 x 42)  
 
 
Optional Pricing:   
 
Standard moldboard shield 
10 ga moldboard, powder coated orange 
One piece adjustable trip edge 
No running gear or cushion valve 
Circle style push frame 
3 x 1.5 DA reversing cylinders 
Std 5/8x8 steel cutting edge 
Pin hitch, MoDOT (plow portion only) 
4 foot hydraulic hoses w/quick couplers 
 
12 x 36 $5,341.00  
 
12 x 42 $5,399.00  
 
14 x 36 $6,032.00  
 
14 x 42 $6,100.00  
 
 
Notes: 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount – Refer to Price 
List 
 
Delivery will be made 120 to 150 days after receipt of order.   
 
Vendor pricing sheets and literature are attached on the purchasing contracts database. 
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Snowplows 

Multiple Award 
______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Viking Cives Midwest, Inc.   
 
Item # 1   Conventional Front Snowplow w/Trip Edge 
 
 
Make/Model:  Viking Parallel Lift J Plow    
 
Price:       
 
Installed on Truck: $13,050.00 
           
Delivered Price: $12,750.00  
 
 
Viking Parallel Life J Plow Features: 
 
12’ or 14’ long, 27” or 39” high with: 
 
1 or 3 section torsion spring trip edge 
 
 3/8” poly moldboard sheet 
 
Parallel lift power reverse push frame 
 
Adjustable stands 
 
 Hose kit with quick disconnects 
 
No cutting edges 
 
 
 
 
Notes: 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount – 25% 
 
Delivery will be made 30 to 120 days after receipt of order.   
 
Vendor pricing sheets and literature are attached on the purchasing contracts database. 
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Snowplows 
Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Henke Manufacturing    
 
Item # 1   Conventional Front Snowplow w/Trip Edge 
 
 
Make/Model:  Henke Parallel Lift Plow (12’) SSTE (Square Spring Trip Edge)   
 
Price:       
 
Installed on Truck: No charge with hitch install 
           
Delivered Price: $10,270.00 
 
 
Additional Option: 
 
Henke Parallel Life Plow (14’), $10,671.00 
 
 
 
 
Notes: 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount – 20% 
 
Delivery will be made 60 to 120 days after receipt of order.   
 
Vendor pricing sheets and literature are attached on the purchasing contracts database. 
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Snowplows 
Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Henderson Products, Inc.   
 
Item # 1a   Front hitch for Item1 
 
 
Make/Model:  Henderson RSP    
 
Price:       
 
Installed on Truck: No Bid 
           
Delivered Price: $819.00 
     
 
 
Optional Pricing:   
 
Pin hitch (truck portion only) including bumper to frame kit and custom bumper $1,565.00 
 
 
 
 
 
Notes: 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount – Refer to Price 
List 
 
Delivery will be made 120 to 150 days after receipt of order.   
 
Vendor pricing sheets and literature are attached on the purchasing contracts database. 
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Snowplows 
Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Viking Cives Midwest, Inc.   
 
Item # 1a   Front hitch for Item1 
 
 
Make/Model:  Viking Parallel Lift J Plow    
 
Price:       
 
Installed on Truck: $2,540.00 
           
Delivered Price: $2,120.00 
     
 
 
Hitch Features:   
 
Parallel lift plate hitch (DIN) 
 
Lever actuated pin attach 
 
Bolt on 10” channel bumpers 
 
Pair of 1/2'” thick check plates 
 
Front and counter balance valve 
 
 
 
 
Notes: 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount – 25% 
 
Delivery will be made 30 to 120 days after receipt of order.   
 
Vendor pricing sheets and literature are attached on the purchasing contracts database. 
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Snowplows 
Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Henke Manufacturing   
 
Item # 1a   Front hitch for Item1 
 
 
Make/Model:  Henke Parallel Lift Plow    
 
Price:       
 
Installed on Truck: $816.00 
           
Delivered Price: $1,723.00 
     
 
 
Additional Information:   
 
MoDOT responsible for delivering truck to and from the closest Henke dealer location for installation. 
 
 
 
Notes: 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount – 20% 
 
Delivery will be made 60 to 120 days after receipt of order.   
 
Vendor pricing sheets and literature are attached on the purchasing contracts database. 
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Snowplows 
Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Henderson Products, Inc.   
 
Item # 2   Conventional Front Snow Plow w/Two-Stage 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

NO BID 
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Snowplows 
Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Viking Cives Midwest, Inc.   
 
Item # 2   Conventional Front Snow Plow w/Two-Stage 
 
 
Make/Model:  Viking PR27R12 or PR27R14    
 
Price:       
 
Delivered Price: $14,080.00 
     
 
 
Viking PR27R12 or PR27R14 Features:   
 
Power reverse two-stage plow 
 
27” tall high speed moldboard with 3/8” poly sheet 
 
Torsion spring trip edge 
 
Spring tooth second stage 
 
Power reverse push frame 
 
MoDOT swivel 
 
Air activation kit 
 
 
 
 
Notes: 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount – 25% 
 
Delivery will be made 30 to 120 days after receipt of order.   
 
Vendor pricing sheets and literature are attached on the purchasing contracts database. 
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Snowplows 
Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Henke Manufacturing   
 
Item # 2   Conventional Front Snow Plow w/Two-Stage 
 
 
Make/Model:  Henke 41R12IS w/Squeege    
 
Price:       
 
Delivered Price: $9,719.00 
     
 
 
Henke 41R12IS w/Squeege Features:   
 
Spring tooth design replaced by independent rubber squeegee blade 
 
 
 
Notes: 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount – 20% 
 
Delivery will be made 60 to 120 days after receipt of order.   
 
Vendor pricing sheets and literature are attached on the purchasing contracts database. 
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Snowplows 
Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Henderson Products, Inc.   
 
Item # 3   Conventional Front Snow Plow w/Scarifier and Squeege 
 
 
Make/Model:  Henderson RSP    
 
Price:       
 
Delivered Price:  
 
12 x 36 $9,827.00 
 
12 x 42 $9,865.00 
 
14 x 36 $10,946.00 
 
14 x 42 $11,005.00 
 
 
 
Henderson RSP Features: 
 
Standard moldboard shield 
 
Trip edge with outboard cylinder style push frame 
 
Squeege and scarifier 
 
Pin hitch (plow portion only) per MoDOT (no para) 
 
 
 
 
Notes: 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount – Refer to Price 
List 
 
Delivery will be made 120 to 150 days after receipt of order.   
 
Vendor pricing sheets and literature are attached on the purchasing contracts database. 
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Snowplows 
Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Viking Cives Midwest, Inc.   
 
Item # 3   Conventional Front Snow Plow w/Scarifier and Squeege 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

NO BID 
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Snowplows 

Multiple Award 
______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Henke Manufacturing   
 
Item # 3   Conventional Front Snow Plow w/Scarifier and Squeege 
 
 
Make/Model:  Henke 41R12IS, Multi-Blade Plow, 12’ (8” Carbide Cutting Edge)    
 
Price:       
 
Delivered Price: $11,664.00 
 
 
 
 
Additional Option: 
 
Henke 41R12IS Multi-Blade Plow, 14’ - $12,065.00 
 
 
 
Notes: 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount – 20% 
 
Delivery will be made 60 to 120 days after receipt of order.   
 
Vendor pricing sheets and literature are attached on the purchasing contracts database. 
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Snowplows 
Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Henderson Products, Inc.   
 
Item # 4 - Rear Mounted Wing Plow 
 
 
Make/Model:  Henderson HWS    
 
Price:       
 
Delivered Price:  
 
LH Wing $6,626.00 
 
RH Wing $6,626.00 
 
 
Henderson HWS Features: 
 
10’ straight 10 ga full trip moldboard 
Behind cab rear mount 
Short 8” lift mast (rear mount) 
Brace heel lift 
Hydraulic extendable rear push arm 
Extended tube and cheek plate mounting kit 
Front mount ahead of rear tires 
Rear mount behind rear tires 
 
 
Notes: 
 
Not quoting between tire mount – additional charges would apply 
 
MoDOT responsible for body side couplers and hoses. 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount – Refer to Price 
List 
 
Delivery will be made 120 to 150 days after receipt of order.   
 
Vendor pricing sheets and literature are attached on the purchasing contracts database. 
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Snowplows 
Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Viking Cives Midwest, Inc.   
 
Item # 4 - Rear Mounted Wing Plow 
 
 
Make/Model:  Viking AHW LP-Rear -11    
 
Price:       
 
Delivered Price:  
 
LH Wing $12,550.00 
 
RH Wing $12,550.00 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Notes: 
 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount – 25% 
 
Delivery will be made 30 to 120 days after receipt of order.   
 
Vendor pricing sheets and literature are attached on the purchasing contracts database. 
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Snowplows 
Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Henke Manufacturing   
 
Item # 4 - Rear Mounted Wing Plow 
 
 
Make/Model:  Henke Rear Mount Wing, 10’    
 
 
Delivered Price:  
 
LH Wing $7,738.00 
 
RH Wing $7,738.00 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Notes: 
 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount – 20% 
 
Delivery will be made 60 to 120 days after receipt of order.   
 
Vendor pricing sheets and literature are attached on the purchasing contracts database. 
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Snowplows 

Multiple Award 
______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Henderson Products, Inc.   
 
Item # 5 - Underbody Scraper w/Spring-Tooth Cutting Edge 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

NO BID 
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Snowplows 

Multiple Award 
______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Viking Cives Midwest, Inc.   
 
Item # 5 – Underbody Scraper w/Spring-Tooth Cutting Edge 
 
 
Make/Model:  Viking Salt Saver Power Reverse Spring Tooth Underbody    
 
Price:       
 
Delivered Price:  
 
$8,950.00 
 
 
 
 
Notes: 
 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount – 25% 
 
Delivery will be made 30 to 120 days after receipt of order.   
 
Vendor pricing sheets and literature are attached on the purchasing contracts database. 
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Snowplows 

Multiple Award 
______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-110721RJ       Vendor:  Henke Manufacturing   
 
Item # 5 - Underbody Scraper w/Spring-Tooth Cutting Edge 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

NO BID 
 


