
Name: Tri-State Construction Equipment: 

Contact name: Kevin Smyser: 

Address Line: 6787 County Road 312

Address Line: Palmyra, MO  63461

Telephone #: 573-769-2274

Email: kevinsmyser@meoi.com

Cooperative: Yes

Name: Murphy Tractor

Contact name: James F. Levy

Address Line: 8600 NE Parvin Rd.

Address Line: Kansas City, MO  64161

Telephone #: 816-483-5000

Email: jlevy@murphytractor.com

Cooperative: Yes

Name: Erb Equipment Co.

Contact name: Tim Smith

Address Line: 200 Erb Industrial Dr.

Address Line: Fenton, MO  63026

Telephone #: 636-349-0200

Email: timsmith@erbequipment.com

Cooperative: Yes

Name: G. W. Van Keppel Co.

Contact name: Steven Phillips

Address Line: 1801 N. 9th St.

Address Line: Kansas City, KS 66101

Telephone #: 913-281-4800

Email: sphillips@vankeppel.com

Cooperative: Yes

Name: Fabick Cat Co.

Contact name: Benny Walker

Address Line: One Fabick Dr.

Address Line: Fenton, MO  63026

Telephone #: 573-619-0202

Email: benny.walker@fabickcat.com

Cooperative: No

Name: Luby Equipment

Contact name: Jerry Jansen

Address Line: 2300 Cassens Dr.

Address Line: Fenton MO. 63026

Telephone #: 217-222-5454

Email: jjansen@lubyequipment.com

Cooperative: Yes

Name Altorfer, Inc.

Contact Name Chris Akright

Address Line: 3520 Moberly

Address Line: Hannibal, MO  63401

Telephone #: 573-221-8600

Email: cakright@altorfer.com

Cooperative: Yes
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Item #1 - Outright purchase of an articulated 6x4 motograder with dual/variable HP - (140-185)

Make/Model Base Price

Vendor Make/Model Base Price HP Option 1 Option 1 HP Option 2 Option 3 Option 4 Option 5 ARO Districts MSRP

Altorfer Inc. Caterpillar 120M2 $193,630.00 145-189 Caterpillar 140M3 $231,335.00 193-243 $24,000.00 $25,000.00 $1,805.00 N/A 120-180 days NE 39%

Erb Equipment Co., Inc. John Deere 670G $199,600.00 160-195 John Deere 770G $207,650.00 165-215

See Add'l 

Options Sheet

See Add'l 

Options Sheet

See Add'l 

Options Sheet

See Add'l 

Options 

Sheet 45 days SL, SE 0%

Luby Equipment Service Case 845B $186,500.00 140-160 Case 865B $204,600.00 178-205 $20,750.00 $21,500.00 STD $1,000.00 90-150 days NE, SL, SE 35%

Murphy Tractor & Equipment John Deere 670G $200,500.00 160-220 John Deere 770G $208,900.00 170-245 $20,655.00 $20,925.00 $995.00 NA 60-90 NW, KC, SW 25%

Fabick Cat Caterpillar 120M2 $195,075.00 145-189 Caterpillar 140M2 $233,220.00 193-243 $24,500.00 $25,550.00 $1,810.00 NA 180-270 NE, CD, SL, SW, SE 0%

Tri-State Construction John Deere 670G $199,500.00 162-220 John Deere 770G $207,900.00 170-245 $20,655.00 $20,925.00 $995.00 NA 60-90 days NE, CD 25%

G.W. Van Keppel Co. Volvo G930C $188,458.00 160-208 Volvo G940C $198,669.00 196-232 $20,388.00 $21,250.00 $1,462.00 $1,143.00 90-120 days NW, KC, CD, SW 30%

Item #3 -Outright Purchase of Heavy Duty articulated motorgrader 6x4 with dual/variable HP

Make/Model Base Price

Vendor Make/Model Base Price HP Option 1 Option 1 HP Option 2 Option 3 Option 4 Option 5 ARO Districts MSRP

Altorfer, Inc. Caterpillar 120M2 AWD $219,735.00 153-209 Caterpillar 140M3 AWD $260,220.00 202-263 $24,000.00 $25,000.00 $1,805.00 N/A 120-180 days NE 39%

Erb Equipment Co., Inc. John Deere 672G $210,985.00 175-195 John Deere 772G $237,400.00 202-250

See Add'l 

Options Sheet

See Add'l 

Options Sheet

See Add'l 

Options Sheet

See Add'l 

Options 

Sheet 45 days SL, SE 0%

Luby Equipment Service Case 865B AWD $229,800.00 178-205 Case 885B AWD $238,500.00 205-219 $20,750.00 $21,500.00 STD $1,000.00 90-150 days NE, SL, SE 35%

Murphy Tractor & Equipment John Deere 672G $213,800.00 165-220 John Deere 772G $236,800.00 205-265 $20,655.00 $20,925.00 $925.00 NA 60-90 days NW, KC, SW 25%

Fabick Cat Caterpillar 120M2 AWD $222,190.00 153-209 Caterpillar 140M2 AWD $262,350.00 202-263 $24,500.00 $25,550.00 $1,810.00 NA 180-270 NE, CD, SL, SW, SE 0%

Tri-State Construction John Deere 672G $212,800.00 178-235 John Deere 772G $235,800.00 202-265 $20,655.00 $20,925.00 $995.00 NA 60-90 days NE, CD 25%

G.W. Van Keppel Co. No Bid Volvo G946C $220,144.00 223-264 $20,388.00 $21,250.00 $1,462.00 $1,143.00 90-120 days NW, KC, CD, SW 30%

Training 12 Hour Basic Operation Optional Software Optional  Maintenance

And Diagnostics Price Per Set

Vendor to Perform First 

Scheduled On-Site 

Maintenance

Altorfer, Inc. $925.00 $1,800.00 $900.00

Erb Equipment Co., Inc. $450.00 $1,470.00 $1,700.00

Luby Equipment Service $250.00 NA $550.00

Murphy Tractor & Equipment $495.00 $2,530.00 Included

Fabick Cat $850.00 $1500/Software - $850/yr $800.00

Tri-State Construction $495.00 $2,530.00 Included

G.W. Van Keppel Co. 750 $2,500.00 $1,080.00
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Item # 2 - Straight Lease For Light Duty Articulated Motograder 6X4 with dual/variable HP (140-185)

End of Lease

Vendors Make & Model HP 12 Month Oveage/Hr 12 Month Overage/Hr Purchase Price Option 2 Option 3 Option 4 Option 5

300 Hours 500 Hours Base Unit/Option 1

Altorfer, Inc. NO BID

Erb Equipment Co., Inc. NO BID

Luby Equipment Service Case 845B 140-160

Murphy Tractor & Equipment John Deere 670G 160-195 $2,003.00 $35.00 $2,403.00 $35.00 $182,690.00 $589.00 $589.00 $29.00 $28.00

Fabick Cat NO BID

Tri-State Construction NO BID

G.W. Van Keppel Co. Volvo G930C 160-208 No Bid No Bid $1,645.23 $6.00 $178,000.00 $1,720.16 $1,792.89 $1,350.00 $96.43

Item # 2A - Straight Lease For Light Duty Articulated Motograder 6X4 with dual/variable HP (165-215)

End of Lease

Vendors Make & Model HP 12 Month Oveage/Hr 12 Month Overage/Hr Purchase Price Option 2 Option 3 Option 4 Option 5

300 Hours 500 Hours Base Unit/Option 1

Altorfer, Inc. NO BID

Erb Equipment Co., Inc. NO BID

Luby Equipment Service Case 865B 178-205

Murphy Tractor & Equipment John Deere 770G 170-245 $1,633.00 $37.00 $2,033.00 $37.00 $196,960.00 $583.00 $600.00 $17.00 $25.00

Fabick Cat NO BID

Tri-State Construction NO BID

G.W. Van Keppel Co. Volvo G940B 196-232 No Bid No Bid $2,178.27 $6.00 $178,000.00 $1,720.16 $1,792.89 $1,350.00 $96.43

Item # 4 - Straight Lease Heavy Duty 6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader with dual/variable HP (165-185)

End of Lease

12 Month Oveage/Hr 12 Month Overage/Hr Purchase Price Option 2 Option 3 Option 4 Option 5

Vendors Make & Model HP 300 Hours 500 Hours Base Unit/Option 1

Altorfer, Inc. NO BID

Erb Equipment Co., Inc. NO BID

Luby Equipment Service Case 865B AWD 178-205

Murphy Tractor & Equipment John Deere 672G 165-195 $1,733.00 $38.00 $2,133.00 $38.00 $198,590.00 $583.00 $599.00 $29.00 $28.00

Fabick Cat NO BID

Tri-State Construction NO BID

G.W. Van Keppel Co. NO BID

Item # 4A - Straight Lease Heavy Duty 6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader with dual/variable HP (185-230)

End of Lease

12 Month Oveage/Hr 12 Month Overage/Hr Purchase Price Option 2 Option 3 Option 4 Option 5

Vendors Make & Model HP 300 Hours 500 Hours Base Unit/Option 1

Altorfer, Inc. NO BID

Erb Equipment Co., Inc. NO BID

Luby Equipment Service Case 885B AWD 205-219

Murphy Tractor & Equipment John Deere 772G 205-265 $1,514.00 $44.00 $1,914.00 $44.00 $227,575.00 $567.00 $583.00 $17.00 $25.00

Fabick Cat NO BID

Tri-State Construction NO BID

G.W. Van Keppel Co. Volvo G946C 223-264 No Bid No Bid $2,594.14 $6.00 $200,447.00 $1,720.16 $1,792.89 $1,350.00 $96.43

Contact Luby Equipment for Details.

Contact Luby Equipment for Details.
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