MoDOT

MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
GENERAL SERVICES DIVISION
FLEET SECTION

NOTIFICATION OF STATEWIDE CONTRACT

CONTRACT TITLE: 2009 Dodge 4500 and 5500 Light Duty Vehicles
CURRENT CONTRACT PERIOD:
BUYER INFORMATION: Jerry Dunn

573-526-7932
jerry.dunn@modot.mo.gov

Bid prices should be firm for purchase until end of the 2009 model year. Three (3)

one-year extensions are available upon mutual consideration by Missouri
RENEWAL INFORMATION Department of Transportation and the successful bidder. Allowance for inflation
increases will be considered at the time of offer of these extensions.

ALL PURCHASES MADE UNDER THIS CONTRACT MUST BE FOR PUBLIC USE ONLY.
PURCHASES FOR PERSONAL USE BY PUBLIC EMPLOYEES OR OFFICIALS ARE PROHIBITED.

COOP
CONTRACT VENDOR VENDOR INFORMATION District | PROCURE
NUMBER NUMBER -MENT

3-081121 4312893570 West Brothers Chrysler Inc

#3 North service Rd.

Sullivan MO 63080

888-468-3178 or 573-205-3825

johns@westbrothers.com

John Schaefferkoetter

3-081121 431057804 South County Dodge Chrysler Jeep

7127 S. Linbergh Blvd

St/ Louis MO 63125

314 - 487-1010

bussinesslink@southcountyautos.com

Terry Brandt
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COOP
CONTRACT VENDOR VENDOR INFORMATION District PROCURE
NUMBER NUMBER -MENT
3-081121 431206283 Lou Fusz Dodge Company

3480 Highway K

O’Fallon MO. 63368

636-442-8130

Rick David

rickdavid@fusz.com
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MoDOT

4500 and 5500 Dodge Light Duty Vehicles (Statewide)
Multiple Award

Contract Number: 3-081121 Vendor: West Brothers

Item — 3 New standard equipped 2009 Model 17, 500 LB. GVWR Chassis-Cab SWB With DRW.
ACCEPTABLE MAKES AND MODELS:

MAKE/MODEL: Dodge Ram 5500 PRICE: $28383.00
EQUIPMENT INCLUDED IN PRICE:

Standard diesel engine with the highest cooling capacity (Size 6.7) Horsepower 305 )
Manufacturer’s standard rear end axle ratio (Ratio: 4.44)

4 speed automatic transmission

Air conditioning

LH & RH manual trailer-type mirrors

Tires:(4) manufacturer’s standard all season, plus full size spare and wheel (Size 225/70R/19.50)
Rubber flooring

Heavy duty all weather removable floor mats

Minimum GVWR 15,000 LB

Brakes 4-wheel anti-lock braking system (ABS)

Speed control and tilt wheel

Back up alarm

Vinyl seats

Fuel Capacity 52 Gal. Oil Capacity 12 Qt. GVWR 18750

AVAILABLE OPTIONS

Option 3A. Mounted 9’ platform body meeting Specification E1320
EACH $ 2629.00 MAKE Knap
Option 3B. Mounted 9’ platform dump body meeting Specification E1327
EACH $ 5220.00 MAKE Knap
Option 3C. Permanently installed bulkhead to fit truck application (minimum requirement to
top of cab)
EACH $ 780.00

Option 3D. Mounted 9’ dump body meeting Specification E1335
EACH $ 6340.00

Option 3E. Provide live hydraulics with under hood clutch pump, tank with built in filter, 20 GPM 3
section valve assembly with power beyond, dual knob spreader valve and hoses for mounted dump
body in specification E1335 or mounted platform body in specification E1327. This package shall be
capable of driving the auger, spinner motor in an salt spreader, and power to raise angle plow. All
hoses shall be provided from front to rear of truck

EACH $5700.00
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OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT PRICES, Item # 3 — Continued

Option 3F. Mounted standard utility tool body. Acceptable makes and models are:
Knapeheide 6108D54J, Stahl CHALLENGER Il 108VvVD- 54
Reading CLASSIC 11 108A DW Omaha 108D54V
RKI L60DW94.

Body to include flush mounted tail, stop, turn, backup and clearance lights as required per FMVSS
108 standards. Unit must include a tread plate step bumper with pintle hook recess.
Submit descriptive literature and specifications showing exact service body you propose to furnish

EACH $5085.00 (MAKE) Knap (MODEL) 6108D54J
Option 3G. Six - 2” deep full width 250 Ibs. capacity free sliding tool drawers mounted
approximately 1 ¥4 from top of compartment with approximately 2 %2 between

trays in lieu of two shelves and dividers in one of the full height vertical
compartments

EACH $ 1540.00

Option 3H. Two full length 250 Ibs. capacity free sliding tool trays with metal dividers with
slots on 4” centers with first tray mounted 5 ¥ “ from bottom of compartment
with approximately 1 %" between trays with second tray mounted above first in
lieu of shelf and dividers in one of the horizontal compartments

EACH $570.00

Option 3I. One full- length (or from crane mounting point) 4 deep top opening
compartment with release located inside side compartment, automatic up
position latch and metal dividers with slots on 4 centers in addition to the
standard tool compartments. The top opening compartment will not protrude
more than 2” into side compartment (The side compartment shall be 27" from
floor to top of side body plus excess for flip top compartment)

EACH $791.00

Option 3J. One double- bottle gas drop well and retainers in lieu of two shelves and
dividers in one of the full height vertical compartments

EACH $430.00

Option 3K. Minimum 25 high panel extension cover with minimum 42 locking rear doors
which will provide a minimum 48 interior height for storage and work area

EACH $ 2650.00

Option 3L. Body to have 3 section, tempered steel telescopic sliding roof and two piece, rigid aluminum, endgate
cover to protect cargo area from weather and theft. A mechanical type seal will be placed on the
telescopic sliding roof and endgate cover
EACH $ 1515.00

Option 3M Raise Telescopic Roof to get 36” clearance for the above option

EACH $570.00
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OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT PRICES, Item # 3 — Continued

Option 3N. Crane mount reinforced rigidly while maintaining full compartment space on top
rear corner of body either left or right for a 3500 Ibs. capacity crane ( with no mounting holes or bolt
holes, we will drill to suit ourselves)
EACH $ 995.00

Option 30. Heavy-duty manual 5 or 6 speed transmission in lieu of automatic transmission

EACH $ -2020.00

Option 3P. Heavy duty, Class V (2-1/2” square tube) receiver trailer hitch. Includes an adapter to reduce to 2”
(Class H11/1V) and a seven-wire RV style trailer plug

EACH $ 450.00
Option 3Q. Exterior color to be Federal Standard #595B “Highway Yellow”

EACH $ 658.00 $ 308 for chassis and $350 for Knap body min order qty. of 5

Option 3R. Alternate diesel engine with the highest cooling capacity (state size and horsepower)
N/A
Option 3S. Standard gasoline engine with the highest cooling capacity in lieu of diesel engine (state size and
horsepower)
N/A
Option 3T. Alternate gasoline engine in lieu of diesel engine (state size and horsepower)
N/A
Option 3U. Automatic transmission power take-off provision

EACH $ 172.00
Option 3V. Snowplow package
EACH $128.00
Option 3W. Crew cab( Quad cab 164” Wheelbase) in lieu of regular cab GVWR 19500
EACH $ 1982.00
Option 3X. Extended cab in lieu of regular cab
N/A
Option 3Y. 2 Factory cab steps. (one on drivers side, one on passenger side)
EACH $ 431.00
Option 3Z. .Four-wheel drive GVWR _18750

EACH $ 3049.00
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OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT PRICES, Item # 3 — Continued

Option 3AA. Hydraulic system to run body, plow and spreader, shall be all electric power line
control design. In cab control modules to plug into cigar lighter for power, no
wiring shall connect the in cab modules to the hydraulic valve assembly, which
will be in an enclosure. The only common wiring shall be power and ground
EACH $ 8100.00

Option 3BB. Provide hydraulics and controls for dump hoist only
EACH $672.00

Option 3CC.  Optional Rear Axle Ratio
N/A

Option 3DD. Limited Slip Rear Axle. Axle Ratio 4.44
EACH $ Included

Option 3EE. Commercial grade spray on bed lining to be applied in the cargo area of the utility body, to include
floor, sides tailgate, front, and horizontal surface of bumper

EACH $ 648.00
Option 3FF. Electric Trailer Brake Controller

EACH $ 175.00 By Knap
Please submit a complete parts list with detailed pricing information for each make/model your company would be
willing to provide. Please indicate below the percent (%) discount off Manufacturers Suggested Retail Prices (MSRP) for all
vehicle options available in your data book or pricing guides.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 2%

Delivery will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order.
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4500 and 5500 Dodge Light Duty Vehicles (Statewide)
Multiple Award

Contract Number: 3-081121 Vendor: Southtown Dodge

Item — 3 New standard equipped 2009 Model 17, 500 LB. GVWR Chassis-Cab SWB With DRW.
ACCEPTABLE MAKES AND MODELS:

MAKE/MODEL: Dodge Ram 5500 PRICE: $27170.00
EQUIPMENT INCLUDED IN PRICE:

Standard diesel engine with the highest cooling capacity (Size 6.7) Horsepower 305 )
Manufacturer’s standard rear end axle ratio (Ratio: 4.44)

4 speed automatic transmission

Air conditioning

LH & RH manual trailer-type mirrors

Tires:(4) manufacturer’s standard all season, plus full size spare and wheel (Size 225/70R/19.50)
Rubber flooring

Heavy duty all weather removable floor mats

Minimum GVWR 15,000 LB

Brakes 4-wheel anti-lock braking system (ABS)

Speed control and tilt wheel

Back up alarm

Vinyl seats

Fuel Capacity 52 Gal. Oil Capacity 12 Qt. GVWR 18750

AVAILABLE OPTIONS

Option 3A. Mounted 9’ platform body meeting Specification E1320
EACH $ 2629.00 MAKE Knap
Option 3B. Mounted 9’ platform dump body meeting Specification E1327
EACH $5220.00 MAKE Knap
Option 3C. Permanently installed bulkhead to fit truck application (minimum requirement to
top of cab)
EACH $ 780.00
Option 3D. Mounted 9’ dump body meeting Specification E1335

EACH $ 6340.00

Option 3E. Provide live hydraulics with under hood clutch pump, tank with built in filter, 20 GPM 3
section valve assembly with power beyond, dual knob spreader valve and hoses for mounted dump
body in specification E1335 or mounted platform body in specification E1327. This package shall be
capable of driving the auger, spinner motor in an salt spreader, and power to raise angle plow. All
hoses shall be provided from front to rear of truck

EACH $5650.00 Gas  $5700.00 diesel
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OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT PRICES, Item # 3 — Continued

Option 3F. Mounted standard utility tool body. Acceptable makes and models are:
Knapeheide 6108D54J, Stahl CHALLENGER Il 108VvVD- 54
Reading CLASSIC 11 108A DW Omaha 108D54V
RKI L60DW94.

Body to include flush mounted tail, stop, turn, backup and clearance lights as required per FMVSS
108 standards. Unit must include a tread plate step bumper with pintle hook recess.
Submit descriptive literature and specifications showing exact service body you propose to furnish

EACH $5085.00 (MAKE) Knap
Option 3G. Six - 2” deep full width 250 Ibs. capacity free sliding tool drawers mounted
approximately 1 ¥4 from top of compartment with approximately 2 %2 between

trays in lieu of two shelves and dividers in one of the full height vertical
compartments

EACH $ 1540.00

Option 3H. Two full length 250 Ibs. capacity free sliding tool trays with metal dividers with
slots on 4” centers with first tray mounted 5 ¥ “ from bottom of compartment
with approximately 1 %" between trays with second tray mounted above first in
lieu of shelf and dividers in one of the horizontal compartments

EACH $570.00

Option 3I. One full- length (or from crane mounting point) 4 deep top opening
compartment with release located inside side compartment, automatic up
position latch and metal dividers with slots on 4 centers in addition to the
standard tool compartments. The top opening compartment will not protrude
more than 2” into side compartment (The side compartment shall be 27" from
floor to top of side body plus excess for flip top compartment)

EACH $791.00

Option 3J. One double- bottle gas drop well and retainers in lieu of two shelves and
dividers in one of the full height vertical compartments

EACH $430.00

Option 3K. Minimum 25 high panel extension cover with minimum 42 locking rear doors
which will provide a minimum 48 interior height for storage and work area

EACH $ 2650.00

Option 3L. Body to have 3 section, tempered steel telescopic sliding roof and two piece, rigid aluminum, endgate
cover to protect cargo area from weather and theft. A mechanical type seal will be placed on the
telescopic sliding roof and endgate cover
EACH $ 1515.00

Option 3M Raise Telescopic Roof to get 36” clearance for the above option

EACH $570.00
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Option 3N.

Option 30.

Option 3P.

Option 3Q.

Option 3R.

Option 3S.

Option 3T.

Option 3U.

Option 3V.

Option 3W.

Option 3X.

Option 3Y.

Option 3Z.

OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT PRICES, Item # 3 — Continued

Crane mount reinforced rigidly while maintaining full compartment space on top

rear corner of body either left or right for a 3500 Ibs. capacity crane ( with no mounting holes or bolt
holes, we will drill to suit ourselves)

EACH $ 995.00

Heavy-duty manual 5 or 6 speed transmission in lieu of automatic transmission

EACH $ -2768.00 Deduct

Heavy duty, Class V (2-1/2” square tube) receiver trailer hitch. Includes an adapter to reduce to 2”
(Class H11/1V) and a seven-wire RV style trailer plug

EACH $ 450.00
Exterior color to be Federal Standard #595B “Highway Yellow”
EACH $ 308.00 chassis and $350.00for the Knap body

Alternate diesel engine with the highest cooling capacity (state size and horsepower)

N/A

Standard gasoline engine with the highest cooling capacity in lieu of diesel engine (state size and
horsepower)

N/A

Alternate gasoline engine in lieu of diesel engine (state size and horsepower)
N/A

Automatic transmission power take-off provision

EACH $ 172.00

Snowplow package

EACH $ 128.00

Crew cab in lieu of regular cab

N/A

Extended cab in lieu of regular cab GVWR 19500
EACH $ 3049.00

2 Factory cab steps. (one on drivers side, one on passenger side)
EACH $ 628.00

.Four-wheel drive GVWR All

EACH $ 3427.00
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OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT PRICES, Item # 3 — Continued

Option 3AA. Hydraulic system to run body, plow and spreader, shall be all electric power line
control design. In cab control modules to plug into cigar lighter for power, no
wiring shall connect the in cab modules to the hydraulic valve assembly, which
will be in an enclosure. The only common wiring shall be power and ground
EACH $8020.00 Gas  $8100.00 Diesel

Option 3BB. Provide hydraulics and controls for dump hoist only
EACH $672.00

Option 3CC.  Optional Rear Axle Ratio
N/A

Option 3DD. Limited Slip Rear Axle. Axle Ratio All
EACH $ 286.00

Option 3EE. Commercial grade spray on bed lining to be applied in the cargo area of the utility body, to include
floor, sides tailgate, front, and horizontal surface of bumper

EACH $ 600.00
Option 3FF. Electric Trailer Brake Controller

EACH $ 175.00
Please submit a complete parts list with detailed pricing information for each make/model your company would be
willing to provide. Please indicate below the percent (%) discount off Manufacturers Suggested Retail Prices (MSRP) for all
vehicle options available in your data book or pricing guides.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount Dealer Cost

Delivery will be made approximately 90-180.00 days after receipt of order.
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4500 and 5500 Dodge Light Duty Vehicles (Statewide)
Multiple Award

Contract Number: 3-081121 Vendor: Lou Fusz Dodge

Item — 3 New standard equipped 2009 Model 17, 500 LB. GVWR Chassis-Cab SWB With DRW.
ACCEPTABLE MAKES AND MODELS:

MAKE/MODEL: Dodge Ram 5500 PRICE: $28774.00
EQUIPMENT INCLUDED IN PRICE:

Standard diesel engine with the highest cooling capacity (Size 6.7) Horsepower 305 )
Manufacturer’s standard rear end axle ratio (Ratio: 4.44)

4 speed automatic transmission

Air conditioning

LH & RH manual trailer-type mirrors

Tires:(4) manufacturer’s standard all season, plus full size spare and wheel (Size 225/70R/19.50)
Rubber flooring

Heavy duty all weather removable floor mats

Minimum GVWR 15,000 LB

Brakes 4-wheel anti-lock braking system (ABS)

Speed control and tilt wheel

Back up alarm

Vinyl seats

Fuel Capacity 52 Gal. Oil Capacity 12 Qt. GVWR 18750

AVAILABLE OPTIONS

Option 3A. Mounted 9’ platform body meeting Specification E1320
EACH $ 2629.00 MAKE Knap MODEL PVMX 93C
Option 3B. Mounted 9’ platform dump body meeting Specification E1327
EACH $5220.00 MAKE Knap MODEL PVMXT 93C w/Rugby HR540 Hoist
Option 3C. Permanently installed bulkhead to fit truck application (minimum requirement to
top of cab)
EACH $ 780.00
Option 3D. Mounted 9’ dump body meeting Specification E1335

EACH $ 6340.00

Option 3E. Provide live hydraulics with under hood clutch pump, tank with built in filter, 20 GPM 3
section valve assembly with power beyond, dual knob spreader valve and hoses for mounted dump
body in specification E1335 or mounted platform body in specification E1327. This package shall be
capable of driving the auger, spinner motor in an salt spreader, and power to raise angle plow. All
hoses shall be provided from front to rear of truck

EACH $5700.00

Page 11 of 14



MoDOT

OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT PRICES, Item # 3 — Continued

Option 3F. Mounted standard utility tool body. Acceptable makes and models are:
Knapeheide 6108D54J, Stahl CHALLENGER Il 108VvVD- 54
Reading CLASSIC 11 108A DW Omaha 108D54V
RKI L60DW94.

Body to include flush mounted tail, stop, turn, backup and clearance lights as required per FMVSS
108 standards. Unit must include a tread plate step bumper with pintle hook recess.
Submit descriptive literature and specifications showing exact service body you propose to furnish

EACH $ 5085.00 (MAKE) Knap (MODEL) 6108D54J
Option 3G. Six - 2” deep full width 250 Ibs. capacity free sliding tool drawers mounted
approximately 1 ¥4 from top of compartment with approximately 2 %2 between

trays in lieu of two shelves and dividers in one of the full height vertical
compartments

EACH $ 1540.00

Option 3H. Two full length 250 Ibs. capacity free sliding tool trays with metal dividers with
slots on 4” centers with first tray mounted 5 ¥ “ from bottom of compartment
with approximately 1 %" between trays with second tray mounted above first in
lieu of shelf and dividers in one of the horizontal compartments

EACH $570.00

Option 3I. One full- length (or from crane mounting point) 4 deep top opening
compartment with release located inside side compartment, automatic up
position latch and metal dividers with slots on 4 centers in addition to the
standard tool compartments. The top opening compartment will not protrude
more than 2” into side compartment (The side compartment shall be 27" from
floor to top of side body plus excess for flip top compartment)
EACH $ 926.00

Option 3J. One double- bottle gas drop well and retainers in lieu of two shelves and
dividers in one of the full height vertical compartments

EACH $ 430.00 Location TBD at time of order

Option 3K. Minimum 25 high panel extension cover with minimum 42 locking rear doors
which will provide a minimum 48 interior height for storage and work area

EACH $ 2650.00

Option 3L. Body to have 3 section, tempered steel telescopic sliding roof and two piece, rigid aluminum, endgate
cover to protect cargo area from weather and theft. A mechanical type seal will be placed on the
telescopic sliding roof and endgate cover
EACH $1515.00

Option 3M Raise Telescopic Roof to get 36” clearance for the above option

EACH $570.00
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OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT PRICES, Item # 3 — Continued

Option 3N. Crane mount reinforced rigidly while maintaining full compartment space on top
rear corner of body either left or right for a 3500 Ibs. capacity crane ( with no mounting holes or bolt
holes, we will drill to suit ourselves)
EACH $ 995.00

Option 30. Heavy-duty manual 5 or 6 speed transmission in lieu of automatic transmission

EACH $ -2020.00 Deduct

Option 3P. Heavy duty, Class V (2-1/2” square tube) receiver trailer hitch. Includes an adapter to reduce to 2”
(Class H11/1V) and a seven-wire RV style trailer plug

EACH $ 450.00
Option 3Q. Exterior color to be Federal Standard #595B “Highway Yellow”
No Bid

Option 3R. Alternate diesel engine with the highest cooling capacity (state size and horsepower)

No Bid

Option 3S. Standard gasoline engine with the highest cooling capacity in lieu of diesel engine (state size and
horsepower)

No Bid

Option 3T. Alternate gasoline engine in lieu of diesel engine (state size and horsepower)
No Bid

Option 3U. Automatic transmission power take-off provision
EACH $ 195.00

Option 3V. Snowplow package

EACH $ 145.00

Option 3W. Crew cab (Quad Cab 4 Door) in lieu of regular cab GVWR 18750
EACH $ 2740.00

Option 3X. Extended cab in lieu of regular cab
No Bid

Option 3Y. 2 Factory cab steps. (one on drivers side, one on passenger side)

EACH $ 545.00 for 2 door regular cab
Option 3Z. .Four-wheel drive GVWR 18750

EACH $ 3985.00
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OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT PRICES, Item # 3 — Continued

Option 3AA. Hydraulic system to run body, plow and spreader, shall be all electric power line
control design. In cab control modules to plug into cigar lighter for power, no
wiring shall connect the in cab modules to the hydraulic valve assembly, which
will be in an enclosure. The only common wiring shall be power and ground
EACH $ 8100.00

Option 3BB. Provide hydraulics and controls for dump hoist only
EACH $ 672.00 electric / hydraulics for hoist only ILO central hydraulics systems

Option 3CC.  Optional Rear Axle Ratio Axle Ratio 4.88
EACH $ 100.00

Option 3DD. Limited Slip Rear Axle. Axle Ratio 4.44
EACH $ 325.00

Option 3EE. Commercial grade spray on bed lining to be applied in the cargo area of the utility body, to include
floor, sides tailgate, front, and horizontal surface of bumper

EACH $648.00
Option 3FF. Electric Trailer Brake Controller

EACH $ 175.00
Please submit a complete parts list with detailed pricing information for each make/model your company would be
willing to provide. Please indicate below the percent (%) discount off Manufacturers Suggested Retail Prices (MSRP) for all
vehicle options available in your data book or pricing guides.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 5%

Delivery will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order.
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