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Item #1 Digger Derrick

Vendor

Altec Industries

Altec Industries

Powerline Equipment Sales, Inc.
Pat Kelly Equipment Co

Drake-Scruggs Equipment, Inc.

Bold denotes awarded bid

Make/Model

2007 Int'l 4400 4x2 with
Altec DL45

2008 4x2 4300 with
Altec DM47

No Bid

No Bid

Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-061115 Aerials, Diggers
Opened on 11/15/2006

Base Price

$150,508.00

$156,772.00

$185,904.00

Single Award
AR Coop.
270-300 Days Yes
Prices good until July 31, 2009
270-300 Days Yes

Options and Pricing for Altec DL45:

Option 1

Option 2

Option 3

Additional training modules: $1,350.00 per class, 4-student minimum, plus

hotel, airfare, and car rental for Altec representative.

Apply black non-skid paint to compartment tops and all walking surfaces $300.00

Compartment lights installed in each compartment. Wiring installed in loom with switch
located in cab. Switch to be energized only when chassis lights are on. $400.00
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ltem #2 45' Light Truck-Mounted. Non-Insulated, Articulated T ic Aerial Device and Utility Tool Body, Specs E1010 and E1351C

Coop.
Vendor Make/Model Base Price AR Yes/No
Altec Industries 2007 GMC C5500 w/ $91,233.00
Altec TA40 w/
132" Aerial Service Line Body
Pat Kelly Equipment Co No Bid
Powerline Equipment Sales, Inc. No Bid
Drake-Scruggs Equipment, Inc. 2009 Ford F550 with $78,909.00 120-150 Days Yes Prices good until April 30, 2009
Versalift VST-240-N with
Knapheide 7132D54J Body Options and Pricing for Drake-Scruggs:

Option 1 Material handling jib and winch.... 800 Ib material handling capacity. Manual jib. $3,136.00
Bold denotes awarded bid
Option 2 Material handling plumbing package only. (Manual jib) $1,200.00
Option 3 Two-speed manual throttle contraol at bucket, pedestal, and rear tailshelf of body. Non insulated unit. $1,009.00
Option 4 1000 Ib lifting eye mounted near the end of the outer boom. $71.00
Option 5 24" x 30" x 42" fiberglass walk-in bucket in lieu of the closed one-piece bucket $234.00
Option 6 Fully insulated aerial device. ~ $4,422.00
Option 7 Heated hydraulic system, 110 volt ~ $239.00

Option 8 Electric power source, pure sine wave, inverter dimensions model TMC 12/2400N
or equal; support system and auxiliary battery $2,844.00

Option 9 Additional training modules  $300.00 per location.

Option 10 Socket tube cover $10.00

Option 11 Hyd. Jib  $5,340.00

Option 12 Hyd. Jib plumbing package only $1,392.00

Option 13 Pure sine wave inverter, Dimensions TMC 12/3000N  $2,894.00

Option 14 18 x 18 outrigger pad holders. $87.00 each

Option 15 Outrigger pads. $98.00 each

Option 16 2-speed manual throttle control at bucket, pedestal, and rear tailshelf of body (insulated unit) $227.00

Option 17 120V wiring in boom (non-insulated unit) $413.00

Option 18 Chassis with V10 6.8L gas engine in lieu of diesel $-5,355.00

Option 19 Ford F-550 4 x 4 option $3,235.00

Option 20 Upgrade to 50 telescopic aerial VST-5000-I line body and F-750, add to base price of VST-240-N $39,648.00
Option 21 Upgrade to 55' telescopic aerial VST-5500-I line body and F-750, add to base price of VST-240-N $43,616.00

Option 22 Upgrade to 60 telescopic aerial VST-6000-I line body and F-750, add to base price of VST-240-N $47,886.00

Following Options for VST-5000, 5500, and 6000I
Option 23 Hydraulic tool power at ground controls $268.00
Option 24 Lift eye on upper boom $69.00
Option 25 Manual jib pole and winch package $3,062.00
Option 26 Hydraulic jub and winch package $5,214.00
Option 27 Jib for use with 3 phase holder application $777.00
Option 28 Closed 24" x 30" platform in lieu of 24" x 48" (-$416.00)
Option 29 Four way axis controller $647.00
Option 30 Outrigger motion alarm system $497.00
Option 31 Oval strobe head in tail shelf $454.00
Option 32 Pintle hood, trailer socket electric brake control $772.00
Option 33 Heated hydraulic system $203.00
Option 34 Diimension inverter model TMC 12/2400N $2,722.00
Option 35 Dimension Pure Sine Wave Inverter model TMC 12/3000N $2,899.00

Option 36 Electroguard and test ban not standard on VST-6000-1 model (add) $2,871.00
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ltem #3 45' Light Truck-Mounted. Non-Insulated, Articulated T ic Aerial Device and Utility Tool Body, Specs E1010 and E1349

Vendor Make/Model Base Price ARO Yes/No
Altec Industries 2007 GMC C5500 w/ $92,149.00
Altec TA40 w/

132" Aerial Service Line Body

Pat Kelly Equipment Co No Bid
Powerline Equipment Sales, Inc. No Bid
Drake-Scruggs Equipment, Inc. 2009 Ford F550 with $79,254.00 150-180 Days Yes Prices good until April 30, 2009
Versalift VST-240-N with
Knapheide 6132D54J Body Options and Pricing for Drake-Scruggs:

Option 1 Material handling jib and winch.... 800 Ib material handling capacity. Manual jib. $3,136.00
Bold denotes awarded bid
Option 2 Material handling plumbing package only. (Manual jib) $1,200.00
Option 3 Two-speed manual throttle contraol at bucket, pedestal, and rear tailshelf of body. Non insulated unit. $1009.00
Option 4 1000 Ib lifting eye mounted near the end of the outer boom. $71.00
Option 5 24" x 30" x 42" fiberglass walk-in bucket in lieu of the closed one-piece bucket $234.00
Option 6 Fully insulated aerial device. ~ $4,422.00
Option 7 Heated hydraulic system, 110 volt  $239.00

Option 8 Electric power source, pure sine wave, inverter dimensions model TMC 12/2400N
or equal; support system and auxiliary battery $2,844.00

Option 9 Additional training modules  $300.00 per location.

Option 10 Socket tube cover $10.00

Option 11 Hyd. Jib  $5,340.00

Option 12 Hyd. Jib plumbing package only $1,392.00

Option 13 Pure sine wave inverter, Dimensions TMC 12/3000N  $2,894.00

Option 14 18 x 18 outrigger pad holders. $87.00 each

Option 15 Outrigger pads. $98.00 each

Option 16 2-speed manual throttle control at bucket, pedestal, and rear tailshelf of body (insulated unit) $227.00

Option 17 120V wiring in boom (non-insulated unit) $413.00

Option 18 Chassis with V10 6.8L gas engine in lieu of diesel $-5,355.00

Option 19 Ford F-550 4 x 4 option $3,235.00

Option 20 Upgrade to 50 telescopic aerial VST-5000-I line body and F-750, add to base price of VST-240-N $39,648.00
Option 21 Upgrade to 55' telescopic aerial VST-5500-I line body and F-750, add to base price of VST-240-N $43,616.00

Option 22 Upgrade to 60 telescopic aerial VST-6000-I line body and F-750, add to base price of VST-240-N $47,886.00

Following Options for VST-5000, 5500, and 6000I
Option 23 Hydraulic tool power at ground controls $268.00
Option 24 Lift eye on upper boom $69.00
Option 25 Manual jib pole and winch package $3,062.00
Option 26 Hydraulic jub and winch package $5,214.00
Option 27 Jib for use with 3 phase holder application $777.00
Option 28 Closed 24" x 30" platform in lieu of 24" x 48" (-$416.00)
Option 29 Four way axis controller $647.00
Option 30 Outrigger motion alarm system $499.00
Option 31 Oval strobe head in tail shelf $454.00
Option 32 Pintle hood, trailer socket electric brake control $772.00
Option 33 Heated hydraulic system $203.00
Option 34 Diimension inverter model TMC 12/2400N $2,722.00
Option 35 Dimension Pure Sine Wave Inverter model TMC 12/3000N $2,899.00

Option 36 Electroguard and test ban not standard on VST-6000-1 model (add) $2,871.00
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VENDOR INFORMATION

Name:

Contact name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Name:

Contact name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Name:

Contact name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Name:

Contact name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Drake Scruggs Equipment Inc.
Bob Coshun

4101 West Main St.
Grandview, MO 64030
816-765-5525

Altec Industries

Ryan Shane

2106 Riverside

Saint Joseph, MO 64507
816-901-4792

Powerline Equipment Sales, Inc.

Garry Blanford
1125 S. Callahan Road
Wentzville, MO 63385
636-332-3200

Pat Kelly Equipment Co.
Rich Sahrman
5920 N. Lindbergh Blvd.
Hazelwood, MO 63042
314-895-9500

Prices good until April 30, 2009

Prices good until July 31, 2008
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