
Item #1  42' Aerial

Vendor Make/Model Base Price ARO Coop.
Drake Scruggs SST-37-EIH / 2008 Ford F550 $61,902.00 120-180 Days Yes

w/ Knapheide Body 7108D54RJ

Knapheide Truck Equipment Utem Skytel Utli 41A / 2007 Ford F550 $61,595.00 120-160 Days Yes
w/ Knapheide Body 7108D54RJ

Utem Skytel Utli 41A / 2007 Chevy CC4500 $66,595.00 120-160 Days Yes
w/ Knapheide Body 7108D54RJ

Powerline Equipment Sales ETI ETC 37 IH / 2007 Ford F550 $70,454.45 150-180 Days Yes
w/ ET SB Series Body

Flannegan Western No Bid

Bold denotes awarded bid
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Item #2  Sign Truck

Vendor Make/Model Base Price ARO Coop.

Flannegan Western FW SSOW / Ford F550 $80,378.89 60-90 Days Yes

Drake Scruggs No Bid

Knapheide Truck Equipment No Bid

Powerline Equipment Sales No Bid

Bold denotes awarded bid
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ITEM 1 Drake-Scruggs

Option Description Price

1 Lifting eye attachment located on the lower boom that has a 1000 lb capacity $68.00
2 Fiberglass walk-thru bucket w/ door I lieu of the standard closed 1-piece bucket $470.00
3 180-degree rotation of the bucket at the end of the boom $1,226.00
4 Outriggers in lieu of torsion bars $2,119.00
5 Provide an electric power source, pure sine wave, inverter Dimensions Model

DUI 12/2500N or equal;  support system and auxiliary battery $2,572.00
6 Fiberglass outer boom in lieu of steel          N/A
7 Insulated lower boom insert with compensating link $1,630.00
8 Provide a steel telescopic inner boom in lieu of fiberglass -$562.00
9 Add 110-volt receptacle at the bucket  (steel boom only) $279.00

10 Receptacle reel mounted on the first boom stage.  Wired waterproof duplex
receptacle mounted on the turret base.  Source of power to be added later.
One male plug on a 4' cord in the bottom right compartment of the utility bed. $637.00

11 Heated hydraulic system, 110-volt $207.00
12 Fiberglass bucket liner with inside step $251.00
13 Bucket capacities to 350 lbs      N/C
14 Diesel engine in lieu of gas engine $5,472.00
15 Add 4wd to chassis $3,595.00
16 84" CA in lieu of 60" CA $270.00
17 7132D54RJ Knapheide 132" long service body 84" CA in lieu of 7108D54J Knapheide 108" long

service body 60" CA $447.00
18 SST-40 EIH Aerial in lieu of SST-38EIH $679.00
19 SST-40 ENH Aerial in lieu of SST-37EIH ($1,113.00)
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ITEM 2 Flannegan Western

Option Description Price

NOTE: Standard 10' bed length is no longer available.  All units ordered will have 11' bed lengths, with a 12' option at no additional cost.

1 4-Wheel Drive $3,500.00
2 Deduct for manual transmission -$1,267.00
3 2nd set of outriggers $2,662.25
4 Engine rev-up chip for truck N/A
5 Manual post-driver $115.50
6 Hydraulic post-driver  (steel or wood posts) $7,086.20
7 Handheld hydraulic post-driver  (includes hose and couplers) $2,480.00
8 Modular slide-in sign compartment $594.82
9 Post holder / Ladder rack $137.50

10 Operator control seat $275.00
11 Manual outriggers $1,700.85
12 Adjustable sign dividers  (need 2 or 4 or 6) $283.20 ea
13 Bumper mounted rock or utility box $825.00
14 Expanded metal shovel box $456.60
15 Enclosed post storage $123.75
16 Tool bar holder $113.75
17 Oxygen & acetylene tank holder $171.35
18 Traffic cone holder $108.90
19 Aggregate box N/A
20 Water compartments (left and right) $562.10 ea
21 10' truck bed - 84" CA, 141" Wheelbase $3,703.57
22 12' truck bed - 84" CA, 141" Wheelbase $3,703.57
23 14' truck bed - 108" CA, 165" Wheelbase $4,303.57
24 Hose reel with 50' hose and connectors  -   3/8" hose/ 30 feet $850.00
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Name: Drake Scruggs
Contact name: Bob Coshun
Address Line: 4101 West Main St.
Address Line: Grandview,  MO  64030
Telephone #: 816-765-5525

Name: Flannegan Western
Contact name: Mike Flannegan
Address Line: 1004 Main Street
Address Line: Emmetsburg,  IA  50536
Telephone #: 712-852-3996

Name: Knapheide Truck Equipment
Contact name: Ron Lehman
Address Line: 6603 Business 50 West
Address Line: Jefferson City,  MO  65109
Telephone #: 573-893-5200

Name: Powerline Equipment Sales
Contact name: Mike Benz
Address Line: 1125 S. Callahan Rd.
Address Line: Wentzville,  MO  63385
Telephone #: 636-332-3200

VENDOR INFORMATION
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