MoDOT

Missouri Department of Transportation

Bid Tabulation of Request 3-130709TV Purchase Tractors

ltem #1 Purchase Tractors 40 - 60 HP (PTO)

Multiple Award

Base Option Pricing Std Districts
Vendor Make/Model HP. Price la 1b 1ic 1d le 1f 1g 1h 1i 1 ARO Provided
|Scott's Tractor & LLC Kubota M6060HD 56 $28,700.00 $6,684.00 $300.00 NA $98.00 $310.00 NA $740.00 $95.00 $5,313.00 $553.00 30 NW, KC
Lauf i Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 1754 43 $26,500.00 $6,400.00 $500.00 NA $1.00 $1.00 NA $1,200.00 $150.00 $4,400.00 $985.00 60-90 ALL
Lauf i Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 1754 Hydro 43 $27,900.00 $6,300.00 $500.00 NA $1.00 $1.00 NA $1,200.00 $150.00 $4,400.00 $985.00 60-90 ALL
Lauf Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 1758 46 $28,321.00 $6,300.00 $500.00 NA $1.00 $1.00 NA $1,200.00 $150.00 $4,450.00 $985.00 60-90 ALL
Lauf Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 1759 46 $30,500.00 $6,400.00 $500.00 NA $1.00 $1.00 NA $1,200.00 $150.00 $4,400.00 $985.00 60-90 ALL
Lauf Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 4608 62.5 $29,500.00 $7,450.00 $500.00 -$3,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 NA $1,100.00 $116.00 $5,400.00 $935.00 60-90 ALL
CNH America LLC Case IH 50 BCUT 40 $29,654.21 Included $200.00 NA $170.25 $138.00 NA $859.17 $320.00 $6,253.17 Included 180 ALL
ICNH America LLC Case IH 75C 65 $28,169.98 $4,029.43 Included -$2,314.71 $429.66 $430.43 $482.79 $1,323.00 $294.00 $6,544.23 Included 180 ALL
|Sievers Co. Case IH Farmall 75C 65 $29,488.00 $4,292.00 - -$2,050.00 $506.00 $387.00 $434.00 $1,150.00 $450.00 $5,190.00 Included 180 NE; CD; SL; SE
United LP John Deere 507M Utility Tractor & H260 Loader 60 $48,143.00
Deere & Compan! John Deere 5075E 61 $27,605.27 $5,866.98 $400.00 NA $130.98 $176.42 NA NA $73.06 $4,509.84 $927.96 60-180 ALL
Deere & Compan! John Deere 5075M 60 $39,743.97 $5.942.03 $442.27 -$5.906.76 $13,098.00 $176.42 $100.62 $1.949.51 $64.80 $5.357.24 $1.266.54 60-180 ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) PowerStar T4.75 64 $29,986.00 $5,660.00 Standard -$2,766.00 $283.00 or $435.00 $436.00 $489.00 $1,200.00 Standard $5,546.00 Included 30-180 ALL
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MODOT Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-130709TV Purchase Tractors
Multiple Award

Iltem #1 Purchase Tractors 40 - 60 HP (PTO) Tractor Data Sheet
Fuel Capacity Engine
Vendor Make/Model HP Transmission (Gallons) (Cylinders) Weight (Ibs)

8x8 Hydraulic

Scott's Tractor & Equipment LLC Kubota M6060HD 56 Shuttle 18 4 5727
12x12 Power

Lauf Equipment Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 1754 43 Shuttle 13 4 3700

Lauf Equipment Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 1754 Hydro 43 3 Range E-hydro 13 4 3850

Lauf Equipment Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 1758 46 3 Range Hydro 13 4 3800
12x12 Power

Lauf Equipment Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 1759 46 Shuttle 13 4 4100
12x12 Power

Lauf Equipment Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 4608 62.5 Shuttle 27 3 6063
CVT Power

CNH America LLC Case |H 50 BCUT 40 Reverse 13 4 4349
12x12 Power

CNH America LLC Case IH 75C 65 Shuttle 23 4 5886

Sievers Equipment Co. Case |H Farmall 75C 65 8x8 Power Shuttle 23 4 5886
16x16 Sync

United Procurement LP John Deere 507M Utility Tractor & H260 Loader 60 Reverser 21 5 7850
12x12 Power

Deere & Company John Deere 5075E 61 Reverser 18 3 570
16x16 Power

Deere & Company John Deere 5075M 60 Reverser 21 5 7800

New Holland Agriculture (CNH) PowerStar T4.75 64 8x8 Power Shuttle 23 4 5896




MoDOT

Item #2 PURCHASE Tractors 66 - 85 HP (PTO)

Missouri Department of Transportation

Bid Tabulation of Request 3-130709TV Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award

Base ‘Option Pricing. Std Districts

Vendor Make/Model HP. Price 2a 2b 2c 2d 2e 2f 29 2h 2i 2 2k 2l ARO Provided
Scott's Tractor & Equipment LLC Kubota M100GXDTC 85 $55,105.00 NA NA $98.00 $310.00 | Standard | $758.00 | $730.00 | $300.00 | Standard NA $7,140.00  $790.00 30 NW; KC
Lauf Equipment Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 4609 76 $39.500.00 | -$7.450.00 | -$3,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 Included NA $1,200.00 | $500.00 $835.00 _ $5500.00 _ $935.00 | 60-90 ALL
Lauf Equipment Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 4610 84 $41,900.00 | -$7,450.00 | -$3,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 Included NA $1,200.00 | $500.00 NA $835.00 | $5,500.00 | $1,150.00 | 60-90 ALL
Lauf Equipment Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 5609 Classic 70 $55,500.00 NA -$4,900.00 $1.00 $1.00 $360.00 | $1,225.00| $775.00 | $550.00 | $305.00 | $4,600.00 $5,600.00  $985.00 | 90-120 ALL
Lauf Equipment Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 5610 Classic 75 $57,000.00 NA -$4,900.00 $1.00 $1.00 $360.00 | $1,225.00| $775.00 | $550.00 | $305.00 | $4,600.00 $5,600.00  $985.00 | 90-120 ALL
Lauf Equipment Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 5611 Classic 80 $62,000.00 NA -$4,900.00 $1.00 $1.00 $360.00 | $1,250.00| $775.00 | $500.00 | $305.00 | $4,600.00 $5,600.00  $985.00 | 90-120 ALL
CNH America, LLC Case IH 85C 70 $41,823.88 | -$5105.10 | -$2558.56 $284.90 $438.90 | $377.30 | $488.95 | $1,323.00 | InBase NA $1,008.70 $6,144.60 Included 180 ALL
CNH America, LLC Case IH 95C 82 $43,277.21 | -$5105.10 | -$2558.56 $284.90 $438.900 | $377.30 | $488.95 | $1,323.00 | $100.00 NA $1,008.70 $6,144.60 Included 180 ALL
Sievers Equipment Co. Case IH Farmall 85C 70 $43,601.00 | -$5,500.00 | -$2,100.00 $375.00 $395.00 | $350.00 | $450.00 | $1,150.00 - $520.00 | $910.00  $5200.00 Included 180 NE; CD; SL; SE
Deere & Company. John Deere 5085M 70 $49,796.70 | -$7,355.16 | -$5.909.76 $130.98 $176.42 | $1,175.23 | $100.62 | $1,949.51 | $44227 | $264.63 | $2:313.36 $5120.12  $934.65 | 60-180 ALL
Deere & Company. John Deere 5100M 85 $55,974.15 | -$7,417.26 | -$6.428.16 $130.98 $176.42 | $1,175.23 | $100.62 | $1,949.51 | $44227 | $264.63 | $2:313.36 $5120.12 $934.65 | 60-180 ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T4.85 70 $46,862.00 | -$6,870.00 | -$3,735.00 | $414;$562;$711 | $433.00 | $372.00 | $483.00 | $650.00 | Standard | $566.00 | $996.00 $5799.00 lIncluded | 30-180 ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T4.95 82 $48,549.00 | -$6,870.00 | -$3,735.00 | $414;$562;$711 | $433.00 | $372.00 | $483.00 | $650.00 | Standard | $566.00 | $996.00 $5799.00 lIncluded | 30-180 ALL
United LP John Deere 5085 and H260 loader 70 $58,210.00




MoDOT

Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-130709TV Purchase Tractors
Multiple Award

ltem #2 Purchase Tractors 66 - 86 HP (PTO)

Tractor Data Sheet

Fuel Capacity Engine
Vendor Make/Model HP Transmission (Gallons) (Cylinders) | Weight (Ibs)

Scott's Tractor & Equipment LLC Kubota M100GXDTC 85 16x16 50 4 8965
12x12 Power

Lauf Equipment Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 4609 76 Shuttle 27 3 6835
12x12 Power

Lauf Equipment Co., Inc Massey Ferguson 4610 84 Shuttle 27 3 6945
16x16 Power

Lauf Equipment Co., Inc Massey Ferguson 5609 Classic 70 Shuttle 42 3 8978
16x16 Power

Lauf Equipment Co., Inc Massey Ferguson 5610 Classic 75 Shuttle 42 3 8978
16x16 Power

Lauf Equipment Co., Inc Massey Ferguson 5611 Classic 80 Shuttle 49 4 10000
12x12 Power

CNH America, LLC Case IH 85C 70 Shuttle 30 4 7977
12x12 Power

CNH America, LLC Case IH 95C 82 Shuttle 30 4 7977
12x12 Power

Sievers Equipment Co. Case IH Farmall 85C 70 Shuttle 30 4 6947
16x16 Power

Deere & Company John Deere 5085M 70 Reverser 36 4 8500
16x16 Power

Deere & Company John Deere 5100M 85 Reverser 36 4 8700
12x12 Power

New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T4.85 70 Shuttle 30 4 7055
12x12 Power

New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T4.95 82 Shuttle 30 4 7055
16x16 Sync

United Procurement LP John Deere 5085 and H260 loader 70 Reverser 21 5 7800




MODOT

Item #3 PURCHASE Tractors 86 - 145 HP (PTO)

Bid Tabulation of Request 3-130709TV Purchase Tractors

Missouri Department of Transportation

Multiple Award

Base St | Districts
Vendor MakelModel HP Price ARO_| Provided|
Scott's Tractor & Equipment LLC Kubota M110GXDTC 95 | $50.75000 NA NA NA 598,00 $310.00 $758.00 | $300.00 | Standard | $730.00 NA_ $714000 $72500 87500 | 30 | nwikc
Laut nc. Massey Ferquson 5612 Classic 90 | $6650000 NA -$4,900.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1250.00| $50000 | $325.00 | $1.000.00| $4.600.00 _$5,60000 $1,325.00 $1,650.00| 90-120 | ALL
Laut Inc. Massey Ferquson 5613 Classic 100 | $69.500.00 NA -$4,900.00 $1.00 $1.00 $125000| $50000 | $32500 | $1.000.00| $4.600.00 | $6,60000 | $1.325.00 s1.65000| 90-120 | ALL
Laut nc. Massey Classicoynaa | 110 | $72.90000 NA NA $1.00 $1.00 $1250.00| $50000 | included | $850.00 | $4.600.00 $6,65000 $1,350.00 $1,90000| 90-120 | ALL
Laut Inc. Massey Classicbynal | 115 | $76.00000 NA NA $1200.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1250.00| $50000 | included | $850.00 | $4.600.00 $6,65000 $1.350.00 $1.900.00| 90-120 | ALL
Laut nc. Massey Ferquson 6615 Deluxe Cut 110 | $88.500.00 NA NA $579.00 $1.00 $1.00 Included | $550.00 | included | $08500 | $4375.00 $6,65000 $1,350.00 $1,90000| 90-120 | ALL
Lauf Inc. Massey Ferquson 6616 Classic 125 | $79.900.00 NA NA $1200.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1250.00| $50000 | included | $850.00 | $4.600.00 $6,65000 $1.350.00 $1.900.00| 90-120 | ALL
Lauf Equipment Co., Inc. Massey Ferquson 6616 Deluxe Cut 120 | $91900.00 NA NA $580.00 $1.00 $1.00 Included | $550.00 | included | $98500 | $437500 $6,65000 $1.35000 $1,90000| 90-120 | ALL
Lauf Inc. Massey Ferquson 7614 Classic 110 | $82500.00 NA NA Included $1.00 $1.00 Included | $500.00 | included | $85000 | $4.600.00 $7,20000 $1.330.00 $1.860.00| 90-120 | ALL
CNH America, LLC Case IH 105U 91 | ss166008 NA NA NA NA $458.15 545810 | inBase | inBase | $103950| $1,34365 $6,08680 $896.28 $1,191.00| 180 AL
CNH America, LLC Case IH 105C 91 | s47.48200 | 510510 | $2.95195 NA $284.90 $438.90 488.95 | InBase NA NA | $1,00870 $614460 InBase NA 180 ALL
CNH America, LLC Case IH 115U 98 | $52.74753 NA NA NA NA $458.15 NA InBase | InBase | $1039.00| $134300 $6,08680 $89628  NA 180 AL
CNH America, LLC Case H110A 9 | s5018150 | -s5.261.07 | $3.833.03 | 17004 $99.00 $96.00 $43351 | $20000 | $191.73 | inBase | $1.921.92 $567336 $896.28 $1.101.96| 180 ALL
CNH America, LLC Case IH 120A 96 | ss250262 | -s5261.07 | $383303 | $17099 599,00 596.00 $43351 | InBase | $191.73 | inBase | $102192 $567336  $896.28 $1,19196| 180 AL
CNH America, LLC Case IH 1254 105 | $54366.10 | -$5261.07 | -$3833.03| $170.00 $99.00 $96.00 $43351 | $20000 | $19173 | InBase | $192192 $676363 $896.28 $1,19196| 180 ALL
CNH America, LLC Case IH 140A 115 | se0167.41 | -s526197 | 5383307 | s17094 599,00 596.00 $43351 | $20000 | $191.73 | inBase | $192192 $676368 $896.28 $1,19196| 180 ALL
CNH America, LLC Case IH MX110 90 | $60.733.86 NA NA NA $1.007.00 $788.00 $517.00 | $400.00 | $291.00 | $811.00 | $1.485.00 $9.467.00 $1.585.00 $2.212.00| 180 ALL
CNH America, LLC Case IH MX1115 95 | s6230808 NA NA $7.355.00 $1,007.00 $788.00 $517.00 | $40000 | $291.00 | $81100 | $148500 $9.467.00 $1,585.00 $2212.00| 180 AL
CNH America, LLC Case IH MX120 100 | s63572.00 NA NA NA $1.007.00 $788.00 $517.00 | $400.00 | $291.00 | $811.00 | $1.485.00 $9.467.00 $1.585.00 $2.212.00| 180 ALL
CNH America, LLC Case IH MX125 105 | $6414426 NA NA $7.355.00 $1,007.00 $788.00 $517.00 | $40000 | $291.00 | $81100 | $148500 $9.467.00 $1,585.00 $2212.00| 180 AL
CNH America, LLC Case IH MX140 120 | s7032113 NA NA $7.355.00 $1.007.00 $788.00 $517.00 | $400.00 | $291.00 | $811.00 | $1.485.00 $9.467.00 $1.585.00 $2.212.00| 180 ALL
ievers Equipment Case IH Farmall 1208 96 | s4845800 | -$5550.00 | -$4000.00 | $222.00 $1150.00 $550.00 $40000 | $25000 | $180.00 | $1.350.00| $1.77500 $614600 $1,05000 $975.00 | 180 AL
S&H Farm Supply, inc. New Holland TS6.110 90 | $51.46000 | -$6.800.00 | -$3.600.00 | $180.00 $95.00 $100.00 $440.00 | $125.00 | $200.00 NA | $1,60000 $0710.00 $122500 $210000| 120 | SwisE
S&H Farm Supply, Inc. New Holland TS6.120 96 | $5252000 | -$6800.00 | -$3.600.00 | $180.00 595,00 $100.00 $44000 | $125.00 | $200.00 NA | $1,60000 $971000 $122500 $210000| 120 | SW:SE
S&H Farm Supply, inc. New Holland TS6.125 105 | $57.110.00 | -$6:800.00 | -$6.00000 | $180.00 $90.00 $100.00 $440.00 | $125.00 | $200.00 NA | $1,60000 $0710.00 $122500 $210000| 120 | sw:SE
S&H Farm Supply, Inc. New Holland TS6.140 115 | $6120000 | -$6,800.00 | -$6,000.00 | $18000 590,00 $100.00 $44000 | $125.00 | $200.00 NA | $1,60000 $971000 $122500 $210000| 120 | SW:SE
Deere & Company John Deere 6105M 86 | $70.01365 | 5028380 | $8.00052 | $3.442.80 $122.89 $101.44 $621.68 | $246.24 | included NA | $2,08212 $7.42292 $93465 $2.079.13| 60-180 | ALL
Deere & Compan John Deere 6105R 86 | s77.00804 NA -$7.816.36 | $6.250.36 $12289 $376.20 $64064 | $24624 | included | $1670.48| $342456 $7.42292 593465 $2,07913| 60-180 | ALL
Deere & Company John Deere 6115M 95 | $7311732 | 5020208 | $8.00052 | $3.442.80 $122.89 $101.44 $621.68 | $246.24 | included NA | $2,04212 $742292 $93465 $2.079.13| 60-180 | ALL
Deere & Compan John Deere 6125M 102 | $7738852 | 5920208 | $8.00052 | $3442.80 $12289 $10144 $621.68 | $246.24 | included NA | $204212 $742202 $93465 $2.079.13| 60-180 | ALL
Deere & Company John Deere 6125 101 | ss555168 -$7.816.60 | $6.250.36 $122.89 $376.20 $64068 | $246.24 | included | $1.670.48| $342456 $7.42292 $934.65 $207913| 60-180 | ALL
Deere & Compan Johm Deere 6140M 114 | $8492336 | 5920208 | 57.03364 | $1.364.20 $12289 $10144 $621.68 | $246.24 | included NA | $204212 $790020 $126654 $2,079.13| 60-180 | ALL
Deere & Company John Deere 6140R 111 | sos.82160 NA -$7.096.64 | $17.830.36 $122.89 $863.36 $64068 | Included | included | $649.04 | $342456 $6701.68 $1.26654 $2079.13| 60-180 | ALL
Deere & Compan John Deere 6150M 123 | $90.44604 | -s8.664.00 | s8.49148 | $3222.40 $12289 $10144 $621.68 | $246.24 | included NA | $204212 $790020 $126654 $2,079.13| 60-180 | ALL
Deere & Compan John Deere 6150R 120 | s105708.72 NA -$7.70032 | $16463.88 $122.80 $863.36 $64068 | Included | included | $64904 | $342456 $3.42456 $1.26654 $2079.13| 60-180 | ALL
Deere & Compan John Deere 5115M 100 | 6284727 NA NA NA $13098 $176.42 370352 | $442.07 | $264.63 NA | $126061 $512012 $93465 $1984.66| 60180 | ALL
Deere & Compan John Deere 6170M 12 | $0057232 NA -$8.207.24 | $1.171.92 $122.80 $101.44 $399.76 | $246.24 | included NA | $2,04212 $790020 $1457.98 $2.079.13| 60-180 | ALL
Deere & Compan John Deere 6170R 140 | s116600.42 NA -$8.200.52 | $14,490.02 $120.89 $863.36 $411.92 | included | included | $64004 _$342456 $6,701.68 $1.45798 $2.07013| 60-180 | ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T4.105 91 | $5038000 | -$6870.00 | -$3.735.00| $175.00 $414; $562; $711 $433.00 $483.00 | Standard | $566.00 | $608.00 | $996.00 | $5.799.00 | included | $266.00 | 30-180 | ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T4.115 98 | $5206800 | -$6870.00 | -$3.735.00| $175.00 $414: $562. 5711 $433.00 $483.00 | Standard | $566.00 | $60800 | $996.00 | $5.799.00 | included | $266.00 | 30-180 | ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T6.140 9 | $6295000 NA NA $6.736.00 | $671,$1046, $1704 $712.00 $305.00 | $30400 | $263.00 | $731.00 | $2.462.00 | $7,656.00 | $1,034.00] $1,090.00] 30-180 | ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T6.150 100 | $65395.00 NA NA $6.736.00 | $671,$1046, $1704 $712.00 $305.00 | $30400 | $263.00 | $73100 | $2.462.00 | $7.656.00 | $1,034.00] $1,000.00| 30-180 | ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T6.160 110 | $67.820.00 NA NA $6.736.00 | $671$1046, $1704 $712.00 $305.00 | $304.00 | $263.00 | $731.00 | $2.462.00 | $7,656.00 | $1,034.00| s1,000.00] 30-180 | ALl
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T6.155 95 | $64,636.00 NA NA $6.736.00 | $671,$1046, $1704 $712.00 $305.00 | $30400 | $263.00 | $731.00 | $2.462.00 | $7.656.00 | $1,034.00] $1,000.00| 30-180 | ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T6.165 105 | $60.170.00 NA NA $6.736.00 | $671$1046, $1704 $712.00 $305.00 | $304.00 | $263.00 | $731.00 | $2.462.00 | $7,656.00 | $1,034.00| s1,000.00] 30-180 | ALl
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T6.175 120 | $7463500 NA NA $6.736.00 | $671,$1046, $1704 $712.00 $305.00 | $30400 | $263.00 | $73100 | $2.462.00 | $7.656.00 | $1,034.00] $1,000.00| 30-180 | ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T7.170 100 | $83011.00 NA NA $5.906.00 $1019;$1661 $604.00 $538.00 | $206.00 | Standard | $732.00 | $1.845.00 | $8.487.00 | $1,034.00] $1,009.00] 30-180 | ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T7.185. 115 | $89.922.00 NA NA $5.906.00 $1019; 51661 $694.00 $538.00 | $20600 | Standard | $732.00 | $1.845.00 | $8.487.00 | $1,034.00 $1,000.00| 30-180 | ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T7.200 130 | $06.833.00 NA NA $5.906.00 $1019;$1661 $604.00 $538.00 | $206.00 | Standard | $732.00 | $1.845.00 | $8.487.00 | $1,034.00] $1,000.00] 30-180 | ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T7.210. 140 | $101,440.00 NA NA $5.906.00 $1019; 51661 $694.00 $538.00 | $20600 | Standard | $73200 | $1.845.00 | $8.487.00 | $1,034.00 $1,000.00| 30-180 | ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland TS6.110 9 | $4812000 | -$6667.00 | $4726.00 | $16000 | $820:81172:$1284 | $568:51135:5046 | $428.00 | $25000 | $189.00 | included | $1,660.00 | $7,117.00| $975.00 | $1.176.00| 30-180 | ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland TS6.120 96 | $4924600 | -s6667.00 | $4726.00 | $16000 | $820:51172:31284 | $568:51135:3046 | $428.00 | $25000 | $189.00 | included | $1660.00 | $7,117.00 | so75.00 | s1.076.00| 30-180 | ALl
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland TS6.125 105 | $53541.00 | -$6667.00 | 472600 | $160.00 | $820:51172:51284 | $568:51135:5946 | $428.00 | $250.00 | $189.00 | Included | $1,66000 | $7,.805.00 | $975.00 | $1.176.00] 30-180 | ALL
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland TS6.140 115 | $57801.00 | -56667.00 | 5472600 | $160.00 | $820:81172:81284 | $568:51135:5046 | 342800 | $250.00 | $189.00 | Included | $1,660.00 | $7,805.00 | $975.00 | $1176.00| 30-180 | ALL
United Procurement LP John Deere 6140M and H310 loader 114 | $109,006.00




MoDOT

Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-130709TV Purchase Tractors
Multiple Award

Iltem #3 Purchase Tractors 86 - 145 HP (PTO)

Tractor Data Sheet

Fuel Capacity Engine
Vendor Make/Model HP Transmission (Gallons) (Cylinders) | Weight (Ibs)
Scott's Tractor & Equipment LLC Kubota M110GXDTC 95 16x16 50 4 9050
16x16 power
Lauf Equipment Co., Inc. Massey Ferguson 5612 Classic 90 shuttle 49 4 10300
16x16 power
Lauf Equipment Co., Inc Massey Ferguson 5613 Classic 100 shuttle 49 4 10500
16x16 power
Lauf Equipment Co., Inc Massey Ferguson 6615 Classic Dyna 4 110 shuttle 61 4 12000
24x24 power
Lauf Equipment Co., Inc Massey Ferguson 6615 Classic Dyna L 115 shuttle 61 4 12500
Lauf Equipment Co., Inc Massey Ferguson 6615 Deluxe Cut 110 CVT 61 4 14000
24x24 power
Lauf Equipment Co., Inc Massey Ferguson 6616 Classic 125 shuttle 61 4 12500
Lauf Equipment Co., Inc Massey Ferguson 6616 Deluxe Cut 120 CVT 61 4 14000
16x16 power
Lauf Equipment Co., Inc Massey Ferguson 7614 Classic 110 shuttle 82 6 15060
12x12 power
CNH America, LLC Case |H 105U 91 shuttle 40 4 9370
12x12 power
CNH America, LLC Case |H 105C 91 shuttle 40 4 7937
12x12 power
CNH America, LLC Case |H 115U 98 shuttle 40 4 9370
CNH America, LLC Case |IH 110 A 90 8x8 power shuttle 40 4 9348
CNH America, LLC Case |H 120A 96 8x8 power shuttle 40 4 9524
X 8x8 power shuttle 62 6 10406
CNH America, LLC Case |H 125A 105
X 16x8 power shuttle 62 6 10406
CNH America, LLC Case |H 140A 115
. 16x16 power 26 2 11300
CNH America, LLC Case |H MX110 90 shuttle
. 16x16 power 60 6 12500
CNH America, LLC Case |H MX1115 95 shuttle
. 16x16 semi power 26 2 11300
CNH America, LLC Case |H MX120 100 shuttle
. 16x16 power 60 6 12500
CNH America, LLC Case |H MX125 105 shuttle
. 16x16 semi power 60 6 12500
CNH America, LLC Case |H MX140 120 shuttle
. . 8x8 power shuttle 40 4 9524
Sievers Equipment Co. Case I|H Farmall 120A 96
8x8 power shuttle 39 4 8847
S&H Farm Supply, Inc. New Holland TS6.110 90
8x8 power shuttle 39 4 8846
S&H Farm Supply, Inc. New Holland TS6.120 96
8x8 power shuttle 62 6 9288
S&H Farm Supply, Inc. New Holland TS6.125 105
8x8 power shuttle 62 6 9288
S&H Farm Supply, Inc. New Holland TS6.140 115
16x16 power quad 58 2 11486
Deere & Company John Deere 6105M 86 plus
16x16 power quad 58 2 11990
Deere & Company John Deere 6105R 86 plus
16x16 power quad 58 2 11486
Deere & Company John Deere 6115M 95 plus
16x16 power quad 58 2 11519
Deere & Company John Deere 6125M 102 plus




16x16 power quad

58 11990
Deere & Company John Deere 6125R 101 plus
16x16 power quad % 12200
Deere & Company Johm Deere 6140M 114 plus
16x16 power quad 05 13580
Deere & Company John Deere 6140R 111 plus
16x16 power quad 04 13073
Deere & Company John Deere 6150M 123 plus
16x16 power quad 05 13657
Deere & Company John Deere 6150R 120 plus
16x16 power 47 8700
Deere & Company John Deere 5115M 100 reverser
16x16 power quad 107 15664
Deere & Company John Deere 6170M 142 plus
16x16 power quad 95 17200
Deere & Company John Deere 6170R 140 plus
_ 12x12 power 30 7055
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T4.105 91 shuttle
_ 12x12 power 30 7055
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T4.115 98 shuttle
. . 46 10560
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T6.140 90 16x16 ElectroShift
. . 46 10560
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T6.150 100 16x16 ElectroShift
46 10560
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T6.160 110 16x16 ElectroShift
60 10604
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T6.155 95 16x16 ElectroShift
60 10604
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T6.165 105 16x16 ElectroShift
60 10979
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland 76.175 120 16x16 ElectroShift
. 18x6 Range 71 12667
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T7.170 100 Command
. 18x6 Range 71 12667
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T7.185 115 Command
. 1846 Range 87 13118
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T7.200 130 Command
. 1846 Range 87 13118
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland T7.210 140 Command
) 8x8 power shuttle 39 9347
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland TS6.110 90
) 8x8 power shuttle 39 9524
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland TS6.120 96
) 8x8 power shuttle 62 10405
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland TS6.125 105
) 8x8 power shuttle 62 10405
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) New Holland TS6.140 115
. 24x24 power 76 12200
United Procurement LP John Deere 6140M and H310 loader 114 shuttle




VENDOR INFORMATION

Name:
Contact name:
Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Email address:

Name:
Contact name:
Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Email address:

Name:
Contact name:
Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Email address:

Name:
Contact name:
Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Email address:

Deere & Company
Tamara Hebert

2000 John Deere Run
Cary, NC 27513
800-358-5010
gnsbhids@johndeere.com

S&H Farm Supply, Inc.

Chris LaGrange

6959 E US Hwy. 60

Rogersville, MO 65742
417-865-5252
chris.lagrange@shfarmsupply.com

Lauf Equipment Co.

Terrance LePage

541 W. Hwy. 94

Jefferson City, MO 65101
573-635-6836
laufequipment@embargmail.com

United Procurement LP

Nancy Woods

725 Locust Drive

Oakleaf, TX 75154
469-218-0110
nwoods@unitedprocurement.net
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Multiple Award

VENDOR INFORMATION

Name:
Contact name:
Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Email address:

Name:
Contact name:
Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Email address:

Name:
Contact name:
Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Email address:

Name:
Contact name:
Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Email address:

Scott's Tractor & Equipment LLC
David Olson

112 NE 92 Hwy

Smithville, MO 64089
816-532-8288
daveo@scottstractor.com

CNH America LLC

Patricia Lardie

700 State Street

Racine, W1 53404
608-444-5349
patricia.lardie@caseih.com

Sievers Equipment Co.
Mark Sievers

406 N. Old Route 66
Hamel, IL 62046
618-633-2622

mark.sievers@sieversequipment.com

New Holland Agriculture (CNH)
Wayne Crow

500 Diller Ave.

New Holland, PA 17557
717-355-1683
wayne.crow@newholland.com
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ITEM 1:
Option la:
Option 1b:
Option 1c:
Option 1d:
Option 1e:
Option 1f:
Option 1g:
Option 1h:
Option 1i:
Option 1;j:

ITEM 2:
Option 2a:

Option 2b:
Option 2c:
Option 2d:
Option 2e:
Option 2f:
Option 2g:
Option 2h:
Option 2i:

Option 2j:

Option 2k:
Option 2I:

ITEM 3:
Option 3a:

Option 3b:
Option 3c:
Option 3d:
Option 3e:
Option 3f:
Option 3g:
Option 3h:
Option 3i:
Option 3;j:

Option 3k:

Option 3I:
Option 3m:

OPTIONS PAGE

Cab and AC

AM/FM Radio

2WD (w/ locking differential) in lieu of 4WD (Credit)
Front Weights - Lbs. per weight
Rear Weights - Lbs. per weight
Front Fender Option - 4WD Only

3rd hydraulic valve

Engine block heater

Quick Attach Loader w/o bucket (Loader must be same brand as tractor)
Recommended Quick Attach bucket for loader. Length:

Deduct Cab and A/C - Open Operator Station, including (ROPS)

with canopy, seat belt and swivel seat. ROPS shall meet the SAE
Standard J334a-1970 and J167-1970 (deduct)

2WD (w/ locking differential) in lieu of 4WD (deduct)

Front Weights - Lbs. per weight
Rear Weights - Lbs. per weight
540/1000 RPM PTO in lieu of 540 RPM PTO

Front Fender Option

3" hydraulic valve

AM/FM Radio

Rear windshield wiper and rear washer fluid applicator

(Loader prep. pkg. will be used to operate front mounted snow plow)
Loader prep pkg. (including dual mid-valves w/ joystick control)
(Loader must be same brand as tractor)

Heavy Duty Quick Attach self-leveling loader w/o bucket
Recommended Quick Attach bucket for loader. Length:

Deduct Cab and A/C - Open Operator Station, including (ROPS)
with canopy, seat belt and swivel seat. ROPS shall meet the SAE
Standard J334a-1970 and J167-1970 (deduct)

2WD (w/ locking differential) in lieu of 4WD (deduct)

High ground speed transmission. Specify:
Front Weights - Lbs. per weight
Rear Weights - Lbs. per weight
Front Fender Option

AM/FM Radio

Rear windshield wiper and rear washer fluid applicator

4th hydraulic valve

Loader prep pkg. (including dual mid-valves w/ joystick control)
(Loader prep. pkg. will be used to operate front mounted snow plow)
Heavy Duty quick attach self-leveling loader w/o bucket

(Loader must be same brand as tractor)

Recommended HD Quick Attach bucket for loader. Length:
Recommended Quick Attach high capacity bucket. Cu/Yd:




r~1 DT > 1

Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation for Request 3-130709TV Purchase Tractors

% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options

Deere & Company 19% on units in Item #1 and #2. 24% on all units in Iltem #3 (except JD 5115M is 19%).

Scott's Tractor & Equipment LLC 15%

S&H Farm Supply, Inc. 25%

CNH America LLC 30% on units in Iltem #1 and #2. 30% on all Item #3 models (except 110A, 120A, 125A and 140A are 25%).
Lauf Equipment Co. 10%

Sievers Equipment Co. 28% on units in Item #1 and #2.  25% on units in Item #3.

United Procurement LP 0%

New Holland Agriculture (CNH) 22% on units in Item #1, 24% on units in Item #2.

For Item #3, Models T4.105, T4.115, TS6.110, TS6.120, TS6.125 and TS6.140 are 24%.
Models T6.140, T6.150, T6.160, T6.155, T6.165, T6.175, T7.170, T7.185, T7.200 and T7.210 are 29%.
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Additional Options

Vendor Optional Training  First On-Site Maintenance Diagnostic Software
S&H Farm Supply - New Holland $1,000 per session $350 No Bid
Sievers Equipment Company - Case IH No Bid See comment No Bid
United Procurement LP No Bid No Bid No Bid
CNH America - Case |H $700 per student $900 No Bid
Lauf Equipment $150 per student $150 No Bid
Scott's Tractor & Equipment LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Deere & Company No Bid $500 $1,500

$4,900 with lap top; $2,392 without lap
New Holland Agriculture (CNH) $250.00 Varies by dealer top



Vendor

Sievers Equipment Co - Case IH

S&H Farm Supply - New Holland
Deere & Company
CNH America - Case IH
Lauf Equipment - Massey Ferguson
Scott's Tractor & Equipment LLC
New Holland Agriculture (CNH)
United Procurement LP

Co-Op Agreement

Is this price offered to Missouri Co-Op's

Yes

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
No

Delivery Charge
Free with 75 miles of St Peters, MO

$3 per mile over 75 miles from St Peters, MO
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