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Bid Tabulation of Request 3-120621RJ Motorgraders

Opened on 06/21/12
Multiple Award

VENDOR INFORMATION

Tri-State Construction Equipment:
Kevin Smyser:

6787 County Road 312

Palmyra, MO 63461

573-769-2274
kevinsmyser@meoi.com

Yes

Murphy Tractor

James F. Levy

8600 NE Parvin Rd.
Kansas City, MO 64161
816-483-5000
jlevy@murphytractor.com
Yes

Erb Equipment Co.

Tim smith

200 Erb Industrial Dr.
Fenton, MO 63026
636-349-0200
timsmith@erbequipment.com
Yes

G. W. Van Keppel Co.
Steven Phillips

1801 N. 9th St.

Kansas City, KS 66101
913-281-4800
sphillips@vankeppel.com

Yes

Fabick Cat Co.

Chris Burns

One Fabick Dr.

Fenton, MO 63026
636-680-1309
chris.burns@fabickcat.com
No

Luby Equipment

Jerry Jansen

2300 Cassens Dr.

Fenton MO. 63026
217-222-5454
jlansen@Iubyequipment.com
Yes

Altorfer, Inc.

Chris Akright

3520 Moberly
Hannibal, MO 63401
573-221-8600
cakright@altorfer.com

Yes
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-120621RJ Motorgraders
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Multiple Award

Item #1 - Outright purchase of an articulated 6x4 motograder with dual/variable HP - (140-185)

Vendor
Altorfer Inc
Erb Equipment Co., Inc.
Luby Equipment Service
Murphy Tractor & Equipment
Fabick Cat
Tri-State Construction

G.W. Van Keppel Co.

Make/Model
Caterpillar 120M2
John Deere 670G

Case 845B
John Deere 670G
Caterpillar 120M2
John Deere 670G

Volvo G930B

Base Price
$187,067.00
$190,270.00
$193,200.00
$188,500.00
$184,067.00
$187,000.00

$169,954.00

HP
145-189
160-195
140-160
160-195
145-189
160-195

160-208

Make/Model
Option 1

Caterpillar 140M2
John Deere 770G
Case 865B
John Deere 770G
Caterpillar 140M2
John Deere 770G

Volvo G940B

Item #3 -Outright Purchase of Heavy Duty articulated motorgrader 6x4 with dual/variable HP

Vendor
Altorfer, Inc.
Erb Equipment Co., Inc.
Luby Equipment Service
Murphy Tractor & Equipment
Fabick Cat
Tri-State Construction

G.W. Van Keppel Co.

Training

Altorfer, Inc.

Erb Equipment Co., Inc.
Luby Equipment Service
Murphy Tractor & Equipment
Fabick Cat

Tri-State Construction

G.W. Van Keppel Co.

Make/Model
Caterpillar 120M2 AWD
John Deere 672G
Case 865B AWD
John Deere 672G
Caterpillar 120M2 AWD
John Deere 672G

No Bid

12 Hour Basic Operation

Base Price
$210,117.00
$200,760.00
$226,000.00
$202,500.00
$210,117.00

$199,500.00

Optional Software

And Diagnostics

Price Per Set

$750.00

$350.00

$250.00

$350.00

$250.00

$350.00

NA

$1001/Software - $745/yr
$1,400.00
NA
$1,400.00
$1,826.00
$2,300.00

NA

HP
153-209
175-195
178-205
165-195
153-209

175-195

Make/Model
Option 1

Caterpillar 140M2 AWD
John Deere 772G
Case 885B AWD
John Deere 772G

Caterpillar 140M2 AWD
John Deere 772G

Volvo G946B

Optional Maintenance

Vendor to Perform First

Scheduled On-Site
Maintenance

$632.00
$1,500.00
$550.00
Included
$632.00
Included

$800.00

Base Price
Option 1

$220,557.00
$186,700.00
$202,000.00
$186,000.00
$220,557.00
$183,000.00

$188,743.00

Base Price
Option 1

$248,138.00
$212,460.00
$237,500.00
$211,000.00
$248,138.00
$207,000.00

$205,648.00

HP
103-243

170-245

178-205
170-245
193-243
170-245

196-232

HP
202-263
202-250
205-219
205-265
202-263
202-250

223-264

Option 2 Option 3 Option 4 Option 5
$24,000.00  $25,000.00  $1,638.00 N/A
$22,000.00  $23,200.00 $925.00 $790.00
$19,750.00  $20,500.00 STD $1,000.00
$18,500.00  $18,950.00 $900.00 $860.00
$24,000.00  $25,000.00  $1,638.00 NA
$18,500.00  $18,950.00 $900.00 $860.00
$17,929.00  $18,636.00  $1,473.00  $1,151.00
Option 2 Option 3 Option 4 Option 5
$24,000.00  $25000.00  $1,638.00 N/A
$22,000.00  $23,100.00 $935.00 $625.00
$19,750.00  $20,500.00 STD $1,000.00
$18,800.00  $19,250.00 $900.00 $860.00
$24,000.00  $25000.00  $1,638.00 NA
$18,800.00  $19,250.00 $925.00 $876.00
$17,929.00  $18636.00  $1,473.00  $1,151.00
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AR

120-180 days
45 days
90-150 days
30-90 days
120-180 days
30-90 days

90-120 days

ARO
120-180 days
45 days
90-150 days
30-90 days
120-180 days
30-90 days

90-120 days

Districts
NE
SL, SE
NE, SL, SE
NW, KC, SW
NE, CD, SL, SW, SE
NE, CD

NW, KC, CD, SW

Districts
NE
SL, SE
NE, SL, SE
NW, KC, SW
NE, CD, SL, SW, SE
NE, CD

NW, KC, CD, SW

39%
25%

40%

25%
39%
25%

30%

MSRP
39%
25%
40%
25%
39%
25%

30%
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Item # 2 - Straight Lease For Light Duty Articulated Motograder 6X4 with dual/variable HP (140-185)

End of Lease

Vendors Make & Model HP. 12 Month Oveage/Hr 12Month  Overage/Mr Purchase Price Option2  Option3 Option 4
300 Hours 500 Hours Base Unit/Option 1

Altorfer, Inc. NO BID
Erb Equipment Co., Inc. John Deere 670G 160195  $2,601.75 $34.10 $2,987.29 $34.10 $160,150.00 $636.60 $671.32 $629.00
Luby Equipment Senvice Case 8458 140160 $16,581.82 $28.00 $16,581.82 $28.00 $1.00 $1695.10  $1,759.47  In Base Unit
Murphy Tractor & Equipment John Deere 670G 160195  $2,350.00 $35.00 $2,750.00 $35.00 $160,000.00 $535.00 $550.00 $26.00
Fabick Cat NO BID
Tri-State Construction John Deere 670G 160195  $2,345.36 $34.10 $2,730.34 $34.10 $159,909.48 $535.32 $548.34 $26.04
G.W. Van Keppel Co. Volvo G930B 160-208 No Bid No Bid $1,828.09 $6.00 $157,000.00 $3344.24  $3404.03  $1,952.65

Item # 2A - Straight Lease For Light Duty Articulated Motograder 6X4 with dual/variable HP (165-215)
End of Lease

Vendors Make & Model HP. 12 Month Oveage/Hr 12Month  Overage/r Burchase Price Option2  Option 3 Option 4
300 Hours 500 Hours Base Unit/Option 1

Altorfer, Inc. NO BID
Erb Equipment Co., Inc. John Deere 770G 170245 $1,251.36 $36.30 $1,666.91 $36.30 $172,591.00 $630.81 $671.32 $23.09
Luby Equipment Senvice Case 8658 178205 $17,337.11 $28.00 $17,337.11 $28.00 $1.00 $1695.09  $1,759.46  In Base Unit
Murphy Tractor & Equipment John Deere 770G 170-245 $955.00 $37.00 $1,375.00 $37.00 $174,500.00 $530.00 $545.00 $15.00
Fabick Cat NO BID
Tri-State Construction John Deere 770G 170-245 $954.05 $36.30 $1,369.11 $36.30 $172,405.16 $529.53 $542.55 $15.05
G.W. Van Keppel Co. Volvo G940B 196232 No Bid No Bid $2,462.65 $6.00 $169,000.00 $3978.81  $403859  $2,587.22

Item # 4 - Straight Lease Heavy Duty 6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader with dualivariable HP (165-185)
End of Lease

12 Month OveagelHr 12Month  Overager Purchase Price Option2  Option 3 Option 4
Vendors Make & Model He 300 Hours 500 Hours Base Unit/Option 1

Altorfer, Inc. NO BID
Erb Equipment Co., Inc. John Deere 672G 175195 $2,498.08 $37.40 $2,906.13 $37.40 $171,983.00 $636.60 $649.52 $26.29
Luby Equipment Service Case 8658 AWD 178205 $19,396.96 $28.00 $19,396.96 $28.00 $1.00 $1,69510  $1759.47  InBase Unit
Murphy Tractor & Equipment John Deere 672G 165-195  $2,425.00 $38.00 $2,825.00 $38.00 $172,250.00 $530.00 $545.00 $26.00
Fabick Cat NO BID
Tri-State Construction John Deere 672G 175195  $2,411.98 $37.40 $2,819.46 $37.40 $171,739.62 $528.61 $541.26 $26.00
G.W. Van Keppel Co. NO BID

Item # 4A - Straight Lease Heavy Duty 6WD articulated 6x6 motorgrader with dual/variable HP (185-230)
End of Lease

12 Month Oveage/Hr 12Month  Overage/Hr Purchase Price Option2  Option 3 Option 4
Vendors Make & Model HP 300 Hours 500 Hours Base Unit/Option 1

Altorfer, Inc. NO BID
Erb Equipment Co., Inc. John Deere 772G 202250  $1,042.69 $42.68 $1,519.58 $42.68 $201,014.00 $590.47 $649.52 $15.75
Luby Equipment Senvice Case 8858 AWD 205219 $20,383.99 $28.00 $20,383.99 $28.00 $1.00 $1695.09  $1,759.46 In Base Unit
Murphy Tractor & Equipment John Deere 772G 205-265 $610.00 $44.00 $1,080.00 $44.00 $200,800.00 $515.00 $530.00 $15.00
Fabick Cat NO BID
Tri-State Construction John Deere 772G 202250 $601.30 $42.68 $1,077.65 $42.68 $200,769.99 $514.55 $527.21 $14.62
G.W. Van Keppel Co. Volvo G9468 223-264 No Bid No Bid $2,796.01 $6.00 $183,000.00 $431217  $4371.95  $2,920.58

Option §

$537.20
$85.83

$25.00

$24.89

$1,925.42

Option §

$12.01
$85.82

$23.00

$22.72

$2,559.99

Option §

$17.57
$85.83

$25.00

$24.63

Option §

$22.49
$85.82

$23.00

$22.07

$2,893.35
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