3-140214RJ - Dump Trucks
Single Axle Pricing Page

2016-2017 PRICES

SINGLE AXLE PRICE AND INFORMATION Midway Sterling - Midway Sterling - |Navistar Navistar Acceptable |Navistar Navistar Navistar Preferred -|Navistar Navistar Innovative | Truck Centers Inc., | Truck Centers Inc.,
Western Star Western Star Acceptable - - International Acceptable - Preferred - International Preferred - - International Freightliner Freightliner
w/Henderson w/Viking Cives  [International w/Monroe International International w/Monroe International wi/Viking w/Henderson w/Viking Cives

w/Henderson wiViking Cives  [w/Henderson wi/Viking

Single Axle Cab and Chassis $85,596.00 $85,596.00 $70,278.00 $70,278.00 $70,278.00 $70,730.00 $70,730.00 $70,730.00 $78,797.00 $81,716.08 $81,716.08

Single Axle Corten V-Style Long Sill Dump Body $48,048.00 $45,582.65 $48,048.00 $54,445.50 $45,582.65 $48,048.00 $54,445.50 $45,582.65 $45,273.65 $46,252.15 $45,629.00

Single Axle Stainless Steel I-Beam Long Sill dump Body $50,354.00 $47,745.65 $50,354.00 $58,456.70 $47,725.05 $50,354.00 $58,456.70 $47,725.05 $48,471.80 $47,771.40

Single Axle Extended Warranty Option #1 $4,058.00 $4,058.00 $2,419.00 $2,419.00 $2,419.00 $2,419.00 $2,419.00 $2,419.00/Included in Base $2,705.30 $2,626.50

Right and/or Left Hand Wing Plow $9,288.00 $9,105.20 $9,288.00 $9,306.42 $9,009.41 $9,288.00 $9,306.42 $9,009.41 $8,917.74 $9,208.20 $9,105.20

Underbody Scraper (For Crew Cab Only) $11,740.00 $11,093.10 $11,740.00 $11,701.15 $10,996.28 $11,740.00 $11,701.15 $10,996.28 $10,461.71 $11,640.03 $11,093.10

10’ Skid Mounted Material Spreader $9,181.00 $9,481.15 $9,181.00 $10,678.73 $9,481.15 $9,181.00 $10,678.73 $9,481.15 $11,543.00 $9,102.11 $9,481.15

10’ Skid Mounted Material Spreader with Auger $10,017.00 $10,191.85 $10,017.00 $10,785.55 $10,294.85 $10,017.00 $10,785.55 $10,294.85 $11,900.00 $9,932.29 $10,191.85

6 Speed Manual Transmission ($5,338.00) ($5,338.00) ($4,500.00) ($4,500.00) ($4,500.00) ($4,500.00) ($4,500.00) ($4,500.00)|N/A N/A N/A

Pavement Temperature Sensor $1,528.00 $1,412.13 $1,528.00 $1,652.44 $1,412.13 $1,528.00 $1,652.44 $1,412.13 $1,360.63 $1,528.00 $1,412.13

Exhaust Brake Engine Retarder $2,340.00 $2,340.00($430 Exhaust Brake |$430 Exhaust Brake [$430 Exhaust $430 Exhaust $430 Exhaust Brake [$430 Exhaust ~ [$430 Exhaust Brake $1,375.00 $1,375.00

or $805 or $805 Compression |Brake or $805 Brake or $805 or $805 Brake or $805  [or $805
Compression Brake |Brake Compression Compression Compression Brake [Compression Compression Brake
Brake Brake Brake

Automatic Tire Chains $2,039.00 $1,861.21 $2,039.00 $2,246.49 $1,861.21 $2,039.00 $2,246.49 $1,861.21 $1,528.52 $2,021.89 $1,861.21

Dual Steering $0.00 $0.00 $8,490.00 $8,490.00 $8,490.00 $8,490.00 $8,490.00 $8,490.00 $8,490.00 $9,446.00 $9,446.00

Dump Body Vibrator $976.00 $821.94 $976.00 $874.18 $821.94 $976.00 $874.18 $821.94 $529.42 $967.17 $821.94

Left-/Right-hand Truck Mounted Attenuator Pockets $917.00 $370.80 $917.00 $190.75 $370.80 $917.00 $190.75 $370.80 $211.15 $909.49 $370.80

Cummins ISL9 Engine $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00{STD STD STD

Bluetooth Hands-free Technology $309.00 $309.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $156.00 $156.00

Passenger Door Peep Window $178.00 $178.00 $875.00 $875.00 $875.00 $875.00 $875.00 $875.00 $875.00 $160.00 $160.00

Tank Heater $464.00 $464.00 $710.00 $710.00 $710.00 $710.00 $710.00 $710.00{Included in Base N/A N/A

Removal of Base Pre-Wet System from base unit ($2,155.00) ($1,235.00) ($2,155.00) $1,062.75 ($1,235.00) ($2,155.00) $1,062.75 ($1,235.00) ($1,235.00) ($2,072.00) ($1,235.00)

Add 25 GPM Pre-Wet per 2.6.5.0 $1,011.00 $904.34 $1,011.00 $953.75 $904.34 $1,011.00 $953.75 $904.34 $904.34 $1,002.19 $904.34

Receiver Pintle Hitch per 2.6.5.r $78.00 $437.75 $78.00 $170.04 $437.75 $78.00 $170.04 $437.75 $437.75 $77.25 $437.75

Walk Rail for Stainless Steel Bed $732.00 $612.85 $732.00 $610.40 $612.85 $732.00 $610.40 $612.85 $726.15 $612.85

Walk Rail for Corten Steel Bed $542.00 $458.35 $542.00 $381.50 $458.35 $542.00 $381.50 $458.35 $458.35 $537.66 $458.35

Back Up Camera and Display $644.00 $719.97 $644.00 $1,028.96 $719.97 $644.00 $1,028.96 $719.97 $719.97 $638.60 $719.97

Installation of MoDOT owned 50 Watt radio $199.00 $128.75 $199.00 $507.94 $186.43 $199.00 $507.94 $186.43 $128.75 $197.76 $128.75

Installation of MoDOT owned 100 Watt radio $199.00 $144.20 $199.00 $507.94 $201.88 $199.00 $507.94 $201.88 $144.20 $197.76 $144.20

Heated Windshield $440.00 $440.00 $520.00 $520.00 $520.00 $520.00 $520.00 $520.00 $520.00 $389.00 $389.00

Vibrating Wiper Blades $245.00 $242.05 $245.00 $242.05 $245.00 $242.05 $242.05 $243.08 $242.05

Lug Nut Torque Indicator $71.00 $31.00 $72.00 $192.93 $72.00 $192.93 $71.07 $180.00

Tire Pressure Monitoring System $1,372.00 $1,372.00 N/A N/A

Air Control Operated Tarp $1,174.00 $787.95 $1,174.00 $136.25 $787.95 $1,174.00 $136.25 $787.95 $787.95 $1,163.90 $787.95

Air Operated Hydraulic Joy Stick Control Lever $0.00 $247.20 $218.00 $247.20 $218.00 $247.20 no charge $247.20

Air Control Operated Tail Gate Latch $0.00 $66.95 $54.50 $66.95 $54.50 $66.95 no charge $66.95

Air Control Operated Tire Chains $2,039.00 $66.95 $2,039.00 $81.75 $66.95 $2,039.00 $81.75 $66.95 $2,021.89 $66.95

Additional Training Modules $0.00 $212.00|Navistar $3,000 Navistar $3,000 Navistar $3,000 |Navistar $3,000 [Navistar $3,000 Navistar $3,000 [Navistar $3,000 no charge $200.00

12Hrs 12Hrs 12Hrs 12Hrs 12Hrs 12Hrs 12Hrs

Installation of MoDOT Provided Decals $126.00 $36.05 $126.00 $49.05 $36.05 $126.00 $49.05 $36.05 $36.05 $125.66 $36.05

Shovel Tool Box $798.00 $830.18 $798.00 $1,059.48 $830.18 $798.00 $1,059.48 $830.18 $791.04 $830.18

Stainless Steel Spring Loaded Shovel Bracket $43.00 $49.44 $43.00 $79.57 $49.44 $43.00 $79.57 $49.44 $49.44 $42.23 $49.44

Crew Cab Option NA NA $6,535.00 $6,535.00 $6,535.00 $6,535.00 $6,535.00 $6,535.00 $6,535.00 N/A N/A
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Remove base spreader control and replace with Rexroth CS ($1,695.00) ($654.00) ($1,695.00)[NO BID ($654.00) ($1,695.00)[NO BID ($654.00) ($1,630.00) ($674.23)
550/150 Spreader /Joy Stick Controller.per Section 2.6.5.jj.

10-foot Spreader Stand $1,784.00 $2,137.25 $1,784.00 $2,703.20 $2,137.25 $1,784.00 $2,703.20 $2,137.25 $2,054.85 $1,768.51 $2,137.25
Remove base spreader control and replace with Force $1,836.00 $2,981.85 $1,836.00 ($2,188.00) $2,981.85 $1,836.00 ($2,188.00) $2,981.85 $1,820.01 $2,981.85
America CAN Bus Spreader Control System

Remove base spreader control and replace with Cirus ($836.00) $1,293.68 ($836.00)[NO BID $1,293.68 ($836.00)[NO BID $1,293.68 ($836.00) $1,293.68
Controls SpreadSmart RX CAN Bus Spreader Control

System

Single Axle Air Ride Suspension ($253.00) ($253.00) $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $176.96 $162.74
Single Axle Contractor Bed with Drop Down Sides $30,302.00 $48,878.65 $30,302.00 $50,614.15 $48,878.65 $30,302.00 $50,614.15 $48,878.65 $47,177.09 $30,045.10 $48,925.00
Fuses Triangles, Fire Extinguisher and First Aid Kit $238.00 $164.00 $238.00 $238.00 $238.00 $238.00 $238.00 $238.00 $238.00 $60.00 $60.00
Additional Set of Mud Flaps $130.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Removal of Tension Bow ($780.00) ($487.00) ($487.00) ($487.00) ($487.00) ($780.00) ($487.00)
Brake Dust Shields All Axles - Tandem $254.00 $254.00|Std Std Std Std Std Std Std NA NA
Brake Dust Shields All Axles - Single $183.00 $183.00(Std Std Std Std Std Std Std $101.00 $101.00
Air Cleaner with Snow Door $516.00 $516.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $392.00 $392.00
Air Cleaner with Snow Door w/Precleaner Passive $893.00 $893.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $541.00 $541.00
Air Cleaner with Snow Door w/out Precleaner Passive $516.00 $516.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $392.00 $392.00
Air Cleaner with Snow Door Single Element Air Cleaner No Bid No Bid $260.00 $260.00 $260.00 $260.00 $260.00 $260.00 $260.00 $392.00 $392.00
Air cleaner with Snow door w/Dual Element Air Cleaner No Bid No Bid $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 $288.00 NA N/A
HD Right Hand 3 Function Front Mount Wing Plow $12,241.00 $12,828.65 $17,569.50 $12,627.80 $17,569.50 $12,627.80 $12,627.80 $13,222.11 $13,741.23

w/Additional Leaf Spring in Right Hand Steer Axle Spring
Pack in Lieu of Air Spring
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SINGLE AXLE PRICE AND INFORMATION Vanguard Truck |Vanguard Truck |Vanguard Truck Vanguard Truck |Westfall GMC Mack |Westfall GMC Mack [Westfall GMC Mack
Center Mack Center Mack Center Mack Granite|Center Mack MHD GU4 MHD GU4 w/Monroe[MHD GU4 w/Viking-
Granite GU4 Granite GU7 GU4 wiViking Cives |Granite GU7 w/Henderson Cives
w/Henderson w/Henderson wi/Viking Cives
Single Axle Cab and Chassis $91,348.95 $93,449.00 $91,348.95 $93,449.00 $89,208.00 $89,208.00 $89,276.25
Single Axle Corten V-Style Long Sill Dump Body $48,048.00 $48,048.00 $45,732.00 $45,732.00 $48,084.00 $54,446.00 $45,582.65
Single Axle Stainless Steel I-Beam Long Sill dump Body $50,354.00 $50,354.00 $47,874.40 $47,874.40 $50,354.00 $58,457.00 $47,745.65
Single Axle Extended Warranty Option #1 $3,202.00 $5,108.00 $3,202.00 $5,108.00 $3,638.25 $3,638.25 $3,638.25
Right and/or Left Hand Wing Plow $9,288.00 $9,288.00 $9,105.20 $9,105.20 $9,288.00 $9,306.00 $9,105.20
Underbody Scraper (For Crew Cab Only) $11,740.00 $11,740.00 $11,093.10 $11,093.10 $11,740.00 $11,701.00 $11,093.10
10’ Skid Mounted Material Spreader $9,181.00 $9,181.00 $9,481.15 $9,481.15 $9,181.00 $10,679.00 $9,481.15
10’ Skid Mounted Material Spreader with Auger $10,017.00 $10,017.00 $10,191.85 $10,191.85 $10,017.00 $10,786.00 $10,191.85

6 Speed Manual Transmission

Pavement Temperature Sensor $1,528.00 $1,528.00 $1,412.13 $1,412.13 $1,528.00 $1,652.00 $1,412.13
Exhaust Brake Engine Retarder $308.00 $308.00 $308.00 $308.00 $212.10 $212.10 $212.10
Automatic Tire Chains $2,039.00 $2,039.00 $1,861.21 $1,861.21 $2,039.00 $2,246.00 $1,861.21

Dual Steering

Dump Body Vibrator $976.00 $976.00 $821.94 $821.94 $976.00 $874.00 $821.94
Left-/Right-hand Truck Mounted Attenuator Pockets $917.00 $917.00 $370.80 $370.80 $917.00 $191.00 $370.80
Cummins ISL9 Engine ] By 0 | $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Bluetooth Hands-free Technology $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Passenger Door Peep Window $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Removal of Base Pre-Wet System from base unit ($2,155.00) ($2,155.00) ($1,235.00) ($1,235.00) ($2,155.00) $1,063.00 ($1,235.00)
Add 25 GPM Pre-Wet per 2.6.5.0 $1,011.00 $1,011.00 $904.34 $904.34 $1,011.00 $954.00 $904.34
Receiver Pintle Hitch per 2.6.5.r $78.00 $78.00 $437.75 $437.75 $78.00 $170.00 $437.75
Walk Rail for Stainless Steel Bed $732.00 $732.00 $612.85 $612.85 $732.00 $610.00 $612.85
Walk Rail for Corten Steel Bed $542.00 $542.00 $458.35 $458.35 $542.00 $382.00 $458.35
Back Up Camera and Display $644.00 $644.00 $719.97 $719.97 $644.00 $1,029.00 $719.97
Installation of MoDOT owned 50 Watt radio $199.00 $199.00 $128.75 $128.75 $199.00 $447.00 $128.75
Installation of MoDOT owned 100 Watt radio $199.00 $199.00 $144.20 $144.20 $199.00 $447.00 $144.20
Heated Windshield $431.00 $431.00 $431.00 $431.00 $296.10 $296.10 $296.10
Vibrating Wiper Blades $245.00 $245.00 $242.05 $242.05 $245.00 $242.05
Lug Nut Torque Indicator $72.00 $72.00 $126.00 $126.00 $72.00

Tire Pressure Monitoring System $1,260.00 $1,260.00 $1,260.00 $1,260.00

Air Control Operated Tarp $1,174.00 $1,174.00 $787.95 $787.95 $1,174.00 $136.00 $787.95
Air Operated Hydraulic Joy Stick Control Lever $0.00 $0.00 $247.20 $247.20 $0.00 $218.00 $247.20
Air Control Operated Tail Gate Latch $0.00 $0.00 $66.95 $66.95 $0.00 $55.00 $66.95
Air Control Operated Tire Chains $2,039.00 $2,039.00 $66.95 $66.95 $2,039.00 $82.00 $66.95
Additional Training Modules $315.00 $315.00 $315.00 $315.00 $0.00 $654.00-
Installation of MoDOT Provided Decals $126.00 $126.00 $36.05 $36.05 $126.00 $49.00 $36.05
Shovel Tool Box $798.00 $798.00 $830.18 $830.18 $798.00 $1,059.00 $830.18
Stainless Steel Spring Loaded Shovel Bracket $43.00 $43.00 $49.44 $49.44 $43.00 $80.00 $49.44

Crew Cab Option
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Remove base spreader control and replace with Rexroth CS ($1,695.00) ($1,695.00) ($654.00) ($654.00) ($1,695.00) ($654.00)
550/150 Spreader /Joy Stick Controller.per Section 2.6.5.jj.

10-foot Spreader Stand $1,784.00 $1,784.00 $2,137.25 $2,137.25 $1,784.00 $2,703.00 $2,137.25
Remove base spreader control and replace with Force $1,836.00 $1,836.00 $2,981.85 $2,981.85 $1,836.00 ($2,188.00) $2,981.85
America CAN Bus Spreader Control System

Remove base spreader control and replace with Cirus ($836.00) ($836.00) $1,293.68 $1,293.68 ($836.00) $1,293.68
Controls SpreadSmart RX CAN Bus Spreader Control

System

Single Axle Air Ride Suspension $769.00 $769.00 $769.00 $769.00 $684.60 $684.60 $684.60
Single Axle Contractor Bed with Drop Down Sides $30,302.00 $30,302.00 $49,028.00 $49,028.00 $30,302.00 $50,614.00 $48,878.65
Fuses Triangles, Fire Extinguisher and First Aid Kit $252.00 $252.00 $252.00 $252.00 $241.00 $185.00

Additional Set of Mud Flaps $134.00 $134.00 $134.00

Removal of Tension Bow ($780.00) ($780.00) ($780.00) ($487.00)
Brake Dust Shields All Axles - Tandem $56.70 $56.70 $56.70
Brake Dust Shields All Axles - Single $69.00 $69.00 $39.90 $39.90 $39.90
Air Cleaner with Snow Door $560.00 $560.00 $308.70 $308.70 $308.70

Air Cleaner with Snow Door w/Precleaner Passive

Air Cleaner with Snow Door w/out Precleaner Passive

$560.00

$560.00

$560.00

Air Cleaner with Snow Door Single Element Air Cleaner

Air cleaner with Snow door w/Dual Element Air Cleaner

HD Right Hand 3 Function Front Mount Wing Plow
w/Additional Leaf Spring in Right Hand Steer Axle Spring
Pack in Lieu of Air Spring

$560.00

$12,241.00

$560.00

$12,241.00

$560.00

$14,193.40

$14,193.40

$12,241.00

$308.70 $308.70 $308.70

$12,627.80




