Floor Plan AA

Floor Plan CC

Floor Plan DD

Floor Plan FF

Floor Plan GG

Floor Plan HH

Floor Plan i

Floor Plan JJ

Floor Plan LL

Option 1 - Camera

Option 2 - Surveillance

Option 3 - Shelving

Option 4 - ADA Package (CC)

Option 5 - CNG Engine (CC/JJ)

Comments

Number of Days for Delivery

Multimodal Transit Vehicles RFB 3-130822TV
2015 Light Duty Cutaway — Wide Body
Bid Opening on 8/22/2014

Item C Bid Tab

Masters Transportation -
Ford E450 Goshen

Mid America Coach -
Ford E450 Starcraft

Central States Bus Sales -
Ford E450 Champion

Central States Bus Sales -
Ford E450 Eldorado

Midwest Transit
Equipment- Ford E450

Impulse Allstar Challenger Advantage Elkhart Coach Il
$50,112.00 No Bid $54,286.00 $48,679.00 $47,455.00
$54,623.00 $51,061.00 $57,090.00 $52,167.00 $51,316.00
$47,956.00 No Bid $51,541.00 $46,862.00 $45,892.00
$52,249.00 No Bid $56,810.00 $50,732.00 $49,916.00
$52,551.00 No Bid $62,726.00 $51,127.00 $50,628.00
$52,004.00 $49,789.00 $50,549.00 $50,947.00 $49,575.00
$50,313.00 $48,739.00 $48,617.00 $49,599.00 $47,905.00
$55,868.00 No Bid No Bid $54,099.00 $52,333.00
$51,787.00 No Bid $55,943.00 $51,032.00 $49,247.00

$880.00 $790.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $1,050.00
$3,725.00 $4,364.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $3,470.00

$366.00 $875.00 $1,500.00 $750.00 $650.00
$5,788.00 $6,493.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $5,555.00
$20,947.00 $24,369.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $27,393.00

CNG Engine: Ford 6.8L

CNG Engine: Ford 6.8L V-

CNG Engine: Ford Triton
6.8L w/ Torque Shift 5

w/ Torque Shift 5 Speed |10 w/ 91G Gaseous Prep [CNG Engine: Ford 6.8L CNG Engine: Ford 6.8L Speed Auto 5R110W
transmission. 38 GGE package w/ Ford OEM 38 GGE capacity w/ tank |38 GGE capacity w/ tank [transmission. 39 GGE
capacity w/ 4 Type lll transmission. 38 GGE location of rear and location of rear and capacity under Floor-4
tanks. capacity under the bus. |frame rails. frame rails. tanks.
120-180 (add 45 days for
120 CNG) 120-145 120-145 90-120

AWARDED




Missouri Dept. of Transportation
RFB 3-140822TV Transit Vehicles
Opened 8/22/14 @2:00PM

VENDOR INFORMATION

Name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Contact Name:

Email:
Cooperative:

Name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Contact Name:

Email:
Cooperative:

Name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Contact Name:

Email:
Cooperative:

Central States Bus Sales, Inc.
2450 Cassens Drive

Fenton, MO 63026
636-343-6050

Louis Tagliaferre
loutag@centralstatesbus.com
Yes

Don Brown Chevrolet

2244 S. Kingshighway

St. Louis, MO 63110
314-772-1400

David Helterbrand
David@donbrownchevrolet.com

Yes

Huntleigh Bus Sales
13788 Lakefront Dr.
Earth City, MO 63045
314-770-0100

Daryl Dunn
dddunn001@aol.com
Yes

Name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Contact Name:

Email:
Cooperative:

Name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Contact Name:

Email:
Cooperative:

Name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Contact Name:

Email:
Cooperative:

Masters Transportation

800 Quik Trip Way

Belton, MO 64012

800-783-3613

Bob Tucker
bobt@masterstransportation.com
Yes

Mid America Coach

8809 East State Route 350
Kansas City, MO 64133
816-734-5000

Peter H. Beren

peterb@midamericacoach.com

Yes

Midwest Transit Equipment, Inc.
146 W. Issert Dr.

Kankakee, IL 60901
800-933-2412

Thomas D. Boldwin

tom.boldwin@midwesttransit.com

Yes

Name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Contact Name:

Email:
Cooperative:

Name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Contact Name:

Email:
Cooperative:

Republic Ford Lincoln
P. 0. Box 700
Republic, MO 65714
417-732-2626

Steve Forrester

sforrester@republicford.com

Yes

Roberts Chevrolet Buick
P.0.Box 470

Platte City, MO 64079
816-858-3200

Dean J. Meier
fleet@robertsch.com
Yes
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