
Item #1 - Slope Mower
Delivery

Vendor Make/Model Base Price Option 1 ARO

Alamo Industrial Alamo Traxx RF $78,665.00 NA 90-120

Tiger Corporation Tiger Prowler $65,622.00

2.5% of Net Price for One 
Year or 5.0% of Net Price 

for Two Years/$250.00 
deductible per incident 15 days

Item #2 - 60" (5 Foot) Right Side Mount Rotary Mower
#2a #2b Delivery

Vendor Make/Model First Price Second Price Option 1 ARO

Tiger Corporation TM-60EDH $18,290.70 $21,886.20
2.5% of NET/$250 

deductible 45 days
Motrim, Inc. LMS-SR $14,900.00 $16,500.00 $1000/For 1 year 60-90 days

Alamo Industrial Alamo Versa Rotary 60" $23,741.00 $28,738.00 $3,982.00 90-120 days
Diamond Mowers DSR060-C0 $16,870.00 $19,939.00 $1,181.00 60-90 days

Item #3 - 60" (5 Foot) Right Side Mount Rotary Mower with Double Deck Design
#3a #3b Delivery

Vendor Make/Model First Price Second Price Option 1 Option 2 Option 3 ARO

Tiger Corporation TSR-60 EDH $18,486.00 $22,081.50
2.5% of NET/$250 

deductible $2,179.80 $2,254.50 45 days

Item #4 - 72" (6 Foot) Right Side Mount Rotary Mower
#4a #4b Delivery

Vendor Make/Model First Price Second Price Option 1 ARO

Tiger Corporation TM-72EDH $18,584.10 $22,179.60
2.5% of NET/$250 

deductible 45 days
Alamo Industrial Alamo Versa Rotary 72" $25,409.00 $27,136.00 $3,982.00 90-120 days
Diamond Mowers DSR072-C0 $17,420.00 $20,447.00 $1,219.00 60-90 days

Item #5 - 60" Rear Boom Right Side Mount Rotary Mower
#5a #5b Delivery

Vendor Make/Model First Price Second Price Option 1 ARO

Diamond Mowers RBM-C-T (50" head) $24,966.00 $25,476.00 $1,706.00 60-90 DAYS
S & H Farm Supply Bushhog SM60 $8,909.00 No Bid No Bid 30-45 days

Tiger Corporation RBM-16 $22,300.00 $23,142.00
2.5% of Net/$250 

deductible 45-120 days
Alamo Industrial Alamo Exten-A-Kut $13,912.00 $13,912.00 $1,593.00 90-120 days

Item #6 - 60" (5 Foot) Right Side Flail Mower
#6a #6b Delivery 

Vendor Make/Model First Price Second Price Option 1 Option 2 ARO

Motrim, Inc. CSH-60F $14,900.00 $16,500.00 No Charge $1000/For 1 year 60-90 days

Tiger Corporation TSF-63SD $14,278.30 $17,674.05 No Charge
2.5% of Net/$250 

deductible 45 days
Diamond Mowers, Inc. DSF060-C $17,079.00 $20,233.00 No Charge $1,148.00 60-90 DAYS

Alamo Industrial Alamo Versa Flail 60" $23,016.00 $34,236.00 NA $3,982.00 90-120 days
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Item #7 - 72" (6 Foot) Right Side Flail Mower
#7a #7b Delivery

Vendor Make/Model First Price Second Price Option 1 Option 2 ARO

Motrim, Inc. CSH-74F $15,900.00 $17,500.00 No Charge $1000/For 1 year 60-90 days

Tiger Corporation TSF-75SD $14,458.50 $17,854.25 No Charge
2.5% of Net/$250 

deductible 45 days
Diamond Mowers, Inc. DSF075-C $17,425.00 $20,579.00 No Charge $1,148.00 60-90 days

Alamo Industrial Alamo Versa Flail 72 $23,458.00 $34,678.00 NA $3,982.00 90-120 days

Item #8 - Six-Foot Rotary Mower
Delivery

Vendor Make/Model Base Price Option 1 ARO

Hall Manufacturing Bush-Whacker 7210 $2,514.75 NA 30-45 days

Tiger Corporation Trail Kat TK-6 $3,217.50
2.5% of Net/$250 

deductible 45 days
Alamo Industrial RX-72 Lift Type Rotary $4,460.00 $1,593.00 90 days

Item #9 - Seven-Foot Rotary Mower
Delivery

Vendor Make/Model Base Price Option 1 ARO

Hall Manufacturing Bush-Whacker 8410 $2,934.75 NA 30-45 days

Tiger Corporation Trail Kat TK-7 $3,757.50
2.5% of Net/$250 

deductible 45 days
Alamo Industrial RX 84 Lift Type Rotary $5,268.00 $1,593.00 90 days

Item #10 - Eight-Foot Rotary Mower
Delivery

Vendor Make/Model Base Price Option 1 ARO

Hall Manufacturing Bush-Whacker T-104 $4,194.75 NA 30-45 days
Alamo Industrial RX 96 Lift Type Rotary $7,489.00 $1,593.00 90-110 days

Item #11 - Fifteen-Foot, Three Section Rotary Mower
Delivery

Vendor Make/Model Base Price Option 1 Option 2 Option 3 Option 4 Option 5 ARO

Hall Manufacturing Bush-Whacker T-180 $11,290.13 $820.00 $754.11 $1,500.00 NA NA 30-45 days
Tiger Corporation Trail Kat TK-15 $15,682.50 $211.50 NA NA

5% o et/$ 50
deductible NA 45-90 days

John Deere & Company CX15 Spring Suspension $15,714.00 Included $1,403.64 NA NA NA 60-90 days
S&H Farm Supply Woods BW180XHDRW $14,500.00 $45.00 $850.00 No Bid No Bid No bid 30-45 days
Alamo Industrial Alamo Eagle 15 $22,028.00 Included NA NC $2,485.00 $9,627.00 90-100 days
Diamond Mowers DFW180-C $24,878.00 $1,875.00 STD NA $1,661.00 $12,464.00 60-90 days

Item #12 - 5' Cutterbar (Sicklebar) - Hydraulic
Delivery

Vendor Make/Model Base Price Option 1 Option 2 ARO

Alamo Industrial Alamo Switchblade 5' $14,783.00 $2,730.00 $1,930.00 90 days

Item #13 - 6' Cutterbar (Sicklebar) - Hydraulic
Delivery

Vendor Make/Model Base Price Option 1 Option 2 ARO

Alamo Industrial Alamo Switchblade 6' $15,034.00 $2,730.00 $1,930.00 90 days

Item #14 - Mid-Mount Boom Mower - 20' Reach
Base Price - #14a Base Price - #14b Base Price - #14c Delivery

Vendor Make/Model 50" Rotary 60" Rotary 50" HD Flail Cutter Option 1 Option 2 Option 3 ARO

Motrim Inc. LMT-20A $21,500.00 $21,500.00 $19,500.00 $2,300.00 $1,200.00 $1500/For 1 year 60-90 days
MTS-20 $19,500.00 $19,500.00 $19,500.00 $2,300.00 $1,200.00 $1500/For 1 year 60-90 days

Tiger Corporation SS-LX-22 $25,607.95 $26,995.15 $27,743.15 $4,760.00 Included
2.5% of Net/$250 

deductible 45 days
Alamo Industrial Alamo 22' Samurai $41,582.00 $42,175.00 $42,175.00 $7,728.00 Included $3,982.00 90-110 days

Terrain King KB 2200 No Bid $52,702.00 $52,702.00 $5,470.00 Included $3,373.00 90-120 days
Diamond Mowers DBM-C-A $28,905.00 $29,436.00 $30,793.00 $3,027.00 Included $2,023.00 60-90 days
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Item #15 - Mid-Mount Boom Mower - 25' Reach
Base Price - #15a Base Price - #15b Base Price - #15c Delivery

Vendor Make/Model 50" Rotary 60" Rotary 50" HD Flail Cutter Option 1 Option 2 Option 3 ARO

Motrim Inc. MTS-25 $23,500.00 $23,500.00 $23,500.00 $2,300.00 $1,200.00 $1,500 for 1 yr. 60-90 days
LMT-25A $25,500.00 $25,700.00 $23,500.00 $2,300.00 $1,500.00 $1,500 for 1 yr. 60-90 days

Tiger Corporation BB-24 $34,130.00 $35,515.55 $36,263.55 $4,760.00 Included (1700 lbs)
2.5% of Net/$250 

deductible 45 days
Alamo Industrial Alamo 25' Samurai $43,478.00 $42,071.00 $42,071.00 $7,728.00 Included $3,982.00 90-110 days
Diamond Mowers DBM-C-A $40,342.00 $40,872.00 $42,229.00 $5,407.00 Included $2,824.00 60-90 days

Item #16 - Schulte XH1500 15' Cut Three Section Rotary Mower
Delivery

          Item was rebid as RFB 3-130920TV 15' HD Mowers.

Item #17 - 6' Rear Mount, Double Deck Design Rotary Mower
#17a #17b Delivery

Vendor Make/Model First Price Second Price Option 1 ARO

Hall Manufacturing Bush-Whacker ST-7210 $2,178.75 NA NA 30-45 days
John Deere & Company MX6 $2,499.76 $2,499.76 No Bid 60-90 days

Alamo Industrial RX 72 Lift Type Rotary Mower $4,630.00 $5,130.00 $1,593.00 90-120 days

Item #18 - 7' Rear Mount, Double Deck Design Rotary Mower
#18a #18b Delivery

Vendor Make/Model First Price Second Price Option 1 ARO

Hall Manufacturing Bush-Whacker ST-8410 $2,651.25 NA NA 30-45 days
John Deere & Company John Deere MX7 $3,265.08 $3,265.08 No Bid 60-90 days

Item #19 - 8' Rear Mount, Double Deck Design Rotary Mower
#19a #19b Vendor Option Delivery

Vendor Make/Model First Price Second Price Option 1 Option 2 Option 3 Option 4 Semi-Mount ARO

Hall Manufacturing Bush-Whacker ST-104 $4,140.68 NA ($100.00) ($450.00) NA NA 30-45 days
John Deere & Company John Deere MX8 $5,884.04 $5,884.04 ($1,288.96) $0.00 ($97.28) No Bid ($1,203.08) 60-90 days

Item #20 -126" Rear Mount, Double Deck Design Rotary Mower
#20a #20b Delivery

Vendor Make/Model First Price Second Price Option 1 Option 2 Option 3 Option 4 ARO

John Deere & Company John Deere HX10 $7,577.32 $7,577.32 ($548.72) $0.00 ($97.28) No Bid 60-90 days

Item #21 -180" Rear Mount, Double Deck Design Rotary Mower
#21a #21b Delivery

Vendor Make/Model First Price Second Price Option 1 Option 2 Option 3 ARO

Hall Manufacturing Bush-Whacker ST-180 $11,019.75 NA NA ($150.00) NA 30-45 days

John Deere & Company John Deere CX15 540RPM
$16,537.84 $16,537.84 NA ($460.56) No Bid 60-90 days

John Deere & Company John Deere CX15 1000RPM
$16,537.84 $16,537.84 NA ($460.56) No Bid 60-90 days

S&H Farm Supply Schulte FX-1800 $16,370.00 No Bid No Bid ($590.00) No Bid 30-45 days
Woods BW180XHDRW $13,667.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid 30-45 days
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Item #22 -240" Rear Mount, Double Deck Design Rotary Mower
#22a #22b Delivery

Vendor Make/Model First Price Second Price Option 1 Option 2 ARO

John Deere & Company John Deere CX20 $24,446.40 $24,446.40 NA No Bid 60-90 days
S&H Farm Supply Woods BW2400XRW $23,800.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid 30-45 days

Schulte FX-520 $30,050.00 No Bid NA No Bid 30-60 days

Item #23 - 22.5' Extreme Duty Triple Gang Flail Mower
Delivery

Vendor Make/Model Base Price Option 1 Mounting ARO

Motrim Inc.
CSA-21 w/ 90 Wing Cutters

& w/ 102" Rear Cutter $35,500.00 $1,500 for 1 yr. 60-90 days
Tiger Corporation T3F-282C $42,494.05 2.5% of Net 45 days
Diamond Mowers DTF282-C $44,775.00 $3,513.00 $5,407.00 60-90 days
Alamo Industrial Alamo Interstater 20' - 9" (unmounted) $50,217.00 $7,276.00 $8,286.00 90-120 days

Item #24 - 15', 3-Section Flex-Wing Rotary Mower
Delivery

Vendor Make/Model Base Price Option 1 ARO
Alamo Industrial Alamo Falcon 15 $29,812.00 $3,982.00 90-120 days
Diamond Mowers DFH180-C $36,674.00 $29,339.00 60-90 days



Name: Tiger Corporation

Contact name: Chad Johnson

Address Line: 3301 N. Louise Avenue

Address Line: Sioux Falls, SD  57107

Telephone #: 800-843-6849

Email: cjohnson@tiger-mowers.com

MSRP Discount NA

Coop Procurement Yes

Name: Alamo Sales Corporation

Contact name: Ian Burden

Address Line: 1502 E. Walnut St.

Address Line: Seguin, TX  78155

Telephone #: 800-882-5762

Email: bids@alamo-group.com

MSRP Discount (Alamo's Parts Price Book) 10%

MSRP Discount (Alamo's Universal Price Book) 20%

MSRP Discount  (Alamo's Hydro Select Price Book) 15%

MSRP Discount (Traxx RF, Remote Control Flail) 6%

Coop Procurement Yes

Name: Motrim Inc.

Contact name: Tom Brill
Address Line: P.O. Box 850

Address Line: Cambridge. OH  43725
Telephone #: 740-439-2725
Email: tombrill@motrim.net

MSRP Discount 10%

Coop Procurement Yes

Name: Hall Manufacturing , Inc.

Contact name: Andy Capel

Address Line: P.O. Box 5638, 3706 E. Washington Ave.

Address Line: North Little Rock, AR  72119

Telephone #: 501-945-7550

Email: rhall@bush-whacker.com

MSRP Discount 30%

Coop Procurement Yes

Name: Terrain King

Contact name: Ian Burden

Address Line: 1502 E. Walnut

Address Line: Seguin, TX  78155

Telephone #: 800-882-5762

Email: bids@alamo-group.com

MSRP Discount (Terrain King Parts Price Book) 10%

MSRP Discount (Terrain King Hydraulics Line) 17%

Coop Procurement Yes

Name: John Deere & Company

Contact name: Tamara Hebert

Address Line: 2000 John Deere Run

Address Line: Cary, NC  27513

Telephone #: 800-358-5010, ext. 2313

Email: GNSBids@JohnDeere.com

MSRP Discount 24%

Coop Procurement Yes
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Name: S & H Farm Supply

Contact name: Chris A. LaGrange

Address Line: 6959 E. US Hwy 60

Address Line: Rogersville, MO  65742

Telephone #: 417-865-5252

Email: chris.lagrange@shfarmsupply.com

MSRP Discount (Schulte) 30%

MSRP Discount (Bushhog) 25%

Coop Procurement Yes

Name: Diamond Mowers, Inc.

Contact name: Bill Doyle

Address Line: 27134 Parklane Dr.

Address Line: Sioux Falls, SD  57106

Telephone #: 605-368-5865

Email: tim@diamondmowers.com

MSRP Discount 20%

Coop Procurement Yes
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Item # 1 Options 1)  Extended Warranty

Item # 2 Options 1)  Extended Warranty

Item # 3 Options 1)  Extended Warranty

Item # 4 Options 1)  Extended Warranty

Item # 5 Options 1)  Extended Warranty

Item # 6 Options 1) Smooth knives

2)  Extended Warranty

Item # 7 Options 1) Smooth knives

2)  Extended Warranty

Item # 8 Options 1)  Extended Warranty

Item # 9 Options 1)  Extended Warranty

Item # 10 Options 1)  Extended Warranty

Item # 11 Options 1)  Pneumatic aircraft take off tires, minimum 18 ply with new rib retread cap (in lieu of laminated tires)

2)  Main deck suspension shall be a walking beam type rear tire suspension.  It will be designed to reduce 

scalping when entering approaches and to keep the mower deck from excess wear from dropping into ruts.  

The walking axles will be positioned as far forward as possible to best control cutter height over uneven grounds.  

The walking beam is limited in oscillation so that one wheel would be on high ground most of the time (in lieu 

of the standard wheel design that was specified).

3)  Bondioli driveline components to include driveshafts, clutches and gear boxes (in lieu of the driveline 

components in the specification).  Three-year warranty.

4)  Extended Warranty

5)  Hydraulic batwing option (In order to add this option the following items need to be included:  

      a) The addition of hydraulic motors and hoses in lieu of gear boxes and drive shafts on the top of the deck, 

      b) The addition of a speed increaser, and 

      c) An independent hydraulic reservoir and independent hydraulic system will be need to be added. 

          (No tractor hydraulics will be utilized.)

Item # 12 Options 1)  Mounting/delivery price on a provided agricultural tractor

2)  Extended Warranty

Item # 13 Options 1)  Mounting/delivery price on a provided agricultural tractor
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2)  Extended Warranty

Item # 14 Options 1)  Mounting/delivery price on a provided agricultural tractor

2)  Left side counter weight

3)  Extended Warranty

Item # 15 Options 1)  Mounting/delivery price on a provided agricultural tractor

2)  Left side counter weight

3)  Extended Warranty

Item # 16 Options Item was not renewed. Item was rebid as RFB 3-13-920TV 15' HD Mowers.

Item # 17 Options 1)  Extended Warranty

Item # 18 Options 1)  Extended Warranty

Item # 19 Options 1)  Lift type hitch (Deduct)

2)  Pull type hitch (Deduct)

3)  Puncture proof laminate tires (Deduct)

4)  Extended Warranty

Item # 20 Options 1)  Lift type hitch (Deduct)

2)  Pull type hitch (Deduct)

3)  Puncture proof laminate tires (Deduct)

4)  Extended Warranty

Item # 21 Options 1)  Dual Cutting Blades

2)  Puncture proof laminate tires

3)  Extended Warranty

Item # 22 Options 1)  Puncture proof laminate tires

2)  Extended Warranty

Item # 23 Options 1)  Extended Warranty

Item # 24 Options 1)  Extended Warranty
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