
Item #1  Purchase Tractors 40 - 85 HP (PTO)

**Due to an internal policy, MoDOT will not purchase Premium tractors**

**The requirement for bias ply tires will be waived due to the shift of industry practice towards supplying only radial tires on the majority of tractor models **

Base Std Districts

Vendor Make/Model HP Price 1a 1b 1c 1d 1e 1f 1g 1h 1i ARO Provided

Golden Valley Tractor New Holland TS6.110 90 $32,337.00 $5,818.00 NA $4,009.00 $93.00 $131.00 $364.00 NA NA $1,197.00 165 ALL

Crown Power & Equipment (Eldon) New Holland T5050 80 $30,200.00 $6,600.00 NA $5,800.00 $95.00 $590.00 $375.00 NA NA $500.00 120 CD

Lauf Equipment Massey Ferguson 5445 75 $36,700.00 $8,300.00 NA $6,000.00 $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. $850.00 Source Source $900.00 120 KC, CD, SL, SW

Massey Ferguson 5455 85 $39,900.00 $8,500.00 NA $6,500.00 $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. $850.00 Source Source $900.00 120 KC, CD, SL, SW

Rosebud Tractor and Equipment New Holland T4.90 75 $28,625.00 $5,400.00 NA $3,200.00 $1.10/lb. $1.10/lb. $450.00 NA NA $780.00 240 NE, CD, SL, SE

New Holland T4.100 85 $29,166.00 $5,400.00 NA $3,200.00 $1.10/lb. $1.10/lb. $450.00 NA NA $780.00 240 NE, CD, SL, SE

New Holland T5050 80 $29,389.00 $5,400.00 NA $5,400.00 $1.10/lb. $1.10/lb. $600.00 NA NA $750.00 180 NE, CD, SL, SE

John Deere Company

**$1068.39 must be added to all M Series tractor John Deere 5065M 50 $28,088.97 $7,519.23 NA $5,425.38 $99.63/ea $145.80/ea $105.00 NA NA $1,712.34 60-240 ALL

prices for the 1000 RPM PTO to bring these John Deere 5075M 60 $30,724.71 $7,519.23 NA $5,425.38 $99.63/ea $145.80/ea $105.00 NA NA $1,712.34 60-240 ALL

tractors up to spec ** John Deere 5085M 70 $33,553.90 $7,519.23 NA $5,425.38 $99.63/ea $145.80/ea $105.00 NA NA $1,712.34 60-240 ALL

John Deere 5100M 80 $39,104.02 $7,519.23 NA $5,880.60 $99.63/ea $145.80/ea $105.00 NA NA $1,712.34 60-240 ALL

John Deere 6230 76 $36,439.60 $8,871.56 NA $6,881.80 $93.48/ea $144.40/ea $384.56 NA NA $820.80 60-240 ALL

John Deere 6330 85 $39,995.64 $8,447.36 NA $7,772.60 $93.48/ea $144.40/ea $384.56 NA NA $820.80 60-240 ALL

John Deere 6230P 79 $50,565.84 $0.00 NA $7,367.44 $93.48/ea $144.40/ea $503.88 NA NA $937.84 60-240 ALL

John Deere 6330P 89 $52,715.12 $0.00 NA $7,367.44 $93.48/ea $144.40/ea $503.88 NA NA $937.84 60-240 ALL

John Deere 5083E Limited 69 $36,425.29 $0.00 NA $0.00 $93.48/ea $136.80/ea $115.00 NA NA $923.40 60-240 ALL

John Deere 5093E Limited 79 $39,419.86 $0.00 NA $0.00 $93.48/ea $136.80/ea $115.00 NA NA $923.40 60-240 ALL

S&H Farm Supply, Inc. New Holland T5050 80 $29,010.00 $7,394.00 NA $5,200.00 $100.00/ea $140.00/ea $600.00 No Bid No Bid $1,000.00 129 SW, SE
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Item #2  PURCHASE Tractors 95 - 125 HP (PTO)

**Due to an internal policy, MoDOT will not purchase Premium tractors**

Base Std Districts

Vendor Make/Model HP Price 2a 2b 2c 2d 2e 2f 2g 2h 2i 2j ARO Provided

Golden Valley Tractor New Holland T6.155 95 $56,530.00 Included Included $90.00 $73.00 $8,690.00 $1,173.39 $530.00 NA NA $229.00 165 ALL

New Holland T5070 105 $29,174.00 $7,321.00 $4,646.00 $62.00 $70.00 $7,620.00 $1,160.00 $380.00 NA NA Included 165 ALL

Crown Power & Equipment (Eldon) New Holland T6030 95 $55,982.00 Included Included $79.00 $500.00 $8,300.00 $1,395.00 $495.00 NA NA $250.00 120 CD

New Holland T5070 96 $46,489.00 Included Included $95.00 $590.00 $7,550.00 $1,213.00 $375.00 NA NA $250.00 120 CD

Crown Power & Equipment (Columbia) CaseIH Maxxum 115 95 $50,380.00 STD $6,952.00 $100.00 $100.00 $7,375.00 $1,440.00 $455.00 No Bid No Bid STD 180 NE, CO 

Lauf Equipment Massey Ferguson 5460 95 $48,900.00 $9,200.00 Included $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. $7,000.00 $1,000.00 $850.00 Source Source $295.00 120 KC, CD, SL, SW

Massey Ferguson 5465 100 $54,900.00 Included $6,600.00 $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. $9,000.00 $1,500.00 $980.00 Source Source $295.00 120 KC, CD, SL, SW

Massey Ferguson 5470 105 $55,200.00 Included $6,600.00 $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. $7,000.00 $1,200.00 $980.00 Source Source $295.00 120 KC, CD, SL, SW

Massey Ferguson 5475 110 $59,000.00 Included $6,600.00 $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. $9,000.00 $1,500.00 $980.00 Source Source $295.00 120 KC, CD, SL, SW

Massey Ferguson 5480 115 $58,900.00 Included $6,600.00 $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. $7,000.00 $1,200.00 $980.00 Source Source $295.00 120 KC, CD, SL, SW

Vestal Equipment Case IH MXU 115 95 $50,380.00 STD $6,952.00 $100.00 $100.00 NA $1,500.00 $455.00 NA NA STD 180 SW

Rosebud Tractor and Equipment New Holland T5070 96 $35,860.00 $5,400.00 Included $1.10/lb. $1.10/lb. $6,360.00 $1,550.00 $600.00 NA NA Included 180 NE, CD, SL, SE

New Holland T6030 Plus 95 $52,800.00 Included Included $1.10/lb. $1.10/lb. $8,400.00 $1,700.00 $750.00 NA NA Included 180 NE, CD, SL, SE

New Holland T6050 105 $55,800.00 Included Included $1.10/lb. $1.10/lb. $8,400.00 $1,700.00 $750.00 NA NA Included 180 NE, CD, SL, SE

New Holland T6070 120 $61,200.00 Included Included $1.10/lb. $1.10/lb. $8,400.00 $1,700.00 $750.00 NA NA Included 180 NE, CD, SL, SE

New Holland T7.170 100 $84,320.00 Included Included $1.10/lb. $1.10/lb. $8,400.00 $1,950.00 $750.00 NA NA Included 180 NE, CD, SL, SE

New Holland TS6030 96 $37,700.00 $6,200.00 Included $1.10/lb. $1.10/lb. $5,900.00 $1,550.00 $750.00 NA NA Included 180 NE, CD, SL, SE

John Deere Company John Deere 6430 99 $43,437.68 $9,753.92 $7,327.92 $93.48/ea $144.40/ea $5,536.60 $2,396.28 $497.04 NA NA $354.92 60-240 ALL

John Deere 6430P 103 $74,687.36 $0.00 $7,367.44 $93.48/ea $144.40/ea $5,536.60 $4,505.28 $503.88 NA NA $353.40 60-240 ALL

John Deere 7130 101 $52,027.20 $5,453.00 $7,327.92 $93.48/ea $292.60/1 set $7,755.04 $1,038.16 $384.56 NA NA $354.92 60-240 ALL

John Deere 7230 110 $54,609.68 $6,351.32 $7,327.92 $93.48/ea $292.60/1 set $7,755.04 $1,038.16 $384.56 NA NA $354.92 60-240 ALL

John Deere 7130P 101 $72,032.69 $0.00 $7,325.64 $93.48/ea $194.56/ea $7,755.04 $1,879.48 $384.56 NA NA $417.24 60-240 ALL

John Deere 7230P 110 $80,007.37 $0.00 $7,325.64 $93.48/ea $194.56/ea $7,755.04 $1,879.48 $384.56 NA NA $417.24 60-240 ALL

S&H Farm Supply, Inc. New Holland T5070 96 $31,050.00 $7,394.00 $5,200.00 $100.00/ea $140.00/ea $8,464.00 $1,900.00 $600.00 No Bid No Bid STD 130 SW, SE

New Holland T7.170 100 $79,250.00 STD STD $125.00/ea $200.00/ea $13,975.00 $2,000.00 $700.00 No Bid No Bid STD 140 SW, SE

Optional Services, Training, & Software

Make/ Optional Optional Optional

Vendor Model Service Training Software

Golden Valley Tractor All NA $0.00 $0.00

Crown Power & Equipment (Eldon) All Per Request $500.00 $200 - $800

Crown Power & Equipment (Columbia) All No Bid $500.00 No Bid

Lauf Equipment All NA NA NA

Vestal Equipment All NA $500.00 NA

Rosebud Tractor and Equipment New Holland T4.90 $120.00 $1,200.00 NA

New Holland T4.100 $120.00 $1,200.00 NA

New Holland T5050 $150.00 $1,200.00 NA

New Holland T5070 $150.00 $1,200.00 NA

New Holland T6030 Plus $180.00 $1,200.00 NA

New Holland T6050 $180.00 $1,200.00 NA

New Holland T6070 $180.00 $1,200.00 NA

New Holland T7.170 $220.00 $1,200.00 NA

New Holland TS6030 $120.00 $1,200.00 NA

John Deere Company All 500 No Bid No Bid

S&H Farm Supply, Inc. All 450 $1,200.00 NA

Option Pricing
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Name: John Deere Company Name: Golden Valley Tractor, Inc.

Contact name: Tamara Hebert Contact name: Michael Friedli

Address Line: 2000 John Deere Run Address Line: 1403 N. 2nd Street

Address Line: Cary, NC  27513 Address Line: Clinton, MO  64735

Telephone #: 800-358-5010 Ext. 2862 Telephone #: 660-885-5591

Email address: gnsbids@johndeere.com Email address: gvt.mfriedli@gmail.com

Name: S&H Farm Supply, Inc. Name: Vestal Equipment

Contact name: Chris LaGrange Contact name: R.D. Vestal

Address Line: 6959 E US Hwy. 60 Address Line: 3815 S. Springfield Road

Address Line: Rogersville, MO  65742 Address Line: Bolivar, MO  65613

Telephone #: 417-865-5252 Telephone #: 417-326-7641

Email address: chris.lagrange@shfarmsupply.com Email address: vestal@windstream.net

Name: Lauf Equipment Co. Name: Crown Power & Equipment 

Contact name: Terrance LePage Contact name: Dennis Henry

Address Line: 541 W. Hwy. 94 Address Line: P.O. Box 152

Address Line: Jefferson City, MO  65101 Address Line: Eldon, MO  65026

Telephone #: 573-635-6836 Telephone #: 573-392-0230

Email address: laufequipment@embarqmail.com Email address: dhenry@crown-power.com

Name: Crown Power & Equipment Name: Rosebud Tractor and Equipment

Contact name: Harold Chapman Contact name: John Estes

Address Line: 1881 Prathersville Road Address Line: 241 Hwy. 50, P.O. Box 237

Address Line: Columbia, MO  65202 Address Line: Rosebud, MO  63091

Telephone #: 573-443-4541 Telephone #: 573-764-3393

Email address: chapmanhc@yahoo.com Email address: rosetrac@fidnet.com

VENDOR INFORMATION
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ITEM 1

  Option 1a: Cab and AC

  Option 1b: Low center of gravity (as defined in Specs )

  Option 1c:  2 Wheel Drive in lieu of 4WD(front wheel assist)4WD (Front wheel assist)

  Option 1d: Front Weights (per additional 100 lbs over 300 lbs )Front Weights (per 100 lbs)

  Option 1e: Rear Weights

  Option 1f: Category I, 3 Point Hitch with adjustable stabilizersFront fender Option - 4WD Only

  Option 1g: Loader w/bucketFront replacement tires

  Option 1h: Supplied oil/oil filterRear replacement tires

  Option 1i: OEM to change oil/oil filter on site3rd hydraulic valve

ITEM 2

  Option 2a: Aluminum/steel canopy with ROPS in lieu of cabCab and AC

  Option 2b: Low center of gravity (as defined in Specs )4WD (Front wheel assist)

  Option 2c:  2 Wheel Drive in lieu of 4WD(front wheel assist)Front weights (per 100 lbs)

  Option 2d: Front Weights (per additional 100 lbs over 300 lbs )Rear weights (per 100 lbs)

  Option 2e: Rear WeightsLoader w/bucket

  Option 2f: Category I, 3 Point Hitch with adjustable stabilizersLoader prep pkg.(includes joystick w/no loader brackets)

  Option 2g: Loader w/bucketFront fender option

  Option 2h:  Dual Rear WheelsFront replacement tires

  Option 2i: Supplied oil/oil filterRear replacement tires

  Option 2j: OEM to change oil/oil filter on siteFront and rear windshield wiper and washer fluid



Golden Valley Tractor 24%

Crown Power & Equipment (Eldon) 23% Parts 0%

Crown Power & Equipment (Columbia) 23% Parts 0%

Lauf Equipment 10%

Vestal Equipment 23% Parts 0%

Rosebud Tractor 15%

John Deere Company 5000 Series 19%

6000 Series 24%

7000 Series 24%

S&H Farm Supply, Inc. 15%

Missouri Department of Transportation
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