

Missouri
Department
of Transportation



Daniel Niec, District Engineer

North Central District
902 North Missouri St.
P.O. Box 8
Macon, MO 63552
(660) 385-8245
Fax (660) 385-1707
Toll free 1-888 ASK MoDOT
<http://www.modot.mo.gov>

QUOTATION
TABULATION

General Services
(Procurement) Division

Thank you for your response to our Request for Quotation # D206-075-R2. For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses which were received. This quotation was awarded to: **See the bolded and shaded areas below**. If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown above. Buyer: William D. "Bill" Noyes, CPPO, CPPB, Procurement Agent

PRICING IN EFFECT FOR AS-NEEDED ORDERS DURING THE 3rd QUARTER OF 2006 (July 1 through September 30)

Unit	Pkg.	Description	Jefferson City Oil Co. To Order Call: 1-800-366-1131	Jet Bulk Oil Co. To Order Call: 1-800-538-6459	MFA Oil Company To Order Call: 1-800-MFA-LUBE (632-5823)	Prairie International To Order Call: (217)-222-1518
Gallons	Bulk	15W-40 Motor Oil	\$ 5.32 Mfg: Conoco Brand: Fleet 15W40	\$ 5.30 Mfg: Citgo Brand: Citgard 500 15W40	\$ 5.15 Mfg: MFA Oil Co. Brand: Premium HD	NO BID
Gallons	Bulk	Dexron Automatic Transmission Fluid	\$ 5.32 Mfg: Conoco Brand: Dexron III Mercon	\$ 4.99 Mfg: Citgo Brand: Dexron III	\$ 4.95 Mfg: MFA Oil Co. Brand: Dexron III Mercon	NO BID
Gallons	Bulk	Universal Hydraulic Transmission Oil	\$ 5.32 Mfg: Conoco Brand: Power Tran	\$ 5.25 Mfg: Citgo Brand: Transgard THF	\$ 4.95 Mfg: MFA Oil Co. Brand: GP Hyd Fluid	NO BID
Drum	120 lb	80W-90 Gear Oil	NO BID	\$ 134.40 Mfg: Citgo Brand: MP 80W90	\$ 120.00 Mfg: MFA Oil Co. Brand: Multi-Purpose	NO BID
Drum	120 lb	Multi-Purpose Grease Spec 2.5-Lithium Complex	NO BID	\$ 163.20 Mfg: Citgo Brand: Lithoplex MP	\$ 132.00 Mfg: MFA Oil Co. Brand: Sho-Me	NO BID
Container	1 gal	Transmission Fluid Allison TES 295	NO BID	\$ 24.89 Mfg: BP Brand: Autran Syn 295	NO BID	\$ 26.00 Mfg: Castrol Brand: Transynd
Container	55 gal	Transmission Fluid Allison TES 295	NO BID	\$ 1396.45 Mfg: BP Brand: Autran Syn 295	NO BID	\$ 1275.00 Mfg: Castrol Brand: Transynd
Container	55 gal	Re-Refined 10W-30 Motor Oil	NO BID	\$ 288.75 Mfg: Service Pro Brand: 10W30	\$ 302.50 Mfg: Safety-Kleen Brand: American Choice	NO BID

NOTE: Central Power Systems & Chart Automotive each submitted a "No Quote" response. RS Used Oil Service's response was received late & not considered. No response was received from BG Services, Brownfield Oil, KCR International, Loethen Oil, McCollister & Co, Meyer's Truck Implement, Warren Distribution, or Wallis Lubricant, LLC.