Quantity

100 Rolls
300 Rolls
300 Rolls
300 Rolls
300 Rolls
10 Boxes

100 Rolls
300 Rolls
300 Rolls
300 Rolls
300 Rolls
10 Boxes

100 Rolls
300 Rolls
300 Rolls
300 Rolls
300 Rolls
10 Boxes

MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

WILLOW SPRINGS, MISSOURI
Tabulation of Bids Received April 2, 2009
Request Number: D9001757R9

Description Vendor
8’ Curlex | Reg. Color 8x90 Pennington Seed

8’ Curlex Il Reg. Color 8x90

8’ Curlex Il Green Color 8x90

8’ Curlex I11 Reg. Color 8x90

8’ Curlex I11 Green Color

Companion Pins 1x6 staples 1000/box
Freight per shipment

8’ Curlex | Reg. Color 8x90 Pennington Seed
8’ Curlex Il Reg. Color 8x90

8’ Curlex Il Green Color 8x90

8’ Curlex I11 Reg. Color 8x90

8’ Curlex I11 Green Color

Companion Pins

Freight per shipment

8’ Curlex | Reg. Color 6.67x108 ASP Enterprises
8’ Curlex Il Reg. Color 6.67x108

8’ Curlex Il Green Color 6.67x108

8’ Curlex I11 Reg. Color 6.67x108

8’ Curlex I11 Green Color 6.67x108

Companion Pins 6x1x6, 11 ga., 1000/box

Unit Price

Remarks

$30.50
$35.00
$37.10
$37.75
No Bid
$25.00
$28.00

$30.95
$36.05
$38.65
$45.80
No Bid
$25.00
$28.00

$28.00
$32.00
No Bid
$52.00
No Bid
$45.00

*Award Bid

Reject

Bid a different brand

Reject

Reject



MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
WILLOW SPRINGS, MISSOURI
Tabulation of Bids Received April 2, 2009
Request Number: D9001757R9

Quantity Description Vendor Total Price Remarks
100 Rolls 8’ Curlex | Reg. Color Applied Turf Products $39.75

300 Rolls 8’ Curlex Il Reg. Color $45.00

300 Rolls 8’ Curlex Il Green Color $48.00

300 Rolls 8’ Curlex I11 Reg. Color $48.00

300 Rolls 8’ Curlex 111 Green Color $51.00 Reject
10 Boxes Companion Pins $30.00

100 Rolls 8’ Curlex | Reg. Color BWI $36.18

300 Rolls 8’ Curlex Il Reg. Color $41.87

300 Rolls 8’ Curlex Il Green Color $48.59

300 Rolls 8’ Curlex I11 Reg. Color $57.29

300 Rolls 8’ Curlex 111 Green Color $60.27 Reject
10 Boxes Companion Pins $37.13

100 Rolls 8’ Curlex | Reg. Color 8x112.5 Evergreen Seed $32.95

300 Rolls 8’ Curlex Il Reg. Color 8x112.5 $38.35

300 Rolls 8’ Curlex Il Green Color 8x112.5 $40.90

300 Rolls 8’ Curlex 111 Reg. Color 8x112.5 $72.00

300 Rolls 8’ Curlex Il Green Color 8x112.5 $73.85 Reject
10 Boxes Companion Pins $24.00

* Bid was awarded based on best value for MoDOT. MoDOT exercises it’s right to reject Line 5 of quote from all bidders.



