MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

WILLOW SPRINGS, MISSOURI

Tabulation of Bids Received September 18, 2007
Bid Number D9080504R9

Description

Strobe Control/Power-Supply Whelen 1SP188

Strobe Light-Assy (Lt. Duty) P/U #OMMEDGEP

Strobe Light/Rear 500 Linear Whelen 01-0683565-A1
Strobe Tube Bulb Rear Light Whelen 7TELTUBWD

Strobe Tube Bulb Rear Light Whelen 02-0361417-00

Strobe Tube Bulb Top Light Whelen TURB094

Strobe Light M/D & XHD MCEDGELA Microedge

Strobe Switch, Lighted Whelen PC-5S

Strobe-Reflector Assy, 3 Light 02-0363171-000
Strobe-Lens, End Cap/9ECAPA Edge Replacement End Cap
Strobe-Lens, Amber/Optic 3.75” Whelen 68-1141474-10 (A)
Strobe Lens, Amber/Opt Rear Whelen 68-1183137-1S

Lens Amber Rear Small 68-3963228-10,A 500 Series

Strobe Control/Power-Supply Whelen 1ISP188

Strobe Light-Assy (Lt. Duty) P/U #9MMEDGEP

Strobe Light/Rear 500 Linear Whelen 01-0683565-A1
Strobe Tube Bulb Rear Light Whelen 7TELTUBWD

Strobe Tube Bulb Rear Light Whelen 02-0361417-00

Strobe Tube Bulb Top Light Whelen TURB094

Strobe Light M/D & XHD MCEDGELA Microedge

Strobe Switch, Lighted Whelen PC-5S

Strobe-Reflector Assy, 3 Light 02-0363171-000
Strobe-Lens, End Cap/9ECAPA Edge Replacement End Cap
Strobe-Lens, Amber/Optic 3.75” Whelen 68-1141474-10 (A)
Strobe Lens, Amber/Opt Rear Whelen 68-1183137-1S

Lens Amber Rear Small 68-3963228-10,A 500 Series

Vendor

Amalfi Group

Whelen

Unit Price

$573.52
$446.22
$ 79.73
$ 64.32
$ 4221
$ 4221
$150.75
$ 18.09
$ 4221
$ 29.14
$ 5.36
$ 1541
$ 4.69

$559.00
$435.00
$ 65.00
$ 65.00
$ 43.00
$ 43.00
$168.00
$ 18.00
$ 43.00
$ 32.00
$ 6.00
$ 16.00
$ 5.00

Remarks

AWARD BID



MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

WILLOW SPRINGS, MISSOURI

Tabulation of Bids Received September 14, 2007
Bid Number D9080464R9

Description

Strobe Control/Power-Supply Whelen ISP188

Strobe Light-Assy (Lt. Duty) P/U #OMMEDGEP

Strobe Light/Rear 500 Linear Whelen 01-0683565-A1
Strobe Tube Bulb Rear Light Whelen 7TELTUBWD

Strobe Tube Bulb Rear Light Whelen 02-0361417-00

Strobe Tube Bulb Top Light Whelen TURB094

Strobe Light M/D & XHD MCEDGELA Microedge

Strobe Switch, Lighted Whelen PC-5S

Strobe-Reflector Assy, 3 Light 02-0363171-000
Strobe-Lens, End Cap/9ECAPA Edge Replacement End Cap
Strobe-Lens, Amber/Optic 3.75” Whelen 68-1141474-10 (A)
Strobe Lens, Amber/Opt Rear Whelen 68-1183137-1S

Lens Amber Rear Small 68-3963228-10,A 500 Series

Strobe Control/Power-Supply Whelen 1SP188

Strobe Light-Assy (Lt. Duty) P/U #9MMEDGEP

Strobe Light/Rear 500 Linear Whelen 01-0683565-A1
Strobe Tube Bulb Rear Light Whelen 7TELTUBWD

Strobe Tube Bulb Rear Light Whelen 02-0361417-00

Strobe Tube Bulb Top Light Whelen TURB094

Strobe Light M/D & XHD MCEDGELA Microedge

Strobe Switch, Lighted Whelen PC-5S

Strobe-Reflector Assy, 3 Light 02-0363171-000
Strobe-Lens, End Cap/9ECAPA Edge Replacement End Cap
Strobe-Lens, Amber/Optic 3.75” Whelen 68-1141474-10 (A)
Strobe Lens, Amber/Opt Rear Whelen 68-1183137-1S

Lens Amber Rear Small 68-3963228-10,A 500 Series

Vendor

Tandem Truck

B& C Truck

Unit Price Remarks

$604.23
$470.11
$ 84.00
$ 67.76
$ 44.47
$ 44.47
$180.00
$ 19.10
$ 44.47
$ 30.71
$ 5.65
$ 16.25
$ 495

$758.36
$604.46
$124.42
$ 92.76
$ 65.01
$ 82.86
$273.76
$ 26.87
$ 61.03
$ 48.18
$ 842
$ 25.18
$ 6.67



MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

WILLOW SPRINGS, MISSOURI

Tabulation of Bids Received September 14, 2007
Bid Number D9080464R9

Description

Strobe Control/Power-Supply Whelen ISP188

Strobe Light-Assy (Lt. Duty) P/U #9MMEDGEP

Strobe Light/Rear 500 Linear Whelen 01-0683565-A1
Strobe Tube Bulb Rear Light Whelen 7TELTUBWD

Strobe Tube Bulb Rear Light Whelen 02-0361417-00

Strobe Tube Bulb Top Light Whelen TURB094

Strobe Light M/D & XHD MCEDGELA Microedge

Strobe Switch, Lighted Whelen PC-5S

Strobe-Reflector Assy, 3 Light 02-0363171-000
Strobe-Lens, End Cap/9ECAPA Edge Replacement End Cap
Strobe-Lens, Amber/Optic 3.75” Whelen 68-1141474-10 (A)
Strobe Lens, Amber/Opt Rear Whelen 68-1183137-1S

Lens Amber Rear Small 68-3963228-10,A 500 Series

Vendor

*Code 3, Inc.

* Vendor is considered non-responsive due to no bids on several items.

Non-Responsive

Peterbilt of Springfield
Springfield Brake
Emergency Vehicle Parts
OMB Police Supply
Workizer

Unit Price Remarks

$139.69 Code 3 P/N S50889M

$311.11 Code 3 P/N X22SAH

No Bid

$ 13.78 Code 3 P/N T09424 Strobe tube
$ 13.78 Code 3 P/N T09424 Strobe tube
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 21.52 Code 3 P/N S51152M/S51153M
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 8.59 Code 3 P/N T07954



