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QUOTATION
TABULATION

District 8 - Purchasing

Thank you for your response to our Request for Informal Quotation # “D8PP-9017”". For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses which were received. This quotation

was awarded to: VVehicle Maintenance Program

If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown below. Buyer; Andy McNeill, Intermediate Procurement

Agent.
Qty U/M Group #1 - Wallingford’s Jack’s O’Reilly Genuine Workizer GM Auto Tire Vehicle Mills Iron | McKnight | AA Wheel MHC
DESCRIPTION Municipal Auto Parts Work Supply & Parts Co | Maintenance | & Supply Tire & Truck Kenworth
Sales Parts Company Products Program
80 Pair | 11.00R-22.5 Tire 70.16 71.93 97.25 107.45 77.95 70.50 105.50 62.17 72.67 90.97 101.21 138.76
Chains (V-Bar style)
300 Each | 11.00R-22.5 Cross 1.27 2.14 2.75 3.24 2.55 2.30 3.20 1.21 2.18 3.53 2.92 4.68
links
TOTAL COST: $5993.80 $6396.40 | $8605.00 | $9571.00 | 7001.00 | $6330.00 | $9400.00 | $5336.60 | 6467.60 | $8336.60 | $8972.80 | $12,504.80
Qty U/M Group #2 - Wallingford’s Jack’s O’Reilly Genuine Workizer GM Auto Tire Vehicle Mills Iron | McKnight | AA Wheel MHC
DESCRIPTION Municipal Auto Parts Work Supply & Parts Co | Maintenance | & Supply Tire & Truck Kenworth
Sales Parts Company Products Program
42 Pair | 315/80R-22.5 Tire No Bid 39.90 No Bid 54.74 42.95 40.00 54.00 37.99 40.31 No Bid 51.78 62.42
Chains (Cable Type)
13 Pair | 11.00R-22.5 Tire No Bid 39.90 83.76 54.74 42.95 40.00 54.00 33.39 40.31 139.86 51.78 53.92
Chains (Cable Type)
i $2194.50 | $1088.88 | $3010.70 | $2362.25 | $2200.00 | 2970.00 $2029.65 | $2217.0 | $1818.18 | $2847.90 | $3322.60
TOTAL COST: * 5 *

ADDITIONAL NOTES:
* Did not submit bid on both items on Group #2. Low bid on Group #1 and #2 is Vehicle Maintenance Program.

Andy McNeill, CPPB
Intermediate Procurement Agent
Phone: 417-895-7645




