
Contract D7-09-050
Vibratory Roller Rentals

Company Line 
Item 

Product Description Qty Length of lease= one(1) 
month or 30 days

Cost Per Unit Extended cost 
for units

Number of 
Months

Extended Costs Need Date Delivery Date Comments

Berry Tractor 001 Vibratory Rollers 1 2.2 Months $4,900 $4,900 3 $14,700 4-Jan 30-Mar BOMAG BW190AD-4

Berry Tractor 002 Vibratory Rollers 1 1.1 Months No Bid #VALUE! 1 $0.00 1-Apr 30-Mar One unit only

Berry Tractor 003 Vibratory Rollers 1 1.1 Months No Bid #VALUE! 1 $0.00 16-Apr 14-Apr

Berry Tractor 004 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 Weeks No Bid #VALUE! 1 #VALUE! 21-Apr 20-Apr

Berry Tractor 005 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 Weeks No Bid #VALUE! 3 #VALUE! 26-May 25-May

Berry Tractor 006 Vibratory Rollers 1 2 weeks No Bid #VALUE! 3 #VALUE! 1-Jun 29-May

Berry Tractor 007 Vibratory Rollers 1 2 weeks No Bid #VALUE! 2 #VALUE! 2-Jun 11-Jun

Berry Tractor 009 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 weeks No Bid #VALUE! 2 #VALUE! 6-Jul 2-Jul
July 6, 2009 - July 28, 

2009  3 Weeks

Berry Tractor 010 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 weeks No Bid #VALUE! 3 #VALUE! 6-Jul 2-Jul
July 6, 2009 - July 28, 

2009  3 Weeks

$4,900

Fabick 001 Vibratory Rollers 2 2.2 Months NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 4-Jan 30-Mar

Fabick 002 Vibratory Rollers 1 1.1 Months NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 1-Apr 30-Mar

Fabick 003 Vibratory Rollers 1 1.1 Months NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 16-Apr 14-Apr

Fabick 004 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 Weeks NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 21-Apr 20-Apr

Fabick 005 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 Weeks NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 26-May 25-May

Fabick 006 Vibratory Rollers 1 2 weeks NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 1-Jun 29-May

Fabick 007 Vibratory Rollers 1 2 weeks NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 2-Jun 11-Jun

Fabick 009 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 weeks NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 6-Jul 2-Jul
July 6, 2009 - July 28, 

2009  3 Weeks

Fabick 010 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 weeks NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 6-Jul 2-Jul
July 6, 2009 - July 28, 

2009  3 Weeks

Van Keppel 001 Vibratory Rollers 2 2.2 Months NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 4-Jan 30-Mar

Van Keppel 002 Vibratory Rollers 1 1.1 Months NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 1-Apr 30-Mar

Van Keppel 003 Vibratory Rollers 1 1.1 Months NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 16-Apr 14-Apr

Van Keppel 004 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 Weeks NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 21-Apr 20-Apr

Van Keppel 005 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 Weeks NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 26-May 25-May

Van Keppel 006 Vibratory Rollers 1 2 weeks NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 1-Jun 29-May

Van Keppel 007 Vibratory Rollers 1 2 weeks NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 2-Jun 11-Jun

Van Keppel 009 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 weeks NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 6-Jul 2-Jul
July 6, 2009 - July 28, 

2009  3 Weeks

Van Keppel 010 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 weeks NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote NO Quote 6-Jul 2-Jul
July 6, 2009 - July 28, 

2009  3 Weeks

June 4, 2009 - June 11, 2009  2 Weeks

April 16, 2009 - May 6, 2009  1 Month

April 21, 2009 - May 6, 2009 3 Weeks

April 1, 2009 - May 6, 2009  1.1 Months

May 26, 2009 - June 11, 2009  3 Weeks

June 1, 2009 - June 11, 2009   2 Weeks

April 1, 2009 - June 11, 2009  2.2 Months

April 1, 2009 - June 11, 2009  2.2 Months

April 1, 2009 - May 6, 2009  1.1 Months

April 16, 2009 - May 6, 2009  1 Month

April 21, 2009 - May 6, 2009 3 Weeks

April 1, 2009 - May 6, 2009  1.1 Months

April 16, 2009 - May 6, 2009  1 Month

April 21, 2009 - May 6, 2009 3 Weeks

May 26, 2009 - June 11, 2009  3 Weeks

June 1, 2009 - June 11, 2009   2 Weeks

June 4, 2009 - June 11, 2009  2 Weeks

Lease Period

May 26, 2009 - June 11, 2009  3 Weeks

June 1, 2009 - June 11, 2009   2 Weeks

June 4, 2009 - June 11, 2009  2 Weeks

April 1, 2009 - June 11, 2009  2.2 Months



Contract D7-09-050
Vibratory Roller Rentals

Company Line 
Item 

Product Description Qty Length of lease= one(1) 
month or 30 days

Cost Per Unit Extended cost 
for units

Number of 
Months

Extended Costs Need Date Delivery Date CommentsLease Period

Victor L. Phillips 001 Vibratory Rollers 1 2.2 Months $3,778 $3,778 4 15112.00 1-Apr 30-Mar Only one unit quoted

Victor L. Phillips 002 Vibratory Rollers 1 1.1 Months $0 $0 1 0.00 1-Apr 30-Mar

Victor L. Phillips 003 Vibratory Rollers 1 1.1 Months $0 $0 1 0.00 16-Apr 14-Apr

Victor L. Phillips 004 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 Weeks $0 $0 1 0.00 21-Apr 20-Apr

Victor L. Phillips 005 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 Weeks $0 $0 3 0.00 26-May 25-May

Victor L. Phillips 006 Vibratory Rollers 1 2 weeks $0 $0 3 0.00 1-Jun 29-May

Victor L. Phillips 007 Vibratory Rollers 1 2 weeks $0 $0 2 0.00 2-Jun 11-Jun

Victor L. Phillips 009 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 weeks $0 $0 2 0.00 6-Jul 2-Jul
July 6, 2009 - July 28, 

2009  3 Weeks

Victor L. Phillips 010 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 weeks $0 $0 3 0.00 6-Jul 2-Jul
July 6, 2009 - July 28, 

2009  3 Weeks

$3,778

Murphy Tractor 001 Vibratory Rollers 2 2.2 Months $3,500 $7,000 3 21000.00 4-Jan 30-Mar All Units required quoted

Murphy Tractor 002 Vibratory Rollers 1 1.1 Months $3,500 $3,500 1 0.00 1-Apr 30-Mar

Murphy Tractor 003 Vibratory Rollers 1 1.1 Months $3,500 $3,500 1 0.00 16-Apr 14-Apr

Murphy Tractor 004 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 Weeks $3,500 $3,500 1 3500.00 21-Apr 20-Apr

Murphy Tractor 005 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 Weeks $3,500 $3,500 3 10500.00 26-May 25-May

Murphy Tractor 006 Vibratory Rollers 1 2 weeks $3,500 $3,500 3 10500.00 1-Jun 29-May

Murphy Tractor 007 Vibratory Rollers 1 2 weeks $3,500 $3,500 2 7000.00 2-Jun 11-Jun

Murphy Tractor 009 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 weeks $3,500 $3,500 2 7000.00 6-Jul 2-Jul
July 6, 2009 - July 28, 

2009  3 Weeks Low Bid- Award Winner

Murphy Tractor 010 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 weeks $3,500 $3,500 3 10500.00 6-Jul 2-Jul
July 6, 2009 - July 28, 

2009  3 Weeks

$31,500

Cummings, 
McGowan & West 001 Vibratory Rollers 2 2.2 Months $15,500 $31,000 3 93000.00 4-Jan 30-Mar Subject to Avaliability

Cummings, 
McGowan & West 002 Vibratory Rollers 1 1.1 Months $9,200 $9,200 1 0.00 1-Apr 30-Mar Hours Usage

Cummings, 
McGowan & West 003 Vibratory Rollers 1 1.1 Months $7,100 $7,100 1 0.00 16-Apr 14-Apr 8 hour/day

Cummings, 
McGowan & West 004 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 Weeks $5,000 $5,000 1 5000.00 21-Apr 20-Apr 40 hour/week

Cummings, 
McGowan & West 005 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 Weeks $7,100 $7,100 3 21300.00 26-May 25-May 160 hour/month

Cummings, 
McGowan & West 006 Vibratory Rollers 1 2 weeks $5,000 $5,000 3 15000.00 1-Jun 29-May

Cummings, 
McGowan & West 007 Vibratory Rollers 1 2 weeks $2,900 $2,900 2 5800.00 2-Jun 11-Jun

Cummings, 
McGowan & West 009 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 weeks $7,100 $7,100 2 14200.00 6-Jul 2-Jul

July 6, 2009 - July 28, 
2009  3 Weeks

Cummings, 
McGowan & West 010 Vibratory Rollers 1 3 weeks $2,900 $2,900 3 8700.00 6-Jul 2-Jul

July 6, 2009 - July 28, 
2009  3 Weeks

$61,800
TOTAL TOTAL $101,978 TOTAL $0.00 TOTAL $0.00

April 1, 2009 - July 2, 2009           3 Months

April 1, 2009 - July 2, 2009           3 Months

April 16, 2009 - May 6, 2009  1 Month

April 21, 2009 - May 6, 2009 3 Weeks

May 26, 2009 - June 11, 2009  3 Weeks

June 1, 2009 - June 11, 2009   2 Weeks

April 1, 2009 - May 6, 2009  1.1 Months

April 16, 2009 - May 6, 2009  1 Month

April 1, 2009 - June 11, 2009  2.2 Months

April 1, 2009 - May 6, 2009  1.1 Months

April 21, 2009 - May 6, 2009 3 Weeks

May 26, 2009 - June 11, 2009  3 Weeks

June 1, 2009 - June 11, 2009   2 Weeks

June 4, 2009 - June 11, 2009  2 Weeks

June 4, 2009 - June 11, 2009  2 Weeks

April 1, 2009 - June 11, 2009  2.2 Months

April 16, 2009 - May 6, 2009  1 Month

April 21, 2009 - May 6, 2009 3 Weeks

May 26, 2009 - June 11, 2009  3 Weeks

June 1, 2009 - June 11, 2009   2 Weeks

June 4, 2009 - June 11, 2009  2 Weeks


