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February 27, 2008 
 
RE:  Hot Mix / Cold Mix  
        D7-08-062  Bid Tabulation 
 
To Whom It May Concern: 
 
The following is a tabulation of bids for Hot Mix and Cold Mix Commercial Asphalt F.O.B. that have been 
received and reviewed.  Note:  All invoices should reference D7-08-062.  A separate P.O. will be issued for 
each load. 
      
Tabulation Of Bids    Hot Mix  Cold Mix 
      (Per Ton)  (Per Ton) 
 
Ash Grove Butler               No Bid   $33.00 
Ash Grove El Dorado Springs/Dever             No Bid   $33.00 
Ash Grove Montevallo   No Bid   $33.00 
Ash Grove Osceola    No Bid   $33.00 
Ash Grove Rich Hill    No Bid   $33.00 
Ash Grove Stockton    No Bid   $33.00     
Bailey Quarries    No Bid   No Bid 
Blevins Carthage    $36.00   $41.00 
Blevins Chesapeake    $38.50   $42.00 
Hutchens Construction Monett/Purdy $40.08   $51.94 
Hutchens Construction Bella Vista, Ark $37.25   $53.40 
Iron Mountain Trap Rock   No Bid   $85.00 
Swift Construction     $31.80   $38.00 
Teeter’s Asphalt    $39.00   No Bid 
 
Due to MoDOT’s variable hauling and labor costs, all bidders are considered responsive and will be utilized.  
As Hot Mix and Cold Mix Asphalt are needed at various locations throughout the district, it will be ordered 
from the location nearest the maintenance building or job.  This contract pricing will take effect March 1, 
2008. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
Cathy Bay 
Intermediate Procurement Agent 
MoDOT – District 7 
417.629.3223 Phone 


