
MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

WILLOW SPRINGS, MISSOURI 

Tabulation of Bids Received March 30, 2011 

D9111539R9 

 

Description    Vendor   Unit    Price  Remarks 
 

Lubricating Oil, 15W-40  Universal Lubricants  Bulk/Gallon  $6.59/Gal Awarded Bid 

         2.5 Gallon  $7.01/Gal. 

         5-Quart  $6.81/Gal 

         Quart   $1.88/Qt. 

 

5W30 Motor Oil       5-Quart  No Bid 

       Quart   $1.93/Qt. 

Universal Hydraulic/ 

Transmission Oil       Bulk/Gallon  $5.41/Gal. 

         55 Gal. Drum  $5.61/Gal. 

         5-Gallon  $5.41/Gal. 

         2.5 Gallon  $5.41/Gal.  

          

MP Gear Oil, 85/140       5-Gallon  $7.41/Gal. 

         Quart   No Bid 

 

MP Gear Oil, 75W-90 

100% Synthetic       5-Gallon  $28.40/Gal. 

         Quart     $7.02/Qt. 

 

HI-TAC Grease       Pound   $1.76/Lb. 

 

Multi-Vehicle Synthetic 

Blend Transmission Fluid      Quart   $2.61/Qt. 



MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

WILLOW SPRINGS, MISSOURI 

Tabulation of Bids Received March 30, 2011 

 

Description    Vendor   Unit    Price  Remarks 
 

Lubricating Oil, 15W-40  MFA Oil Co.   Bulk/Gallon  $7.50/Gal. 

         2.5 Gallon  $8.95/Gal. 

         5-Quart  No Bid 

         Quart   $2.20/Qt. 

 

5W30 Motor Oil       5-Quart  No Bid 

       Quart   $2.35/Qt. 

Universal Hydraulic/ 

Transmission Oil       Bulk/Gallon  $6.75/Gal. 

         55 Gal. Drum  $7.50/Gal. 

         5-Gallon  $8.00/Gal. 

         2.5 Gallon  $8.00/Gal 

          

MP Gear Oil, 85/140       5-Gallon  $10.80/Gal. 

         Quart   $3.00/Qt. 

 

MP Gear Oil, 75W-90 

100% Synthetic       5-Gallon  26.80/Gal. 

         Quart   No Bid 

 

GC-L8 #2 Grease-Show Me      Pound   $1.96/Lb. 

 

Multi-Vehicle Synthetic 

Blend Transmission Fluid      Quart   $3.45/Qt. 

 



MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

WILLOW SPRINGS, MISSOURI 

Tabulation of Bids Received March 30, 2011 
 

Description    Vendor   Unit    Price  Remarks 
 

Lubricating Oil, 15W-40  Certified Laboratories  Bulk/Gallon  No Bid  7 days ARO 

         2.5 Gallon  No Bid. 

         5-Quart  No Bid 

         Quart   No Bid  

 

5W30 Motor Oil       5-Quart  No Bid 

       Quart   No Bid. 

Universal Hydraulic/ 

Transmission Oil       Bulk/Gallon  $16.61/Gal. 

         55 Gal. Drum  $17.73/Gal. 

         5-Gallon  $21.24/Gal. 

         2.5 Gallon  $23.07/Gal. 

          

MP Gear Oil, 85/140       5-Gallon  $24.17/Gal. 

         Quart   No Bid 

 

MP Gear Oil, 75W-90 

100% Synthetic       5-Gallon  No Bid 

         Quart   No Bid  

 

GC-L8 #2 Grease-Show Me      Lb   $221.24 per case/48 to a case 

 

Multi-Vehicle Synthetic      Quart   No Bid 

Blend Transmission Fluid   

     



Heathwood Oil Company    Non-Responsive 

     Hicks Oil      Non-Responsive  

     Gard Corp      Non-Responsive 

     D. A. Lubricant Company    Non-Responsive 

     Mid-South Sales     Non-Responsive 

     Hunter Oil Company     Non-Responsive 

     Dennis Oil Company     Non-Responsive 

     Hartog Oil Company     Non-Responsive 

     RS Used Oil Company    Non-Responsive 


