BAGGED AND BULK WINTER COLD MIX ASPHALTIC MATERIALS
Tabulation for Bid Request SW-13-024AM
2/4/2012 12:00 pm local time

BULK MATERIAL (ordered in 25 ton loads)

HD Supply,
QPR Quality Willard White Cap White Cap Paving
Pavement | Fred Weber, Longan Asphalt Construction [ Construction | Maintenance
Repair Inc. Const. Co. [ Paving, Inc. Supply Supply Supply, Inc. [Carter Waters
Quikcrete
Commercial
Winter Cold Grade Crafco HP
Mix (MC250 Seaboard Permanent | Asphalt Cold

QPR EZ Street Proline w/anti-stirp Bond X Blacktop Patch Saturock "F"
Barry No Bid No Bid $107.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Barton No Bid No Bid $111.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Bates No Bid No Bid $118.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Benton No Bid No Bid $125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Cedar No Bid No Bid $116.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Christian No Bid No Bid $116.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Dade No Bid No Bid $112.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Dallas No Bid No Bid $118.50 $108.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Greene No Bid No Bid $115.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Henry No Bid No Bid $123.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Hickory No Bid No Bid $121.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Jasper No Bid No Bid $107.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Lawrence No Bid No Bid $110.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
McDonald No Bid No Bid $103.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Newton No Bid No Bid $104.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Polk No Bid No Bid $117.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
St. Clair No Bid No Bid $119.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Stone No Bid No Bid $112.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Taney No Bid No Bid $121.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Vernon No Bid No Bid $114.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
Webster No Bid No Bid $117.00 $108.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.15
BAGGED MATERIAL (ordered in truckload quantites as specified below)
Barry $9.50 $15.00 $13.25 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Barton $9.50 $15.00 $13.50 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Bates $9.50 $15.00 $13.75 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Benton $9.50 $15.00 $14.00 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Cedar $9.50 $15.00 $13.50 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Christian $9.50 $15.00 $13.50 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Dade $9.50 $15.00 $13.50 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Dallas $9.50 $15.00 $13.75 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Greene $9.50 $15.00 $13.50 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Henry $9.50 $15.00 $14.00 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Hickory $9.50 $15.00 $13.75 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Jasper $9.50 $15.00 $13.25 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Lawrence $9.50 $15.00 $13.50 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
McDonald $9.50 $15.00 $13.25 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Newton $9.50 $15.00 $13.25 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Polk $9.50 $15.00 $13.50 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
St. Clair $9.50 $15.00 $13.75 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Stone $9.50 $15.00 $13.50 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Taney $9.50 $15.00 $13.75 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Vernon $9.50 $15.00 $13.50 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Webster $9.50 $15.00 $13.50 No Bid $9.97 $7.71 $8.93 $9.25
Bag weight 50 Ib. 50 50 50 50 50 60
Bags per pallet 63 56 50 56 63 60 56
pallets per truckload 15 10 81012 16 14 15 12

Willard Asphalt: $100.00/ton FOB Lebanon, MO plant - Order of 400 tons $5.00/ton discount
QPR: Bags can be purchased in single pallet quantities at Lowes for $13.98/bag.

This is a multiple award bid that shall serve as a method of establishing price agreements for our
maintenace areas. Material cost, availability, previous material quality, etc., may be used as
determining factors for selection of material source.

If you have any questions, please contact me at phone number (417) 895-7645.
Thank you,

Andy McNeill, CPPB

Senior Procurement Agent




