
Propane Bid Tabulation 

SW-13-021AM 

 

MoDOT 

LOCATION 

MFA OIL 

COMPANY 

BROOKS GAS 

CO., Inc. 

Amerigas 

Propane  L.P. 

Cassville $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Monett $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Butler $1.44 NO BID NO BID 

Rich Hill*(Will Call 

Only) 
$1.44 NO BID NO BID 

Cole Camp $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Warsaw $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

El Dorado Springs $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Stockton $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Greenfield $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Buffalo (includes old 

project office and new 

mechanics building) 

$1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Republic $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Springfield Lube 

Center 

$1.44 NO BID $1.294 

District Office Backup 

Generartor Tank (Will 

Call Only) 

$1.44  $1.294 

Strafford $1.44 $1.134 $1.294 

Fairgrove (Will Call 

Only) 

$1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Preston $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Wheatland (Will Call 

only) 

$1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Clinton (includes 

Project Office) 

$1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Urich (Will Call Only) $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Sarcoxie (Will Call 

Only) 

$1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Mt. Vernon $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Anderson $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Longview (Will Call 

Only) 

$1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Bolivar $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Halfway $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Humansville (Will Call 

Only) 

$1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Appleton City (Will Call 

Only) 

$1.44 NO BID $1.294 



Collins $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Galena $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Lampe $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Branson 

Maintenance/Project 

Office 

$1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Bradleyville $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Nevada $1.44 NO BID $1.294 

Marshfield $1.44 $1.134 $1.294 

Conway Welcome 

Center East Bound Side 

$1.44 $1.134 $1.294 

Conway Welcome 

Center West Bound 

Side (includes treatment 

plant backup generator 

tank) 

$1.44 $1.134 $1.294 

Seymour $1.44 $1.139 $1.294 

 

Low bids are highlighted in light blue 

 

October 23, 2012 9:30 a.m local time 


