BID POSTED

5/15/2012; 1:30 p.m.

e Van Keppel Berry Tractor Murphy Tractor
EXCAVATORS
Contract Period
5/1/12-4/30/13 #1 #2 #3 [ #5 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #1 #2 #3 #a #5
10-12 Metric  |15-16 Metric |20-21 Metric |22- 25 Metric|30 Metric 10-12 Metric  |15-16 Metric |20-21 Metric |22- 25 Metric|30 Metric 10-12 Metric  |15-16 Metric |20-21 Metric |22- 25 Metric|30 Metric
PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST
WEEKLY COST $1,160 $1,300 $1,460 $1,760 $1,948 $1,300 $1,465 $1,830 $2,200 $2,750 $1,100 $1,400 $1,700 $1,940 $3,000
MONTHLY COST $3,280 $3,780 $4,200 $5,040 $5,596 $3,900 $4,265 $5,500 $6,600 $8,250 $3,200 $4,200 $5,000 $5,810 $9,000
EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION
MAKE Volvo Volvo Volvo Volvo Volvo Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere
MODEL ECR145 EC160 EC210 EC240 EC290 PC128LC PC160LC PC200LC PC220LC PC300LC 120D 160D 200D 240D 350D
HORSEPOWER 92 116 147 168 192 89 121 155 179 246 93 121 159 177 271
DIGGING DEPTH 18'2" 19'10" 22'1" 22'11" 24' 18'1" 19'7" 21'9" 22'8" 24'3" 20" 21' 21'8" 24' 27"
MAX REACH 27'5" 29'5" 32'7" 33'8" 35'1" 27'2" 29'5" 32'5" 33'5" 36'5" 28'5" 30'7" 32 35'3" 38'11"
BUCKET SIZE RANGE .62-1.21 .92-1.47 1.08-1.86 1.37-2.39 1.50-2.55 24"-48" 20"-42" 24"-48" 24"-48 30"-54" 24"-42" 24"-48" 24"-48" 24"-54" 24"-76"
MAX LIFT AT MAX REACH FRONT  |5,600 8,047 10,050 12,600 14,060 4,500 5,000 10,000 5,650 11,800 8,940 14,137 20,308 25,633 2,700
MAX LIFT AT MAX REACH SIDE 3,390 5,049 6,390 8,390 8,760 4,500 5,000 10,000 5,650 11,800 8,990 8,525 12,435 17,214 24,935
OPERATING WEIGHT 33,450 42,108 4,500 56,879 65,918 28,375 37,130 51,820 54,930 78,820 29,250 39,980 49,940 54,660 77,330
MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way)
Permit Cost (one way) $4.00 $4.00 $4.50 $4.50 $5.00
Escort Cost (one way)
Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location =
Category 1
Faomies | | | | | | | | | |
$190 $215 $235 $255 $290 $250 $250 $285 $285 $285 $250 $250 $250 $250 $250
Category 2
rosme | | | | | | | | | |
$285 $310 $335 $350 $385 $300 $300 $335 $335 $335 $260 $260 $295 $295 $295
Category 3
66-100 miles | $385 | $410 | $430 $450 $485 $450 | $450 | $485 $485 | $485 $400 I $400 | $450 I $450 I $500
Category 4
101-135 miles | $475 | $500 | $520 $540 $575 $600 | $600 | $635 $635 | $635 $540 I $540 | $610 I $610 I $675
Category 5
136-170 miles | $570 | $595 | $615 $635 $670 $775 | $775 | $810 $810 | $810 $680 I $680 | $765 I $765 I $850
Category 6
171-205 miles | $725 I $765 | $805 $825 $860 $900 | $900 | $935 $935 | $935 $820 I $820 | $925 I $925 I $1,025




BID POSTED
5/15/2012; 1:30 p.m.

[ Midwest Equipment RSC United Rentals
EXCAVATORS
Contract Period
5/1/12-4/30/13 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #1 #3 20- |#1 #2 #3 #4 #5
10-12 Metric  |15-16 Metric |20-21 Metric |22- 25 Metric|30 Metric Ton 10-12 Metric |21 Metric Ton 10-12 Metric  |15-16 Metric |20-21 Metric |22- 25 Metric|30 Metric
PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $350 $375 $450 $550 $800 $595 $855 $590 $612 $713 $866 $1,029
WEEKLY COST $1,000 $1,100 $1,250 $1,500 $2,400) $1,788 $2,378 $1,387 $1,997 $2,170 $2,099 $2,789
MONTHLY COST $3,000 $3,300 $3,750 $4,500 $7,200) $4,258 $5,558 $3,145 $4,683 $5,019 $4,488 $7,539
EQUIPMENT INFORMATIONEQUIPMENT INFORMATION 4500 EQUIPMENT INFORMATION|EQUIPMENT INFORMATION
MAKE Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere
MODEL PC138 PC160 PC200 PC220 PC300 135D 2WLC 120 135 160 200 270
HORSEPOWER 92 121 148 168 246 93 159 89 94 112 141 188
DIGGING DEPTH 19'4" 20'6" 21'9" 24' 26'1" 19'9" 20'3" 19'6" 19'7" 21'7" 21'11" 25'11"
MAX REACH 28'7" 30'4" 32'5" 34'8" 39'1" 29' 30'11" 27'10" 28'5" 30'7" 32 37'1"
BUCKET SIZE RANGE 24"-48" 24"-48" 24"-48" 24"-48" 24"-48" 24"*36" 36"-42" 36" Std 36" Std 36" Std 42" Std 42" Std
MAX LIFT AT MAX REACH FRONT  |4,280 5,000 9,400 9,350 15,000 9,013 6,200 9,550 14,764 19,727
MAX LIFT AT MAX REACH SIDE 3,330 3,330 5,600 6,500 9,300 5,750 3,600 5,280 8,945
OPERATING WEIGHT 32,000 36,640 46,643 54,926 77,980 28,840 30,870 30,870 46,130 63,425
N MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One W MOBILIZATION COST (One Way)
Permit Cost (one way) $50.00 $50.00
Escort Cost (one way)
Vendor Starting Location = |Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location =
Category 1
1-30 miles
$225 $225 $270 $310 $325 $150 $150 $750 $800 $900 $950 $1,000
Category 2
31-65 miles
$270 $270 $315 $355 $375 $200 $200
Category 3
66-100 miles $315 | $315 | $360 $400 | $420 $250 | $250 | I | |
Category 4
101-135 miles $360 | $360 | $405 $445 | $465 $300 | $300 | I | |
Category 5
136-170 mil
36-170 miles $450 | $450 | $450 $535 | $555 $350 | $300 | I | |
Category 6
171-205 miles $540 I $540 | $585 $625 | $645 $400 | $400 | I | |




BID POSTED
5/15/2012; 1:30 p.m.

e Hertz Victor L. Phillips Fabick CAT
EXCAVATORS
Contract Period
5/1/12-4/30/13 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #1 #2 #3 #a #5
10-12 Metric  |15-16 Metric |20-21 Metric |22- 25 Metric|30 Metric 10-12 Metric  |15-16 Metric |20-21 Metric |22- 25 Metric|30 Metric 10-12 Metric  |15-16 Metric |20-21 Metric |22- 25 Metric|30 Metric
PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $381 $411 $491 $491 $781 $440 $440 $650 $695 $715 $375 $500 $550 $650 $900
WEEKLY COST $996 $1,083 $1,463 $1,463 $2,183 $1,200 $1,200 $1,750 $2,025 $2,265 $1,200 $1,500 $1,650 $1,950 $2,700
MONTHLY COST $3,119 $3,689 $4,275 $4,275 $7,189 $3,600 $3,600 $4,950 $6,075 $6,385 $3,500 $4,500 $4,950 $5,850 $8,100
EQUIPMENT INFORMATIONEQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION
MAKE Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere CASE Hyundai CASE CASE CASE CAT CAT CAT CAT CAT
MODEL 120DLC 160DLC 200DLC 200DLC 350DLC CX130 R140 CX210 CX240 CX290 308 312 315 320 328
HORSEPOWER 93 121 121 159 271 95 108 157 177 207 55.6 90 115 148 204
DIGGING DEPTH 19'11" 21'4" 21'4" 21'11" 26'10" 18'2" 18'2" 20' 22'7" 23'4" 15'5" 19'10" 21'6" 24' 21'7"
MAX REACH 28'5" 30'7" 30'7" 32'7" 38'11" 3+'10" 27'1" 28'10" 31'7" 32'11" 22" 28' 29' 32' 33'
BUCKET SIZE RANGE 24"-36" 24"-36" 24"-36" 24'-48' 48"-60" 36"-42" 36"-48" 36"-48" 36"-48" 42"-54" 12"-36" 18"-36" 24"-48" 24"-54" 36"-66"
MAX LIFT AT MAX REACH FRONT 3,967 5,363 5,363 8,048 12,275 3,152 3,400 6,100 6,250 9,350 2,425 3,300 6,064 8,600 9,950
MAX LIFT AT MAX REACH SIDE 2,511 5,363 5,363 8,048 9,996 2,160 2,560 4,950 5,600 6,750 1,984 2,600 4,234 4,900 7,250
OPERATING WEIGHT 30,702 39,980 39,980 49,940 77,970 37,800 31,000 4,740 55,500 65,500 18,500 29,000 38,100 47,400 65,000
N MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way)
Permit Cost (one way) $15.00 $15.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00
Escort Cost (one way)
Vendor Starting Location = |Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location =
Category 1
1-30 miles
$48 l $48 | $48 $48 I $48 $225 | $225 I $270 | $310 | $325 $150 I $150 | $150 $250 $500
Category 2
31-65 miles
$96 | $96 | $96 $96 | $96 $270 | $270 | $315 | $355 | $375 $250 | $250 | $250 $400 $500
Category 3
66-100 miles sie | swa | swa sua | swa a5 | sas | sse0 | a0 | sazs s;0 | ;0 | ss00 $400 $500
Category 4
101-135 miles $192 | $192 | $192 $192 | $192 $360 | $360 | $405 | $445 | $465 $400 I $400 | $400 $500 $700
Category 5
136-170 miles $240 | $240 | $240 $240 I $240 $450 | $450 | $495 | $535 | $555 $400 I $400 | $400 $500 $700
Category 6
171-205 miles $288 I $200 | $288 $288 | $288 $540 | $540 | $585 | $625 | $645 $500 I $500 | $500 $700 $700




P Van Keppel Berry Tractor Murphy Tractor Midwest Equipment RSC
BACKHOES
Contract Period
5/1/12-4/30/13 #2 #1 #2 #3 #1 #2 #3 #1 #2 #3 #1 #2
14' With 14' Class with [14' With 15' Class 14' Class with |14' With 15' Class 14' Class with |14' With 15' Class 14' Class with |14' With
PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $250.00 $250.00 $300.00 $200.00 $200.00 $300.00 $335.00 $388.00
WEEKLY COST $636.00 $750.00 $750.00 $900.00 $600.00 $600.00 $600.00 $500.00 $500.00 $600.00 $798.00 $888.00
MONTHLY COST $1,800.00 $2,250.00 $2,250.00| $2,700.00 $1,785.00 $1,785.00| $1,785.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00| $1,800.00 $26.00 $1,798.00
EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION RUIPMENT INFORMATI(
MAKE Volvo Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Deere Deere Deere Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Deere Deere
MODEL BL70B WB146 WA146 WB156 310J 310J 310J WB140 /146 |WB140/146 |WB156 310J 310J
HORSEPOWER 90 88 88 95 84 84 84 88 88 95 72 84
INCLUDES CAB Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
INCLUDES AUX HYDRAULICS Y Available Available Available Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
OPERATING WEIGHT 17248 15090 NA 16530 16220 16220 16220 16090 16090 16530 14700 15400
MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) | MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) | MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) BILIZATION COST (One \
Permit Cost (one way) $4.00 $4.00 $4.00
Escort Cost (one way)
Vendor Starting Location Vendor Starting Location Vendor Starting Location Vendor Starting Location Vendor Starting Location
Category 1
1-30 miles
$190.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $135.00 $135.00
Category 2
31-65 miles
$285.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $270.00 $270.00 $270.00 $150.00 $150.00
Category 3
66-100 miles
$385.00 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 $400.00 $400.00 $400.00 $315.00 $315.00 $315.00 $185.00 $185.00
Category 4
101-135 miles
$475.00 $600.00 $600.00 $600.00 $540.00 $540.00 $540.00 $360.00 $360.00 $360.00 $225.00 $250.00
Category 5
136-170 miles
$570.00 $775.00 $775.00 $775.00 $680.00 $680.00 $680.00 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 $260.00 $260.00
Category 6
171-205 miles
$725.00 $900.00 $900.00 $900.00 $820.00 $820.00 $820.00 $540.00 $540.00 $540.00 $300.00 $300.00




P United Rental Hertz Victor L. Phillips Fabick CAT
BACKHOES
Contract Period
5/1/12-4/30/13 #1 #2 #3 #1 #2 #3 #2 #3 #1 #2 #3
14' Class with |14' With 15' Class 14' Class with [14' With 15' Class 14' With 15' Class 14’ Class with |14' With 15' Class
PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $348.00 $357.00 $352.00 $202.00 $181.00 $220.00 $300.00 $395.00 $350.00 $350.00 $450.00
WEEKLY COST $1,258.00 $1,131.00| $1,590.00 $503.00 $443.00 $499.00 $825.00 $925.00 $800.00 $800.00| $1,250.00
MONTHLY COST $1,865.00 $1,973.00| $3,182.00 $11,953.00 $1,469.00| $1,650.00 $2,025.00| $2,650.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00| $3,400.00
EQUIPMENT INFORMATIO| EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION
MAKE Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere CASE CASE CAT CAT CAT
MODEL 310 310J 410) 310J 310J 410) 580SN 590SN 420E 420E 450E
HORSEPOWER 70 73 98 84 84 98 92 95 93 93 102
INCLUDES CAB Pending Availability Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
INCLUDES AUX HYDRAULICS Pending Availability Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
OPERATING WEIGHT 12800 15400 15880 13880 18017 19022 16500 19000 16000 16000 20000
MOBILIZATION COST (One] MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) | MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) |[ILIZATION COST (One | MOBILIZATION COST (One Way)
Permit Cost (one way)
Escort Cost (one way)

Vendor Starting Location

Vendor Starting Location

Vendor Starting Location

Vendor Starting Location

Category 1
1-30 miles
$129.00 $129.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $225.00 $225.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00
Category 2
31-65 miles
$129.00 $129.00 $96.00 $96.00 $96.00 $270.00 $270.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00
Category 3
66-100 miles
$129.00 $129.00 $144.00 $144.00 $144.00 $315.00 $315.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00
Category 4
101-135 miles
$192.00 | $192.00 | $192.00 $360.00 $360.00 $300.00 | $300.00 | $300.00
Category 5
136-170 mil
mies $240.00 | $240.00 | $240.00 | $450.00 | $450.00 $500.00 | $500.00 | $500.00
Category 6
171-205 miles $288.00 | $288.00 | $288.00 $540.00 $540.00 $500.00 | $500.00 | $500.00




W Van Keppel Berry Tractor Murphy Tractor
Contract Period
5/1/12-4/30/13 #1 #2 #3 #a #5 #5 #6 #1 1300 [#2 #3 #4 #5 #6
2000 b Lift {2500 b 3000 Ib Lift {2500 lb 3000 Ib Lift §2500 b Lift |3000 Ib Lift Jlb Lift 1500 b Lift 11700 Ib Lift 12000 Ib Lift {2500 Ib Lift |3000 Ib Lift
PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST WHEEL TRACK
WEEKLY COST $532.00 $645.00 $795.00 $645.00 $795.00) $750.00 $780.00)
MONTHLY COST $1,512.00 $1,890.00 $2,363.00; $1,890.00 $2,363.00] $2,250.00 $2,340.00| $1,200.00 $1,200.00| $1,200.00| $1,600.00| $1,800.00 $1,800.00|
EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION
MAKE Volvo Volvo Volvo Volvo Volvo Komatsu Komatsu Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere
MODEL MC110C MC115C MC135C MCT125 MC135C CK30 CK35 317 317 317 320 325 332
HORSEPOWER 84 84 92 84 92 84 84 57 57 57 62 70 75
BUCKET WIDTH (SIZE RANGE) 84" 78-84 78-84 84" 84" 80" 80" 72" 72" 72" 78" 84" 84"
MAX REACH AT TOP 2'11" 125" 125" 2'11" 2'11" 13'0" 13"0" 114" 114" 114" 115.2" 125" 127"
OPERATING WEIGHT 10,205 7,971 8,430 10,205 10,663 9,550 10,060 1750 1750 1750 1950 2500 3125
LIST OF ATTACHMENTS AVALIABLE Buckets, Hammers, Forks
MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way)
Permit Cost (one way) $3.50 $3.50 $3.50 $3.50 $3.50 $3.50
Escort Cost (one way)
Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location =
Category 1 Category 1
1-30 miles
$190.00 $190.00 $190.00 $190.00 $190.00 $250.00 $250.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00
Category 2
31-65 miles
$285.00 $285.00 $285.00 $285.00 $285.00 $300.00 $300.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00
Category 3
66-100 miles
$385.00 $385.00 $385.00 $385.00 $385.00 $450.00 $450.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00
Category 4
101-135 miles
$475.00 $475.00 $475.00 $475.00 $475.00 $600.00 $600.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00
Category 5
136-170 miles
$570.00 $570.00 $570.00 $570.00 $570.00 $750.00 $750.00 $275.00 $275.00 $275.00 $275.00 $275.00 $275.00
Category 6
171-205 miles
$725.00 $725.00 $725.00 $725.00 $725.00 $900.00 $900.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00




W Midwest Equipment RSC United Rentals
Contract Period
5/1/12-4/30/13 #2 #3 #a #5 #6 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #6 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5
1500 b Lift 11700 Ib Lift 12000 Ib Lift {2500 lb Lift 3000 Ib Lift 1300 Ib Lift 1500 |b Lift 1700 Ib Lift 2000 Ib Lift 2500 Ib Lift {3000 Ib Lift §1300 Ib Lift {1500 Ib Lift 1700 Ib Lift 12000 Ib Lift {2500 Ib Lift
=
PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $150.00 $150.00 $175.00 $175.00 $300.00| $218.00 $248.00 $278.00 $315.00 $378.00 $408.00| $206.00 $189.00 $220.00 $320.00 $350.00)
WEEKLY COST $450.00 $450.00 $525.00 $525.00 $900.00| $718.00 $738.00 $788.00 $828.00 $958.00 $1,058.00| $816.00 $561.00 $640.00 $894.00| $1,209.00
MONTHLY COST $1,350.00 $1,350.00| $1,500.00| $1,500.00 $2,000.00)| $1,378.00 $1,418.00 $1,488.00 $1,528.00| $1,968.00| $2,298.00 $1,105.00| $1,432.00| $1,648.00| $1,925.00| $2,236.00|
EQUIPMENT INFORMATION
MAKE Kmomatsu |Kmomatsu |Kmomatsu |Kmomatsu [Kmomatsu Bobcat Bobcat/Deere Bobcat/Deere Bobcat/Deere Bobcat Bobcat Deere Deere Deere Takenchi Takenchi
MODEL SK815 SK820 SK1020 SK1026 CK30/35 5130 5160/315 5175/318 630/320 T650 T300/T750 |315 .05 320 TL240 TL250
HORSEPOWER 54 54 70 84 84 46 56 46/58 74 74 81 45 30 66 81 98
BUCKET WIDTH (SIZE RANGE) 68-74 68-74 74 74-80 80 60" 60" 60-72" 60-84" 60-84" 60-84" 66" 33" 72" 78" 78"
MAX REACH AT TOP 115 118 122 128 121/129 91" 9'6" 9'g" /7'10" 9'8" 9'8" 13'4" 89" 114" 115.2 94.8" 98"
OPERATING WEIGHT 6050 6480 7573 8068 9546/10053 4740 6192 5800/6450 7957 9440 9702 5200 6300 6435 9590 11905
LIST OF ATTACHMENTS AVALIABLE
MOE MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way)
Permit Cost (one way)
Escort Cost (one way)
Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location =
Category 1
1-30 miles
$225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $135.00 $129.00 $129.00 $129.00 $129.00 $129.00
Category 2
31-65 miles
$270.00 $270.00 $270.00 $270.00 $270.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $129.00 $129.00 $129.00 $129.00 $129.00
Category 3
66-100 miles
$315.00 $315.00 $315.00 $315.00 $315.00 $180.00 $180.00 $180.00 $180.00 $180.00 $180.00 $129.00 $129.00 $129.00 $129.00 $129.00
Category 4
101-135 miles
$360.00 $360.00 $360.00 $360.00 $360.00 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00
Category 5
136-170 miles
$450.00 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 $260.00 $260.00 $260.00 $260.00 $260.00 $260.00
Category 6
171-205 miles
: | $540.00 $540.00 $540.00 $540.00 $540.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 | | | |




| Hertz Victor L. Phillips Fabick CAT
SKID STEERS
Contract Period
5/1/12-4/30/13 43 ‘m ‘ns 1300 ’#z ’#3 #4 #5 #6
1700 Ib Lift [2000 Ib Lift [2500 Ib Lift 1500 Ib Lift 1700 Ib Lift [2000 Ib Lift [2500 Ib Lift (3000 Ib Lift
PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $141.00 $151.00 $171.00) $150.00 $170.00 $240.00 $260.00I $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $225.00 $250.00)
WEEKLY COST $313.00 $333.00 $373.00]  $450.00 $450.00 $650.00 $675.00] $450.00 $450.00|  $450.00 $450.00 $650.00 $700.00
MONTHLY COST $750.00 $779.00 $825.00] $1,165.00| $1,165.00| $1,650.00 $1,800.00| $1,400.00 $1,400.00| $1,400.00| $1,400.00| $1,750.00 $2,100.00|
EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION
MAKE Bobcat Deere Deere CASE CASE CASE CASE CAT CAT CAT CAT CAT CAT
MODEL 5175 320D 320D SV185 SR200 SR250 SV300 216 226 242 246 252 272
HORSEPOWER 46 63 70 57 70 84 84 51 61. 62 75 75 94
BUCKET WIDTH (SIZE RANGE) 68" 72" 78" 72" 72" 72" 72" 66-78" 66-78" 66-78" 66-78" 66-78" 66-78"
MAX REACH AT TOP 29.6" 36" 33" 120" 123" 125" 130" 122" 122" 12'11" 12'11" 13'4" 13'6"
OPERATING WEIGHT 5808 6600 8125 6500 6900 7700 8300 5800 5900 6900 7200 7900 8300
LIST OF ATTACHMENTS AVALIABLE All Attachments Avaliable
MO MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way)
Permit Cost (one way)
Escort Cost (one way)
Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location =
Category 1
1-30 miles
$48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $225.00 | $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 | $100.00 $100.00 $100.00
Category 2
31-65 miles
$96.00 $96.00 $96.00 $270.00 | $270.00 $270.00 $270.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 | $125.00 $125.00 $125.00
Category 3
66-100 miles
$144.00 $144.00 $144.00 $315.00 $315.00 $315.00 $315.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00
Category 4
101-135 miles
$192.00 $192.00 $192.00 $360.00 $360.00 $360.00 $360.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00
Category 5
136-170 miles
$240.00 $240.00 $240.00 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 $400.00 $400.00 $400.00 $400.00 $400.00 $400.00
Category 6
171-205 miles
$288.00 | $288.00 $288.00 | $540.00 | $540.00 $540.00 $540.00 $400.00 $400.00 $400.00 | $400.00 $400.00 $400.00




Van Keppel Berry Tractor Murphy Midwest
DOZERS
Contract Period
5/1/12-4/30/13 #3 90 J#1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5
HP 70 HP 80 HP 90 HP 125 HP 200 HP 70 HP 80 HP 90 HP 125 HP 200 HP 70 HP 80 HP 90 HP 125 HP 200 HP
PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $275 $300 $450 $600 $900
\WEEKLY COST $1,116 $850 $900 $1,200 $1,800 $2,400 $1,000 $1,200 $1,425 $2,700 $3,500 $750 $900 $1,350 $1,700 $2,250
MONTHLY COST $2,076 $2,500 $2,700 $3,600 $5,400 $7,250 $3,000 $3,500 $4,250 $8,000 $10,000 $2,250 $2,700 $3,600 $4,900 $6,750
EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION
MAKE Dressta Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu
MODEL TD10 D31 D37 D39 D51 D65 450) 550 650 750) 850 D31 D37 D39 D41 /D51 D65
HORSEPOWER 101 75 85 95 130 205 74 84 99 155 200 78 89 106 130 205
OPERATING WEIGHT 19375 15,720 16,340 18,780 28,050 44,710 17500 18250 19750 36425 45000 18056 18298 20834 28484 45129
BLADE CAPACITY 2.5 2 yds 2.25Yd 3yd 3.8yd 7.3yd 96" -124" 96" -124" 96"-128" 135"-156" 146" -168" 211 232 2.9 3.53 7.34
CAB Y OR N N Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) 4280
Permit Cost (one way) $4.50 $4.50 $4.50 $4.50 $5.00
Escort Cost (one way)
Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location =
Category 1
1-30 miles
$190 $250 $250 $285 $285 $285 $300 $300 $300 $300 $635 $225 $225 $225 $225 $225
Category 2
31-65 miles
$285 $300 $300 $335 $335 $335 $300 $300 $300 $300 $635 $270 $270 $270 $270 $270
Category 3
66-100 miles
$385 $450 $450 $485 $485 $485 $300 $300 $300 $300 $635 $315 $315 $315 $315 $315
Category 4
101-135 miles
$475 $600 $600 $635 $635 $635 $450 $450 $450 $450 $750 $360 $360 $360 $360 $360
Category 5
136-170 miles
$570 $775 $775 $810 $810 $810 $565 $565 $565 $565 $800 $450 $450 $450 $450 $450
Category 6
171-205 miles
$725 $900 $900 $900 $900 $900 $675 $675 $675 $675 $1,000 $450 $450 $450 $450 $450




RSC United Rentals Hertz Victor L. Phillips Fabick
DOZERS
Contract Period
5/1/12-4/30/13 #1 #3 #1 #2 #3 #4 #1 #2 #3 #4 #1 #3 #4 #5 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5
70 HP 90 HP 70 HP 80 HP 90 HP 125 HP 70 HP 80 HP 90 HP 125 HP 70 HP 90 HP 125 HP 200 HP 70 HP 80 HP 90 HP 125 HP 200 HP
PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $498 $698 $517 $534 $588 $959 $311 $321 $335 $580 $360 $450 $575 $350 $400 $450 $625 $900
\WEEKLY COST $1,498 $1,898 $1,455 $1,508 $1,940 $2,579 $733 $743 $893 $1,700 $1,050 $1,200 $1,550 $2,200 $950 $1,100 $1,250 $1,850 $2,700
MONTHLY COST $4,000 $4,678 $3,609 $3,783 $4,560 $6,969 $2,299 $2,531 $2,841 $5,289 $3,150 $3,850 $4,800 $6,750 $2,800 $3,250 $3,950 $5,500 $8,500
EQUIPMENT INFORI EQUIPMENT EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION
MAKE Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere CASE CASE CASE CASE CAT CAT CAT CAT CAT
MODEL 450) 650) 450) 550J 650J 750) 4505-LGP 5505-LGP 6505-LGP 7505-LGP 650K 850K 1150K 1850K D3K D4K D5K D6K D6T
HORSEPOWER 74 99 70 80 90 145 77 85 99 150 75 96 120 190 70 80 90 125 225
OPERATING WEIGHT 17525 20750 16283 17016 18560 32585 17525 18252 19750 36725 19400 21700 27850 49800 17000 17500 20000 28500 4500
BLADE CAPACITY 10'4"x30" | 10'8" x32.5" 2¢cy 21cy 26¢cy 4.23cy 124" 124" 124" 156" 2.6 2.7 4.2 7.3 1.88 yd 2.5yd 2.86yd 3.5yd 55yd
CAB Y OR N Y Y Varies Varies Varies Varies Y Y Y Y N Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
MOBILIZATION COST (| MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way)
Permit Cost (one way) $50.00 $50.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA Included
Escort Cost (one way) NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA Included
Vendor Starting Locfendor Starting Location Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location =
Category 1
1-30 miles
$150 $150 $129 $129 $129 $129 $48 $48 $48 $48 $225 $225 $250 $270 $150 $150 $150 $150 $400
Category 2
31-65 miles
$200 $200 $129 $129 $129 $129 $96 $96 $96 $96 $270 $270 $295 $315 $250 $250 $250 $350 $500
Category 3
66-100 miles
$250 $250 $129 $129 $129 $129 $144 $144 $144 $144 $315 $315 $340 $360 $300 $300 $300 $500 $500
Category 4
101-135 miles
$300 $300 $192 $192 $192 $192 $360 $360 $385 $405 $400 $400 $400 $700 $700
Category 5
136-170 miles
$350 $350 $240 $240 $240 $240 $475 $475 $495 $520 $400 $400 $400 $700 $700
Category 6
171-205 miles $400 | $400 $288 | $288 | $288 | $288 $360 | $560 | $590 | $625 $500 | $500 I $500 I $700 | $700




Van Keppel Berry Tractor Murphy Tractor Midwest
WHEEL LOADERS
Contract Period
5/1/12-4/30/13 #1 #2 #3 #a #5 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #1 #2 #a #5 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5
2Yard 2.5 Yard 3.5 Yard 4Yard 5 Yard 2 Yard 2.5 Yard 3.5 Yard 4 Yard 5 Yard 2 Yard 2.5 Yard 3.5 Yard 4Yard 5 Yard 2 Yard 2.5 Yard 3.5 Yard 4Yard 5 Yard
PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $400 $430 $585 $620 $300 $350 $450 $500 $700
\WEEKLY COST $600 $1,088 $1,460 $1,760 $2,360]  $1,200 $1,300 $1,500 $1,870 $2,700 $1,440 $1,440 $2,070 $2,370 $3,500 $750 $900 $1,250 $1,400 $2,000
MONTHLY COST $1,800 $3,024 $4,200 $5,040 $6,720 $3,500 $3,900 $5,200 $5,600 $8,000 $4,320 $4,320 $6,210 $7,110 $10,000) $2,250 $2,700 $3,750 $4,200 $6,000
EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION
MAKE Volvo Volvo Volvo Volvo Volvo Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu Komatsu
MODEL L20F L60F L9OF L110F L150F WA150 WA200 WA320 WA380 WA480 444) 444) 624) 644) 744) WA150 WA200 WA320 WA380 WA450
HORSEPOWER 56 153 172 198 271 96 126 167 191 299 128 128 298 232 304 98 126 167 191 272
HEIGHT TO HINGE PIN 104" 12'8" 13" 132" 142" D.O.TS. D.O.TS. D.O.TS. D.O.TS. D.O.TS. 11'10" 110" 13' 13'4" 141" 116 12.2 12.1 13.5 14.4
REACH TO TOP HEIGHT 27" 33" 41" 4'8" 5'4" D.O.TS. D.O.TS. D.O.TS. D.O.TS. D.OTS. 5'10" 5'10" 6'4" 5'6" 6'11" 3.1 3.1 3.5 3.9 4.1
TIP CAPACITY FRONT 7,055 18,600 23,550 29,224 45,285 14,963 21,495 28,110 33,885 46,200 15635 15635 25483 33576 39152 14873 21363 27365 32100 39860
TIP CAPACITY FULL TURN 6,175 15,520 2,100 24,840 38,493 13,014 18,530 25,045 28,625 39,725 13469 13469 21949 28937 37750 12939 18397 24560 27800 34679
(OPERATING WEIGHT 10,030 27,120 37,480 41,950 55,000 17,295 23,259 31,680 38,760 56,340 25460 25460 33773 4079 53315 17311 23259 31680 38760 49780
MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way)
Permit Cost (one way) | | | | | $4.00 | $4.00 ‘ $5.00 ‘ $5.00 $5.00 | |
scortCostfoneway) | | | | | | | | |
Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location =
Category 1
1-30 miles
$190 $190 $190 $190 $215 $250 $250 $285 $285 $285 $250 $250 $350 $350 $350 $225 $225 $250 $250 $270
Category 2
31-65 miles
$285 $285 $285 $285 $310 $300 $300 $335 $335 $335 $260 $260 $350 $350 $350 $270 $270 $270 $295 $315
Category 3
66-100 miles
$385 $385 $385 $385 $410 $450 $450 $485 $485 $485 $400 $400 $500 $500 $500 $315 $315 $315 $340 $360
Category 4
101-135 miles
$475 $475 $4,750 $475 $500 $600 $600 $635 $635 $635 $540 $540 $675 $675 $675 $360 $360 $360 $385 $405
Category 5
136-170 miles
$570 $570 $570 $570 $595 $775 $775 $810 $810 $810 $680 $680 $850 $850 $850 $450 $450 $450 $475 $495
Category 6
171-205 miles
$725 $725 $725 $725 $765 $900 $900 $935 $935 $935 $820 $820 51,025 51,025 51,025 $540 $540 $540 $465 $585




RSC United Rental Hertz Victor L. Phillips Fabick
WHEEL LOADERS
Contract Period
5/1/12-4/30/13 #1 #3 42 #3 #4 42 #3 #a 41 #2 #3 # 11 #2 #3
2 Yard 3.5 Yard 2.5 Yard 3.5 Yard 4Yard 2.5 Yard 3.5 Yard 4Yard 2 Yard 2.5 Yard 3.5 Yard 4Yard 2 Yard 2.5 Yard 3.5 Yard
PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $658 $758 $594 $635 $650 $379 $399 $525) $365 $450 $565 $700 $350 $400 $550
WEEKLY COST $2,008 $2,238 $1,588 $2,451 $2,468 $1,075 $1,200 $1,292] $1,100 $1,345 $1,695 $2,100] $1,000 $1,200 $1,600]
MONTHLY COST $3,998 $4,958 $4,853 $5,989 $6,474 $3,300 $3,650 $4,305| $3,300 $4,045 $5,085 $6,295| $3,000 $4,000 $5,000]
EQUIPMENT EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION
MAKE Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere CASE CASE CASE CASE CAT CAT CAT
MODEL 244) 544K 544R 621) 644K 544) 624 644/ 521E 521E 721E 821E 914 924 930
HORSEPOWER 59 145 167 160 232 167 198 232 131 162 183 213 101 132 152
HEIGHT TO HINGE PIN 10'6" 12'9" 13'8" 94" 14'11" 12'7" 13" 137" 142.1 150.8 156.6 162.3 117" 12'8" 139"
REACH TO TOP HEIGHT 91" 33" 34" 310" 26" 25" 25" 186.8 194 208.5 310.8 6'8" 74" 80"
TIP CAPACITY FRONT 8457 24740 20480 25639 26978 21993 25639 34379 18291 23376 27616 31376 13382 17106 21907
TIP CAPACITY FULL TURN 20799 17678 21854 23165 18653 21854 30520 15939 20379 23933 27110 11675 14987 19166
OPERATING WEIGHT 11552 28263 28464 31691 41215 30511 36275 44005 23100 27406 30644 37844 16797 21819 28332
MOBILIZATION COST MOBILIZATION COST MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way)
Permit Cost (one way) $50.00 | $50.00 $1,ooo.ool $1,ooo.ool $1,000.00 NA ‘ NA ‘ $50.00 Jin Frieght ‘In Frieght |\n Frieght |\n Frieght NA | NA ‘ NA
Escort Cost (one way) | NA ‘ NA NA In Frieght In Frieght In Frieght |\n Frieght NA | NA ‘ NA
Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location =
Category 1
1-30 miles
$150 $150 $48 $48 $48 $225 $225 $250 $250 $150 $150 $150
Category 2
31-65 miles
$200 $200 $96 $96 $96 $270 $270 $270 $295 $250 $250 $250
Category 3
66-100 miles
$250 $250 $144 $144 $144 $315 $315 $315 $340 $300 $300 $300
Category 4
101-135 miles
$300 $300 $192 $192 $192 $360 $360 $360 $385 $400 $400 $400
Category 5
136-170 miles
$350 $350 $240 $240 $240 $450 $450 $450 $475 $400 $400 $400
Category 6
171-205 miles
$400 $400 $288 $288 $288 $540 $540 $540 $565 $500 $500 $500




Victor L. Berry Tractor Murphy Tractor Midwest Equipment RSC United Rentals Hertz Victor L. Phillips Fabick CAT
TRACK LOADERS  |phitiips
(Crawler Loaders)
Contract Period
5/1/12-4/30/13 #2 NO BID #1 120 |#2 175 HP J#1 175 HP NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID #1 120 |#2 175
175 HP HP 120 HP HP HP
PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $600 $650 $800 $1,000)
WEEKLY COST $1,520) $1,890 $2,610 $1,575 $1,950 $2,400 $3,000)
MONTHLY COST $4,560) $5,670 $7,830 $4,725 $5,850 $6,700 $8,500)
EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQCRIEVIENT] EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION ECCIRIVIENT) EQCIRVENT EQDIRVENT EQCIRIENT) EQUIPMENT INFORMATION
INFORMATION INFORMATION | INFORMATION | INFORMATION | INFORMATION
MAKE CAT Deere Deere CAT CAT CAT CAT
MODEL 963C 655C 755C 953C / 953D 963C / 963D 953 963
HORSEPOWER 160 130 181 128 /148 158 /189 127 189
HEIGHT TO HINGE PIN 12'11" 144" 13'4" 112" 11'9" 12'11"
REACH AT TOP HEIGHT 3'9" 42" 48" 32" 3'g" 9' 9'9"
BUCKET CAPACITY 2.25 23cy 31cy 2.35 3.0 2.25yd 3yd
OPERATING WEIGHT 41940 33950 46255 32895 / 34341 43186 32000 45000
MOBILIZATION COST (One Way)  LIZATION COST (Ond MOBILIZATION COST MOBILIZATION COST [OBILIZATION COJOBILIZATION COJOBILIZATION COJOBILIZATION CO! MOBILIZATION COST
Permit Cost (one way) $4.00 $5.00 NA NA
Escort Cost (one way) NA NA

Vendor Starting Location =

Vendor Starting Locd

Vendor Starting Location =

Vendor Starting Location =

Vendor Starting

Vendor Starting L{

Vendor Starting L

Vendor Starting |

Vendor Starting Location =

Category 1
1-30 miles | $235 $250 | $250 $225 | $225 $180 | $180
Category 2
31-65 miles | $335 $260 | $325 $270 | $270 $250 | $250
Category 3
66-100 miles
| $430 $400 | $500 $315 | $315 $400 | $400
Category 4
101-135 miles | $520 $540 | $675 $360 | $360 $500 | $500
Category 5
136-170 miles | s6ts <680 | <850 $450 | $450 $700 | $700
Category 6
171-205 miles | 4805 $820 | $1,025 $540 | $540 $700 | $700




Van Keppel Berry Tractor Murphy Tractor Midwest Equipment RSC United Rentals Hertz Victor L. Fabick CAT
MOTOR GRADERS Phillips
Contract Period #1 #2 #3 #1 #2 #1 #2 #3 #a #5 11 #2 NO BID NO BID 145h NO BID NO BID
5/1/12-4/30/13 ’
T
RICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $600 $750 $600 $600 $751
WEEKLY COST $1,356 $1,564 $1,756]  $1,800 $2,200 $2,700 $3,000 $3,000 $3,700 $4,200 $1,500 $1,500 $2,503
MONTHLY COST $4,000 $4,400 $4,800 $540 $6,600 $800 $9,000 $9,000 $11,000 $12,500 $450 $4,500 $4,995
SE— TR ETETITn T T
EQUIPMENT INFORMATION UIPMENT INFORMATI EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUlPMENT INFORMATIONIENT INFORMENT INFORJPMENT INFORMANIENT INFORH EQUIPMENT
MAKE Volvo Volvo Volvo Komatsu Komatsu Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere CAT Komatsu Deere
MODEL G930 G940 G946 GD555 GD655 670G 672G 770G 7726 872G 140 GD655 670 D
HORSEPOWER 195 215 235 160 207 195 195 230 230 273 165 / 185 165 / 190 145
HEIGHT TO TOP OF CAB 107" 107" 107" 102" 106" 40'5" 10'5" 10'5" 10'5" 10'5" 10'3" 10'3" 10'5"
MAXIMUM OPERATING WEIGHT 34,830 36,150 38,140 30,950 39,505 46800 46800 48000 48000 48620 32357-46872 33069 46800
LENGTH-OVERALL 29'4" 30' 30' 27'5" 34'8" 319" 319" 319" 319" 319" 28.6' 282" 292"
MOLDBOARD LENGTH 14'.87 14' 14' 12x26 1426 12'-14' 12'-14' 12'-14' 12'-14' 14' or 16' 12'-14' 12'-14' 12'
MOLDBOARD THICKNESS Y .87 .87 7/8 7/8 88" .88 88" .88" 1 87 87 88"
VARIABLE HP Y or N N Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
RIP BOARD Y or N_SKIPFIRE N N N Y Y ? ? ? ? ? Option Option Y
MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST  BILIZATION (BILIZATION IOBILIZATION COSBILIZATION MOBILIZATION
Permit Cost (one way) | $4.00 $4.00 $4.00 $4.00 $5.00 $50.00
Escort Cost (one way) NA
Vendor Starting Location = ‘endor Starting Location Vendor gmmng Location = Vendor Starting Location = | Starting Lod Starting Locjdor Starting Locatid Starting LoqVendor Starting
Category 1
1-30 miles [ sas | saus | sus ss0 | s2s0 ss0 | sws0 | swso | seso | s2s0 s22s| $225 $48
Category 2
31-65 miles | $310 I $310 | $310 $300 | $300 $260 I $260 | $260 I $260 | $260 $270| $270 $96
Category 3
66-100 miles [ sa0 [ a0 | saw0 sas0 | saso sao0 |  sa00 | a0 | saoo |  sa00 $315] $315 $144
Category 4
101-135 miles | $500 I $500 | $500 $600 | $600 $540 I $540 | $540 I $540 | $540 $360| $360 $192
Category 5
136-170 miles [ ss0s | 595 | sss s | s77s s680 | s680 | s680 | $680 | 680 $450] $450) $240
Category 6
171-205 miles | s765 | 765 | $765 $000 | $900 $820 |  $820 | $820 | $820 |  $820 $540] $540 $288




Van Keppel Berry Tractor Murphy Tractor
Contract Period #1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #2 #4 [#1 #2 #3 10- |#4 #5 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5
5/1/12-4/30/13 3-5Ton 6-9 Ton 10-12Ton (10-12Ton |[13+Ton 3-5Ton 6-9 Ton 10-12 Ton 10-12 Ton 13+Ton 6-9 Ton 10-12 Ton 13+Ton 3-5 Ton 6-9 Ton 12 Ton 10-12 Ton 13+Ton 3-5Ton 6-9 Ton 10-12 Ton 10-12 Ton 13+Ton
DAILY COST [ [ | | $95 | | [ [
WEEKLY COST [ s1260 [ 1276 | $1,292 | s$1,500 | $1,788 $836 | $956 | 1,132 | $1,132 | $1,276 $956 | $1,276 | $1,440 $300 $780 |  $1,335 | $1,650 | $1,800 $735 | $900 | $1,000 | $1,500 |
MONTHLY COST $3,600 $3,640 $3,680 $4,280 $5,116 $2,396 $2,636 $3,200 $3,200 $3,600 $3,636 $3,600 $3,840 $900 $2,350 $4,000 $4,900 $5,400 $2,200 $2,700 $3,000 $4,500 $5,500
TYPE SMOOTH ROLLERS PAD
MAKE Volvo Volvo Volvo Bomag Volvo Volvo Volvo Volvo Bomag Bomag Volvo Volvo Bomag Bomag Bomag Bomag Bomag Bomag HAMM HAMM HAMM HAMM HAMM
MODEL DD38 DD70 DD30 BW161 DD138 SD4s SD70 SD116D 211D 213D SD77F SD116F 213PD BW120AD BW141AD BW177 BW213 BW190AD HD13 HD70 HD30 HD130 HD140
HORSEPOWER 42 84 129 100 172 $84.00 $99.00 $160.00 $133.00 $132.00 $99.00 $160.00 $132.00 33 84 110 160 134 315 76.5 118 118
SINGLE DRUM Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
DOUBLE DRUM Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
OPERATING WEIGHT W FOPS/R] 8,397 14,874 21,704 22,046 30,325 10,225 15,556 23,630 22,046 27,112 16,115 25,044 25,373 5,953 16,880 17,450 28,380 25,360 7055 17416 22046 33289 31944
OPERATING WEIGHT W/ ROPS-cabin
Permit Cost (one way) [ [ [ [ [ [ [ I I I I I I I [ [ 5400 | sa00 | 400 | sa00 | sa00
Escort Costfone way) _ | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
ategory
1-30 miles
$190 $190 $190 $190 $190 $190 $190 $190 $190 $190 $190 $190 $190 $250 $250 $250 $250 $250 $250 $250 $250 $250 $250
Eategory 2
31-65 miles | ‘ | | | | | |
$285 $285 $285 $285 $285 $285 $285 $285 $285 $285 $285 $285 $285 $300 $300 $300 $300 $300 $260 $260 $260 $260 $260
S S S S S S S S S 1
66-100 miles | ‘ | |
$385 $385 $385 $385 $385 $385 $385 $385 $385 $385 $385 $385 $385 $450 $450 $450 $450 $450 $400 $400 $400 $400 $400
Category 4
101-135 miles
$475 $475 $475 $475 $475 $475 $475 $475 $475 $475 $475 $475 $475 $600 $600 $600 $600 $600 $540 $540 $540 $540 $540
Category 5
emone | | | s | s | | | | | | | | | | | | |
$570 $570 $570 $570 $570 $570 $570 $570 $570 $570 $570 $570 $570 $750 $775 $775 $775 $775 $680 $680 $680 $680 $680
F — — — — — — — " " S — S S 1
Category 6
i NP I P | o [ oom [ o | | l | | | [ oo | |
$725 $725 $725 $725 $725 $725 $725 $725 $725 $725 $725 $725 $725 $900 $900 $900 $900 $900 $820 $820 $820 $820 $820




Midwest Equipment RSC United Rentals Hertz Victor L. Phillips Fabick CAT
Contract Period #1 #1-A #1-B #2 #2-A #3 #3-A #5 #5-A #1 #2 #1 #2 #3 #1 #2 #3 #4 #2 #3 #4 #5 #1 #2 #3
5/1/12-4/30/13 3-5Ton 3-5Ton 3-5Ton 6-9 Ton 6-9 Ton 10-12 Ton |10-12 Ton |13+ Ton 13+ Ton 3-5Ton 6-9 Ton 3-5Ton 6-9 Ton 10-12 Ton 3-5Ton 6-9 Ton 10-12 Ton 10-12 Ton 6-9 Ton 10-12Ton [10-12Ton |(13+Ton 3-5Ton 6-9 Ton 10-12 Ton
DAILY COST $200 | $235 | $250 | $235 | $300 | $350 | $400 | $400 $500 $418 |  $468 $271 |  ¢429 |  sa10 $100] $125] $150] $135 $340] $450] $365] $530 $400] $800] $750)
WEEKLY COST 5600 | $700 | $750 | $700 | $900 | $1,000 | $1,200 | $1,200 | $1,500 $1,138 $1,228 $896 $1,300 | 51,582 $485 | $780 | $840 | 860 $1,005 | $1,260 | $1,195 | $1,575 $1,160 | $2,300 | $2,130
MONTHLY COST $1,800 $2,100 $2,150 $2,100 $2,700 $3,000 $3,600 $3,600 $4,500 $2,458 $2,968 $1,813 $2,925 $4,049 $960 $2,314 $2,475 $2,550 $2,995 $4,000 $3,200 $4,750 $2,500 $4,600 $6,000
TYPE Vib Vib Vib Vib Vib Vib Vib Vib Vib 5Ton 8 Ton Smooth PAD PAD Smooth Smooth/Pad Smooth Smooth / Pad Soil Vib Asphalt Vib Soil Vib Asphalt Vib Smooth Smooth Smooth
MAKE Bomag | Bomag Bomag Bomag Bomag Bomag Bomag Bomag Bomag Volvo IR HAMM HAMM HAMM Volvo Volvo Volvo Volvo Dynapac Dynapac | Dynapac | Dynapac CAT CAT CAT
MODEL BW120AD| BW138 BW145 BW138 BW177 BW161 BW213 BW213 BW190 SD450D SD70D HD12vV 3327 3410 DD-24 SD70D DD-90 SD100D CA134 CC424HF CA150 CC525HF CB34 CB434 CB54
HORSEPOWER 34 46 76 46 109 99 160 160 99 ? ? 30.7 68 100 40 99 130 130 84 110 80 125 46 83 137
SINGLE DRUM Y-54" Y-66" Y-84" Y-84" Y Y PAD PAD Y Y Y Y N N N
DOUBLE DRUM Y-48" Y-54" Y-54" Y-66" Y-78" Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
OPERATING WEIGHT W FOPS/R| 5236 9502 11785 9502 15640 19511 26540 26540 25353 10225 13756 5942 14594 22730 2600 15750 9895 23100 12500 25690 20500 28665 8688 16538 23820
OPERATING WEIGHT W/ ROPS- N N N N N N Option Option N NA NA 7519 17196 24250 NA 15750 9895 23100
Permit Cost (one way) [ [ [ [ [ [ [ [ [ [ e [ ona [ na [ wa [ [ [ v [ v T e
Escort Cost (one way) | | | | | | | | | | v | v | owa [ ow | | | v | ow |
ategory
1-30 miles
$225 $225 $225 $225 $225 $225 $225 $225 $225 $135 $135 $129 $129 $129 $48 $48 $48 $48 $225 $250 $225 $250 $150 $150 $150
m m m m
Category 2
| | | | | | e | | oo [ aom | | |
$270 $270 $270 $270 $270 $270 $270 $270 $270 $180 $180 $129 $129 $129 $96 $96 $96 $96 $270 $290 $270 $290 $250 $250 $250
I S S S - - — S — S S S — 1}
ategory
66-100 miles
$315 $315 $315 $315 $315 $315 $315 $315 $315 $180 $180 $129 $129 $129 $144 $144 $144 $144 $315 $335 $315 $335 $300 $300 $300
Category 4
101-135 miles
$360 $360 $360 $360 $360 $360 $360 $360 $360 $225 $225 $192 $192 $192 $192 $360 $380 $360 $380 $400 $400 $400
S S — - m -
Category 5
136-170 miles | ‘ | ‘ | | | | | | |
$450 $450 $450 $450 $450 $450 $450 $450 $450 $260 $260 $240 $240 $240 $240 $450 $470 $450 $470 $400 $400 $400
F — — — — — — — — —
Category 6
i [ PO O O O [ [N [ | | | l [ o | [ o |
$540 $540 $540 $540 $540 $540 $540 $540 $540 $300 $300 $288 $288 $288 $288 540 560 540 560 @o 500 500




PNEUMAT'C Van Keppel Berry Tractor Murphy Tractor Midwest Equipment RSC United Rental Hertz Victor L. Phillips Fabick CAT
ROLLERS #1 #3 5 13+ Ton NO BID #1 #2 NO BID NO BID NOBID |#2 6-9 Ton #3 3
Contract Period 6-9 Ton 10-12 Ton 13+ Ton 3-5Ton 6-9 Ton 10-12 Ton 13+ Ton
5/1/12-4/30/13
PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $280 $500 $315
WEEKLY COST $920 $1,404 $1,404 $1,400 $835 $1,500 $900 $1,250
MONTHLY COST $2,520 $4,000 $4,000 $4,000 $2,500 $4,500 $2,700 $3,500 $6,000)
EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT | EQUIPMENT EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMEN |EQUIPMEN | EQUIPMEN EQUIPMENT EQUIPMENT
TYPE 9 Wheel 8 Wheel
MAKE Volvo Hy-Pac Bomag Bomag Bomag Bomag Dynapac CAT CAT
MODEL PT125 €530 24H BW11RH9 BW11RH BW24RH CP253 PS150 PS360
HORSEPOWER $84.00 $92.00 $100.00 $74.00 85 100 $99.00 100 130
HOW MANY WHEELS 9 9 9 9 9 8 $9.00 10 7
EMPTY WEIGHT 10K 27K 33K 99,875 9,975 18,570 13,256
BALLISTED WEIGHT 27K 46K 52K 27,000 2,700 53,570 26,500 28,535 55,115
MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) BILIZATION C(DBILIZATION CO| MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) BILIZATION GBILIZATION (BILIZATION qMOBILIZATION COST| MOBILIZATION COST
Permit Cost (one way) I | | NA | NA
Escort Cost (one way) I | NA NA
Vendor Starting Location = r Starting Locdor Starting Locat| Vendor Starting Location = Starting Loc| Starting Lod Starting Logndor Starting Locatior)Vendor Starting Location 3
Category 1
1-30 miles
$190 $190 $190 $250 $225 $225 $250 $200 $500
Category 2
31-65 miles
$285 $285 $285 $300 $270 $270 $290 $250 $500
Category 3
66-100 miles
$385 $385 $385 $450 $315 $315 $335 $300 $500
Category 4
101-135 miles
$475 $475 $475 $600 $360 $360 $380 $400 $700
Category 5
136-170 miles | ‘ ‘ ’
$570 $570 $570 $750 $450 $450 $470 $400 $700
Category 6
171-205 miles | ‘ | |
$725 $725 $725 900 $540 $540 $560 $500 $700




SELF PROPELLED

BROOMS

DAILY COST
WEEKLY COST
MONTHLY COST

TYPE

MAKE

MODEL
HORSEPOWER
WEIGHT

WIDTH

HEIGHT

PUMP CAPACITY

HYDROSTATICDRIVE Y OR N
CAB-AIR CONDITIONED Y OR N
BRUSH WATERING SYSTEM Y OR N

Van Keppel Berry Tractor Murphy Tractor Midwest RSC Rentals United Rentals Hertz VLP Fabick
Equipment
#1 #2 #3 #1 #2 #1 #1 #1 #2 #1 6 #2 8' #1 #1  No Bid #1  NoBid
$245 $279 $190 $298 $358 $211 $301 $228
$825 $825 $2,500 $735 $835 $750 $570 $758 $878 $629 $827 $651
$2,295 $2,295 $7,500 $2,200 $2,500 $2,250 $1,700 $1,648 $1,898 $1,859 $1,963 $1,465
4-Wheel 4-Wheel 6 Ft 8Ft 4-Wheel
Broce Broce Broce Superior Superior Superior Broce Broce Leymor Lay-Mor Lay-Mor Broce
RJ350 KR350 MK-1 DT80C SM80CT DT80J RJ350 RJ350 8C 6HC 8HC RJ350
80 85 97 85 85 80 80 80 80 37 37 80
5000 5200 9200 5300 6500 5300 5000 5000 5200 3000 3100 5,500
96 96 96 98 100 98 96 96 100 81 100 96
102 102 126 130 91 10. 102 100 105 93 105 102
26 26 26 28 N/A 28 26 26
Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Varies Varies Y
Y Y Y Y Y Y Y N Y Varies Varies Y
Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Varies Varies Y

Permit Cost (one way) [ na NA_ | NA NA NA $3.50 NA NA NA NA NA NA | |

Escort Cost (one way) [ NA NA | NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA | |
1-30miles $190 $190 $190 $177 $177 $150 $225 $135 $135 $129 $129 $48
31-65 miles $285 $285 $285 $264 $264 $175 $270 $150 $150 $129 $129 $96
66-100 miles $385 $385 $385 $360 $360 $200 $315 $180 $180 $129 $129 $144
101135 miles $475 $475 $475 $456 $456 $250 $360 $225 $225 NA NA $192
136-170 miles $570 $570 $570 $553 $553 $275 $450 $260 $260 NA NA $240

171-205 miles $725 | $725 | $725 $649 $649 $300 $540 $300 $300 NA NA $288 I




Van Keppel Berry Tractor Murphy Tractor Midwest Equipment RSC
MINI EXCAVATORS
Contract Period
5/1/12-4/30/13 #2 ‘#5 #6 #3 ’#4 ’#5 ’#s #1 ‘wa #5 44 #1 ‘ns ‘#4 ‘ns #6
7.5'Dig [12'Dig [14' Dig 8.5' Dig |10' Dig 12' Dig 14' Dig 6' Dig 7.5' Dig 8.5' Dig 10' Dig 12' Dig |14' Dig 10' Dig 6' Dig 7.5' Dig |8.5' Dig [10' Dig 12' Dig 14' Dig
PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $200 $250 $300 $400 $200 $238 $268 | $288 $308 $358 $398
WEEKLY COST $576 $716 $880) $500 $600 $770 $1,065 $600 $688 $758 | $828 $948 $1,088 | $1,198
MONTHLY COST $1,692| $2,052|  $2,400] $1,500| $1,800| $2,300 $3,200] $1,350 $1,500)  $1,500|  $1,700| $2,000 $2,000] $1,800 $1,458 | $1,518 | $1,558 | $1,628 | $1,958 | $2,778
EQUIPMEN MATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT INFORMATION
MAKE Volvo Volvo Volvo Komatsu [ Komatsu | Komatsu | Komatsu Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Deere Komatsu HI Deere Deere Deere Deere Bobcat
MODEL EC35 ECRS8 | ECR88 PC27 PC35 PCS5 PC78 17D 27D 27D 35D 50D 50D PC35 9NX 17DX | 27DX 35 50D 442
HORSEPOWER 35 51 57 25 29 38 55 14.8 26.4 26.4 28.6 38.1 38.1 29 10 14.8 26 29.9 39.9 73
DIGGING DEPTH 113" | 11'10" 13'8" 94" 11'4" 12'6" 15'5" 71" 86" 86" 10' 13' 14'2" 11'4" 52" 71" 86" 10' 12'9" 13'11"
MAXIMUM REACH 17'8" 19'6" 22'6" 15'10" 17'3" 19'6" 24'11" 11'9" 15'4" 15'4 17'1" 19'6" 19'6" 18'6" 5' 12'10" | 15'4" 17'1" 20'6" 23'10"
BUCKET SIZE RANGE 18" -24" | 18"-24" | 18"-24" | 12"-36"| 12"-36" | 12"-36" | 23"-36" | 10"-24"| 10"-24" [ 10"-24" | 10"-30" [12"-36"| 12"-36" | 12"-36" 12" [12"-18"[12"-18"| 12"-24" | 18"-24" 24"
MAX LIFT AT MAX REACH FRONT 858 2,040 240 1,300 1,356 1,874 1,420 979 2554 2554 3315 5183 5183 1587 @ gl
MAX LIFT AT MAX REACH SIDE 858 820 1,360 606 750 1,102 1,150 500 902 902 1,439 | 2,301 2,301 606 @ gl
OPERATING WEIGHT 7,859 | 12,863 | 18629 | 6,590 8,250 11,110 | 16,240 | 4,173 6,360 7,768 7,768 | 10,811 10,811 7,909 2,060 | 4,173 | 6,358 7,934 11,308 | 16,538
LIST ATTACHMENTS AVLIABLE Buckets / Hammers Forks, smooth, tooth buckets, mowers, blades, grapples, etc.-Call Bucket, Hommer, Thumb
MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST MOBILIZATION COST (One Way)
Permit Cost (one way) | $3.50 | $3.50 | $3.50 | $3.50 | $3.50 | $3.50 | |
Escort Cost (one way) | | |
Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location =
Category 1
1-30 miles | $190 I $190 | $190 $190 $177 I $177 I $250 I $250 $150 $150 $150 $150 $150 $150 $225 $135 $135 | $135 I $135 | $135 $135

Category 2

31-65 miles $285 | $285 $285 $264 l $264 l $300 I $300 $175 $175 $175 $175 $175 $175 $270 $150 $150 | $150 I $150 | $150 $150

Category 3

66-100 miles $385 | $385 $1 $360 | $360 | $450 | $450 $200 $200 $200 $200 | $200 $200 $315 $180 $180 | $180 | $180 | $180 $180

Category 4

101-135 miles | $475 | $475 $475 $456 | $456 | $600 | $600 $250 $250 $250 $250 | $250 $250 $360 $225 | $225 | $225 | $225 | $225 $225

Category 5

136-170 miles | $570 | $570 $570 $553 I $553 | $775 | $775 $275 $275 $275 $275 | $275 $275 $450 $260 $260 | $260 I $260 | $260 $260

Category 6

171-205 miles | $725 | $725 $725 $649 | $649 | $900 | $900 $300 $300 $300 $300 $300 $300 $540 $300 $300 | $300 | $300 | $300 $300



mailto:2337@gl
mailto:4510@gl
mailto:860@gl
mailto:1560@gl

United Rentals Hertz Victor L. Phillips Fabick CAT
MINI EXCAVATORS
Contract Period
5/1/12-4/30/13 #1 ‘#z ‘#4 ’#5 ’#e ‘#7 #1 ’#z ’ ’#4 ’#5 ’#s 44 ‘«5 ’ns #1 ’nz ’ns ’m ‘#5 ’ns
6' Dig 7.5' Dig 9.5' Dig 11.5' Dig |12.5' Dig |14' Dig 6' Dig 7.5' Dig 8.5'Dig |10'Dig 12' Dig 14' Dig 10'Dig |12' Dig 14' Dig 6' Dig 7.5'Dig |[8.5'Dig |10'Dig |12'Dig |[14' Dig
H PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $160 $229 $281 $328 $333 $491 $117 $117 $135 $141 $151 $211 $180 $245 $330 $150 $175 $195 $225 $250 $350)
WEEKLY COST $424 $674 $814 $929 | $1,139 | $1530 | $323 $323 $343 $373 $393 $623 $555 $700 $990 $450 $525 $585 $675 $750  $1,050
MONTHLY COST $1,261 | $1642 | $1,463 | $2,500 | $2,933 | $2,191 $799 $799 $899 $999 $1,399 $2,199 $1,665|  $2,005| $2,965] $1,350| $1,575| $1,750| $2,025| $2,250|  $3,150
EQUIPMEN EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIPMENT EQUIPMENT INFORMATION
MAKE Takeuchi | Takeuchi | Takeuchi | Takeuchi | Takeuchi| Takeuchi Deere Bobcat Deere Bobcat Takeuchi | Takeuchi [ Takeuchi| Takeuchi | Takeuchi CAT CAT CAT CAT CAT CAT
MODEL TB108 TB116 TB125 TB135 | TB145 | TB17S 17D 323 27D 331 TB250 TB175 | TB228 | TB250 TB175 301 302 303 304 305 307
HORSEPOWER 9.2 12 225 27.8 37.8 58.3 14.8 13.9 26.4 41.8 39.7 69.2 235 38 60.8 18.1 24.9 29.5 40 46.9 54
DIGGING DEPTH 5'6" 7'10" 9'6" 112" 12'6" 152" 85" 90.4" 102" 122" 149" 180" 95" 12'5" 152" 77" 97" 11'4" 18'5" 12'9" 15'3"
MAXIMUM REACH 9'6" 12'9" 15'6" 17'6" 19'8" 238" 154" 154" 184" 191.9" 2326" 293 15'6" 19'8" 24'3" 12'6" 15'9" 18'1" 18'0" | 19'10" 221"
BUCKET SIZE RANGE 12" 18" 18" 24" 24" 24" 12"-24"| 12"-24" | 12"-24" | 12"-24" | 12"-24" | 12"-36" J12"-18"| 12"-24" | 18"-36" | 12"-32"| 12"-24" | 12" -24"[122"-36"[ 12" -36" | 18" -36"
MAX LIFT AT MAX REACH FRONT 366 813 1163 1524 2806 4555 444 640 1160 4735 4735 8530 1731 1735 6266 660 1323 1433 1610 2866 1364
MAX LIFT AT MAX REACH SIDE 366 813 1163 1524 2488 2996 227 410 2175 2175 5274 1169 2175 2663 550 683 551 920 992 1764
OPERATING WEIGHT 2029 3406 6151 7606 10494 | 17230 1893 3668 2887 10650 10650 18780 6100 10950 17900 | 3935 6283 7839 8900 | 11729 | 15900
LIST ATTACHMENTS AVLIABLE Breaker
MOBILIZATI] MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION COST MOBILIZATION COST (One Way)
Permit Cost (one way) | | | | | NA | NA NA NA NA NA NA | NA NA | NA NA | NA
Escort Cost (one way) | | | | | NA I NA I NA I NA I NA I NA NA | NA NA | NA NA | NA
Vendor S| Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location = Vendor Starting Location =
Category 1
1-30 miles $129 | $129 | $129 I $129 I $129 | $129 S48| S48| S48| S48| S48| sa8]  $225 I $225 | $225 $100 | $100 | $100 | $100 I $100 | $100
Category 2
31-65 miles $129 | $129 | $129 l $129 l $129 | $129 S%I sssl sssl sssl sssl $96] $270 I $270 | $270 $135 | $135 | $135 | $135 I $135 | $135
Category 3
66-100 miles $129 | | | | | $144| $144| $144| $144| $144| s144] 315 | $315 | $315 $200 | $200 | $200 | $200 | $200 | $200
Category 4
101-135 miles | | | | | $192| $192| $192| $192| $192| s192] $360 | $360 | $360 | $200 | $200 | $200 | $200 | $200 | $200
Category 5
136-170 miles | | | | | $24o| $24o| $24o| $24o| $24o| $240] $450 | $450 | $450 $400 | $400 | $400 | $400 I $400 | $400
Category 6
171-205 miles | | | | | $288] s288]  sass $288] $288] s288] ssa0 | ssa0 [ ssa0 ss00 | ss00 | sso0 | ssoo | ssoo [ ssoo




oo \VendorContactinformation

Van Keppel dbolerjack@vankeppel.com
David Bolerjack

6455 W. Independence Dr.

Springfield, MO 65802

417-865-3550

417-865-1044 fax

417-234-6130 cell

Berry Tractor bbettencourt@berrytractor.com

Brian Bettencourt
2060 N. West Bypass
Springfield, MO 6580.
417-831-2651
417-831-5097 fax
417-299-0004 Cell

Midwest Equipment and Supply
Jerry Freitag jfmidwest@gmail.com

1480 S Highway T ifreitag@roadbuildersmachinery.com

Springfield, MO 65802
417-732-5505
417-735-0026 fax
417-631-7750 cell

Murphy Tractor ddooley@murphytractor.com
Daniel Dooley

1601 N. Corrington

Kansas City, MO 64120

816-483-500

816-483-5721 fax

Hertz Equipment Rental Corporation
Jason Oosterbeek herbids@hertz.com
707 East 16th Street

Kansas City, MO 64108
816-221-7788

866-999-0817 Fax

816-305-8534 Cell

Fabick CAT mike.cantrell@fabickcat.com
Mike Cantrell

3534 E. 20th Street

Joplin, MO 64801

417-624-3010

417-624-2112 fax

417-434-0202 cell

Victor L. Phillips bewan@vlpco.com
Bill Ewan

5430 Highway 43 South

Joplin, MO 64804

417-781-8222

417-781-2768 fax

417-529-3305 cell

RSC Rental john.schupp@RSCrental.com
John Schupp

6876 W. Republic RD.

Republic, MO 65738

417-877-8024

417-877-8031 fax

417-353-2342

United Rentals (North America), Inc.
Michael Brumley  tbrumley@ur.com
2700 East Kearney

Springfield, MO 6580.
417-865-2072

417-831-9494 fax

417-392-1044 cell
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