BAGGED AND BULK WINTER COLD MIX ASPHALTIC MATERIALS

4/2/2012 12:00 pm local time

Tabulation for Bid Request SW-12-029AM

BULK MATERIAL (ordered in 25 ton loads)

APAC- Seaboard
QPR Quality McConnell & | Kansas, Inc. Asphalt
Pavement Hot Mix Fred Weber, | Associates | Kansas City Products
Repair **  |Materials, Inc. Inc. Corp. Division Company |Carter Waters
Bond-X or
QPR EZ Street EZ Street UPM UPM Bond-X Green Saturock
Barry No Bid $144.00 No Bid No Bid $180.00 $98.40 $102.08
Barton No Bid $133.00 No Bid No Bid $155.00 $98.40 $96.60
Bates No Bid $133.00 No Bid No Bid $143.00 $98.40 $89.88
Benton No Bid $133.00 No Bid No Bid $155.00 $98.40 $95.45
Cedar No Bid $133.00 No Bid No Bid $155.00 $98.40 $95.74
Christian No Bid $144.00 No Bid No Bid $175.00 $98.40 $102.75
Dade No Bid $133.00 No Bid No Bid $165.00 $98.40 $99.78
Dallas No Bid $133.00 No Bid No Bid $170.00 $98.40 $100.26
Greene No Bid $144.00 No Bid No Bid $170.00 $98.40 $101.22
Henry No Bid $133.00 No Bid No Bid $150.00 $98.40 $91.20
Hickory No Bid $133.00 No Bid No Bid $165.00 $98.40 $98.14
Jasper No Bid $144.00 No Bid No Bid $170.00 $98.40 $99.97
Lawrence No Bid $144.00 No Bid No Bid $170.00 $98.40 $101.79
McDonald No Bid $144.00 No Bid No Bid $175.00 $98.40 $102.56
Newton No Bid $144.00 No Bid No Bid $175.00 $98.40 $100.93
Polk No Bid $133.00 No Bid No Bid $160.00 $98.40 $98.14
St. Clair No Bid $133.00 No Bid No Bid $155.00 $98.40 $94.78
Stone No Bid $144.00 No Bid No Bid $195.00 $98.40 $105.07
Taney No Bid $144.00 No Bid No Bid $195.00 $98.40 $105.07
Vernon No Bid $133.00 No Bid No Bid $155.00 $98.40 $92.92
Webster No Bid $144.00 No Bid No Bid $195.00 $98.40 $103.62
BAGGED MATERIAL (ordered in truckload quantites as specified below)
Barry $9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30* No Bid $8.37 $11.25
Barton 9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30% No Bid 38.37 $11.00
Bates $9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30* No Bid $8.37 $11.00
Benton 9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30% No Bid 38.37 $11.00
Cedar $9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30* No Bid $8.37 $11.00
Christian 9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30% No Bid 38.37 $11.25
Dade $9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30* No Bid $8.37 $11.25
Dallas 9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30% No Bid 38.37 $11.25
Greene $9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30* No Bid $8.37 $11.25
Henry 9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30% No Bid 38.37 $11.00
Hickory $9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30* No Bid $8.37 $11.25
Jasper 9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30* No Bid $8.37 $11.25
Lawrence $9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30*% No Bid $8.37 $11.25
McDonald 9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30% No Bid 38.37 $11.25
Newton $9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30* No Bid $8.37 $11.25
Polk 9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30% No Bid 38.37 $11.25
St. Clair $9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30* No Bid $8.37 $11.50
Stone 9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30% No Bid 38.37 $11.50
Taney $9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30* No Bid $8.37 $11.50
\Vernon 9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30% No Bid 38.37 $11.00
Webster $9.50 No Bid $15.00 12.30* No Bid $8.37 $11.25
Bag weight 50 Ib. 50 50 60 60
Bags per pallet 63 56 56 49 56
pallets per truckload 15 10 16 16 8

* McConnell & Associates: Full Truck load delivered to Springfield is $10.11 per bag, and $10.29 per bag to Joplin

Bids from Cold Mix Manufacturing Corp (Green Patch) and Hot Mix Materials, Inc (EZ Street) are non-
responsive, as they are not on the MoDOT approved list.

This is a multiple award bid that shall serve as a method of establishing price agreements for our
maintenace areas. Material cost, availability, previous material quality, etc., may be used as
determining factors for selection of material source.

If you have any questions, please contact me at phone number (417) 895-7645.
Thank you,

Andy McNeill, CPPB

Senior Procurement Agent
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