
Bid Tabulations/ Posted Date 3/8/2012

Time: 11:27 AM

VENDOR Description of Service
QTY  

(months)

Price Per 

Month
Extended Costs Rental Period Make, Model & Year Date Available

Victor L. Phillips

Bill Ewan  Vibratory Roller s

(10) Ton Vibratory Roller

(001) Vibratory Roller to Nevada 5 $3,825.00 $19,125.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Dynapac, CC424HF, 2011 28-Mar-12

(002) Vibratory Roller to Butler 5 $4,465.00 $22,325.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Dynapac. CC524HF, 2009 28-Mar-12

(003) Vibratory Roller to Lamar 5 $3,825.00 $19,125.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Dynapac, CC424HF  2011 28-Mar-12

(004) Vibratory Roller to Warsaw 5 $4,465.00 $22,325.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Dynapac, CC524HF, 2008 28-Mar-12

(005) Vibratory Roller to Osceola 5 $0.00 $0.00 April 1, - Sept 1 No Bid No Bid

(006) Vibratory Roller to Clinton 5 $0.00 $0.00 April 1, - Sept 1 No Bid No Bid

Units quoted can be switched to different locations to meet lowest bid.

TOTAL $82,900.00

Van Keppel

David Bolerjack  Vibratory Roller s

(10) Ton Vibratory Roller

(001) Vibratory Roller to Nevada 5 $4,700.00 $23,500.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Volvo, DD90, 2011 3/23/12 Subject to Avaliability (STA)

(002) Vibratory Roller to Butler 5 $0.00 $0.00 April 1, - Sept 1 No Bid

(003) Vibratory Roller to Lamar 5 $4,700.00 $23,500.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Volvo, DD90, 2011 3/26/12       STA

(004) Vibratory Roller to Warsaw 5 $0.00 $0.00 April 1, - Sept 1 No Bid

(005) Vibratory Roller to Osceola 5 $4,700.00 $23,500.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Bomag, 161, 2011 3/27/12        STA

(006) Vibratory Roller to Clinton 5 $0.00 $0.00 April 1, - Sept 1 No Bid

TOTAL $70,500.00

Midwest Equipment Co

Jerry Freitag  Vibratory Roller s

(10) Ton Vibratory Roller

(001) Vibratory Roller to Nevada 5 $3,240.00 $16,200.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Bomag, BW161, IR DD90 30-Mar-12

(002) Vibratory Roller to Butler 5 $3,240.00 $16,200.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Bomag, BW161, IR DD90 30-Mar-12

(003) Vibratory Roller to Lamar 5 $3,240.00 $16,200.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Bomag, BW161, IR DD90 30-Mar-12

(004) Vibratory Roller to Warsaw 5 $3,240.00 $16,200.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Bomag, BW161, IR DD90 30-Mar-12

(005) Vibratory Roller to Osceola 5 $3,240.00 $16,200.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Bomag, BW161, IR DD90 30-Mar-12

(006) Vibratory Roller to Clinton 5 $3,240.00 $16,200.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Bomag, BW161, IR DD90 30-Mar-12

5 Years old or newer, 2000 hours or less.

TOTAL $97,200.00

Murphy Tractor

Daniel Dooley  Vibratory Roller s

(10) Ton Vibratory Roller

(001) Vibratory Roller to Nevada 5 $2,985.00 $14,925.00 April 1, - Sept 1 HAMM, HD90, 2003 1-Apr-12

(002) Vibratory Roller to Butler 5 $2,985.00 $14,925.00 April 1, - Sept 1 HAMM, HD90, 2003 1-Apr-12

(003) Vibratory Roller to Lamar 5 $2,985.00 $14,925.00 April 1, - Sept 1 HAMM, HD90, 2003 1-Apr-12

(004) Vibratory Roller to Warsaw 5 $2,985.00 $14,925.00 April 1, - Sept 1 HAMM, HD90, 2011 1-Apr-12

(005) Vibratory Roller to Osceola 5 $2,985.00 $14,925.00 April 1, - Sept 1 HAMM, HD90, 2005 1-Apr-12

(006) Vibratory Roller to Clinton 5 $2,985.00 $14,925.00 April 1, - Sept 1 HAMM, HD90, 2005 1-Apr-12

TOTAL $89,550.00

Fabick CAT

Mike Cantrell  Vibratory Roller s

(10) Ton Vibratory Roller

(001) Vibratory Roller to Nevada 5 $4,500.00 $22,500.00 April 1, - Sept 1 CAT, CB54XW, Year not specified 27-Mar-12

(002) Vibratory Roller to Butler 5 $4,500.00 $22,500.00 April 1, - Sept 1 CAT, CB54XW, Year not specified 27-Mar-12

(003) Vibratory Roller to Lamar 5 $4,500.00 $22,500.00 April 1, - Sept 1 CAT, CB54XW, Year not specified 27-Mar-12

(004) Vibratory Roller to Warsaw 5 $4,500.00 $22,500.00 April 1, - Sept 1 CAT, CB54XW, Year not specified 27-Mar-12

(005) Vibratory Roller to Osceola 5 $4,500.00 $22,500.00 April 1, - Sept 1 CAT, CB54XW, Year not specified 27-Mar-12

(006) Vibratory Roller to Clinton 5 $4,500.00 $22,500.00 April 1, - Sept 1 CAT, CB54XW, Year not specified 27-Mar-12

TOTAL $67,500.00

Dean's Machinery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Clarence Collister

573-216-3014

Hertz Rental Equipment Late Bid Late Bid Late Bid Late Bid Late Bid Late Bid Arrived by Fed-X at 2:18 P.M.

Cummings, McGowan & West

Doug Cornett  Vibratory Roller s

573-216-3014 (10) Ton Vibratory Roller

(001) Vibratory Roller to Nevada 5 $7,300.00 $36,500.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Volvo, DD118HF, YR-TBD STA

(002) Vibratory Roller to Butler 5 $7,300.00 $36,500.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Volvo, DD118HF, YR-TBD STA

(003) Vibratory Roller to Lamar 5 $7,300.00 $36,500.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Volvo, DD118HF, YR-TBD STA

(004) Vibratory Roller to Warsaw 5 $7,300.00 $36,500.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Volvo, DD118HF, YR-TBD STA

(005) Vibratory Roller to Osceola 5 $7,300.00 $36,500.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Volvo, DD118HF, YR-TBD STA

(006) Vibratory Roller to Clinton 5 $7,300.00 $36,500.00 April 1, - Sept 1 Volvo, DD118HF, YR-TBD STA

TOTAL $109,500.00
Grand Total of Bid $517,150.00 Awarded  bids $135,250.00
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