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Southwest Area - Purchasing

Thank you for your response to our Request for Informal Quotation # “SW-12-002AM”. For your information, the following is a tabulation of all

responses which were received. This quotation was awarded to:  BROWN TRAFFIC

address/phone number shown below. Buyer; Andy McNeill, Senior Procurement Agent.

If you have any questions, please contact me at the

ADDITIONAL NOTES:
Quote from General Traffic is Non-Responsive as they quoted GTE equipment. Low quote is from Brown Traffic.
Quote is awarded to Brown Traffic 7-21-2011, 11:30 am local time.

Andy McNeill, CPPB

Senior Procurement Agent

Phone: 417-895-7645

Description Brown Traffic General Traffic | Traffic Control

QTY Equipment Corp. Corporation

45 Eagle — 12" Black Poly — Empty Signal Head Non Responsive No Bid

24 Eagle 12" Tunnel Visor Non Responsive No Bid

12 Cable Astrobrac — 3 section kit, MK1 No Bid $226.00/2712.00

18 Missouri Type Il Bracket Kit (3B) No Bid $135.00/2430.00

20 Cast Chase Nipple No Bid $4.25/85.00

12 Riser Support Tube (3 section)36” No Bid $19.50/234.00

20 12" x 1-1/2” Alum. Nipple No Bid $9.50/190.00

20 11" x 1-1/2” Alum. Nipple No Bid $9.50/190.00

12 Terminal Compartment J-Box No Bid $65.00/780.00

24 Span Wire Adapter No Bid $9.00/216.00

36 Stiffener Plate - Inside No Bid No Bid

36 Stiffener Plate - Outside - No Bid No Bid

TOTAL n/a




