
ITEM #1 - BULK ANTIFREEZE (55 GALLON CONTAINERS)
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Christian  $  5.43  $  5.43  $  5.43 $8.16 $0.50 $0.50 $5.59 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.50 No Bid
Dallas  $  5.43  $  5.43  $  5.43 $8.16 No Bid $0.50 $5.59 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.65 No Bid
Douglas  $  5.43  $  5.43  $  5.43 $8.16 $0.50 $0.50 $5.59 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.65 No Bid
Greene  $  5.43  $  5.43  $  5.43 $8.16 $0.50 $0.50 $5.59 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.50 No Bid
Hickory  $  5.43  $  5.43  $  5.43 $8.16 $0.50 $0.50 $5.59 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.65 No Bid
Laclede  $  5.43  $  5.43  $  5.43 $8.16 $0.50 $0.50 $5.59 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.65 No Bid
Ozark  $  5.43  $  5.43  $  5.43 $8.16 $0.50 $0.50 $5.59 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.65 No Bid
Polk  $  5.43  $  5.43  $  5.43 $8.16 $0.50 $0.50 $5.59 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.65 No Bid
Stone  $  5.43  $  5.43  $  5.43 $8.16 $0.50 $0.50 $5.59 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.65 No Bid
Taney  $  5.43  $  5.43  $  5.43 $8.16 $0.50 $0.50 $5.59 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.65 No Bid
Webster  $  5.43  $  5.43  $  5.43 $8.16 $0.50 $0.50 $5.59 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.50 No Bid
Wright  $  5.43  $  5.43  $  5.43 $8.16 $0.50 $0.50 $5.59 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $4.65 No Bid

ITEM #2 - BULK ANTIFREEZE (30 GALLON CONTAINERS or please list container size available)
Christian No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $  4.40  $  4.50 No Bid
Dallas No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $  4.40  $  4.65 No Bid
Douglas No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $  4.40  $  4.65 No Bid
Greene No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $  4.40  $  4.50 No Bid
Hickory No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $  4.40  $  4.65 No Bid
Laclede No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $  4.40  $  4.65 No Bid
Ozark No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $  4.40  $  4.65 No Bid
Polk No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $  4.40  $  4.65 No Bid
Stone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $  4.40  $  4.65 No Bid
Taney No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $  4.40  $  4.65 No Bid
Webster No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $  4.40  $  4.50 No Bid
Wright No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $  4.40  $  4.65 No Bid

ITEM #3 - ANTIFREEZE (Carton price 6 - 1 gallon containers)
Christian $5.73 $5.73 $5.73 $8.44 $0.50 $0.50  $  5.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dallas $5.73 $5.73 $5.73 $8.44 $0.50 $0.50  $  5.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Douglas $5.73 $5.73 $5.73 $8.44 $0.50 $0.50  $  5.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Greene $5.73 $5.73 $5.73 $8.44 $0.50 $0.50  $  5.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hickory $5.73 $5.73 $5.73 $8.44 $0.50 $0.50  $  5.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Laclede $5.73 $5.73 $5.73 $8.44 $0.50 $0.50  $  5.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ozark $5.73 $5.73 $5.73 $8.44 $0.50 $0.50  $  5.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Polk $5.73 $5.73 $5.73 $8.44 $0.50 $0.50  $  5.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Stone $5.73 $5.73 $5.73 $8.44 $0.50 $0.50  $  5.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Taney $5.73 $5.73 $5.73 $8.44 $0.50 $0.50  $  5.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Webster $5.73 $5.73 $5.73 $8.44 $0.50 $0.50  $  5.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wright $5.73 $5.73 $5.73 $8.44 $0.50 $0.50  $  5.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

If you have any questions, please contact me at phone number (417) 895-7645.
Thank you,
Andy McNeill, CPPB
Senior Procurement Agent
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