Yellow=Low Daily Price
Green=Low Weekly Price
Purple=low Monthly Price

*This does not take mobilization costs in consideration; each project will be evaluated for overall low cost prior to renting.

Fabick Cat-loplin Victor L. Phillips Midwest Equip Co Murphy Tractor Van Keppel Hertz Volvo Rents Bocat of
Springfield
#1 #2 #3 |45 #1 #2 #3 #4 s |41 #2 #3 #4 #4 #5 #1 [n2 #3 (44 [#5 w1 w2 |43 [#a |45 [|#1  [#2 (43  [|#a |45 e |92 |43 #4 #s|e1 [#2 |3
(Trackhoes) 1012 (1516 (2021 [22-25 [30MT  [10-12MT|15-16 (2021 [22-25 |30 MT |10-12MT [15-16 MT (20-21 (22-25 [22-25 [30MT |10-12 [15-16 [20-21 (22-25 (30MT [10-12 [15-16 |20-21 |22-25 |30MT [10-12 [15-16 (2021 |22-25 |30MT [10-12 |15-16 [20-21 [22-25 |30 [10- |15-16|20-
Contaetrenod MT  (MT  [MT [T MT [MT|MT T mT mT MT (M7 MT  [MT MT  [MT  [MT  [MT MT  (MT  [MT  [MT MT  (MT  [MT  [MT M 12 |mT |21
3/1/10-2/2/11 continued T |mr T
MT = Metric Ton NO BID
m— —— S— m—
PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST ($) $325 | $450 | $500 | $600 | $850 $395 | $445 | $550 | $680 | $710| $350 $375 | $450 | $550 | $675 | $800 | $400 | $500 | $650 | $748 | $1,125| $365| $420| $465| $560| $620| $333| $384| $477| $615| $666| $325 | $400 | $400 | $4a50 |NA|
'WEEKLY COST ($) $1,050| $1,400| $1,500 | $1,900( $2,500 | $1,175 | $1,325| $1,650 | $2,035 [$2,130| $1,000 $1,00 | $1,275 | $1,550 | $2,000 | $2,400 | $1,000| $1,335 | $1,625| $1,870| $2,805) $1,095 | $1,260| $1,395| $1,680| $1,860] $923$1,025| $1,435 | $1,743 | $1,845| $1,000| $1,200| $1,200 | $1,400 | NA| NOBID
MONTHLY COST ($) $3,000| $4,200| $4,500 | $5,500( $7,500 | $3,500 [ $3,955| $4,950 | $6,100 |$6,390] $3,000 $3,300 | $3,825 | $4,650 | $6,000 | $7,200 | $3,000| $4,000 | $4,865| $5,610| $8,415 $3,285| $3,780| $4,185 | $5,040| $5,580| $3,024| $3,536 | $4,203| $5,125 | $5,945] $3,000| $3,600| $3,600 | $4,250 | NA|
S e 1 1 1 — 1 -1 EQUIP INFO
MAKE CAT Case Komatsu John Deere / Hitachi Volvo John Deere Volvo | Volvo | Volvo | Volvo |NA|
MODEL 308 | 312 | 315 | 320 328 CX130 | C160B | CX210B| CX240 | CX290| PC120/138|PC158/160] PC200 | PC220 | PC270 | PC300 | 120D | 160D | 200D | 240D | 350D | EC140 | EC160 | EC210| EC240 | EC290| 120)D | 180)D | 200D | 270)D | 330)D | EC140 | EC140| EC160 | EC210 |NA|
HORSEPOWER 556 | 90 | 115 | 148 204 95 120 | 157 177 | 207 92 121 148 168 | 187 246 93 121 | 159 | 177 | 271 | 92 | 116 | 147 | 168 | 192 | 89 | 121 | 150 | 188 | 251 | 94 | 94 | 118 | 147 |NA
DIGGING DEPTH (ft-In) 155" | 19'10"| 21'6" | 24' | 217" 182" | 1911"| 20° 227" [ 234"| 194 206 219 24 229 | 261 20 21 | 218 | 24 27 | 182 | 191 | 221 | 2211 262 | 171 | 19 | 203 | 231 | 225 | 182 | 182 | 20 | 221 [NA
MAX REACH (ft-In) 2 | 2 29 | 32 33" 273" | 279" | 28'10" | 317" |3211"] 287 304 325 | 348 | 348 | 3901 | 285| 307 | 32 | 353 |3811| 274 | 295 | 327 | 338 | 37 | 269 | 31.9 [ 3041] 353 | 348 | 20 | 20 20 | 314 |NA|  NOBID
BUCKET SIZE RANGE (in) 12"-36"| 18"-36"| 24"-48"|24"-54"| 36"-66" | 36-42 | 36-48 | 36-48 | 36-48 | 36-54| 24-48 24-48 | 24-478 | 24-54 | 2460 | 30-66 | 24-42 | 24-48 | 24-48 | 24-54 | 24-72 | 24-30 | 24-48 | 24-48 | 30-60 | 30-60 | 30-42 | 30-42 | 30-42 | 30-48 | 30-48 | 18-36 | 18-36 | 18-36 | 18-48 |NA)
MAX LIFT-REACH FRONT (Ibs) (gl=grnd Ivl) | 2425 | 3300 | 6064 | 8600 | 9950 3152 | 4150 | 8100 | 6400 | 9350 | 4280gl | 5000 | 9400 | 9350 | 10100 | 15000 | 8990 | 14137 | 20308 | 25633 | 27000 | 5890 | 7870 | 9850 | 12310 13420| 2603 | 5905 | 5028 | 5984 | 6785 | 7720 | 7720 | 9127 | 11770 |NA|
MAX LIFT -REACH SIDE (Ibs) 1984 | 2600 | 4234 | 4900 | 7250 2165 | 3400 | 4950 | 5600 | 6750 | 3330gl | 3330 | 5600 | 6500 | 8350 | 9300 | 8990 | 8525 | 12435| 17214 | 24935| 3680 | 4960 | 6300 | 8240 | 8590 | 3326 | 5905 | 7786 | 5984 | 10208| 7260 | 7260 | 9127 | 11770 |NA|
OPERATING WEIGHT (Ibs) 18500 | 29000 | 38100 | 47400 65000 | 27800 | 37700 | 47400 | 55120 | 65500 27-32000 | 36640 | 46643 | 54926 | 66399 | 77980 | 29250 | 39980 | 49940 | 54660 | 77330 | 33450 | 42108 | 48470 | 56880 | 65918 | 29250 | 41447 | 49940 | 63425 | 77970| 31600 | 31600| 42100 | 51200 |NA|
MOBILIZATION COST (One Way)
MOBILIZATION MOBILIZATION MOBILIZATION MOBILIZATION MOBILIZATION MOBILIZATIO MOBILIZATION
Permit Cost (one way) | NA | NA | NA | Included NA | NA NA NA | NA NA ‘ NA NA NA NA ‘ NA Sa.sol $3.50 l 54.501 54.501 $450 ] NA | NA NA NA | NA $35 | $35 | $35 | $35 | $35 |NA |NA NA NA |NA
Escort Cost {one way) NA | NA | NA | Included NA | NA NA NA | NA NA [ NA | NA NA [ NA [ NA NA NA NA | NA | NA NA | NA | NA [ NA | NA | NA [ NA | NA | NA | $300 |NA |NA NA NA |NA NO BID
Vendor Starting Location =
Category 1
1-25 miles | $150| $150| $150 | szsol $500 $225 | $225 | $270 ‘ $310 | $325|  $225 ‘ $225 | $270 [ $310 | $310 [ $325 szsol $250 [ 5300[ 5300[ $300 szzsl szzsl $z7a| $310| $325 | $30 | $30 | $30 | $30 | $250 | $60 | $60 | $60 | $60 |NA NO BID
Category 2
26-50 miles | $250| $250| $250 | $400| $500 $270 | $270 | $315 \ $355 | $375| %270 \ $270 | $315 | $355 | $355 [ $375 szso| $250 [ 5300[ 5300[ $300 $z7a| $z7a| $315| $355| $375 | $30 | $30 | $30 | $30 | $250 | $75 | $75 | $75 | $75 |NA NO BID
Category 3
5175 miels I ssuul saool $300 | 3400| $500 $315 | $315 | $360 ‘ $400 | $420 |  $315 ‘ $315 | $360 ‘ $400 ‘ $400 ‘ $420 szso| $250 ‘ sann‘ sann‘ $300 $315| $315| saeul $400| $420 | $60 I $60 I $60 I $60 I $350 | $100 | s1oo| $100 | $100 |NA NO BID
Category 4
76-100 miles | $400| $400| $400 | $500| $700 $360 | $360 | $405 ‘ 5445 | $465 | $360 ‘ $360 | $405 [ $445 [ $445 [ $465 | $350 [ $350 [ 5450[ 5450[ $450 $360| $360| $405| $455| $465 | 90 | $90 | $90 | $90 | $500 | $150 | $150| $150 | $150 |NA NO BID
Category 5
101-125 mil
mes | $400| $400| $400 | $500| $700 $450 | $450 | $495 ‘ $535 | $555 | $450 ‘ $450 | $495 [ $535 | $535 [ $555 $440| $440 [ $565 [ $565 [ $565 $450| $450| $495| $535| $555 $120| $120| $120| $120| $600 | $200 | szoo| $200 | $200 |NA NO BID
Category 6
126-150 miles | $500 | $500 | $500 | $700 | $700 $540 | $540 | $585 | 625 | $645| 540 $540 | 9585 | $625 | 9625 | 645 | 480 | $480 | $675 | $675 | $675 $540| $540| $585 | $625 | 9645 $150| $150| $150| $150| $750 | 300 | 300 | 300 | 300 |NA|  nNOBID




_ Fabick Cat- Joplin Victor L. Phillips Midwest Equip Co Murphy Tractor Van Keppel Hertz Volvo Rents Bobcat of
Springfield
BACKHOES #1 #2 #3  |#1 [#2  |#3 #1 #2 #3 [|#1 #2 #3 #1 #2 |43 #1 #2 |43 # |#2 #3 |41 [#2 |43
Contract Period 14' Class|14' 15' |14 |14 [15*  [14'Class  [14'with  [15'  [14' 14 150 | 14 150 1 |10 |15 14 |14 15' |14' [14' [15'
3/1/10 - 2/28/11 with With Class |Cla |With |Class |with Extendable |Class |Class With |[Class |Class [With |[Class |Class |With [Class |Class [With |Cla |Clas |With|Class
Standar |Extenda|with |ss |Extend|with |Standard  |Stick with _ Jwith Extend [with  Jwith Extend |with _ |with Extend |with  |with |Extend |ss |s Exte |with
With Standard Stick or Extended Stick NO BID
S—————
PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $350 $350| $450| NA| $300 | $325 $200 $200 $250 $200 $250 | $250 | $200 | $200 [ $300 | $154 | $154 | $200 | $150 | $200 |NA
WEEKLY COST $800 $800|$1,250] NA| $700 | $870 $500 $560 $600 $600 $600 | $600 | $600 | $600 | $600 | $S405 | $405 [ $477 | $450 [ $600 | NA NO BID
MONTHLY COST $2,400( $2,400|$3,400| NA|$2,100| $2,600 $1,500 $1,500 $1,800] $178 |$1,785|$1,785] $1,800 | $1,800| $1,800| $1,333 | $1,435( $1,538] $1,250( $1,600 | NA
EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO
MAKE CAT CAT CAT | NA| Case | Case Komatsu John Deere Volvo John Deere Volvo | Volvo | NA
MODEL 420D 420D 446 | NA|580SM| 590SM | WB140/146| WB140/146|WB156| 310J 310J 310J BL70 BL70 BL70 | 310JD | 310JD | 410JD | BL60 | BL60 | NA
HORSEPOWER 93 93 102 |NA| 91 108 88 88 95 84HP | 84HP | 84HP 90 90 90 92 92 96 86 86 NA NO BID
INCLUDES CAB Yes Yes Yes | NA[ Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes [ NA
INCLUDES AUX HYDRAULICS Yes Yes Yes | NA|[ Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes YEs YEs YEs Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No NA
OPERATING WEIGHT (Ibs) 16000 | 16000 | 20000 | NA| 17600 [ 19600 16090 16090 16530 | 16220 | 16221 | 16222 | 17248 | 17248 | 17248 | 16960 | 16960 | 18500 | 20549 | 20549 | NA
MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILZATION MOBLIZATION MOBILZATION MOBLIZATION MOBLIZATION MOBLIZATION MOBILIZATION
Permit Cost (one way) NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA INA  INA NA
Escort Cost (one way) NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA INA  NA NA NO BID
Vendor Starting Location =
|  Springfield |
Category 1
1-25 miles
$100 $100 | $100 |NA $225 $225 $225 $225 $225 $250 $250 | $250 | $225 | $225 | $225 $30 $30 $30 $60 $60 | NA NO BID
Category 2
26-50 miles
$250 $250 | $250 |NA $270 $270 $270 $270 $270 $250 $250 | $250 | $270 | $270 | $270 $30 $30 $30 $75 $75 | NA NO BID
Category 3
51-75 miles
$250 $250 | $250 |NA $315 $315 $315 $315 $315 $250 $250 | $250 | $315 | $315 | $315 $60 $60 $60 $100 | $100 | NA NO BID
Category 4
76-100 miles
$300 $300 | $300 [NA | $360| $360 $360 $360 $360 | $350 [ $350 | $350 | $360 | $360 | $360 $90 $90 $90 | $150 | $150 | NA NO BID
Category 5
101-125 miles
$500 $500 | S500 |NA $450 $450 $450 $450 $450 $440 $440 | $440 | $450 | $450 | $450 $120 | $120 | $120 | $200 [ $200 | NA NO BID
Category 6
126-150 miles
$500 $500 | $500 |NA $540 $540 $540 $540 $540 $480 $480 | $480 | $540 | $540 | $540 $150 | $150 | $150 | $300 | $300 | NA NO BID

Yellow=Low Daily Price
Green=Low Weekly Price
Purple=low Monthly Price
*This does not take mobilization costs in consideration; each project will be evaluated for overall low cost prior to renting.




Fabick Cat - Joplin Victor L. Phillip Midwest Equip Co. Murphy Tractor Van Keppel Hertz Volvo Rents

Bobcat of Springfield
w2 |13 |4 #5[#6 o (w2 |13 #a #5 6 o (w2 |13 G 3 # #2 #3 # 3 w6 |#1 [w2 |#3|er [#2 [#3 (44 [#s w6 w1 |2 (43 [#a |45 [#6 w1 |#2 |43 |#4 |45 |#6
Contract Period 1300 (1500 |17001b|20001b (2500 Ib (3000 Ib 1300 |1500 [17001b [20001b |25001b (300016 |1300 {1500 (170016 |20001b (250016 [3000Ib Lift (1300 Ib [15001b [17001b (200016 [25001 |3000 |1300 |1500 (17 [1300 |1500 |1700 (2000 |2500 {3000 [1300 (1500 (1700 |20001b|25001b(3000 |1300 (1500 [1700 |2000 |2500 |3000
3/1/10-2/28/11 IbLift [IbLft [Lift |Life uft (Lt [ib Lift|Mb Lift |Lift Lift Lift Lift Ib Lift | b Lift | Lift Lft |Lift Lift Lift Lift Lift Lift I Lift |Ib Lift |Ib Lift |00 |Ib Lift |Ib Lift [Ib Lift |Ib Lift |Ib Lift [IbLife [IbLife |IbLift [Iblife [Lft  [uift  [Iblift[ibLife [bLfe [IbLfe [IbLife [IbLfe |Ib Life
"
DAILY COST $175 [ $200 [ $250 | NA NA  $175 5200 245  $250 | NA| NA  $165 175  $200 $300 $190  $190  $190  $190  $210 $250 $118 $118 $118 $123 $128 $207 | $125 5125 $160 $200 5200 NA
WEEKLY COST $500 | $600 | $700 | NA NA  $450 $575 $645 $665 | NA | NA 5495  $525  $600 $900 $475 4475 $475 4475 $525  $600 NOBID $277 $227 $227 $296 $301 $682 | $400 $400 $480 $600 $600 NA

MONTHLY COST

[$1,200] $1,200] $1,200] $1,350 | $1,750] $2,100] NA NA  $1,295 $1,495 $1,695 $1,795 | NA

$1,200 $1,200 $1,400 $1,600 $1,600 NA | $1,458

NA_ $1,485 $1,575 $1,800  $2,650 $1,425  $1,425 $1,425 $1,425  $1,525 $1,785 $602_$602_$602 $702 $752 $1,120|

MAKE cAT NA| NA| case | Case | Case | case | NA| NA Komatsu John Deere Bobcat Volvo | volvo | volvo | Volvo | volvo | A [Bobeat [Bobeot [obat [Bobest | Babat| Bobat]
MODEL 26 | 226 | 232 | 2a2 | 250 | o2 | na| wa| a0 430 | a5 465 | NA | NA | sks20 |sk1020| sk1026 | ck30/35 | 317 317 317 320 325 | 332 5130] s150] 5175 5205 [ 5250] 5300 | mce0| mc70 | mcao [ meato| o] a | s130 [ s1s0 | sies [ se30 | s2s0 | s300
HORSEPOWER 51| e | e 62 75 | 94 | na|NA| 69 77 77 83 | NafNa| 54 70 84 84 57 57 57 62 70 85 OB 49 | 49 | 49 | 66 | 75 | 81 | a5 | s4 | 84 | 84 | 84 | NA| 49 | 49 | 61 | 743 | 75 | 81
BUCKET WIDTH (in) 66"-78" 68"-78" NA| NA| 66 | 6673 | 7382 | 7384 | NA | NA | 68 | 74 | 7a"g0"| 80" 72 72 72 78 84 84 62 | 68 | 68 | 68 | 74 | 74 |60-84) 60-84 | 60-84 | 6084|6084 | NA| 62 | 68 | 68 | 74 | 74 | s0
MAX REACH AT TOP (ft-In) 11‘1"|12'2" 11‘9"| 211" 13‘4"| 136" | NA | NA | 1207 | 1216 | 1206 | 1255 | NA | na | 118" | 122" | 128" | 121/129" | 114 114 14 | 1152 | 125 | 127 110 | 115 | 118 | 118 | 129 | 1288 857 | 857 | 904 | 903 | 903 | NA | 226 | 181 | 206 | 214 | 34 | 34
OPERATING WEIGHT (lbs) 5800 | 5900 | 6700 | 6900 | 7900 | 8300 | NA | NA | 6605 | 6800 | 8120 | 8875 | NA | na | 6480 | 7573 | 8068 [9546/10053 1750 | 1750 | 1750 | 1950 | 2500 | 3125 5235 | 5935) 6220] 6655 | 7825| 8268 | 5624 | 5801 | 6824 | 7480 | 7480 | NA | 5235 | 5935 | 6220 | 7707 | 7835 | 8268
permit Costloneway)  [na [na  [na Tna [na nalwal na [ ma | ona | ma [walwal ma | wal wa] wa va | e | v | owa | owa | NOBID na [ walnalnalwal na [ wawalwa ] waf wa[waf| wa[mwa]walwalwalma
EscortCostoneway)  |na | |na [na [na nalwal ma | ma | ma | ma [walwal ma | owal owa| wa va | omna | owa | owa | ow | w na [ wa | na | nalnal na [ na [ wal wal wa | walwaf wa | mwa| walwalwalma
Category 1 Springfield MO
1-25 miles NOBID
s75 | s75 | s75 | s75 | s75 | 75 | NA NA  $225  s205 225 $225 | NA  NA S35 $225  $225 $225 $150  $150  $150  $150  $150  $150 $30 $30 530 $30 $30  $30 | $60 | $60 | $60 | $60 | $60 | $60 | $150 | $150 | $150 | $150 | $150 | $150
-ss> -ss> 2 e o o
Category 2
26-50 miles
$115 | $115 | $115 | $115 | $115 | s115 | NA  NA  $270  $270  $270  $270 | NA NA_ $270  $270  $270 $270 $175  $175 8175 $175  $175 8175 $30 $30 530 $30 330 30 | $75  $75 | $75 | $75 | $75 | $75| $200 | $200 | $200 | $200 | $200 | $200
Category 3
5175 miles NOBID
$200 | $200 | $200 | $200 | $200 | $200 | NA__NA__ $315 $315 $315 $315 | NA__NA__ $315  $315  $315 $315 $200 $200 __$200 $200 _$200 _ $200 $60 _$60 $60 $60 $60 _ $60 | $100 $100 $100 $100 _ $100 $100| $260 [ $260 | $260 | $260 | $260 | $260
Category 4
76100 miles $200 | 5200 | $200 | 200 | s200 | s200 [ nA  wa 360 sac0 360 saeo | NA  na 360 s30  s360  saeo | sas0  saso  s2s0  saso  s2s0  saso|  MOP'P | o0 so0 s o0 soo  s90 | s1s0 s150  s1s0  sis0  $1s0 $150| 5300 | $300 | $300 | $300 | $300 | $300
- T = o e o 2 e
Category 5
101-125 miles NOBID
$400 | $400 | $400 | $400 | $400 | $400 | NA NA  $450  $450 3450  $450 | NA NA  $450 3450 $450 $450 $275  $275  Sa75 275 $275  $275 $120 $120 $120 $120 $120 $120 | $200 $200 $200 $200 $200 $200| $350 | $350 | $350 | $350 | $350 | $350
Category 6
126-150 miles NOBID
$400 | $400 | $400 | $400 | $400 | $400 | NA _NA _ $540 $540 $540 $540 | NA NA  $540  $540  $540 $540 $300 $300 $300 $300 $300  $300 $150 $150 $150 $150 $150 $150 | $300  $300 $300 $300 $300 $300| $400 | $400 | $400 | $400 | $400 | $400

Yellow=Low Daily Price
Green=Low Weekly Price
Purple=low Monthly Price
*This does not take mobilization costs in consideration; each project will be evaluated for overall low cost prior to renting.



Bobcat of
Fabick Cat-Joplin Victor L. Phillips Midwest Equip Co. Murphy Tractor Van Keppel Hertz Volvo Rents o. @ ) °
DOZERS Springfield
Contract Period #1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #1 #2 #3 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #1 #1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #1 #2 |41 |42 |43
3/1/10 - 2/28/11 70HP |80HP |90 HP [125HP 200 HP|70 HP |80 HP |90 HP [125HP (200 HP |70 HP |80 HP |90 HP |70 HP |80HP |90HP |125HP (200 HP 70 HP 70 HP |80HP |90HP [125HP(200HP|70HP (80 |70 (80 |90
HP |HP |HP [HP
NO BID NO BID NO BID
PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING
$350 | $400 | $450 | $625 | $900 | $335 | $375 | $425 | NA NA $285| $325[ $365| $306 [ $375  $490 $670 | $930 $256 | $292 | $308 | $410 | NA
$950 |$1,100| $1,250| $1,850| $2,700| $900 |$1,050|$1,275|$1,600| $2,280] $850| $975| $1,085| $765 | $935 $1,220 | $1,675 | $2,325 NO BID $666 | $718 | $861 [$1,333] NA NO BID NO BID
$2,800 $3,250| $3,950 $5,500| $8,500] $2,900 [ $3,150 | $3,775 $4,800| $6,800| $2,485| $2,925| $3,250| $2,295[ $2,800 $3,655 | $5,015 | $6,870 $2,050] $2,511| $2,793| $3,588| NA
EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO |EQUIP INFO
CAT CAT CAT CAT CAT Case | Case [ Case | Case | Case |Komatusu John Deere John Deere
D36 | D46 | D56 | D6K | D6T | 550H | 650K | 850K | 1150K | 1850K| D31 | D37 | D39 | 450) | 550 | 750 850) NA 450) | 550) | 650J | 750) | NA
70 80 90 125 | 225 70 75 96 118 | 199 78 89 105 74 84 155 200 NA 70 80 90 115 NA
NO BID NO BID NO BID
OPERATING WEIGHT 17000 | 17500 | 20000 | 28400 | 45000 | 14960 | 19400 | 20700 | 29400 | 49450 | 18056 | 18298 | 29834 | 17500 | 18250 | 36-425 | 45000 NA 16283 | 17016 | 18560 | 26080 [ NA
1.88yd| 2.5yd [ 2.86yd| 3.5yd | 5.5yd | 1.9 26 2.7 42 | 733 | 211 | 232 | 2.9 |96-124|96-124[135-156| 146-168 | NA 97 105 | 115 | 120 NA
Y Y Y Y Y N N Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y NA N N N N NA
MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBLIZATION MOBLIZATION MOBLIZATION MOBLIZATION MOBLIZATION MOBLIZATION |MOBLIZATION
Permit Cost (one way) NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA $35 | $35 | $35 | $35 | $35
Escort Cost (one way) NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NO BID NA NA NA NA NA NO BID NO BID
Vendor Starting Location =
Category 1
1-25 miles
$100 | $100 | $100 | $500 | $500 | $225 | $225 | $225 | $250 | $270 | $225 | $225 | $225 | $300 | $300 | $300 $300 $635 NO BID $30 | $30 | $30 [ $200 | NA NO BID NO BID
Category 2
26-50 miles
$150 | $150 | $150 | $500 | $500 | $270 | $270 | $270 | $295 | $315 | $270 | $270 | $270 | $300 | $300 | $300 $300 $635 NO BID $30 | $30 | $30 [ $300 | NA NO BID NO BID
Category 3
51-75 miles
$300 | $300 | $300 | $500 | $500 | $315 | $315 | $315 | $340 | $360 | $315 | $315 | $315 | $300 | $300 | $300 $300 $635 NO BID $60 | $60 | $60 | $400 | NA NO BID NO BID
Category 4
76-100 miles
$400 | $400 | $400 | $700 | $700 | $360 | $360 | $360 | $385 | $405 | $360 | $360 | $360 | $450 | $450 | $450 $450 $750 NO BID $90 | $90 | $90 | $500 | NA NO BID NO BID
Category 5
101-125 miles
$400 | $400 | $400 | $700 | $700 | $450 | $450 | $450 | $465 | $495 | $450 | $450 | $450 | $565 | $565 | $565 $565 $800 NO BID $120 | $120 | $120 | $600 | NA NO BID NO BID
Category 6
126- 150 miles | SSOOI $500| $500 | $700| $700 $540| $540 | $540| $565 | $585 | $540 | $540| $540 | $675 | $675 | $675 | $675 Isl,ooo NO BID $150| SISOI $150| $7ool NA NO BID NO BID

Yellow=Low Daily Price
Green=Low Weekly Price
Purple=Low Monthly Price

*This does not take mobilization costs into consideration; each project will be evaluated for overall low cost prior to renting.




Fabick Cat-Joplin Victor L. Phillips Midwest Equip Co Muphy Tractor Van Keppel Hertz Volvo Rents Bobcat of
WHEEL LOADERS [:1 .2 |93 |#a [#5 W1 w2 |#3 wa |45 |# w2 #3 W |#5 WL |#2 |83 #a W |m |#2 #3 (w4 |#5  [#1 |42 #3 #a |45 |41 |#2 |43
Contract Period 2YD |25YD(35YD (4 [5YD 2YD (25YD|3.5YD [4YD [5YD [|2YD 25YD [35YD |[4YD [5YD |2YD [25YD|35YD [4YD |5YD |2YD [25YD |3.5YD [4YD |SyD [2YD [25YD [35YD |4YD |5 |2YD|25 |35
3/1/10 - 2/28/11 Yo YD YD |YD |]
NO BID
PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $350 | $400 | $500 | NA| $1,500 | $400 | $495 | $600 [ $750 | NA | $300 | $350 | $450 | $500 | $700 | $a50 | $450 | $680 | $2,450 | $990 | $335 [ $420 | $470 | $560 | $750 | $354 | $354 | $379 | $461 [NA
WEEKLY COST $975 | $1,100] $1,500| NA| $4,500 | $1,200 | $1,350] $1,700 [ $2,200( $3,330] $750 | $950 | $1,285|$1,485| $2,100 |$1,110{$1,110| $1,700 | $2,040 | $2,465] $1,005] $1,260 | $1,410| $1,680| $2,250| $948 | $948 | $999 |$1,230( NA NO BID NO BID
MONTHLY COST $2,950| $3,300| $4,500| NA | $13,000| $3,600 | $4,000] $5,100 | $6,500| $9,500| $2,250 | $2,800 | $3,850| $4,450| $6,300 | $3,305| $3,305| $5,100 | $6,120 | $7,395| $3,015| $3,780 | $4,230 $5,040| $6,750 $2,870| $2,870 | $3,331 | $4,305 | NA
EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO EQUIPINFO | EQUIP INFO
MAKE CAT CAT CAT | NA| CAT Case Komatsu John Deere Volvo john Deere NA
MODEL 914 | 924 | 930 | NA| 980 | 521F | 621E | 721E | 821E | 90z | WA150 | WA200 | WA320| WA380| WA450 | 444) | 444) | 624) | 644) | 744) | 160 | 170 | 190 | L110 | L150 544| 544  624| 644[NA
HORSEPOWER 101 | 132 | 152 [NA[ 350 131 | 162 | 183 | 213 | 271 98 126 167 | 191 272 | 128 | 128 | 198 | 232 | 304 | 154 | 168 | 172 [ 230 | 284 167| 167 198 232|NA
HEIGHT TO HINGE PIN 113" | 12'8" | 13'4" [NA| 14'9" | 142.1 [ 150.8 | 156.6 | 162.3 [ 171.0 | 11.6 122 | 122 | 135 [ 144 | 111 [ 121 | 13.0 | 134 | 141 | 12.8 | 128 | 13.0 [ 13.2 | 143 7.9 7.9] 132| 13.7|NA NO BID NO BID
REACH TO TOP HEIGHT 68" | 74" [ 80" [NA| 911" | 186.8 [ 194 | 2085 | 310.8 [ NA 3.1 3.1 3.5 3.9 4.1 51 | 5.1 6.4 5.6 61 | 91 | 811 [ 91 9.5 9 8.9 89| 142| 14.7|NA
TIP CAPACITY FRONT 13382 | 17106 | 21907 | NA| 44000 | 18291 | 23376 27616 | 31376 | 40741| 14873 | 21363 | 27365 | 32100 | 39860 | 15635| 15635 | 25483 | 33576 | 39152 | 17700 | 20240 | 24720 | 28750 | 38320 | 20564| 20564| 23411| 34379|NA
TIP CAPACITY FULL TURN 11675 | 14987 | 19166 | NA| 40000 | 15939 | 20379[ 23933 | 27110 34899 | 12939 | 18397 | 24560 | 27800 | 34679 | 13469| 13469 | 21949 | 28937 [ 37750 | 15520 17360 | 21100 | 24300 | 33700 | 18320 18320| 20944| 30520|NA
OPERATING WEIGHT 16297 | 21819 28332 [ NA| 69000 | 23100 | 27406 | 30644 | 37844 | 40448 | 17311 | 23259 | 31680 | 38760 | 49780 | 25460| 25460 | 33773 | 40799 | 53312 26110 29580 | 33040 | 40340 | 54015 | 29648| 29648| 35102| 40161|NA
MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION MOBILIZATION MOBILIZATION MOBILIZATION MOBILIZATION MOBILIZATION | MOBILIZATION
Permit Cost (one way) NA | NA | NA [NA| NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA | $3.50 | $3.50 | $4.50 | $4.50 | $4.50 | NA NA NA NA NA | $35 | $35 | $35 | $35 |NA
Escort Cost (one way) NA | NA | NA [NA[ NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA | NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA NA | NA NO BID NO BID
Vendor Starting Location = Springfield
Category 1
1-25 miles
$150 | $150 | $150 | NA| $500 | $225 | $225 | $250 | $250 | $270 | $225 | $225 | $250 | $250 | $270 | $250 | $250 | $350 | $350 | $350 | $225 | $225 | $250 | $250 [ $270 | $30 | $30 [ $200 | $200 [ NA NO BID NO BID
Category 2
26-50 miles
$250 | $250 | $250 | NA| $500 | $270 | $270 | $270 | $295 | $315 | $270 | $270 | $270 | $295 | $315 | $250 | $250 | $350 | $350 | $350 | $270 | $270 | $270 | $295 | $315 | $30 | $30 [ $300 | $300 [ NA NO BID NO BID
Category 3
51-75 miles
$300 | $300 | $300 | NA| $500 | $315 | $315 | $315 | $340 | $360 | $315 | $315 | $315 | $340 | $360 | $250 | $250 | $350 | $350 | $350 | $315 | $315 | $315 | $340 [ $360 | $60 | $60 | $400 | $400 [ NA NO BID NO BID
Category 4
76-100 miles
$400 | $400 | $400 | NA| $700 | $360 | $360 | $360 | $385 | $405 | $360 | $360 | $360 | $385 | $405 | $350 | $350 [ $450 | $450 | $450 | $360 | $360 | $360 | $385 [ $405 | $90 | $90 [ $500 | $500 [ NA NO BID NO BID
Category 5
101-125 miles
$400 | $400 | $400 | NA| $700 | $450 | $450 | $450 | $475 | $495 | $450 | $450 | $450 | $475 | $495 | $440 | $440 | $565 | $565 | $565 | $450 | $450 | $450 | $475 | $495 | $120 | $120 | $600 | $600 [ NA NO BID NO BID
Category 6
126-150 mil
mes | Ssool $500| $500 | NA| $700 | $540 | 5540| $540 | $565 | $585 | $540 | $540 | $540 | $465 | $585 S440| $440 | $675 | $675 | $675 | $540 | $540 I $540 | $565 | $585 s150| $150 | $70 | $700 |NA NO BID | NO BID

Yellow=Low Daily Price
Green=Low Weekly Price
Purple=low MonthlyPrice
*This does not take mobilization costs in consideration; each project will be evaluated for overall low cost prior to renting.



Fabick Cat-Joplin Victor L. Phillips Midwest Equip Co Murphy Tractor Van Keppel Hertz Volvo Rents SBobcat' OIL
pringfie
TRACK LOADERS #1 #2 #3 |#a |45 |#1 |4 |43 #4]#s|41 #2 #3 |44 |us |m #2 43 |#a |#5  [dl#2 |# [# [4s|u#a|e |# |40 |d# |# |# |#a|# |#1]|s2|# [# |45
(Crawler Loaders) 120 HP (175 HP 122 120 HP [175 HP 120 HP|175 HP 173 |4]| [12[2 |3 5|12 |3 5 [12]173 |4
Contract Period o |1 5 ol1 11 o ls
3/1/10 - 2/28/11 HP|7 HP H |7 207 H |HP
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING PRICING
DAILY COST $750 | $900 | NA| NA | NA $650 | $700 | NA| NA| NA | $700 | $850 | NA | NA | NA
WEEKLY COST $2,200{$2,700] NA| NA [ NA NO BID $1,650( $1,975| NA | NA | NA [$1,675] $2,125[ NA [ NA[ NA| nNOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MONTHLY COST $6,500($8,000] NA | NA | NA $4,950 $5,925| NA | NA | NA [$5,015] $6,375] NA | NA | NA
EQUIPMENT INFORMATION EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO EQUIPINFO | EQUIPINFO | EQUIP INFO EQUIP INFO
MAKE CAT | cAT [ NA| NA | NA cAT | cat | NA| NA| NA| JohnDeere | NA | NA | NA
MODEL 953 [ 963 | NA| NA [ NA 953 | 963 | NA | NA | NA | 655C | 755C | NA [ NA | NA
HORSEPOWER 127 | 189 | NA| NA | NA 148 | 189 [ NA| NA| NA| 130 | 181 | NA [ NA | NA
HEIGHT TO HINGE PIN 11'9" [ 12'12" | NA | NA | NA NO BID 96 | 1211 [ NA| NA| NA| 144 | 134 [ NA| NA| NA| wNOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
REACH AT TOP HEIGHT 9 9'9" | NA| NA | NA 3.2 99 | NA| NA| NA| 42 48 | NA | NA | NA
BUCKET CAPACITY (yd) 2.25 3 | NA| NA | NA 24 | 32 [ NA[NA|NA] 23 | 31 | NA| NA| NA
OPERATING WEIGHT 32000 | 45000 | NA | NA | NA 34381 | 44577 | NA | NA | NA | 33950 46255 | NA | NA | NA
MOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILIZATION MOBILIZATION MOBILIZATION MOBILIZATION| MOBILIZATION| MOBILIZATION| MOBILIZATION
Permit Cost (one wa
( y) NA NA | NA| NA | NA NO BID NA NA | NA|NA| NA|$3.50] $4.50 | NA| NA| NA| o NO BID
Escort Cost (one way) NA | NA | NA| NA | NA NA NA | NA[ NA|NA] NA | NA | NA| NA [ NA NO BID NO BID
Vendor Starting Location =
Category 1
1-25- mil
miies | $500 | $500 | NA| NA | Na|  NOBID $225 | $225 | NA| NA | NA | $250 | $300 | NA | NA| NA [ NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Category 2
26-50 mil
mries | $500 | $500 | NA| NA | NA NO BID $270 | $270 | NA| NA | NA | $250 | $300 | NA| NA| Na | NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID
Category 3
51-75 miles
$500 | $500 | NA | NA | NA NOBID $315 | $315 | NA | NA | NA | 250 | $300 | NA | NA | Na | NOBIP NOBID NO BID NO BID
Category 4
76-100 mil
miies | $700 | $700 | NA| NA | NA NO BID $360 | $360 | NA| NA | NA | $350 | $450 | NA| NA| Na | NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID
Category 5
101-125 miles NO BID NO BID NO BID
$700 | $700 | NA| NA | NA $450 | $450 [ NA | NA | NA | 3440 | $565 [ NA | NA | NA NO BID NO BID
Category 6
126-150 miles NO BID NO BID NO BID
$700 | $700 | NA| NA | NA $540 | $540 [ NA | NA | NA ] 3480 | $675 | NA | NA | NA NO BID NO BID

Yellow=Low Daily Price
Green=Low Weekly Price
Purple=low Monthly Price

*This does not take mobilization costs in consideration; each project will be evaluated for overall low cost prior to renting.




Bobcat of

Fabick Cat-Joplin Victor L. Phillips Midwest Equip Co Murphy Tractor Van Keppel Hertz Volvo Rents

#1 #0 |43 [ 45 [#1 [#2 [#3 44 w5 [#1 [#2 [u3 [ea #s [e1 (w2 #3 #a #s [e1 [e2 43 44 #5 [#1 #2 #3 44 us [#n 42 #3 44 #5
48" Smth [54" (66" Smth|84" Smth 48" |54" 66" 84" smth 48" 54" 66" 84" 48" |54" Smth 66" Smth 84" smth 48" |54" Smth | 66" Smth 84" smth 48" Smth (54" Smth 66" Smth 84" smth 48" 54" 66" Smth 84" Smth
Smth Smt |Smt [Smth Smth |Smth [Smth |Smth Smt Smt Smth | Smth
Smt=smooth

DAILY COST $275 | NA | $400 NA| NAT $370 | $470 [ NA| $210 ] $270] $315 [ $a75 [ NA| NA]  $380 NA [ $270 | $295 $115 | $126 $150 | $175 [ $275 $300
WEEKLY COST $825 | NA | $1,200 NA| NA | $1,100 [ $1,410 $630 | $810 | $945 | $1,425| NA| NA|  $950 INa | s810 5885 | ssas $450 | $550 $800 | %900 | NA
MONTHLY COST 52,475 | NA | $3,600 nA | Na | $3,250 | 84,225 | na$1,890( $2,430] $2,835] sa,250( na| na | $2,850 [ nalna [ s2,830 | s2.655 $2,527 $1,250] $1,500  $2,400 52,700 | NA
MAKE CAT | NA| cAT CAT | NA| NA | NA | Dynapac| Dynapac | NA Bomag NA HAMM NA | NA Volvo NA Ingersol NA | R I Volvo Volvo | NA
MODEL 5323 | NA | 5433 | csse | NA| NA | NA | cA150D| CA260 | NA |BW124[BW145|BW177| BW213| NA | NA | 3205 3307 3412 | NA| NA| spaspx | sp7opx sD116DX | NA| DD30 D45 D70 D100 |NA | D45 | SD4s D70 SD100 | NA
HORSEPOWER 83 | NA| 100 156 | NA| NA|NA| 80 150 | NA)| 44 | 73 | 79 | 160 | NA| NA 57 82 131 | NA[NA| 80 99 160 NA | 32 Diesel 48 70 99 NA | 80 | 80 99 130 | NA
FREQUENCY 2100 vpm| NA [1915vpm| 1914 vpm| NA | NA | NA | 2580 | 1980 | NA| 2460 | 2040 | 1800 | 1800 | NA | NA | 1800/2520 | 1800/2500 |1800/2400] NA | NA | 1900vpm | 18.5-2025vpm | 1870-2018vpm| NA | 3480 3100 3300 300042003 |NA | 32hz | 32hz | 30.8-33.8hz | 31.2-33.6hz| NA NO BID
AMPLITUDE 05" | NA| 066" | 067" | NA| NA| NA| 0066 | 0.067 | NA| 0.067 | 0.067] 0.071| 0.071 | NA| NA | .061/.027 | .067/.023 |.077/.035| NA| NA | 0.078 .05-08 .051-076 | NA| 0.16-020 NA | 198 | 198 | 12198 | 120192 | NA
CENTRIFUGAL FORCE (Ibs) 15000 | NA | 30000 | 60000 | NA| NA| NA| 25620 | 55350 | NA | 18540 22500| 30375 | 61825 | NA | NA | 15525/13500| 27900/21825 }7600/4832| NA | NA | 22500 | 23300/32100 | 47900-61000 | NA | 6570-8090 | 8000-12500 | 8940-17970 | 33090-42070 [NA | 99%kn | 99kn | 104-143kn | 206-264kn | NA
OPERATING WEIGHT (Ibs) 9680 | NA | 14875 | 25000 | NA| NA| NA| 15880 | 24915 | NA| 7075 | 11035] 15355 | 26540 NA | 11354 15100 24433 | NA| NA | 10600 15750 23930 NA | 600 7400 15000 27670 |NA | 4807 | 4807 | 15750 23100 | NA
Permit Cost (one way) [ wa Twal wa [ wa [wa|wafna] wa | wa [naf wa ] na na[ na[nafnal s3so | s3s0 | s3so [nafwal wa | NA | NA [ na na | ona | ona [ owna [wafwalwa] na | owa [w
Escort Cost (one way) [ wa [wal wa [ wa [walwafwal wa na [ nal wa [ wa [ na | na [nafwa na | owa | owa [ma|wal ma | NA | nA e v | owa | owa | owa (wal walwa | wa | wa [w NO BID
!ategory ! — _
1-25 miles
$150 | NA | $150 $500 [ NA| NA| NA| $225 $225 | NA| $225 | $225 | $225 | $225 | NA| NA 5250 5250 $300 | NA| NA| $225 5225 $225 NA $30 $30 5&’ sa) NA| $60 | $60 $60 $60 NA NO BID
— 1
Category 2
26-50 miles
$250 | NA| $250 | $500 | NA| NA| NA| $270 | $270 | NA| $270 | $270 | $270 | $270 | NA| NA|  $250 $250 $300 | NA| NA| s270 $270 $270 NAl 30 $30 $30 $30 NA| $75 | $75 $75 $75 | NA NO BID
— = == == == == == == —
Category 3
51-75 miles
5300 | NA| $300 | $500 | NA| NA| NA| $315 | $315 | NA| $315 | $315 | $315 [ $315 | NA| NA| 250 $250 5300 | NA| NA| $315 $315 $315 NA L 60 $60 $50 $60 NA | $100 | $100 $100 $100 | NA NO BID
= 1
Category 4

76-100 miles
| 5400 |NA| $400 | 700 |NA NA| NA‘ $360 | $360 ‘NA $360 | $360 | 360 | $360 | NA NA| M ‘ $450 ‘NA ”’J 3350 S s360 [ NA1 990 =0 | 20 | = |NA e S

100 s - T

Category 5

101125 miles | | | | | ‘ ‘ | | ‘ ‘ ‘ ‘ | | |
$400 | NA | $400 | 700 | NA| NA| NA| 450 | $4s0 | NA| $aso | $aso| saso | saso | NA| na | sad0 $440 $565 | NATNA| 5450 3450 240 NAL_$120 0 2120 S0 e swo | w0l s S =
— S - - "

Category 6

126-150 miles

| 500 | NA 500 700 |NA NA| NA‘ 540| 540 ‘NA 540| 540| 540| S40|NA NA 480 ‘ 480 675 | NA NA‘ 540 | 540 | 540 |NA 150 150 150 150 NAJ $300 | $300 300 300 | NA NO BID

Yellow=Low Daily Price
Green=Low Monthly Price
Purple=low Weekly Price
*This does not take mobilization costs in consideration; each project will be evaluated for overall low cost prior to renting.



Fabick Cat-Joplin Victor L Phillps Midwest Equip Co. Murphy Tractor Van Keppel Hertz Volvo Rents Bobeat of Springfild
MINI EXCAVATORS [« 2 3 |m Ws w6  [#1 |2 |43 [ea |45 |#6  |WL  [#2 [#3 |4 s (W6 (#1022 [#3 |W 6 |1 s |43 |sa |45 %6 v 40 3 3
o) 6'0ig |7.5'Dig |85'Dig|10'0ig |12'Dig|[14'Dig [6' (7.5 [85' |10'Dig |12'Dig |14'0ig [6'Dig |75 (85 [10'Dig |12 Dig|14'Dig|6'Dig |75'Dig |85 [10'Dig |12’ |14’ Dig] 75'Dig |85 [10'Dig |12 Dig|14'Dig : i |7: ig |10 Dig Depth | 12' Dig Depth 14
3/10-2/8/11 Depth [Depth [Depth [Depth | Depth [Depth [Dig |Dig [Dig [Depth [Depth [Depth [Depth (pig [Dig [Depth |Depth Depth |Depth [Depth (Dig [Depth |pig |Depth [oepth peptn |pig [Deptn | Depth [Depth
PRICING PRICNG PRICNG PRICNG PRiCING PRICING PRicING
DALY cosT 151 [Fstas [ s1s0 [ s1s0 steo [ saso[ saos | nal wal waf s150 | s150 [ s180] $210 | s270[ s300] s [ s240 [ s2s0] s 270 S15] [S300] Na| WA s [ sus s200 S35 $350
wekLy cosT (5) 5375 | _saso | saso | ss05 | 750 | s1.050] na| na| Na sso0 | 725 | ss0 630 | ss10 | $ss5 [ sa00 | $400 | 500 [ $c00 | s700 ["$00] ss70 | ss70 | ss0 810 | ss10 s375 $525 | 675 | so00 | NA | NA | ss2s | ssas | seo0 S675 $1.050
[ MoNTHLY cosT () [ 1,125 [ 51,350 [ s1,350[ s1,750 [ $2,200] $3.000] na [ va | na [ s1.500 2,150 $2.950] $1,080[$1,350] $1.620] $1,890 [ $2.430] 52,565] 51,300[ $1,300] 51,400] s1,500[ sseesl $,700] $1.710[ $1,720[ $1,720] 52,070 2,430 s2,0¢ 5900 $1,200] $1,500( $2.000] s2.550] Na | wa [ sus7s [ suszs [ suro0 | sa025 [ s3aso
EQuP INFO EauPinFo Eaup ivFo Eaup N EauP nFo Eaup ino EQuP o
e car | car | car | car | car| car [walwalwa Takeuch) Komatsu John Deere Volvo [y Bobeat Vo[ Volvo [Volvo [Volvo [Volvo | NA | WA | Bobcat | Bobeat | Bobeat | Bobeat | Bobeat
mopeL 301 | 300 | 302 | 303 | 305 | 307 | na| na| na| ve2ss] veaso| e1zs| ecos [ pcis [ ecar] pcss | pess| ecas| 170 | 210 | 27 | 350 | sop | soo | ecas| ecwas | ecnas] ecnss | ecnss| ecnss| na| 32] 326] 331] 337 | walecas| ecas | ecos | ecas | ecss| wa | wa | assaoo | assmae]  ex a37/435 | _aanjeso
HorsePoweR 181 | 249 | 209 | 295 | aco| sa | walwafwal o35 | s8 | os| sa | 15 | 25 | 20 |2l 65 | 148 | 264 | 264 o86 | 38| 31| 076 | 276 | 276 | sos | ses| ses| waliso|oralars| 27 [wal 16| 27 | 27 | 36 | s [ wal wa| 2 27 33 488 73/523
oicaiNG DepTH (tin) 77 | or | o | wwa | aoer| s | walwalwal o5 | vos| asof ans | 21| oa| wa |6l 2] 70| 86 86| 10| 15| 1aa] o | o | o | 11| 13sf 1asfnalse|ss]i0of sofmafval 8 | & [ maf 1 | wal waf sym00] 8300 100 | somz | 13numse
[MAXIMUM ReACH ) 126 | 159 | 159 [ 181 [1910°] 200 [ waf wal wa| 156 [ 108 2as ] o0 [ 130 162 186 [205] aaa] 110 150 [ a5 170 | 106] 196 18] 168 [ 168 206 [ 237 [ 257 | wal12a[1aa] 16 [ 60| waluoo] 15 [ 15 [ 17 | 106 | wal wa [ 1em316[1am3n6] v 1875/184 | 231/21.33
BucKer size RaNGE (in) 1232 | 1220 | 1220 | 1236 | 1236] 1836 | na| na| wal 1218 1220] 1836 1230 | 1230] 1230 1236 | 1236] 1236| 1020 ] 1026 | 1028] 1030] 1236] 1236| 2424 | 122 | 12.26] 1224 | 1826 1624] wa[182d182d 1820 1824 ] walr20d 1224 | 1220 1236 1236 ] wa| wa | 1324 | 1320 | 1336 1336 1340
Max e AT (o) [ eo0 | 1323 | 1323 [ 1433 [ 2se6 | 17ca | wa| wa| wal 1731 [ azas | 26 | aos [ 745 [ 13| 1587 [ 2172 aseo| o70 | 2s5a [ 654 | 3316 [ suss[ sues| ao7s [ a07s | 2095 | 611 [ oaso [ ozso| wa| eso] rauc] aare] sasr | walera| aos [ aos | ass | suao| wa| wa | sass | ass | sasryeses | sesyjases [ 114a2/11816)
[MAX UFT AT MAX REACH SIDE (bs) sso | ass | es3 | ss1 | 992 | wzea [ waf wal nal 1ieo [ ours| oesa| 201 | 412 | asa | eos | oso | 1s30| soo | ooa | oo | 1430 2301| 2301 atso| atso | 2150 3153 | ases | asos| wa nalaos| aos | aos | aos | osso| waf wa | wa A na Ns
(Ibs) 3935 | Goa3 | cos3 | 7837 | 11720 15900 | wa| wa| wal 6100 [ 10950 17230 sms | aos0 [ eas0| 7000 | 11380] assss| e173 | es6o | 6360 | 77es [ 0s1al r0sua| 7s6a| 7ser | 7561 | 12863 | 1s620] 18620] na 368l esoe| 709o| 11086] a | 70| ssea | sses | 7se1 | 12300] na | wa 11085/13556 16538/18689)
'MIOBILIZATION COST (One Way) MOBILZATION ‘MoBILZATION MOBILZATION MOBILZATION WoBILZATION MOBILZATION
permit Costloneway) [ wa [ wa [ wa [ wa | wa [ wa [ walwalwal wa [ wa [ wa | wa [ wa [ wa wa [ wa] wasasof sss0fsssof sssolsaso sasol wa | wa [ na [ wa [ wa [ wafwalwa[walwal wafwafwal wa [ wa [ walwalwafwal wa [ wa [ wa [ wa [ wa
Escort ost fone way) vl w vl v wlwfwlw wlwlw{wlwlwlwlwlwlwlowlwlolwlo|lwlwliolwlolw{lwelowwWewlwoe slewlwlolwloel w] w v | wm | ow
Vendor Starting Location =
‘Springfield
Category 1
L2 mies [ [ s T o[ s T sso0] saon | wnl wal wnl soos [ soasT soas | soos [ 2o [ soas[ saas [ 2o [ soms | 150 sas0 [ saso [ s1s0 [ sasol ssso | 22| soos [ saas[ szos [ s22s | soos | wa[ saol o] saol sz0 [ wa | sao] so0 | so0 [ sco [ soo [ ssof mal ssso [ sss0 [ a0 [ a0 [ 0
Category 2
2650 miles
[suss [ suss Tons [ s [aso] soso | wal walwa] somo [ oo somo | 20 [ s2r0 [ s2s0] saro [ sarol saro] ssrs] surs [surs [ surs [ surs [ sars | saro[ saro [ saro [ a0 [ s230 [ sar0| wa[ ol ol ol sso [wa|lszs| 25 | svs | o5 | sos [sos| wa] smo [ smoo [ s20 | a0 [ a0
Caterorv 3
5175 mies [“sa00 [ s200 T sa00 [ s200 [ szs0] saso | wa [ wa [ wa] 315 [ sous [ sors | ssss [ soas [ saas | soas [ svas [ svss | sao0 [ saoo [ saoo[ saco [ s200[ saco | ssss [ sars [ sass | ss1s [ saas | ssas | wa [ seo] seol seol sco | wa [ssoo] s100 | 100 | s100 [ s100 ['s100] wa | sos0 [ s2e0 | szs0 | sz0 | om0
Categorv 4
76100 mie: [“s200 T 5200 T s200 [ s200 [ s200[ s00 | ua ['a [ wa | a0 [ sae0 [ saso | 0 [ sae0 [ saso [ saso [ sas0] 0| soso [ saso [ saso[ saso [ ss0[ saso | sae0 saso [ saso sa60 [ saso [ saco | wa [ sso] soo] ssol sso | wa [ssso] s1s0 | s1s0 | stso [ sso['saso| wa | saoo [ sao0 | sao | sa0 | a0
Category 5
101125 mies [sa00 [ sao0 T saoo [ saoo T ssoo [ ssoo | wal wa [ wa[ saso [ saso [ saso | saso [ saso [ saso] saso [ saso[ saso| sars [ sars [ savs [ sars [ sars sars | saso ] saso [ saso[ saso [ saso [ saso | wa [ssaol sroofsr20] 120 wa | saoo] saoo | s200 [ s200 | saoo [s200f wa [ s3s0 [ s3s0 [ 30 [ sss0 [ sumo
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Yellow=Low Daily Price
Green=Low Weekly Price
Purple=low Monthly Price
*This does not take mobilization costs in consideration; each project will be evaluated for overall low cost prior to renting.



Vendor Contact Information

Fabick CAT jan.glassman@fabickcat.com
lan Glassman

3534 E. 20th Street

Joplin, MO 64801

417-624-3010

417-624-2112 fax

417-434-0202 cell

Victor L. Phillips bewan@vlpco.com
Bill Ewan

5430 Highway 43 South

Joplin, MO 64804

417-781-8222

417-781-2768 fax

417-529-3305 cell

Midwest Equipment and Supply jfreitag@roadbuildersmachinery.com

Jerry Freitag

1480 S Highway T
Springfield, MO 65802
417-732-5505
417-735-0026 fax
417-631-7750 cell

Murphy Tractor ddooley@murphytractor.com
Daniel Dooley

1601 N. Corrington

Kansas City, MO 64120

816-483-500

816-483-5721 fax

Van Keppel dbolerjack@ve
David Bolerjack

6455 W. Independence Dr.
Springfield, MO 65802
417-865-3550

417-865-1044 fax

417-234-6130 cell

Hertz Equipment Rental Corpora
Chuck

1907 East Bergman Street
Springfield, MO 65802
417-865-5561

417-865-8060 fax

417-693-4508 cell

EBE Enterprises / Volvo Rents
Rob Ray or Rob Barnica

7096 W. Carnahan Street
Springfield, MO 65802
417-831-9111

417-831-9114 fax
417-830-4445 cell

Bobcat of Springfield
Lee Proctor

2520 N. Eastgate
Springfield, MO 65803
417-865-3535
417-865-6186 fax
417-830-8977 cell
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tion dcallhan@hertz.com

rob.barnica@volvorents.com

Iproctor@vankeppel.com
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