
 

 
 
 
 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 

Missouri Department of Transportation 
 

1511 Missouri Blvd. 
P.O. Box 718 
Jefferson City, Missouri 65102 
573.751.3322 
Fax: 573.522.1059 
1.888.ASK MODOT (275.6636) 

 
February 17, 2012 
 

 
Thank you for your response to our Request for Bid # CD‐12‐019B.  For your information, the following is a tabulation of all 
responses which were received.  If you have any questions, please contact me at (573) 526‐6956. 

 
Buyer:  Corey Duemmel, Sr. Procurement Agent  
 
CD‐12‐019B REQUEST FOR BID: PLANT MIX OIL MATERIAL 
 
 
 
SEE TABULATION PAGE 
 
 

Per the bid requirements, MoDOT Central District will review pricing and quantities prior to final award.    Contract will be 
awarded to the low bidder per each delivey location upon approval. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

A total of 228 vendors,  10  of which were MBE/WBE/DBE vendors) were sent notification of the online posting of this RFB opportunity.  Zero 
(0) MBE/WBE/DBE responded.   
 



 RFB CD-12-019B PLANT MIX OIL MATERIAL WORKSHEET/BID TABULATION
GROUP 1

COUNTY Location PAY ITEM TON Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton
MONITEAU California Stockpile 1 188 27.60$             19.80$                No Bid 21.50$                21.50$                27.80$                27.80$                No Bid

2 12 596.00$           589.00$              565.00$              565.00$              531.10$              531.10$              
200 12,340.80$      10,790.40$         -$                    10,822.00$         10,822.00$         11,599.60$         11,599.60$         -$                    

per ton price 61.70$               -$                    54.11$                58.00$                -$                    

COUNTY Location PAY ITEM TON Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton
HOWARD Fayette 1 188 No Bid No Bid 25.30$                25.30$                21.10$                21.10$                No Bid

2 12 565.00$              565.00$              539.16$              539.16$              
200 -$                    -$                    11,536.40$         11,536.40$         10,436.72$         10,436.72$         -$                    

per ton price -$                    -$                    57.68$                52.18$                -$                    

-
Indicates Awarded Vendor GROUP 1 TOTALS: 21,258.72$   

Willard Asphalt

Willard AsphaltLeo O'LaughlinSiegel Quarries

Siegel Quarries Leo O'LaughlinBlevins Asphalt

Blevins Asphalt

Vance Brothers

Vance Brothers



 RFB CD-12-019B PLANT MIX OIL MATERIAL WORKSHEET/BID TABULATION

GROUP 2

COUNTY Location PAY ITEM TON Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton
MILLER Eldon Shed 1 1978 27.60$             19.80$                20.65$                20.65$                19.70$                19.70$                19.37$                19.37$                No Bid

2 122 596.00$           589.00$              571.25$              571.25$              565.00$              565.00$              529.07$              529.07$              
2100 127,304.80$    111,022.40$       110,538.20$       110,538.20$       107,896.60$       107,896.60$       102,860.40$       102,860.40$       -$                    

per ton price 60.62$               52.64$                51.38$                48.98$                -$                    

COUNTY Location PAY ITEM TON Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton
LACLEDE Lebanon Shed 1 1695 No Bid 17.85$                17.85$                20.40$                20.40$                30.59$                30.59$                35.00$             32.00$                

2 105 566.00$              566.00$              568.00$              568.00$              529.01$              529.01$              590.00$           590.00$              
1800 -$                    89,685.75$         89,685.75$         94,218.00$         94,218.00$         107,396.10$       107,396.10$       121,275.00$   116,190.00$       

per ton price -$                    49.83$                52.34$                59.66$                67.38$                

COUNTY Location PAY ITEM TON Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton
LACLEDE Nebo 1 3297 No Bid  $               21.35  $               21.35  $               22.56  $               22.56  $               30.90  $               30.90  $               40.00  $               32.00 

2 203 566.00$              566.00$              568.00$              568.00$              529.09$              529.09$              590.00$              590.00$              
3500 -$                    185,288.95$       185,288.95$       189,684.32$       189,684.32$       209,282.57$       209,282.57$       251,650.00$       225,274.00$       

per ton price -$                    52.94$                54.20$                59.80$                71.90$                

COUNTY Location PAY ITEM TON Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton
CAMDEN Camdenton Shed 1 2072 No Bid 21.50$               21.50$               20.98$               20.98$               24.79$               24.79$               No Bid

Siegel Quarries Blevins Asphalt Vance Brothers Leo O'Laughlin Willard Asphalt

Siegel Quarries Blevins Asphalt Vance Brothers Leo O'Laughlin Willard Asphalt

Siegel Quarries Blevins Asphalt Vance Brothers Leo O'Laughlin Willard Asphalt

Siegel Quarries Blevins Asphalt Vance Brothers Leo O'Laughlin Willard Asphalt

CAMDEN Camdenton Shed 1 2072 No Bid 21.50$               21.50$               20.98$               20.98$               24.79$               24.79$               No Bid
2 128 566.00$              566.00$              565.00$              565.00$              529.04$              529.04$              

2200 -$                    116,996.00$       116,996.00$       115,790.56$       115,790.56$       119,082.00$       119,082.00$       -$                    
per ton price -$                    53.18$                52.63$                54.13$                -$                    

COUNTY Location PAY ITEM TON Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton
MILLER Iberia 1 942 No Bid  $               25.85  $               25.85  $               23.15  $               23.15  $               23.57  $               23.57 No Bid

2 58 571.25$              571.25$              565.00$              565.00$              529.09$              529.09$              
1000 -$                    57,483.20$         57,483.20$         54,577.30$         54,577.30$         52,890.16$         52,890.16$         -$                    

per ton price -$                    57.48$                54.58$                52.89$                -$                    

-
Indicates Awarded Vendor GROUP 2 TOTALS; 546,515.82$  

Vance Brothers Leo O'Laughlin Willard AsphaltSiegel Quarries Blevins Asphalt



 RFB CD-12-019B PLANT MIX OIL MATERIAL WORKSHEET/BID TABULATION
GROUP 3

COUNTY Location PAY ITEM TON Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton Delivery/Ton Pick up/Ton
CALLAWAY Stockpile Rt. B 1 3394 No Bid No Bid 20.30$                20.30$                18.12$                18.12$                No Bid

2 209 565.00$              565.00$              529.72$              529.72$              
3603 -$                    -$                    186,983.20$       186,983.20$       172,210.76$       172,210.76$       -$                    

per ton price -$                    51.90$                47.80$                -$                    

Indicates Awarded Vendor GROUP 3 TOTALS: 172,210.76$ 

Vance Brothers Leo O'Laughlin Willard AsphaltSiegel Quarries Higgins Asphalt
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