Missouri MODOT Central District

1511 Mi i
o smms  BID TABULATION
Department '* Jefferson City, MO 65102

(573) 751-3322

. General Services
fax (573) 522-1059 ..
of Trans po rtation Toll free 1-888 ASK MoDOT (Procurement) Division
Roger Schwartze, District Engineer www.modot.org

Thank you for your response to our Request for Bid # D5-10-059B. For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses which were
received. This bid was was a multiple award bid. If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown above.

Buyer: Sheldon Redel, Procurement Agent
D5-10-059B REQUEST FOR BID: Mower Parts

SCHULTE MOWER PARTS
Moore Equipment Hall Manufacturing
Item Description Unit Unit Price and Part # Unit Price and Part #
No.
0221580205 EA $787.50 $660.00
1 Complete Main Drive Shaft MO3954 4940
#MO3954 Moore
0221580210 EA $445.50 NO BID
2 Wing Drive Shaft MO4970
#MO4970 Moore
0221580215 EA $18.00 NO BID
3 Blade CW Left Wing MO401-046
#MO401-046 Moore
0221580220 EA $18.00 NO BID
4 Blade CCW Right Wing MO401-047
#MO401-047 Moore

Our mission is to provide a world-class transportation experience that delights our customers and promotes a prosperous Missouri.



SCHULTE MOWER PARTS

Moore Equipment Hall Manufacturing
Item Description Unit Unit Price and Part # Unit Price and Part #
No.
0221580225 EA $18.90 NO BID
5 Blade CW Center MO401-052
#MO401-052 Moore
0221580230 EA $7.65 NO BID
6 Bolt Keyed MO251-007
#MO251-007 Moore
0221580235 EA $24.04 NO BID
7 Bolt Pentagon
#251-018
0221580240 EA $3.24 NO BID
8 Lock Nut MO257-003
#MO257-003 Moore
0221580245 EA $31.50 NO BID
9 Wheel Bearing Kit -2004 newer MO4925
#MO4925 Moore
0221580250 EA $54.00 NO BID
10 Complete Hub Assembly 5 hole MO206-013
#M0O206-013 Moore
0221580255 EA $42.30 NO BID
11 Spindle-Main Frame Walking Axle MO208-027
#MO208-027 Moore
0221580260 EA $37.80 NO BID
12 Spindle (wing) MO208-028
#MO208-028 Moore




SCHULTE MOWER PARTS

Moore Equipment Hall Manufacturing
Item Description Unit Unit Price and Part # Unit Price and Part #
No.
0221580265 EA $47.70 NO BID
13 Walking Axle Bearing Kit MO4921
#MO4921 Moore
0221580270 EA $53.10 NO BID
14 Pivot Pin Walking Beam MO150-16
#MO150-16 Moore
0221580275 EA $270.00 NO BID
15 Walking Beam (left) MOC301-341
#MOC301-341 Moore
0221580280 EA $270.00 NO BID
16 Walking Beam (right) MOC301-342
#MOC301-342 Moore
0221580285 EA $53.10 $58.00
17 Skid Shoe Center Section MOC301-137 HMIS-c301-137
#MOC301-137 Moore
0221580290 EA $53.10 $58.00
18 Skid Shoe Front Right Wing MOC502-136 HMIS-c502-136
#MOC502-136 Moore
0221580295 EA $53.10 $58.00
19 Skid Shoe Front Left Wing MOC502-137 HMIS-c301-137
#MOC502-137 Moore
0221580305 EA $53.10 $49.00
20 Skid Shoe Rear Wing MOC301-136 HMIS-c301-136
#MOC301-136 Moore




SCHULTE MOWER PARTS

Moore Equipment

Hall Manufacturing

Item Description Unit Unit Price and Part # Unit Price and Part #
No.
0221580310 EA $8.10 $7.30
21 Castle nut Moore HMIS-6500
#330002500
for MOC301-136
0221580315 EA $6.07 $6.20
22 Washer Moore HMIS-6501
#367001001
for MOC301-136
0221580320 EA $256.50 $278.00
23 FF2 Complete Clutch, Size 6 1-3/8” 6 spline Moore 2086
#M09920
0221580325 EA $2.16 $2.16
24 Coil Springs, 6mm (qty 8 per clutch) Moore HMI-9920
#351022370
for MO9920
0221580330 EA $11.56 $12.00
25 Lining (qty 2 per clutch) Moore HMI-6502
#247000061
for MO9920
0221580335 EA $292.50 $271.00
26 FV42 Complete Clutch, Size 6 1-3/8” 6 spline MO9960 HMI-6506
-for 540 rpm tractor & outer clutch on 1000 rpm Moore
# MO9960
0221580340 EA $50.26 $34.20
27 Belleville Springs, 4.5mm Moore HMI-6504
#367006870

for MO9960




TRIUMPH AND JC BUILT MOWER PARTS

Moore Equipment

Hall Manufacturing

Item Description Unit Unit Price and Part # Unit Price and Part #
No.

0221580345 EA $14.71 $14.70
28 Lining (qty 2 per clutch) Moore HMI-6505

#247006351

for MO9960

0221580350 EA $270.00 NO BID
29 | FT42R Complete Clutch, Size 6 1-3/8” 6 spline MO9990

-for 540 rpm tractor Moore
-same as M0O9960 but has no clutch band

# MO9990

0221580355 EA $32.02 $32.00
30 Belleville Springs, 3.25mm Moore HMI-6507

#367004870

for MO9990

0221580365 EA $31.27 $30.00
31 Outer clutch band Moore HMI-6508

#240000214

for MO9990

FV32 Complete Clutch, Size 6 1-3/8”" 6 spline EA $243.00 NO BID

32 -for center clutch on 1000 rpm tractor - MO9956

# MO9956 Moore

0221580370 EA $39.10 $40.00
33 Belleville Spring Moore HMI-6509

#367009860

for MO9956

0221580375 EA $14.62 $13.50
34 Lining (qty 2 per clutch) Moore HMI-6510

#247006251

for MO9956




TRIUMPH AND JC BUILT MOWER PARTS

Moore Equipment

Hall Manufacturing

Item Description Unit Unit Price and Part # Unit Price and Part #
No.
0221566065 EA $15.00 $19.00
35 JC Mono Blade, 6' Mower MO12601 JC16002
#MO12601 Moore
0221566085 EA $10.89 $6.05
36 Stump Jumper, Blot Kit, Attaching Blades MO120113 JC16001
34”7 x 24" Moore
#M0120113
0221566170 EA $250.00 $210.00
37 Gearbox, 6’ Mower, Complete MO250404 JC15001
#M0O250404 Moore
0221566345 EA $80.00 $82.50
38 Tail Wheel Assembly, Yoke Pin, Collar, JC MO1375 JC12001
Built Mower Moore
#MO1375
0221591738 BOX $18.00 $60.00
39 Section, Under-Serrated, Packaged 25 Per MOO0646 HMI-7-646
Box Moore
#MO0646
0221570515 BOX $18.50 $15.00
40 Section, Over-Serrated, Packaged 25 Per Box MOO0747 JC11017
#MOO0747 Moore
0221570600 EA $10.50 $7.25
41 Moore Center Guard Position MO5937 JC11015
#MO5937 Moore
0221570607 EA $10.75 $7.25
42 Moore Inner Guard, Left Position MO5935 JC11019
#MO5935 Moore




TRIUMPH AND JC BUILT MOWER PARTS

Moore Equipment

Hall Manufacturing

Item Description Unit Unit Price and Part # Unit Price and Part #
No.
0221570612 EA $10.75 $7.25
43 Moore Outer Guard, Right Position MO5936 JC11019
#MO5936 Moore
0221570672 BOX $3.00 $1.00
44 Flanged Lock Nut, Packaged 10 Per Box MO1683 HMI-8-1638
#MO1683 Moore
0221570715 EA $50.00 $52.00
45 Sickle Knife Assembly, 6’, Under-Serrated, MO1876 HMI-8-1876
Bolted Moore
#MO1876
0221570720 EA $55.00 $55.00
46 Sickle Knife Assembly, 6’, Over-Serrated, MO1886 JC11018
Bolted Moore
#MO1886
0221570750 EA $160.00 $150.00
47 Cutter Bar, 6’ MO5705 HMI-5706
#MO5705 Moore
0221570810 EA $8.00 $7.90
48 Clip, Low Spring, Hold Down MO1016 JC11021
#MO1016 Moore
0221570815 EA $8.75 $10.00
49 Clip, High Spring, Hold Down MO1026 JC11022
#MO1026 Moore
0221570905 EA $1.50 $8.00
50 Wear Plate, 6’ Cutter Bar MO47954 HMI-7-474
#MO47954 Moore




TRIUMPH AND JC BUILT MOWER PARTS

Moore Equipment

Hall Manufacturing

Item Description Unit Unit Price and Part # Unit Price and Part #
No.
0221570925 BOX $5.90 $4.00
51 Wear Strip, Packaged 10 Per Box MO1050 JC11024
#MO1050 Moore
0221591525 EA $105.00 $101.00
52 Pitman Assembly MO1828 HMI-7-450
#MO1828 Moore
0221591130 EA $8.20 $1.30
53 Knife Heap Cap, Rear MOO00450 HMI-8-3416
Triumph #450 Moore
0221591140 EA $984.35 $338.00
54 Carriage 0341600 HMI-8-3416
Triumph #3416 Moore
0221591147 EA $4.32 $2.10
55 Pitman Connector 0190800 HMI-8-1908
Triumph #1908 Moore
0221591155 EA $209.00 $215.00
56 Cylinder, Curb Stop, Hydraulic MO6934 HMI-8-2401
Triumph #2401 Moore
0221591158 EA $175.00 $175.00
57 Cylinder, Lift Bar, Hydraulic MO6935 HMI-8-2402
Triumph #2402 Moore
0221591180 EA $26.75 $5.00
58 Side Outlet Elbow. ¥4” Hydraulic Fitting 058500 HMI-8-5850
Triumph #5850 Moore




TRIUMPH AND JC BUILT MOWER PARTS

Moore Equipment

Hall Manufacturing

Item Description Unit Unit Price and Part # Unit Price and Part #
No.
0221591200 EA $293.36 NO BID
59 Fly Wheel Assembly, with Nut 0185800
Triumph #1858 Moore
0221591247 EA $281.70 $142.00
60 Motor Guard 0586000 HMI-8-5860
Triumph #5860 Moore
0221591258 EA $6.50 $7.65
61 Knife Head Cap, Front MO1883 HMI-8-1883
Triumph #1883 Moore
0221591445 EA $340.20 $130.00
62 Knuckle 0113000 HMI-8-1130
Triumph #1130 Moore
0221591465 EA $739.80 $189.00
63 Motor Mount 0182700 HMI-8-1827
Triumph #1827 Moore
0221591470 EA $594.00 $160.00
64 Motor Mount Support 0270100 HMI-8-2701
Triumph #2701 Moore
0221591530 EA $108.00 $21.00
65 Pin, Release 0113900 HMI-8-1139
Triumph #1139 Moore
(NOTE: to be used with Triumph cutter bar
support #1128)
0221591553 EA $5.00 $3.05
66 Pin, Clevis MO4242 HMI-8-1127
Triumph #4242 Moore

(NOTE: to be used with Triumph hydraulic

cylinders #2401 and #2402)




TRIUMPH AND JC BUILT MOWER PARTS

Moore Equipment

Hall Manufacturing

Item Description Unit Unit Price and Part # Unit Price and Part #
No.
0221591555 EA $52.92 $12.85
67 Pin, Carriage 0112700 HMI-8-1127
Triumph #1127 Moore
0221591556 EA $20.52 $6.30
68 Pin, Rocker 0114100 HMI-8-1141
Triumph #1141 Moore
(NOTE: to be used with Triumph motor mount
support #2701)
0221591562 EA $8.00 $2.25
69 Plate, Knife Wear, Rear MO00445 HMI-7-445
Triumph #445 Moore
0221591743 EA $0.95 $0.90
70 Shim, Knife Head Cap MO00453 HMI-7-453
Triumph #453 Moore
0221591765 EA $45.00 $27.95
71 Sole, Inner Shoe MO5855 HMI-8-5855
Triumph #5855 Moore
0221591770 EA $18.00 $9.00
72 Sole, Outer Shoe MO1238 HMI-8-1238
Triumph #1238 Moore
0221591779 EA $871.86 $330.00
73 Sub Frame 0654700 HMI-8-6547
Triumph #6547 Moore
0221591790 EA $574.56 $261.00
74 Support, Cutter Bar 0117800 HMI-8-1128
Triumph #1128 Moore




TRIUMPH AND JC BUILT MOWER PARTS

Moore Equipment

Hall Manufacturing

Item Description Unit Unit Price and Part # Unit Price and Part #
No.
0221591795 EA $1,036.80 $310.00
75 Support, Spring with Spring 0119000 HMI-1190
Triumph #1190 Moore
0221566070 EA NO BID $220.00
76 JC Stump Jumper Approximately 34” JC16004
Diameter, for 6° Mower
JC16004
0221566155 EA NO BID $270.00
77 JC Drive Shaft, for JC Built Mower JC14001
JC14001
(NOTE: torque limiter not included — order
separately)
0221566360 EA NO BID $85.00
78 Torque Limiter (slip clutch), for use with JC JC13001
Drive Shatft
JC13001
0221566337 EA NO BID $45.00
79 JC Spider 2065
JC2065
(Replacement part for use with JC flex coupler
#2211)
0221591015 EA $84.00 $65.00
80 Shoe Assembly, Inner Complete Assembly 0571300 HMI-8-5713
Includes Inner Shoe, Wear Plate, and Rivets Moore

Triumph #5713




TRIUMPH AND JC BUILT MOWER PARTS

Moore Equipment

Hall Manufacturing

Item Description Unit Unit Price and Part # Unit Price and Part #
No.
0221591016 EA $55.00 $10.00
81 Shoe Assembly Outer, Complete Assembly MO5709 HMI-8-5709
Includes Outer Shoe, Ledger Plate and Rivets Moore
Triumph #5709
0221591025 EA $114.48 $36.00
82 Bolt, Knuckle 0144300 HMI-8-1443
Triumph #1443 Moore
(For use with Triumph knuckle bolt nut #1421)
NOTE: grease zerk not included.
0221591460 EA $990.00 $215.00
83 Hydraulic Motor — fits Triumph 2500 Hydro- MO11886 1886
Clipper Moore
Triumph #1886
(Mounting bolt not included)
Delivery Time Frame 1 WEEK 45 DAYS

A total of 20 vendors (2 of which were MBE/WBE/DBE vendors) were sent notification of the online posting of this RFB opportunity. Zero
MBE/WBE/DBE responded.




