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Contract Award - Award of this bid is made on a “REGION by REGION” basis using the “lowest and best” principle of award.  A2Z GLOBAL STAFFING, INC. is low 

bidder in all (4) four REGIONS (Nine Counties).  All costs associated with providing the required services are included in the price per hour stated below. 
 

BUYER:  Judy M. Franke, CPPB, Senior Procurement Agent 
 

 
Line 

Item 

Description 
(Estimated driver rate should be the minimum necessary to recruit personnel for MoDOT direct pay) 

A2Z Global 
Staffing, Inc. 

Centerline Drivers, 

dba TrueBlue, Inc. 

TransForce, 

Inc. 

REGION 
ONE 

001 
CONTRACTOR’S FEE for furnished drivers for direct hire with a current Commercial Driver’s 

License “A” or “B” on an as needed, if needed basis for: 

$5.63 

per hour 

$7.20 

per hour 

$4.21 

per hour 

002 
Contractor’s DRIVER COST, PER HOUR, for furnished drivers for direct hire with a current 

Commercial Driver’s License “A” or “B” on an as needed, if needed basis for: 

$13.82 

per hour 

$23.40 

per hour 

$27.96 

per hour 

PLATTE, CLAY & RAY COUNTIES TOTAL COST: 
$19.45 

per hour 

$30.60 

per hour 

$32.17 

per hour 

 

REGION 
TWO 

003 
CONTRACTOR’S FEE for furnished drivers for direct hire with a current Commercial Driver’s 

License “A” or “B” on an as needed, if needed basis for: 

$5.63 

per hour 

$7.20 

per hour 

$4.21 

per hour 

004 
Contractor’s DRIVER COST, PER HOUR, for furnished drivers for direct hire with a current 

Commercial Driver’s License “A” or “B” on an as needed, if needed basis for: 

$13.82 

per hour 

$23.40 

per hour 

$27.96 

per hour 

JACKSON COUNTY TOTAL COST: 
$19.45 

per hour 
$30.60 

per hour 

$32.17 

per hour 

 

REGION 
THREE 

005 
CONTRACTOR’S FEE for furnished drivers for direct hire with a current Commercial Driver’s 

License “A” or “B” on an as needed, if needed basis for: 

$5.63 

per hour 

$7.20 

per hour 
NO BID 

006 
Contractor’s DRIVER COST, PER HOUR, for furnished drivers for direct hire with a current 

Commercial Driver’s License “A” or “B” on an as needed, if needed basis for: 

$13.82 

per hour 

$23.40 

per hour 
NO BID 

CASS & JOHNSON COUNTIES TOTAL COST: 
$19.45 

per hour 

$30.60 

per hour 
NO BID 

 

REGION 
FOUR 

007 
CONTRACTOR’S FEE for furnished drivers for direct hire with a current Commercial Driver’s 

License “A” or “B” on an as needed, if needed basis for: 

$5.63 

per hour 

$7.20 

per hour 
NO BID 

008 
Contractor’s DRIVER COST, PER HOUR, for furnished drivers for direct hire with a current 

Commercial Driver’s License “A” or “B” on an as needed, if needed basis for: 

$13.82 

per hour 

$23.40 

per hour 
NO BID 

LAFAYETTE, SALINE & PETTIS COUNTIES TOTAL COST: 
$19.45 

per hour 

$30.60 

per hour 
NO BID 

Permanent Hiring Fee: 

For any hours < 525, Contractor will not be compensated for loss of recruitment services. 

For hours between 525 - 1040, Contractor will be compensated in the amount equal to $2,000.00, per driver, for loss of recruitment services. 

For any hours > 1040, Contractor will not be compensated for loss of recruitment services. 

 


