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Thank you for your response to Request # NE16-16B-R2.  For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses received.  This 

solicitation is a Multiple Award (refer to the highlighted vendor indicated for each section below).  If you have any questions, please contact me.  

Buyer:  William D. “Bill” Noyes, CPPO, CPPB, Senior Procurement Agent                                 Date/Time of posting:  November 18, 2015/ 9:30 AM 

 
GROUP # 1 GALAXY TIRES 

Qty 
TIRES (tires only – no mounting) 

Unit Costs Listed Are “Each” (price per tire) 
Brand Brahlers 

Cross-

Midwest 

Froesel 

Tire 
Jireh 

McKnight 

Tire 

Miller 

Tire 

8 20.5 x 25 Loader Tires E-3/L-3 24-Ply – Rock Lug Galaxy EXR300 965.00 970.00 1045.00 No Bid 1029.61 1120.00 

GROUP #1 – TOTAL ORDER EXTENSION: $7,720.00 $7,760.00 $8,360.00 No Bid $8,236.88 $8,960.00 

Delivery Time (A.R.O. = After Receipt of Order): 2 weeks 10 days 7-10 days No Bid 2-3 weeks 2-3 weeks 

  
GROUP # 2 BRIDGESTONE TIRES 

Qty 
TIRES (tires only – no mounting) 

Unit Costs Listed Are “Each” (price per tire) 
Brand Brahlers 

Cross-

Midwest 

Froesel 

Tire 
Jireh 

McKnight 

Tire 

Miller 

Tire 

16 14.00R-24 Radial Grader Tire (1 Star VUT) Bridgestone 1065.15 995.15 920.00 No Bid 890.00 963.00 

GROUP #2 – TOTAL ORDER EXTENSION: $17,042.40 $15,922.40 $14,720.00 No Bid $14,240.00 $15,408.00 

Delivery Time (A.R.O. = After Receipt of Order): 2 weeks 10 days 10-14 days No Bid 2-3 weeks 2-3 weeks 

 
GROUP # 3 FIRESTONE TIRES 

Qty 
TIRES (tires only – no mounting) 

Unit Costs Listed Are “Each” (price per tire) 
Brand Brahlers 

Cross-

Midwest 

Froesel 

Tire 
Jireh 

McKnight 

Tire 
Miller 

Tire 

18 10.00-16 Bias 8-Ply 3-Rib Tractor Tire Firestone 189.92 236.99 154.90 No Bid 175.06 159.00 

2 12.4 x 24 Bias Ply Long Bar Tractor Tire Firestone 296.04 488.39 308.91 No Bid 254.88 229.00 

8 12.5/80-18 Bias Backhoe Tire (12-Ply R-4 Tread) Firestone 261.95 261.95 269.50 No Bid 261.95 260.00 

2 13.6 x 24 Bias 8-Ply Long Bar Tractor Tire Firestone 290.15 708.09 523.50 No Bid 284.04 250.00 

1 13.6 x 28 Radial Long Bar Tractor Tire Firestone 352.12 941.90 696.17 No Bid 590.54 530.00 

16 14.00-24 Bias Grader Tire (12-Ply Super Ground Grip) Firestone 514.15 514.15 498.55 No Bid 514.15 505.00 

2 14.9 x 28 Bias Ply Long Bar Tractor Tire Firestone 368.82 540.84 399.50 No Bid 372.60 330.00 

8 18.4 x 34 Bias Ply Long Bar Tractor Tire Firestone 551.31 793.63 586.66 No Bid 576.72 502.00 

CONTINUED ON PAGE TWO 



CONTINUED FROM PAGE ONE 

 
GROUP # 3 FIRESTONE TIRES (continued) 

Qty 
TIRES (tires only – no mounting) 

Unit Costs Listed Are “Each” (price per tire) 
Brand Brahlers 

Cross-

Midwest 

Froesel 

Tire 
Jireh 

McKnight 

Tire 
Miller 

Tire 

3 18.4 x 34 Radial Long Bar Tractor Tire Firestone 960.05 1286.50 950.50 No Bid 914.23 895.00 

4 18.4 x 38 Radial Long Bar Tractor Tire Firestone 920.05 1287.86 951.70 No Bid 968.97 877.00 

2 21L/24 Bias Backhoe Tire (12-Ply R-4 Tread) Firestone 779.35 779.35 687.43 No Bid 779.35 775.00 

2 235/70R-16 H/T Tire Firestone 103.34 103.34 101.50 No Bid 103.34 92.00 

2 340/85R-28 Radial Long Bar Tractor Tire Firestone 576.08 941.90 696.17 No Bid 590.54 530.00 

3 380/85R-24 Radial Long Bar Tractor Tire  Firestone 690.21 1144.30 845.66 No Bid 717.46 639.00 

10 380/85R-28 Radial Long Bar Tractor Tire Firestone 907.17 1120.08 827.78 No Bid 702.27 630.00 

2 7.50-16 Bias 8-Ply 3-Rib Tractor Tire Firestone 140.38 169.87 110.11 No Bid 128.52 111.00 

GROUP #3 – TOTAL ORDER EXTENSION: $41,315.96 $52,986.96 $41,437.77 No Bid $39,497.57 $36,612.00 

Delivery Time (A.R.O. = After Receipt of Order): 2 weeks 10 days 2 weeks No Bid 2-3 weeks 2-3 weeks 

 
GROUP # 4 HANKOOK TIRES 

Qty 
TIRES (tires only – no mounting) 

Unit Costs Listed Are “Each” (price per tire) 
Brand Brahlers 

Cross-

Midwest 

Froesel 

Tire 
Jireh 

McKnight 

Tire 

Miller 

Tire 

8 10.00-20 DM04 Tire Hankook No Bid No Bid No Bid 317.63 318.55 No Bid 
6 1100R-22.5 AH12 Tire Hankook No Bid No Bid No Bid 278.40 289.36 No Bid 

97 1100R-22.5 Z35A Tire Hankook No Bid No Bid No Bid 296.00 303.92 No Bid 
16 225/70R-19.5 AH11 Tire Hankook No Bid No Bid No Bid 200.58 211.06 No Bid 
30 225/70R-19.5 DH01 Tire Hankook No Bid No Bid No Bid 211.24 219.43 No Bid 
39 315/80R-22.5  AM06 Tire Hankook No Bid No Bid No Bid 359.69 377.35 No Bid 
2 425/65R-22.5 AM15 Lug Radial Steer Tire Hankook No Bid No Bid No Bid 534.34 574.52 No Bid 
4 LT245/70R-17 Dynapro ATM Tire Hankook No Bid No Bid No Bid 136.79 146.70 No Bid 
2 LT245/75R-16 Dynapro ATM Tire Hankook No Bid No Bid No Bid 119.45 129.00 No Bid 
2 LT245/75R-17 Dynapro HT Tire Hankook No Bid No Bid No Bid 132.00 142.40 No Bid 
4 LT265/70R-17 Dynapro ATM Tire Hankook No Bid No Bid No Bid 144.00 154.36 No Bid 
2 LT265/70R-17 Dynapro HT Tire Hankook No Bid No Bid No Bid 130.66 140.25 No Bid 
2 LT265/70R-17 Dynapro MT Mud Tire Hankook No Bid No Bid No Bid 168.80 179.04 No Bid 

GROUP #4 – TOTAL ORDER EXTENSION: No Bid No Bid No Bid $59.791.49 $61,975.97 No Bid 

Delivery Time (A.R.O. = After Receipt of Order): No Bid No Bid No Bid 1 week 2-3 weeks No Bid 

 

Notification of the online posting of this solicitation was also sent to CFI Tire Service and MFR Tire, but no responses were received from these 

vendors.  Notification was also sent to the State of Missouri Office of Administration’s Office of Equal Opportunity (OA OEO). 
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