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Thank you for your response to our Request # NE15-21B-R2.  For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses which were received.  This was 

to be a multiple award solicitation, but was NOT AWARDED – Due To Budget Constraints.  If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone 

number shown above.         Buyer: William D. “Bill” Noyes, CPPO, CPPB, Senior Procurement Agent          Date/Time of posting: December 17, 2014 / 10:30 AM 

 

Quantity U/M Description 

 

Bobby 

Hoelscher 

Leo 

O’Laughlin 

LWK 

Trucking 

Mid-Missouri 

Limestone 

Mutter 

Farms 

Skyline 

Materials 

500 Ton 
Spec. 3 Modified 

Delivered to:  Kirkville 

15.00 

7500.00 

12.69 

6345.00 

14.20 

7100.00 
No Bid 

20.60 

10300.00 

14.99 

7495.00 

400 Ton 
Spec. 3 Modified 

Delivered to:  Macon 

18.75 

7500.00 

16.45 

6580.00 

16.35 

6540.00 

18.00 

7200.00 

15.20 

6080.00 
No Bid 

1000 Ton 
Spec. 3 Modified 

Delivered to:  Moberly 

15.15 

15150.00 

12.39 

12390.00 

13.35 

13350.00 

14.00 

14000.00 

11.74 

11740.00 

13.99 

13990.00 

500 Ton 
Spec. 3 Modified 

Delivered to:  New Cambria 

20.55 

10275.00 

17.24 

8620.00 

19.35 

9675.00 
No Bid 

15.40 

7700.00 

17.99 

8995.00 

1000 Ton 
Spec. 8 

Delivered to:  Kirksville  

14.50 

14500.00 

12.39 

12390.00 

13.90 

13900.00 
No Bid 

16.55 

16550.00 

14.999 

14999.00 

700 Ton 
Spec. 8 

Delivered to:  Macon 

18.25 

12775.00 

14.50 

10150.00 

12.65 

8855.00 

14.50 

10150.00 

11.40 

7980.00 
No Bid 

1000 Ton 
Spec. 8 

Delivered to:  Moberly 

14.65 

14650.00 

11.85 

11850.00 

13.10 

13100.00 

11.25 

11250.00 

11.80 

11800.00 

13.999 

13999.00 

250 Ton 
Spec. RR2 

Delivered to:  Kirksville 

22.45 

5612.50 

14.99 

3747.50 

17.65 

4412.50 
No Bid No Bid 

20.00 

5000.00 

300 Ton 
Spec. RR2 

Delivered to:  New Cambria 

28.95 

8685.00 

18.25 

5475.00 

21.20 

6360.00 
No Bid 

18.90 

5670.00 

38.50 

11550.00 

250 Ton 
Spec. BR2 

Delivered to:  Kirksville 

23.45 

5862.50 

18.70 

4675.00 

18.40 

4600.00 
No Bid No Bid 

30.00 

7500.00 

300 Ton 
Spec. BR2 

Delivered to:  New Cambria 

29.95 

8985.00 

19.50 

5850.00 

25.50 

7650.00 
No Bid No Bid 

44.45 

13335.00 
 

APAC-Missouri, Capital Quarries, and Magruder Limestone each submitted a “No Bid” response.  Notification of the online posting of this solicitation was also 

sent to Boone Construction (MBE), Central Stone, Con Agg of MO, George C. Potterfield Trucking, Joerling Bros. Trucking,  Knox County Stone,  L&W 

Quarries, Lomax Trucking, M&M Trucking, Norris Quarries, Ren Potterfield Trucking, Shinn Construction, Stockman Quarry, Wilkerson Brothers Quarry, but no 

responses were received from these vendors.  Notification also sent to the State of Missouri Office of Administration’s Office of Equal Opportunity (OA OEO). 


