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Thank you for your response to our Request # NE15-50B-R2.  For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses which were 

received.  This solicitation was awarded to: Graybar Electric.  If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown 

above.               Buyer: William D. “Bill” Noyes, CPPO, CPPB, Senior Procurement Agent               Date/Time of posting:  May 28, 2015 / 2:00 PM 

 

Qty U/M Description  

 
Graybar 

Electric 

Cape 

Electrical 

Butler  

Supply 

Kriz-Davis 

Co. 

Voss 

Lighting * 

88 EA LED Dusk To Dawn Lights 

CRTK-A-A08-E-120-5-SR-A 
108.88 each 

9581.44 

106.20 each 

9345.60 

108.15 each 

9517.20 

97.00 each 

8536.00 
No Bid 

45 EA LED Flood Lights - CPL Lumark NFFLD-A25- 

LED 85W - 4000K 9400 Lumens Flood w/ trunnion 
322.41 each 

14508.45 

314.40 each 

14148.00 

320.25 each 

14411.25 

312.75 each 

14073.75 
No Bid 

3 EA LED Wall Pack Lights - Atlas WLK64LED 

64 Watt LED Wall Pack 
317.07 each 

951.21 

314.40 each 

943.20 

349.95 each 

1049.85 

341.75 each 

1025.25 
No Bid 

2 EA LED Canopy Lights 

Atlas VN1256LED 
317.07 each 

634.14 

309.25 each 

618.50 

349.95 each 

699.90 

341.75 each 

683.50 
No Bid 

328 EA T-5 Fixtures w/ 5’ Grip Cables – Daybrite FBD454 

HO-UNV-1/4-ED-2LS w/ FBF/FBD Grip 5’ Cable 
89.85 each 

29470.80 

87.60 each 

28732.80 

89.25 each 

29274.00 

104.25 each 

34194.00 

105.30 each 

34538.40 

1312 EA T-5 Light Bulbs 

F54T/835HO 
2.42 each 

3175.04 

3.85 each 

5051.20 

3.15 each 

4132.80 

2.25 each 

2952.00 

4.05 each 

5313.60 

 

TOTAL ORDER EXTENSION: 
 

$58,321.08 

 

$58,839.30 

 

$59,085.00 

 

$61,464.50 

Not 

Considered * 

 

* Voss Lighting did not submit bids on all items. Since this RFB was stated to be awarded “All Or Nothing” this response could not be considered. 

 

Minnick Supply Company submitted a “No Bid” response. 

 

Notification of this solicitation opportunity was also sent to Archway Lighting Supply, Domingo Gonzalez Associates (MBE vendor), Frost Electric 

Supply Co., Globe Electric Co. (WBE/DBE vendor), Maintenance Engineering, Springfield Electric, and Wesco Distribution, but no responses were 

received from these vendors.  Notification was also sent to the State of Missouri Office of Administration’s Office of Equal Opportunity (OA OEO). 

 


