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HAYDITE VS. TRAP ROCK: Thank you for your response to our Request for Bid # NE14-52B-R2. For your information, the following is a tabulation
of all responses which were received. This bid was awarded to: Central Stone Company (Items 1 & 2 — Trap Rock Option). If you have any questions,
me. Buyer: William D. “Bill” Noyes, CPPO, CPPB, Senior Procurement Agent

please contact

ITEM1-FORDELIVERY TO: MACON

Date/Time of posting: May 23, 2014 / 6:00 AM

. Bobby .
Qty | um Product Central Bee!m_an Mutter Capital Buildex Hoelscher Joerling _Bros. LWI_(
Stone Co. Logistics Farms Sand Co. . Trucking Trucking
Trucking
875 | CUYD | Haydite No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 52.00 53.00 No Bid 54.00
$45,500.00 $46,375.00 $47,250.00
960 | TON | Trap Rock 40.20 43.50 44.30 45.00 No Bid 47.25 47.40 49.00
$38,592.00 $41,760.00 $42,528.00 $43,200.00 $45,360.00 $45,504.00 $47,040.00
ITEM 2 - FOR DELIVERY TO: TROY
. Bobby .
oty | UM Product Central Joerling _Bros. Buildex Hoelscher Mutter Bee!m_an LWI_( Capital
Stone Co. Trucking . Farms Logistics Trucking Sand Co.
Trucking
225 | CUYD | Haydite No Bid No Bid 55.50 64.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$12,487.50 $14,415.50
250 | TON | Trap Rock 25.40 25.55 No Bid 29.95 30.25 30.95 31.75 No Bid
$6,350.00 $6,387.50 $7,487.50 $7,562.50 $7,737.50 $7,937.50

Notification of the online posting of this solicitation was also sent to AJ’s Trucking (WBE vendor), APAC Missouri, Boone Construction Co (MBE
vendor), Cherokee Kid Hauling (MBE vendor), DLH Trucking (WBE vendor), George C. Potterfield Trucking, Hall Hauling, Hinton Hauling, Iron
Mountain Trap Rock Co, Leo O’Laughlin, Lomax Trucking Service, M&M Trucking, Rainbow Connection (MBE/WBE vendor), Ren Potterfield Trucking,
S-S-S Inc., Tri-County Trucking & Excavating, Wesco Hauling & Contracting (WBE vendor), and Westfall Hauling (MBE vendor), but no responses were
received from these vendors. Notification was also sent to the State of Missouri Office of Administration’s Office of Equal Opportunity (OA OEO).




