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Thank you for your response to our Request #NE13-38B-R2. For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses received. This
solicitation was awarded to: Tri-State Construction Equipment. If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown

above.

Buyer: William D. “Bill” Noyes, CPPO, CPPB, Senior Procurement Agent

Date/Time of posting: January 4, 2013/ 3:00 PM

2013 LEASES - STATIC ROLLERS
Delivered To:

Tri-State Construction Equipment Company

G.W. Van Keppel Company

4 MONTH LEASE:
May 1 — August 30
Troy Maintenance Building

$3,614.00 per month ($14,456.00 total lease)
Bomag BW11AS — Hours: 130/ Year: 2012 / HP: 78

$6,250.00 per month ($25,000.00 total lease)
Volvo DD90HF — Hours: 700 / Year: 2010 / HP: 130

4 MONTH LEASE:
May 1 — August 30
New Florence Maintenance Building

$3.729.00 per month ($14,916.00 total lease)
Bomag BW11AS — Hours: 186/ Year: 2010 / HP: 78

$6,250.00 per month ($25,000.00 total lease)
Bomag 161AD — Hours: 100/ Year: 2011 / HP: 101

4 MONTH LEASE:

$3,580.00 per month ($14,320.00 total lease)

parLofuus ding Hypac C350D — Hours: 410 / Year: 2010 / HP: 78 No Bid
ﬁﬂgﬂyolN_T:uZEQ ?(E) $3,614.00 per month ($14,456.00 total lease) No Bid
Memphis Maintenance Building Bomag BW11AS — Hours: 260/ Year: 2011 / HP: 78
ﬁAZAyOlN_T:uZEQ ?(E) $3,580.00 per month ($14,320.00 total lease) No Bid
Canton Maintenance Building Bomag BW11AS — Hours: 5/ Year: 2013/ HP: 78
ﬁA?y%N_TEUSEQ ig $3,580.00 per month ($14,320.00 total lease) No Bid
Palmyra Maintenance Building Bomag BW11AS — Hours: 5/ Year: 2013/ HP: 78
i/lg/lyolN—T:uléﬁft\ 25 $3,614.00 per month ($14,456.00 total lease) No Bid

Moberly Maintenance Building

Bomag BW11AS — Hours: 235/ Year: 2012 / HP: 78

Luby Equipment and Roland Machinery each submitted responses that were received after the bid response deadline had passed. These were returned unopened
and could not be considered. BerryTractor, Cumming McGowan & West, Erb Equipment, Heisel Equipment, Murphy Tractor, Pat Kelly Equipment, and Victor L.
Phillips Company each submitted “No Bid” responses. Notification of the online posting of this solicitation was also sent to Altorfer (Hannibal), Altorfer
(Moberly), Bobcat of St. Louis, Foley Equipment, Halco, Hertz Equipment, H.M. Dinzler, Rudd Construction Equipment, and United Rentals, but no responses
were received from these vendors. Notification was also sent to the State of Missouri Office of Administration’s Office of Equal Opportunity (OA OEO).




