

Missouri  
Department  
of Transportation



Paula Gough, P.E., District Engineer

Northeast District  
Macon Regional Office  
902 North Missouri St.  
Macon, MO 63552  
(660) 385-8245  
Fax (660) 385-1707  
Toll free 1-888 ASK MoDOT  
www.modot.mo.gov

TABULATION  
SHEET

General Services  
(Procurement) Division

Thank you for your response to our Request # **NE12-56B-R2**. For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses received. This solicitation was awarded to: **Multiple Vendors (refer to the bolded & shaded items below)**. If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown above.  
Buyer: William D. "Bill" Noyes, CPPO, CPPB, Senior Procurement Agent Date/Time of posting: March 30, 2012 / 8:45 AM

Qty	U/M	DIRTY CINDERS Delivered To:	G&D Engemann	Hall Hauling	Leo O'Laughlin	Lloyd A. Lynn	Mutter Farms	Ren Potterfield Trucking
2225	Ton	Canton	No Bid	No Bid	28.45 per ton 63,301.25	No Bid	No Bid	<b>23.25 per ton</b> <b>51,731.25</b>
1450	Ton	Wayland	No Bid	No Bid	31.95 per ton 46,327.50	No Bid	No Bid	<b>27.75 per ton</b> <b>40,237.50</b>
2825	Ton	Edina	No Bid	No Bid	20.99 per ton 59,296.75	No Bid	<b>17.75 per ton</b> <b>50,143.75</b>	21.45 per ton 60,596.25
2650	Ton	Memphis	No Bid	No Bid	<b>25.95 per ton</b> <b>68,767.50</b>	No Bid	No Bid	26.00 per ton 68,900.00
2000	Ton	Lancaster	No Bid	No Bid	23.49 per ton 46,980.00	No Bid	<b>19.49 per ton</b> <b>38,980.00</b>	22.65 per ton 45,300.00
900	Ton	Palmyra	No Bid	No Bid	23.24 per ton 20,916.00	No Bid	21.75 per ton 19,575.00	<b>19.50 per ton</b> <b>17,550.00</b>
800	Ton	Bowling Green	<b>12.65 per ton</b> <b>10,120.00</b>	14.98 per ton 11,984.00	No Bid	17.15 per ton 13,720.00	19.49 per ton 15,592.00	21.90 per ton 17,520.00
1500	Ton	New Florence	<b>9.55 per ton</b> <b>14,325.00</b>	10.98 per ton 16,470.00	No Bid	14.10 per ton 21,150.00	No Bid	21.85 per ton 32,775.00
1500	Ton	Troy	<b>9.75 per ton</b> <b>14,625.00</b>	10.98 per ton 16,470.00	No Bid	14.10 per ton 21,150.00	No Bid	27.25 per ton 40,875.00
Cinder Source:			Labadie (Charah)	Labadie (Charah)	Thomas Hill (Reed Minerals)	Labadie (Charah)	Thomas Hill (Reed Minerals)	Thomas Hill (Reed Minerals)

LWK Trucking Co., Mertens Construction Co., Mid-Missouri Limestone, and Richard J. Mertens each submitted "No Bid" responses.

Notification of the online posting of this solicitation was also sent to Bobby Hoelscher Trucking, Boone Construction Co. (MBE vendor), George C. Potterfield Trucking, Hinton Hauling, Joerling Bros. Trucking, Lloyd Gittemeier, Lomax Trucking Service, M&M Trucking, and Mick Mehler & Sons, but no responses were received from these vendors. Notification was also sent to the State of Missouri Office of Administration's Office of Equal Opportunity (OA/OEO).