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Thank you for your response to our Request For Bid # NE12-52B-R2.  This RFB establishes a price agreement with multiple vendors for the supply and delivery 

of concrete (ready mix) to various locations in the MoDOT Northeast District on an “as needed/if needed” basis through calendar year 2012.  When materials are 

needed, MoDOT will use this price agreement to choose a vendor based on factors such as cost analysis of all applicable charges, availability, and the project 

proximity to the plant location.  All pricing is “per cubic yard” and firm for calendar year 2012.  For your information, the following is a tabulation of all 

responses received.  Buyer:  William D. “Bill” Noyes, CPPO, CPPB, Senior Procurement Agent                          Date/Time of posting: March 12, 2012 / 9:00 AM  
 

ADAIR COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Kirksville Ready Mix Leo O’Laughlin * 

Plant Location: Kirksville Shelbina 

Phone #: 660-665-5604 573-588-4151 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 7:30-5:00 / 7:30-6:00 7:30-3:30 

7 Bag Mix: $105.00 $105.50 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $111.00 $111.50 

1% Calcium Charge: $2.00 $2.75 

2% Calcim Charge $4.00 $5.50 

Fiber Charge: $5.00 $6.00 

Hot Water Charge: $5.00 $7.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): No Bid $75.00 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: $500 opening charge Plant $150 / Driver $38 per hour 

Other Notes/Charges: None * Route 6 & Route 63 South 
 

AUDRAIN COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Leo O’Laughlin * Warren County Concrete 

Plant Location: Shelbina Various 

Phone #: 573-588-4151 636-239-0061 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 7:30-3:30 7:00-3:00 / 6:00-4:00 

7 Bag Mix: $105.75 $112.00 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $112.75 $118.00 

1% Calcium Charge: $2.75 $1.75 

2% Calcim Charge $5.50 $3.50 

Fiber Charge: $6.00 $6.00 

Hot Water Charge: $6.00 $5.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): $75.00 $30.00 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: Plant $150 / Driver $38 per hour $500 per night 

Other Notes/Charges: * Route 15 & Route E North None 



 

 

 

CLARK COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Great River Ready Mix (W.L. Miller) Ideal Ready Mix M&O Concrete * 

Plant Location: Hamilton, IL Kahoka Memphis 

Phone #: 217-847-3515 660-727-3804 660-465-8620 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 7:30-4:30 Not Specified 8:00-4:00 / 6:30-4:30 

7 Bag Mix: $103.00 $99.75 $98.00 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $110.00 $108.25 $105.50 

1% Calcium Charge: $3.50 $2.00 $3.00 

2% Calcim Charge $7.00 $4.00 $6.00 

Fiber Charge: $9.70 $6.00 $6.80 

Hot Water Charge: $3.50 $4.50 $5.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): $30.00 $25.00 $75.00 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: $5.00 per cubic yard $3.00 per cubic yard None 

Other Notes/Charges: None None * Kahoka West to Scotland County Line 
 

KNOX COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Kirksville Ready Mix * Leo O’Laughlin M&O Concrete 

Plant Location: Kirksville Shelbina Memphis 

Phone #: 660-665-5604 573-588-4151 660-465-8620 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 7:30-5:00 / 7:30-6:00 7:30-3:30 8:00-4:00 / 6:30-4:30 

7 Bag Mix: $105.00 $109.25 $99.00 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $111.00 $116.25 $106.50 

1% Calcium Charge: $2.00 $2.75 $3.00 

2% Calcim Charge $4.00 $5.50 $6.00 

Fiber Charge: $5.00 $6.00 $6.80 

Hot Water Charge: $5.00 $6.00 $5.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): No Bid $75.00 $75.00 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: $500 opening charge Plant $150 / Driver $38 per hour None 

Other Notes/Charges: * West of Route 15 None None 
 

LEWIS COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Bleigh Ready Mix Ideal Ready Mix 

Plant Location: Hannibal, MO / Bowling Green, MO / Quincy, IL Canton 

Phone #: 573-221-1818 573-288-3040 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 7:30-3:00 / 7:00-3:30 Not Specified 

7 Bag Mix: $107.50 $95.75 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $115.75 $104.25 

1% Calcium Charge: $1.85 $2.00 

2% Calcim Charge $2.50 $4.00 

Fiber Charge: $3.50 $6.00 

Hot Water Charge: $5.00 $4.50 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): $25.00 $25.00 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: Plant $150 / Drivers $35 per hour $3.00 per cubic yard 

Other Notes/Charges: Night delivery 4 PM-7AM must be scheduled by 2:30 PM day prior None 



 

 

 

LINCOLN COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Mark Twain Redi-Mix Schreiter Ready Mix Troy Ready Mix & Material Warren County Concrete 

Plant Location: Moscow Mills O’Fallon / Troy / Wright City Troy Various 

Phone #: 636-356-9709 636-240-2600 636-528-5196 636-239-0061 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 7:00-4:30 (M-F) & 7:00-Noon (Sat) 6:00-3:30 7:30-1:00/7:00-3:00 (schedule anytime) 7:00-3:00 / 6:00-4:00 

7 Bag Mix: $86.00 $82.00 $81.00 $90.00 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $92.00 $89.00 $87.00 $96.00 

1% Calcium Charge: $1.50 $1.50 $3.00 $1.75 

2% Calcim Charge $3.00 $3.00 $6.00 $3.50 

Fiber Charge: $5.00 $5.00 $3.75 $6.00 

Hot Water Charge: $4.00 $4.50 $4.00 $5.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): $25.00 $50 4 yds / $75 3 yds / $100 2yds $40 4yds / $60 3 yds / $80 2 yds $30.00 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: Plant $150/Driver $35 hr (4 hr min) $1000 open plant time $6 yd after 3/Plant $200 hr after 5 $500 per night 

Other Notes/Charges: None None phone transfers to cellular after hrs None 
 

MACON COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Leo O’Laughlin Moberly Ready Mix * 

Plant Location: Shelbina Moberly 

Phone #: 573-588-4151 660-263-3997 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 7:30-3:30 Not specified 

7 Bag Mix: $101.50 $101.00 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $107.50 $107.00 

1% Calcium Charge: $2.75 $2.00 

2% Calcim Charge $5.50 $4.00 

Fiber Charge: $6.00 $5.00 

Hot Water Charge: $7.00 $5.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): $75.00 No Bid 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: Plant $150 / Driver $38 per hour $500 opening charge 

Other Notes/Charges: None * South of Route PP 
 

MARION COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Bleigh Ready Mix Leo O’Laughlin * Mark Twain Redi-Mix 

Plant Location: Hannibal, MO / Bowling Green, MO / Quincy, IL Shelbina Hannibal 

Phone #: 573-221-1818 573-588-4151 573-221-0094 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 7:30-3:00 / 7:00-3:30 7:30-3:30 7:00-4:30 (M-F) & 7:00-Noon (Sat) 

7 Bag Mix: $100.50 $102.25 $103.50 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $108.75 $109.25 $108.00 

1% Calcium Charge: $1.85 $2.75 $1.50 

2% Calcim Charge $2.50 $5.50 $3.00 

Fiber Charge: $3.50 $6.00 $5.00 

Hot Water Charge: $5.00 $6.00 $4.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): $25.00 $75.00 $25.00 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: Plant $150 / Drivers $35 per hour Plant $150 / Driver $38 per hour Plant $150 / Driver $35 per hour (4 hr min.) 

Other Notes/Charges: Night 4 PM-7AM schedule by 2:30 PM day prior * Route 36 & Route J West None 



 

 

 

MONROE COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Kirksville Ready Mix * Leo O’Laughlin 

Plant Location: Kirksville Shelbina 

Phone #: 660-665-5604 573-588-4151 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 7:30-5:00 / 7:30-6:00 7:30-3:30 

7 Bag Mix: $105.00 $102.25 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $111.00 $109.25 

1% Calcium Charge: $2.00 $2.75 

2% Calcim Charge $4.00 $5.50 

Fiber Charge: $5.00 $6.00 

Hot Water Charge: $5.00 $6.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): No Bid $75.00 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: $500 opening charge Plant $150 / Driver $38 per hour 

Other Notes/Charges: * North of Route M None 
 

MONTGOMERY COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Mid-Missouri Concrete Warren County Concrete 

Plant Location: Montgomery City Various 

Phone #: 573-564-3899 636-239-0061 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 7:00-4:30 7:00-3:00 / 6:00-4:00 

7 Bag Mix: $89.50 $83.00 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $94.00 $89.00 

1% Calcium Charge: $1.75 $1.75 

2% Calcim Charge $3.25 $3.50 

Fiber Charge: $4.00 $6.00 

Hot Water Charge: $4.00 $5.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): $30.00 $30.00 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: Additional $55 per yard $500 per night 

Other Notes/Charges: None None 
 

PIKE COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Bleigh Ready Mix Mark Twain Redi-Mix Troy Ready Mix & Material Warren County Concrete 

Plant Location: Hannibal/Bowling Green/Quincy, IL Bowling Green Troy Various 

Phone #: 573-221-1818 573-324-0123 636-528-5196 636-239-0061 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 7:30-3:00 / 7:00-3:30 7:00-4:30 (M-F) & 7:00-Noon (Sat) 7:30-1:00/7:00-3:00 (schedule anytime) 7:00-3:00 / 6:00-4:00 

7 Bag Mix: $100.50 $88.00 $90.00 $90.00 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $108.75 $94.00 $96.00 $96.00 

1% Calcium Charge: $1.85 $1.50 $3.00 $1.75 

2% Calcim Charge $2.50 $3.00 $6.00 $3.50 

Fiber Charge: $3.50 $5.00 $3.75 $6.00 

Hot Water Charge: $5.00 $4.00 $4.00 $5.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): $25.00 $25.00 $40 4yds / $60 3 yds / $80 2 yds $30.00 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: Plant $150 / Drivers $35 per hour Plant $150 / Driver $35 hr (4 hr min) $6 yd after 3/Plant $200 hr after 5 $500 per night 

Other Notes/Charges: 4 PM-7AM schedule 2:30 PM day prior None phone transfers to cellular after hrs None 



 

 

 

RALLS COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Bleigh Ready Mix Leo O’Laughlin * Mark Twain Redi-Mix 

Plant Location: Hannibal, MO / Bowling Green, MO / Quincy, IL Shelbina Hannibal 

Phone #: 573-221-1818 573-588-4151 573-221-0094 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 7:30-3:00 / 7:00-3:30 7:30-3:30 7:00-4:30 (M-F) & 7:00-Noon (Sat) 

7 Bag Mix: $100.50 $103.50 $100.50 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $108.75 $110.50 $108.00 

1% Calcium Charge: $1.85 $2.75 $1.50 

2% Calcim Charge $2.50 $5.50 $3.00 

Fiber Charge: $3.50 $6.00 $5.00 

Hot Water Charge: $5.00 $6.00 $4.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): $25.00 $75.00 $25.00 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: Plant $150 / Drivers $35 per hour Plant $150 / Driver $38 per hour Plant $150 / Driver $35 per hour (4 hr min.) 

Other Notes/Charges: Night 4 PM-7AM schedule by 2:30 PM day prior * Route 36 & Route DD West None 
 

RANDOLPH COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Con Agg of MO (Land/Chariton County Concrete) Leo O’Laughlin * Moberly Ready Mix 

Plant Location: Moberly Shelbina Moberly 

Phone #: 660-263-6386 573-588-4151 660-263-3997 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 7:00-5:00 (M-F) & 7:00-Noon (Sat) 7:30-3:30 Not specified 

7 Bag Mix: $128.00 $103.50 $101.00 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $131.00 $109.50 $107.00 

1% Calcium Charge: $2.50 $2.75 $2.00 

2% Calcim Charge $5.00 $5.50 $4.00 

Fiber Charge: $5.00 $6.00 $5.00 

Hot Water Charge: $6.00 $7.00 $5.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): $60.00 $75.00 No Bid 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: Plant $150 per hour Plant $150 / Driver $38 per hour $500 opening charge 

Other Notes/Charges: Holding Time/Overtime $50 per hr (after 1st hr) * Route 63 & Business 63 North None 
 

SCHUYLER COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Kirksville Ready Mix * M&O Concrete * 

Plant Location: Kirksville Memphis 

Phone #: 660-665-5604 660-465-8620 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 7:30-5:00 / 7:30-6:00 8:00-4:00 / 6:30-4:30 

7 Bag Mix: $105.00 $98.00 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $111.00 $105.50 

1% Calcium Charge: $2.00 $3.00 

2% Calcim Charge $4.00 $6.00 

Fiber Charge: $5.00 $6.80 

Hot Water Charge: $5.00 $5.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): No Bid $75.00 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: $500 opening charge None 

Other Notes/Charges: * South of Route 136 * Queen City North to State Line 
 



SCOTLAND COUNTY 
Vendor Name: M&O Concrete 

Plant Location: Memphis 

Phone #: 660-465-8620 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 8:00-4:00 / 6:30-4:30 

7 Bag Mix: $92.00 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $99.50 

1% Calcium Charge: $3.00 

2% Calcim Charge $6.00 

Fiber Charge: $6.80 

Hot Water Charge: $5.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): $75.00 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: None 

Other Notes/Charges: None 
 

SHELBY COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Leo O’Laughlin 

Plant Location: Shelbina 

Phone #: 573-588-4151 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 7:30-3:30 

7 Bag Mix: $101.50 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $106.75 

1% Calcium Charge: $2.75 

2% Calcim Charge $5.50 

Fiber Charge: $6.00 

Hot Water Charge: $6.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): $75.00 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: Plant $150 / Driver $38 per hour 

Other Notes/Charges: None 
 

WARREN COUNTY 
Vendor Name: Schreiter Ready Mix Troy Ready Mix & Material Warren County Concrete 

Plant Location: O’Fallon / Troy / Wright City Troy Various 

Phone #: 636-240-2600 636-528-5196 636-239-0061 

Hours of Operation(winter/summer): 6:00-3:30 7:30-1:00 / 7:00-3:00 (schedule anytime) 7:00-3:00 / 6:00-4:00 

7 Bag Mix: $86.00 $90.00 $87.00 

8 ½ Bag Mix: $93.00 $96.00 $93.00 

1% Calcium Charge: $1.50 $3.00 $1.75 

2% Calcim Charge $3.00 $6.00 $3.50 

Fiber Charge: $5.00 $3.75 $6.00 

Hot Water Charge: $4.50 $4.00 $5.00 

Short Load Charge (4 yds or less): $50 4 yds / $75 3 yds / $100 2yds $40 4yds / $60 3 yds / $80 2 yds $30.00 

After Hours/Night Delivery Charges: $1000 open plant time $6 yd after 3/Plant $200 hr after 5 $500 per night 

Other Notes/Charges: None Plant phone transfers to cellular after hours None 
 

Davis Ready Mix – Elsberry, MO submitted a “No Bid” response.  Notification of posting was sent to Missouri Office of Administration - Office of Equal Opportunity (OA OEO). 


