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Thank you for your response to our Request # NE13-35B-R2.  For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses received.  This solicitation was awarded to: 

Multiple Vendors (refer to the highlighted and bolded items below).  If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown above.     

Buyer:  William D. “Bill” Noyes, CPPO, CPPB, Senior Procurement Agent                                                                          Date/Time of posting:  February 1, 2013 / 1:15 PM  

Qty U/M Clean Cinders - Delivered To: Charah, Inc. 
George C. 

Potterfield Trucking 

Joerling Bros. 

Trucking 

Leo 

O’Laughlin 

Mutter 

Farms 

725 Tons Lancaster Maintenance Bldg. 
33.50 

24827.50 

33.56 

24331.00 

37.50 

27187.50 

24.15 

17508.75 
23.40 

16965.00 

775 Tons Memphis Maintenance Bldg. 
31.98 

24784.50 

32.59 

25257.25 

34.25 

26543.75 
26.25 

20343.75 
No Bid 

1200 Tons Wayland Maintenance Bldg. 
27.00 

32400.00 

27.97 

33564.00 

28.40 

34080.00 
No Bid No Bid 

650 Tons Edina Maintenance Bldg. 
28.50 

18525.00 

28.75 

18687.50 

29.45 

19142.50 

21.15 

13747.50 
20.25 

13162.50 

2375 Tons Canton Maintenance Bldg. 
24.00 

57000.00 

25.72 

61085.00 
23.20 

55100.00 

29.00 

68875.00 
No Bid 

3225 Tons Kirksville Maintenance Bldg. 
31.25 

100781.25 

30.21 

97427.25 

35.00 

112875.00 
20.20 

65145.00 

22.50 

72562.50 

1850 Tons Moberly Maintenance Bldg. 
23.75 

43937.50 

22.28 

41218.00 

27.50 

50875.00 

14.05 

25992.50 
13.85 

25622.50 

2225 Tons Shelbina Maintenance Bldg. 
23.75 

52843.75 

22.85 

50841.25 

25.85 

57516.25 
17.95 

39938.75 
No Bid 

2350 Tons Paris Maintenance Bldg. 
21.80 

51230.00 

20.96 

49256.00 

26.00 

61100.00 
17.45 

41007.50 

17.75 

41712.50 

1475 Tons Mexico Maintenance Bldg. 
16.75 

24706.25 

17.42 

25694.50 

16.90 

24927.50 

21.25 

31343.75 
No Bid 

3025 Tons Palmyra Maintenance Bldg. 
19.70 

59592.50 

21.11 

63857.75 

21.70 

65642.50 

24.50 

74112.50 
No Bid 

2225 Tons Center Maintenance Bldg. 
18.00 

40050.00 

19.02 

42319.50 

19.25 

42831.25 
No Bid No Bid 

2650 Tons Bowling Green Maintenance Bldg. 
18.00 

47700.00 
15.39 

40783.50 

16.25 

43062.50 
No Bid No Bid 

3300 Tons New Florence Maintenance Bldg. 
18.50 

61050.00 

11.85 

39105.00 
11.20 

36960.00 
No Bid No Bid 

750 Tons Troy Maintenance Bldg. 
14.50 

10875.00 

12.12 

9090.00 
11.00 

8250.00 
No Bid No Bid 

Material Source of Supply: Labadie Labadie Labadie Thomas Hill & Labadie Thomas Hill 
 

Bobby Hoelscher Trucking, Boone Construction (MBE vendor), Mertens Construction, & Mid-Missouri Limestone submitted “No Bid” responses.  Notification of this solicitation was also sent to  

16 other vendors (including 5 MBE/WBE vendors), but no responses were received from those vendors.  Notification was also sent to the State of Missouri Office of Equal Opportunity (OA OEO). 


