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Thank you for your response to our Request # NE12-29B-R2. For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses which were
received. This solicitation was awarded to: Multiple Award (refer to bolded & highlighted items below). If you have any questions, please

contact me. Buyer: William D. “Bill” Noyes, CPPO, CPPB, Senior Procurement Agent Date/Time of posting: November 10, 2011/ 9:30 AM
Qty | U/ Cinders Bobby Hoelscher Hall Hinnen Hauling Joerling Bros. Leo LWK Mutter

M Hauled to: Trucking Hauling and Construction Trucking O’Laughlin Trucking Farms
700 | Ton | Bowling Green | 14.05=9835.00 | 11.89 = 8323.00 No Bid 15.95=11165.00 | 14.49 =10143.00 | 19.60 = 13720.00 No Bid
200 | Ton | Brookfield 8.00 =1600.00 | 7.75=1550.00 | 8.00=1600.00 | 7.95=1590.00 | 6.99=1398.00 | 10.80 =2160.00 | 7.00 = 1400.00
700 | Ton | center 11.15=7805.00 | 9.00 =6300.00 No Bid 13.55=9485.00 | 10.59 = 7413.00 | 16.20 = 11340.00 | 10.50 = 7350.00
500 | Ton | chillicothe 10.40 = 5200.00 | 11.63 =5815.00 | 12.25=6125.00 | 10.85 =5425.00 | 10.74 =5370.00 | 16.20 = 8100.00 | 10.10 = 5050.00
700 | Ton | Edina 9.75=6825.00 | 9.24 =6468.00 No Bid 12.25=8575.00 | 10.00 = 7000.00 | 17.40 =12180.00 | 12.50 = 8750.00
300 | Ton | Keytesville 4.95=1485.00 | 3.75=1125.00 No Bid 4.90=1470.00 | 4.49=1347.00 | 6.55=1965.00 | 4.95=1485.00
800 | Ton | Kirksville 8.55=6840.00 | 9.84=7872.00 No Bid 10.75=8600.00 | 8.99 =7192.00 | 16.00=12800.00 | 9.00 = 7200.00
700 | Ton | Lancaster 11.70 = 8190.00 | 12.79 = 8953.00 No Bid 12.95=9065.00 | 12.49 = 8743.00 | 17.40 =12180.00 | 12.50 = 8750.00
700 | Ton | Macon 5.10 =3570.00 | 5.98 =4186.00 No Bid 5.65=13955.00 | 4.49=3143.00 | 6.55=4585.00 | 4.35=3045.00
600 | Ton | pMemphis 13.25 =7950.00 | 14.95 = 8970.00 No Bid 17.25=10350.00 | 14.85 =8910.00 | 19.60 = 11760.00 No Bid
500 | Ton | Milan 12.10 = 6050.00 | 13.45=6725.00 No Bid 14.30 = 7150.00 | 12.49 = 6245.00 | 18.00 = 9000.00 | 10.50 = 5250.00
700 | Ton | wMoberly 4,95 =3465.00 | 3.85=2695.00 No Bid 4.90 =3430.00 | 4.49=3143.00 | 6.00=4200.00 | 3.50 =2450.00
700 | Ton | New Cambria 5.40=3780.00 | 5.00=23500.00 | 6.00=4200.00 | 6.50=4550.00 | 4.74=23318.00 | 6.80=4760.00 | 4.75=3325.00
700 | Ton | paimyra 12.75=8925.00 | 10.90 = 7630.00 No Bid 15.45 =10815.00 | 11.87 = 8309.00 | 18.20 = 12740.00 No Bid
500 | Ton | Trenton 14.30 = 7150.00 | 14.95 =7475.00 | 17.50 = 8750.00 | 16.00 = 8000.00 | 15.49 = 7745.00 | 19.60 = 9800.00 | 13.90 = 6950.00
Start Date Availability: November 14™ 1 week 24 hours 1-2 weeks 24 hours within 1 week | Immediately

Notification of the online posting of this solicitation was also sent to APAC-Missouri, Boone Construction Company (MBE Vendor), George C. Potterfield
Trucking, Lomax Trucking Service, M&M Trucking, Mid-Missouri Limestone, and Ren Potterfield Trucking, but no responses were received from these vendors.




