Description

Lubricating Oil, 15W-40

5W30 Motor Oil

Universal Hydraulic/

Transmission Qil

MP Gear Oil, 85/140

MP Gear Oil, 75W-90
100% Synthetic
HI-TAC Grease

Multi-Vehicle Synthetic
Blend Transmission Fluid

MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

WILLOW SPRINGS, MISSOURI

Tabulation of Bids Received September 20, 2011

Bid Number SEW12-0326-R9

Vendor
Universal Lubricants

Unit
Bulk/Gallon
2.5 Gallon
5-Quiart
Quart

5-Quart
Quart

Bulk/Gallon
55 Gal. Drum
5-Gallon

2.5 Gallon

5-Gallon
Quart
5-Gallon

Quart

Pound

Quart

Price

$7.45/Gal.
$8.90/Gal.

$7.72/Qt.
$2.20/Qt,

No Bid
$2.30/Qt.

$6.72/Gal.
$6.72/Gal.
$7.95/Gal.
$7.95/Gal.

$9.80/Gal.

No Bid

$24.50/Gal.
$7.02/Qt,

$1.80/Lb

$2.85/Qt.

Remarks
AWARD BID



Description
Lubricating Oil, 15W-40

5W30 Motor Oil

Universal Hydraulic/
Transmission Qil

MP Gear Oil, 85/140

MP Gear Oil, 75W-90
100% Synthetic
GC-L8 #2 Grease-Show Me

Multi-Vehicle Synthetic
Blend Transmission Fluid

MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

WILLOW SPRINGS, MISSOURI

Tabulation of Bids Received September 20, 2011

Bid Number SEW12-0326-R9

Vendor
Certified Laboratories

Unit
Bulk/Gallon
2.5 Gallon
5-Quart
Quart

5-Quart
Quart

Bulk/Gallon
55 Gal. Drum
5-Gallon

2.5 Gallon
5-Gallon
Quart
5-Gallon
Quart

Lb

Quart

Price

$18.90/Gal.
$23.59/Gal.

No Bid
No Bid

22.39/Gal.
No Bid

$17.04/Gal.
$18.54/Gal.
$22.17/Gal.
$24.09/Gal.

$6.06/Gal.
No Bid

$9.21/Gal.
No Bid
$4.84/Tube

No Bid

Remarks

330 Gallon Tote
1 Gallon Containers

1 Gallon Containers

330 Gallon Tote

48/14 Oz. tubes



MFA Qil

Heathwood Oil Company
Champion Brands

D. A. Lubricant Company
Jefferson City Oil

Hartog Oil Company

RS Used Oil Company
Oakland Lubrication Co., Inc.
MSC Industrial Supply

Al Scheppers Motor Co.
Wallis Lubricant, LLC
Heartland Fabrication
International Construction and Supply

Non-Responsive
Non-Responsive
Non-Responsive
Non-Responsive
Non-Responsive
Non-Responsive
Non-Responsive
Non-Responsive
Non-Responsive
Non-Responsive
Non-Responsive
Non-Responsive
Non-Responsive



