
Item # Description & C/S Comm. Code Est. Qty.

Total Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
District NW:

St. Joseph

27 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 8.209$       -$                   9.35$         -$                   No Bid No Bid
28 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 8.799$       -$                   8.87$         -$                   No Bid No Bid

Lathrop

29 White Water Borne - 6306686890 6,000 8.209$       49,254.00$        9.35$         56,100.00$        No Bid No Bid
30 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 6,000 8.799$       52,794.00$        8.87$         53,220.00$        No Bid No Bid

TOTAL 102,048.00$   109,320.00$   -$                

District NE:

Macon

31 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 8.132$       -$                   9.26$         -$                   No Bid No Bid
32 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 8.722$       -$                   8.78$         -$                   No Bid No Bid

Hannibal

33 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 7.251$       -$                   9.18$         -$                   No Bid No Bid
34 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 7.841$       -$                   8.70$         -$                   No Bid No Bid

TOTAL -$                -$                -$                

District KC:

Kansas City

35 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 8.197$       -$                   9.30$         -$                   No Bid No Bid
36 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 8.787$       -$                   8.82$         -$                   No Bid No Bid

Warrensburg

37 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 8.173$       -$                   9.30$         -$                   No Bid No Bid
38 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 8.763$       -$                   8.82$         -$                   No Bid No Bid

TOTAL -$                -$                -$                

District CD:

Jefferson City

39 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 8.132$       -$                   9.13$         -$                   No Bid No Bid
40 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 8.722$       -$                   8.65$         -$                   No Bid No Bid

Rolla

41 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 8.221$       -$                   9.13$         -$                   No Bid No Bid
42 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 8.811$       -$                   8.65$         -$                   No Bid No Bid

TOTAL -$                   -$                   -$                   
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District SL:

Ballwin

43 White Water Borne - 6306686890 9,000 8.113$       73,017.00$        9.08$         81,720.00$        No Bid No Bid
44 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 9,000 8.703$       78,327.00$        8.60$         77,400.00$        No Bid No Bid

TOTAL 151,344.00$   159,120.00$   -$                

District SW:

Joplin

45 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 8.293$       -$                   9.18$         -$                   No Bid No Bid
46 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 8.883$       -$                   8.70$         -$                   No Bid No Bid

Springfield

47 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 8.233$       -$                   9.09$         -$                   No Bid No Bid
48 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 8.823$       -$                   8.61$         -$                   No Bid No Bid

TOTAL -$                -$                -$                

District SE:

Willow Springs

49 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 8.245$       -$                   9.03$         -$                   No Bid No Bid
50 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 8.835$       -$                   8.55$         -$                   No Bid No Bid

Sikeston

51 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 8.269$       -$                   8.95$         -$                   No Bid No Bid
52 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 8.859$       -$                   8.47$         -$                   No Bid No Bid

Park Hills

53 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 8.197$       -$                   8.95$         -$                   No Bid No Bid
54 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 8.787$       -$                   8.47$         -$                   No Bid No Bid

TOTAL -$                -$                -$                

253,392.00$      268,440.00$      -$                   

1st Renewal Max.% Increase over Original Bid Price 30.00% 20.00% No Bid

1st Renewal Max.% Decrease over Original Bid Price 0.00% 0.00% No Bid

2nd Renewal Max.% Increase over Original Bid Price 75.00% 20.00% No Bid

2nd Renewal Max.% Decrease over Original Bid Price 0.00% 0.00% No Bid

GRAND TOTAL FOR ALL DISTRICTS


