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ltem # Description Est. Qty. Crop Production Services Helena Chemical Grass Pad
Total Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1 ESCORT XP 3,032 $ 7.03 $ 21,314.96 $ 520 $ 15,766.40 No Bid No Bid
8 or 16 ounce
1A METSULFURON-METHYL - 8 or 16 oz. 3,350 $ 362 $ 12,127.00 $ 329 $ 11,021.50 368 $ 12,328.00
Metcel VMF
2 PLATEAU 755 $ 128.60 $ 97,093.00 $ 138.00 $ 104,190.00 No Bid No Bid
1 gallon
3 PENDULUM AgquaCap 240 $ 4785 $ 11,484.00  $ 4989 $ 11,973.60 No Bid No Bid
2.5 gallon \ \
4 ROUNDUP PRO 200 $ 4565 $ 9,130.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2.5 gallon
4A|GLYPHOSATE WITH SURFACT. 580 $ 1180 $ 6,844.00 $ 1149 $ 6,664.20 1290 $ 7,482.00
Razor - 2.5 gallon
5 ROUNDUP PRO 90 $ 4505 $ 4,054.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 gallon
5A|GLYPHOSATE WITH SURFACT. 810 $ 11.78 $ 9,541.80 $ 1139 $ 9,225.90 1280 $ 10,368.00
Razor - 30 gallon
6 ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE 2,930 $ 1842 $ 53,970.60  $ 1848 $ 54,146.40 2390 $ 70,027.00
2.5 gallon
7 OUST EXTRA 6,244 $ 328 $ 20,480.32 ' $ 324 | $ 20,230.56 No Bid No Bid
64 oz.
8 MILESTONE VM 1,620 $ 27210 $ 440,802.00 $ 297.60 $ 482,112.00 No Bid No Bid
2.5 gallon
9 2.4-D ester 5,080 $ 1565 $ 79,502.00 $ 1359 $ 69,037.20 1488 $ 75,590.40
Weedone - Low Vol. 4 - 2.5 gallon
10 GARLON 3A 1,000 $ 57.05 $ 57,050.00  $ 58.48 $ 58,480.00 No Bid No Bid
2.5 gallon
10A TRICLOPYR 1,610 $ 3962 $ 63,788.20 $ 4236 $ 68,199.60 40.46 $ 65,140.60
Element 3A - 2.5 gallon
11 KRENITE S 1,530 $ 58.05 $ 88,816.50 $ 57.49 $ 87,959.70 No Bid No Bid
2.5 gallon \
12 OUTRIDER 17,400 $ 1162 $ 202,188.00 $ 1157 $ 201,318.00 No Bid No Bid
20 ounce
13 AQUATIC GLYPHOSATE 100 $ 1495 $ 1,495.00 $ 1379 $ 1,379.00 1842 $ 1,842.00
AquaNeat - 2.5 gallon
14 GARLON 4 ULTRA 180 $ 76.80 $ 13,824.00 $ 73.96 $ 13,312.80 No Bid No Bid
2.5 gallon
15/STALKER - 206 $ 65.65 $ 13,523.90 $ 66.26 $ 13,649.56 No Bid No Bid
1 quart
16 DRIFT CONTROL - 100 $ 2035 $ 2,035.00  $ 1710 $ 1,710.00 2312 $ 2,312.00
Reign - 1 gallon \ '$ 0.24 $ 1.07 \
17 NON-IONIC SURFACTANT 1,206 $ 13.90 $ 16,763.40 $ 1350 | $ 16,281.00 1575 $ 18,994.50
Chaos - 1 gallon \ '$ 0.87 $ 1.69
18 WATERSOFT BY UAP 1,010 $ 1645 $ 16,614.50  $ 13.00 $ 13,130.00 No Bid No Bid
2.5 gallon \ \
19 BARK OIL BLUE LT 732 $ 845 §$ 6,185.40 ' $ 775 $ 5,673.00 870 $ 6,368.40
15 gallon
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Item # Description Est. Qty. Lesco Townsend Chemical Alenza
Total Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price | Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1 ESCORT XP 3,032 No Bid No Bid $ 310 $ 9,399.20  $ 845 | $ 25,620.40
8 or 16 ounce \ \
1A METSULFURON-METHYL - 8 or 16 oz. 3,350 No Bid No Bid $ 305 $ 10,217.50 | $ 559 ' $ 18,726.50
Metcel VMF \ \
2/PLATEAU 755 No Bid No Bid $ 12750 $ 96,262.50 No Bid No Bid
1 gallon
3/PENDULUM AgquaCap 240 $ 58.22 ' $ 13,972.80 | $ 48.00 $ 11,520.00 No Bid No Bid
2.5 gallon
4/ROUNDUP PRO 200 No Bid No Bid $ 1410 ' $ 2,820.00 No Bid No Bid
2.5 gallon
4A|GLYPHOSATE WITH SURFACT. 580 $ 16.82 | $ 9,755.60 $ 10.90 $ 6,322.00 $ 1490 | $ 8,642.00
Razor - 2.5 gallon
5/ROUNDUP PRO 90 No Bid No Bid $ 1360  $ 1,224.00 No Bid No Bid
30 gallon
5A|GLYPHOSATE WITH SURFACT. 810 $ 16.82 ' $ 13,624.20 $ 1080 $ 8,748.00 | $ 1445 ' $ 11,704.50
Razor - 30 gallon
6 ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE 2,930 No Bid No Bid $ 1950 $ 57,135.00 | $ 2475 ' $ 72,517.50
2.5 gallon
7/OQUST EXTRA 6,244 No Bid No Bid $ 305 $ 19,044.20 | $ 485 ' $ 30,283.40
64 oz.
8 MILESTONE VM 1,620 $ 605.20 | $ 980,424.00  $ 282.00 | $ 456,840.00 $ 31595 $ 511,839.00
2.5 gallon
9 2.4-D ester 5,080 No Bid No Bid $ 13.70 | $ 69,596.00 $ 1490 | $ 75,692.00
Weedone - Low Vol. 4 - 2.5 gallon
10/ GARLON 3A 1,000 $ 93.75 | $ 93,750.00 $ 56.50 $ 56,500.00 $ 68.15 | $ 68,150.00
2.5 gallon
10A TRICLOPYR 1,610 No Bid No Bid $ 4050  $ 65,205.00 | $ 54.15  $ 87,181.50
Element 3A - 2.5 gallon
11 KRENITE S 1,530 No Bid No Bid $ 58.00 $ 88,740.00 | $ 66.23  $ 101,331.90
2.5 gallon
12 OUTRIDER 17,400 No Bid No Bid $ 1250 ' $ 217,500.00 | $ 1335 ' $ 232,290.00
20 ounce
13 AQUATIC GLYPHOSATE 100 $ 2176 | $ 2,176.00 $ 1290 $ 1,290.00  $ 25.65 | $ 2,565.00
AguaNeat - 2.5 gallon \
14 GARLON 4 ULTRA 180 $ 12350 | $ 22,230.00 $ 4550 $ 8,190.00 $ 88.65 $ 15,957.00
2.5 gallon \ \
15 STALKER - 206 No Bid No Bid $ 62.00 $ 12,772.00 No Bid No Bid
1 quart
16 DRIFT CONTROL - 100 No Bid No Bid $ 20.00 $ 2,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Reign - 1 gallon $ 0.63
17 NON-IONIC SURFACTANT 1,206 $ 19.46 | $ 23,468.76 $ 950 $ 11,457.00 No Bid No Bid
Chaos - 1 gallon $ 2.43 $ 0.59
18 WATERSOFT BY UAP 1,010 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2.5 gallon
19 BARK OIL BLUE LT 732 No Bid No Bid $ 930 $ 6,807.60 No Bid No Bid
15 gallon
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ltem # Description Est. Qty. CWC Chemical
Total Unit Price | Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1 ESCORT XP 3,032 $ 375 % 11,370.00 $ - $ -
8 or 16 ounce \ \
1A METSULFURON-METHYL - 8 or 16 oz. 3,350 $ 375 % 12,562.50 $ - $ -
Metcel VMF \
2 PLATEAU 755 $ 15495 $ 116,987.25 $ - $ -
1 gallon \
3 PENDULUM AquaCap 240 $ 4795 $ 11,508.00 $ - $ -
2.5 gallon \ \
4 ROUNDUP PRO 200 $ 4736 $ 9,472.00 $ - $ -
2.5 gallon \ \
4AGLYPHOSATE WITH SURFACT. 580 $ 1397 $ 8,102.60 $ - $ -
Razor - 2.5 gallon
5 ROUNDUP PRO 90 No Bid No Bid $ - $ -
30 gallon
5A|GLYPHOSATE WITH SURFACT. 810 $ 1345 $ 10,894.50 $ - $ -
Razor - 30 gallon \ \
6 ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE 2,930 $ 2266 $ 66,393.80 $ - $ -
2.5 gallon \
7 OUST EXTRA 6,244 $ 373 % 23,290.12 $ - $ -
64 oz. \
8 MILESTONE VM 1,620 $ 29395 $ 476,199.00 $ - $ -
2.5 gallon \ \
9 2.4-D ester 5,080 $ 1496 $ 75,996.80 $ - $ -
Weedone - Low Vol. 4 - 2.5 gallon \
10 GARLON 3A 1,000 $ 6249 $ 62,490.00 $ - $ -
2.5 gallon \ \
10A TRICLOPYR 1,610 $ 4795 $ 77,199.50 $ - $ -
Element 3A - 2.5 gallon \ \
11 KRENITE S 1,530 $ 59.95 $ 91,723.50 $ - $ -
2.5 gallon \
12 OUTRIDER 17,400 $ 1245 $ 216,630.00 $ - $ -
20 ounce \ \
13 AQUATIC GLYPHOSATE 100 $ 2095 $ 2,095.00 $ - $ -
AguaNeat - 2.5 gallon \ \
14 GARLON 4 ULTRA 180 $ 7895 $ 14,211.00 $ - $ -
2.5 gallon \
15 STALKER - 206 $ 65.49 $ 13,490.94 $ - $ -
1 quart \ \
16 DRIFT CONTROL - 100 $ 2295 $ 2,295.00 $ - $ -
Reign - 1 gallon $ 0.54
17 NON-IONIC SURFACTANT 1,206 No Bid No Bid $ - $ -
Chaos - 1 gallon
18 WATERSOFT BY UAP 1,010 $ 1145 $ 11,564.50 $ - $ -
2.5 gallon \ \
19 BARK OIL BLUE LT 732 $ 1410 $ 10,321.20 $ - $ -
15 gallon

Bidder did not provide product labels as specified in paragraph 3.1.5
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Bidder did not bid as specified

Bidder did not provide Certificate of Analysis per paragrap
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Apparent low bid
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