BID SUMMARY

Bid Request #5-121212CN1

17-Dec-12
CATEGORY #1
0 gna Applied Co ep P a e
ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
1 |Ranger EZ Radar 1-5 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $2,345.00 $2,345.00
2 6-10 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $2,345.00 $2,345.00
3 11-15 No Bid $0.00 [ No Bid $0.00 [ $2,345.00 $2,345.00]
4 16-20 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $2,345.00 $2,345.00
5 20+ No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $2,345.00 $2,345.00
TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $11,725.00
CATEGORY #2
0 gha Applied Co ep P a0 e
ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
1 |Beelll Radar 1-5 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00
2 6-10 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00
3 11-15 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00
4 16-20 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00
5 20+ No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00
TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $ 9,495.00
CATEGORY #3
0 gna Applied Co ep P 0 e
ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
1 |Enforcer Radar 1-5 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $1,699.00 $1,699.00
2 6-10 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $1,699.00 $1,699.00
3 11-15 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $1,699.00 $1,699.00
4 16-20 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $1,699.00 $1,699.00
5 20+ No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $1,699.00 $1,699.00
TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $ 8,495.00




BID SUMMARY
Bid Request #5-121212CN1
17-Dec-12

CATEGORY #1
Kustom Signals Inc Applied Concepts Inc MPH Industries Inc
[[TEM:] DESCRIPTON: [ EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: JUNIT COST: EXT COST:
CATEGORY #4
O gna Applied O ep P a e
ITEM:[ DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
1 [Python T 15 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $1,095.00 $1,095.00
2 6-10 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $1,095.00 $1,095.00
3 11-15 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $1,095.00 $1,095.00
4 16-20 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $1,095.00 $1,095.00)
5 20+ No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 $1,095.00 $1,095.00
TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $5,475.00
CATEGORY #5
O gna Applied O ep = 0 e
ITEM:[ DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
1 |Z-15 Radar 15 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
5 20+ No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $0.00
CATEGORY #6
O gna Appliead O ep P a e
ITEM:[ DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
1 |Z-25 Radar 15 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
5 20+ No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $0.00




BID SUMMARY
Bid Request #5-121212CN1
17-Dec-12

CATEGORY #1
Kustom Signals Inc Applied Concepts Inc MPH Industries Inc
[[TEM:] DESCRIPTON: [ EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: JUNIT COST: EXT COST:
CATEGORY #7
0 gna Applied O ep P e
ITEM:[ DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
1 |Z-35 Radar 15 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
5 20+ No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $0.00
CATEGORY #8
O gna Appliead O ep P e
ITEM:[ DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
1 |Speedgun Radar 15 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 No Bid $0.00 [ No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 |[No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 No Bid $0.00 [ No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
5 20+ No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $0.00
CATEGORY #9
0 gna Applied Co ep P e
ITEM:] DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: [ EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
T |Speedgun Plus 15 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 No Bid $0.00 [ No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
5 20+ No Bid $0.00 [ No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $0.00




BID SUMMARY
Bid Request #5-121212CN1
17-Dec-12

CATEGORY #1
Kustom Signals Inc Applied Concepts Inc MPH Industries Inc
['TEM:]  DESCRIPTON: JEST QTY:] UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
CATEGORY #10
0 gna Applieda Co ep P a e
ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: JUNIT COST: EXT COST:
Falcon HR Stationary
1 |Radar 1-5 $ 972.00 $972.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 $ 928.00 $928.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 $ 905.00 $905.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 $ 894.00 $894.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
5 20+ $ 850.00 $850.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $ 4,549.00 TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $ -
CATEGORY #11
0 I Applied Co ep P a0 e
ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: JUNIT COST: EXT COST:
Falcon HR Stationary
1 |Radar, with Case 1-5 $ 1,095.00 $1,095.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 $ 1,045.00 $1,045.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 $ 1,020.00 $1,020.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 $ 1,011.00 $1,011.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
5 20+ $ 960.00 $960.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $ 5,131.00 TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $0.00
CATEGORY #12
0 gna Appliea Co ep P 8 e
ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: JUNIT COST: EXT COST:
Talon Stationary
1 [Radar 1-5 $ 1,317.00 $1,317.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 $ 1,258.00 $1,258.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 $ 1,227.00 $1,227.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 $ 1,207.00 $1,207.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
5 20+ $ 1,147.00 $1,147.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: 6156.00 TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $0.00




BID SUMMARY
Bid Request #5-121212CN1
17-Dec-12

CATEGORY #1
Kustom Signals Inc Applied Concepts Inc MPH Industries Inc
['TEM:]  DESCRIPTON: JEST QTY:] UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
CATEGORY #13
0 gna Applieda Co ep P e
ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
Eagle Plus K Band
1 |Radar 1-5 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
5 20+ No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $0.00
CATEGORY #14
0 I Applied Co ep P e
ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: JUNIT COST: EXT COST:
1 |Fagle KBand Radar |1-5 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
5 20+ No Bid $0.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $0.00
CATEGORY #15
0 gna Appliea Co ep P e
ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
Raptor
Moving/Stationary
1 |Radar 1-5 $1,686.00 $1,686.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 $1,606.00 $1,606.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 $1,566.00 $1,566.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 $1,526.00 $1,526.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
5 20+ $1,450.00 $1,450.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $7,834.00 TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $0.00




BID SUMMARY
Bid Request #5-121212CN1
17-Dec-12

CATEGORY #1
Kustom Signals Inc Applied Concepts Inc MPH Industries Inc
['TEM:]  DESCRIPTON: JEST QTY:] UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
CATEGORY #16
0 gna Applieda Co ep P e
ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: JUNIT COST: EXT COST:
1 |Golden Eagle Radar [1-5 $ 2,116.00 $2,116.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 $2,021.00 $2,021.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 $1,970.00 $1,970.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 $1,926.00 $1,926.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
5 20+ $1,830.00 $1,830.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $9,863.00 TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $0.00
CATEGORY #17
0 gna Appliea Co ep P e
ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: JUNIT COST: EXT COST:
Golden Eagle Single
1 |KA Band Radar 1-5 $1,946.00 $1,946.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 $ 1,861.00 $1,861.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 $ 1,815.00 $1,815.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 $1,776.00 $1,776.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
5 20+ $1,687.00 $1,687.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $9,085.00 TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $0.00
CATEGORY #18
0 gna Appliea Co ep P e
ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: JUNIT COST: EXT COST:
Golden Eagle Plus KA
1 |Band Radar 1-5 $2,556.00 $2,556.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 $2,426.00 $2,426.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 $2,366.00 $2,366.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 $2,326.00 $2,326.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
5 20+ $2,210.00 $2,210.00 | No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $11,884.00 TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $0.00




BID SUMMARY
Bid Request #5-121212CN1
17-Dec-12

CATEGORY #1

Kustom Signals Inc Applied Concepts Inc MPH Industries Inc
['TEM:]  DESCRIPTON: JEST QTY:] UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
CATEGORY #19

0 gha Applied Co ep P a e

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
Eagle Single KA
1 [Radar 1-5 $1,396.00 $1,396.00 | No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 $1,336.00 $1,336.00 | No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 $1,303.00 $1,303.00 | No Bid $0.00 |[No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 $1,276.00 $1,276.00 | No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00
5 20+ $ 1,212.00 $1,212.00 | No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $ 6,523.00 TOTAL: $ - TOTAL.: $0.00
CATEGORY #20
0 gna Applied Co ep P a e
ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
Eagle Dual Heavy
1 |Dual Radar 1-5 $1,566.00 $1,566.00| No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 $1,496.00 $1,496.00| No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 $1,459.00 $1,459.00| No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 $1,426.00 $1,426.00| No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00
5 20+ $1,355.00 $1,355.00| No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00
TOTAL.: $7,302.00 TOTAL: $ - TOTAL.: $0.00
CATEGORY #21
0 gna Applied Co ep P 8 e

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
1 |Stalker DSR Radar |15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
5 20+ No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $ - TOTAL.: $0.00




BID SUMMARY
Bid Request #5-121212CN1
17-Dec-12

CATEGORY #1
Kustom Signals Inc Applied Concepts Inc MPH Industries Inc
[[TEM:] DESCRIPTON: [ EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: JUNIT COST: EXT COST:
CATEGORY #22
0 gna Applied O ep P e
ITEM:[ DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
1 |Stalker 2X Radar 15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
5 20+ No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $0.00
CATEGORY #23
O gna Applied O ep P e
ITEM:[ DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: | EXT COST: | UNIT COST: EXT COST:
1 |Stalker Dual Radar  [1-5 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
2 6-10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
3 11-15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
4 16-20 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
5 20+ No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
TOTAL: $ - TOTAL: $0.00

RECOMMENDATION: Award Categories #1, #2, #3 $ #4 to MPH Industries Inc, as they are apparent low bidder

RECOMMENDATION: Award Categories, #10, #11, #12, #15, #16, #17, & #19 to Kustom Signals Inc, as they are apparent low bidder




