
Item # Description Rocal, Inc. Vulcan Signs
 Interstate 

Highway Sign 

Corp 
Price Per Each

Standard Del. 

21 Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors Non-Responsive NO BID

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors NO BID

013 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", Red 

Type IX or XI Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

014 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", White 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

015 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", Yellow 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

016

Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', Red Type 

IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal Delivery

11.00$             13.20$                 15.40$                 1,102.20$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

017
Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', White Type 

IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal Delivery
11.00$             13.20$                 15.40$                 1,102.20$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

018 Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', Yellow 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

13.00$             15.60$                 18.20$                 1,302.60$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

019 Guard Cable Delineator, 4 inch x 50 yd 

role, White Type IX or XI  Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

150.00$           180.00$               210.00$               15,030.00$          137.50$               137.50$               137.50$               13,612.50$          

020 Guard Cable Delineator, 4 inch x 50 yd 

role, Yellow Type IX or XI  Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

150.00$           180.00$               210.00$               15,030.00$          137.50$               137.50$               137.50$               13,612.50$          

021 Stop / Stop Paddle with Handle - Normal 

Delivery
70.00$             84.00$                 98.00$                 7,014.00$            29.90$                 29.90$                 29.90$                 2,960.10$            

022 Slow Moving Vehicle Emblem Plaque - 

Normal Delivery
80.00$             96.00$                 112.00$               8,016.00$            13.45$                 13.45$                 13.45$                 1,331.55$            

49,047.90$          35,793.45$          

Item # Description Rocal, Inc. Vulcan Signs
 Interstate 

Highway Sign 

Corp 
Price Per Each

Standard Del. 

21 Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors Non-Responsive NO BID

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors NO BID

013 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", Red 

Type IX or XI Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

014 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", White 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

015 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", Yellow 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

016
Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', Red Type 

IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal Delivery

11.00$             13.20$                 15.40$                 1,102.20$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

017
Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', White Type 

IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal Delivery

11.00$             13.20$                 15.40$                 1,102.20$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

018 Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', Yellow 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

13.00$             15.60$                 18.20$                 1,302.60$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

019 Guard Cable Delineator, 4 inch x 50 yd 

role, White Type IX or XI  Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

150.00$           180.00$               210.00$               15,030.00$          137.50$               137.50$               137.50$               13,612.50$          

020 Guard Cable Delineator, 4 inch x 50 yd 

role, Yellow Type IX or XI  Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

150.00$           180.00$               210.00$               15,030.00$          137.50$               137.50$               137.50$               13,612.50$          

021 Stop / Stop Paddle with Handle - Normal 

Delivery
70.00$             84.00$                 98.00$                 7,014.00$            29.90$                 29.90$                 29.90$                 2,960.10$            

022 Slow Moving Vehicle Emblem Plaque - 

Normal Delivery
80.00$             96.00$                 112.00$               8,016.00$            13.45$                 13.45$                 13.45$                 1,331.55$            

49,047.90$          35,793.45$          

Osburn Associates

Unique Signs - Northwest District

Unique Signs - Northeast District

The Work Zone

Osburn Associates The Work Zone



Item # Description Rocal, Inc. Vulcan Signs
 Interstate 

Highway Sign 

Corp 
Price Per Each

Standard Del. 

21 Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors Non-Responsive NO BID

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors NO BID

013 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", Red 

Type IX or XI Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

014 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", White 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

015 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", Yellow 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

016

Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', Red Type 

IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal Delivery

11.00$             13.20$                 15.40$                 1,102.20$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

017
Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', White Type 

IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal Delivery

11.00$             13.20$                 15.40$                 1,102.20$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

018 Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', Yellow 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

13.00$             15.60$                 18.20$                 1,302.60$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

019 Guard Cable Delineator, 4 inch x 50 yd 

role, White Type IX or XI  Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

150.00$           180.00$               210.00$               15,030.00$          137.50$               137.50$               137.50$               13,612.50$          

020 Guard Cable Delineator, 4 inch x 50 yd 

role, Yellow Type IX or XI  Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

150.00$           180.00$               210.00$               15,030.00$          137.50$               137.50$               137.50$               13,612.50$          

021 Stop / Stop Paddle with Handle - Normal 

Delivery
70.00$             84.00$                 98.00$                 7,014.00$            29.90$                 29.90$                 29.90$                 2,960.10$            

022 Slow Moving Vehicle Emblem Plaque - 

Normal Delivery
80.00$             96.00$                 112.00$               8,016.00$            13.45$                 13.45$                 13.45$                 1,331.55$            

49,047.90$          35,793.45$          

Item # Description Rocal, Inc. Vulcan Signs
 Interstate 

Highway Sign 

Corp 
Price Per Each

Standard Del. 

21 Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors Non-Responsive NO BID

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors NO BID

013 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", Red 

Type IX or XI Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

014 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", White 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

015 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", Yellow 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

016

Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', Red Type 

IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal Delivery

11.00$             13.20$                 15.40$                 1,102.20$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

017

Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', White Type 

IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal Delivery

11.00$             13.20$                 15.40$                 1,102.20$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

018 Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', Yellow 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

13.00$             15.60$                 18.20$                 1,302.60$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

019 Guard Cable Delineator, 4 inch x 50 yd 

role, White Type IX or XI  Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

150.00$           180.00$               210.00$               15,030.00$          137.50$               137.50$               137.50$               13,612.50$          

020 Guard Cable Delineator, 4 inch x 50 yd 

role, Yellow Type IX or XI  Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

150.00$           180.00$               210.00$               15,030.00$          137.50$               137.50$               137.50$               13,612.50$          

021 Stop / Stop Paddle with Handle - Normal 

Delivery
70.00$             84.00$                 98.00$                 7,014.00$            29.90$                 29.90$                 29.90$                 2,960.10$            

022 Slow Moving Vehicle Emblem Plaque - 

Normal Delivery
80.00$             96.00$                 112.00$               8,016.00$            13.45$                 13.45$                 13.45$                 1,331.55$            

49,047.90$          35,793.45$          

Osburn Associates The Work Zone

Unique Signs - Kansas City District

Osburn Associates The Work Zone

Unique Signs - Central District



Item # Description Rocal, Inc. Vulcan Signs
 Interstate 

Highway Sign 

Corp 
Price Per Each

Standard Del. 

21 Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors Non-Responsive NO BID

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors NO BID

013 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", Red 

Type IX or XI Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

014 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", White 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

015 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", Yellow 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

016

Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', Red Type 

IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal Delivery

11.00$             13.20$                 15.40$                 1,102.20$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

017

Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', White Type 

IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal Delivery

11.00$             13.20$                 15.40$                 1,102.20$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

018 Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', Yellow 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

13.00$             15.60$                 18.20$                 1,302.60$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

019 Guard Cable Delineator, 4 inch x 50 yd 

role, White Type IX or XI  Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

150.00$           180.00$               210.00$               15,030.00$          137.50$               137.50$               137.50$               13,612.50$          

020 Guard Cable Delineator, 4 inch x 50 yd 

role, Yellow Type IX or XI  Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

150.00$           180.00$               210.00$               15,030.00$          137.50$               137.50$               137.50$               13,612.50$          

021 Stop / Stop Paddle with Handle - Normal 

Delivery
70.00$             84.00$                 98.00$                 7,014.00$            29.90$                 29.90$                 29.90$                 2,960.10$            

022 Slow Moving Vehicle Emblem Plaque - 

Normal Delivery
80.00$             96.00$                 112.00$               8,016.00$            13.45$                 13.45$                 13.45$                 1,331.55$            

49,047.90$          35,793.45$          

Item # Description Rocal, Inc. Vulcan Signs
 Interstate 

Highway Sign 

Corp 
Price Per Each

Standard Del. 

21 Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors Non-Responsive NO BID

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors NO BID

013 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", Red 

Type IX or XI Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

014 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", White 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

015 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", Yellow 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

016

Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', Red Type 

IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal Delivery

11.00$             13.20$                 15.40$                 1,102.20$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

017
Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', White Type 

IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal Delivery

11.00$             13.20$                 15.40$                 1,102.20$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

018 Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', Yellow 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

13.00$             15.60$                 18.20$                 1,302.60$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

019 Guard Cable Delineator, 4 inch x 50 yd 

role, White Type IX or XI  Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

150.00$           180.00$               210.00$               15,030.00$          137.50$               137.50$               137.50$               13,612.50$          

020 Guard Cable Delineator, 4 inch x 50 yd 

role, Yellow Type IX or XI  Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

150.00$           180.00$               210.00$               15,030.00$          137.50$               137.50$               137.50$               13,612.50$          

021 Stop / Stop Paddle with Handle - Normal 

Delivery
70.00$             84.00$                 98.00$                 7,014.00$            29.90$                 29.90$                 29.90$                 2,960.10$            

022 Slow Moving Vehicle Emblem Plaque - 

Normal Delivery
80.00$             96.00$                 112.00$               8,016.00$            13.45$                 13.45$                 13.45$                 1,331.55$            

49,047.90$          35,793.45$          

Unique Signs - St. Louis District

Osburn Associates The Work Zone

Osburn Associates The Work Zone

Unique Signs - Southwest District



Item # Description Rocal, Inc. Vulcan Signs
 Interstate 

Highway Sign 

Corp 
Price Per Each

Standard Del. 

21 Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

Standard Del. 21 

Days
NO BID

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors NO BID

013 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", Red 

Type IX or XI Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

014 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", White 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

015 Channel Post Delineator, 3" x 6", Yellow 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

1.50$               1.80$                   2.10$                   150.30$               2.15$                   2.15$                   2.15$                   212.85$               

016
Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', Red Type 

IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal Delivery

11.00$             13.20$                 15.40$                 1,102.20$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

017

Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', White Type 

IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal Delivery

11.00$             13.20$                 15.40$                 1,102.20$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

018 Sign Post Delineator, 4" x 6', Yellow 

Type IX or XI  Sheeting - Normal 

Delivery

13.00$             15.60$                 18.20$                 1,302.60$            12.25$                 12.25$                 12.25$                 1,212.75$            

019 Guard Cable Delineator, 4 inch x 50 yd 

role, White Type IX or XI  Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

150.00$           180.00$               210.00$               15,030.00$          137.50$               137.50$               137.50$               13,612.50$          

020 Guard Cable Delineator, 4 inch x 50 yd 

role, Yellow Type IX or XI  Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery
150.00$           180.00$               210.00$               15,030.00$          137.50$               137.50$               137.50$               13,612.50$          

021 Stop / Stop Paddle with Handle - Normal 

Delivery
70.00$             84.00$                 98.00$                 7,014.00$            29.90$                 29.90$                 29.90$                 2,960.10$            

022 Slow Moving Vehicle Emblem Plaque - 

Normal Delivery
80.00$             96.00$                 112.00$               8,016.00$            13.45$                 13.45$                 13.45$                 1,331.55$            

49,047.90$          35,793.45$          

Osburn Associates The Work Zone

Unique Signs - Southeast District


