
Item # Description
Unit of 

Measure
Vulcan Signs

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors NO BID

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

009 Structural Signs - Type IV Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

Square 

Foot
12.40$                 14.88$                 17.36$                 1,242.48$            11.63$                 15.12$                 17.45$                 1,169.98$            12.50$                 12.50$                 12.50$                 1,237.50$            9.96$                   11.95$                 13.45$                 997.00$               

010 Structural Signs - Type IV Sheeting - 

Rush Delivery

Square 

Foot
17.40$                 17.40$                 22.10$                 22.10$                 14.00$                 14.00$                 38.36$                 38.36$                 

011 Structural Signs, Warning, Type IX or XI 

Fluorescent Sheeting - Normal Delivery

Square 

Foot 13.40$                 16.08$                 18.76$                 1,342.68$            12.39$                 16.11$                 18.59$                 1,246.43$            13.85$                 13.85$                 13.85$                 1,371.15$            11.03$                 13.24$                 14.89$                 1,104.10$            

012 Structural Signs, Warning, Type IX or XI 

Fluorescent Sheeting - Rush Delivery

Square 

Foot
18.40$                 18.40$                 26.00$                 26.00$                 15.35$                 15.35$                 42.40$                 42.40$                 

2,620.96$            2,464.51$            2,638.00$            2,181.86$            

Item # Description
Unit of 

Measure
Vulcan Signs

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors NO BID

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

009 Structural Signs - Type IV Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

Square 

Foot
12.40$                 14.88$                 17.36$                 1,242.48$            11.63$                 15.12$                 17.45$                 1,169.98$            9.96$                   11.95$                 13.45$                 997.00$               

010 Structural Signs - Type IV Sheeting - 

Rush Delivery

Square 

Foot
17.40$                 17.40$                 22.10$                 22.10$                 38.36$                 38.36$                 

011 Structural Signs, Warning, Type IX or XI 

Fluorescent Sheeting - Normal Delivery

Square 

Foot
13.40$                 16.08$                 18.76$                 1,342.68$            12.39$                 16.11$                 18.59$                 1,246.43$            11.03$                 13.24$                 14.89$                 1,104.10$            

012 Structural Signs, Warning, Type IX or XI 

Fluorescent Sheeting - Rush Delivery

Square 

Foot
18.40$                 18.40$                 26.00$                 26.00$                 42.40$                 42.40$                 

2,620.96$            2,464.51$            2,181.86$            

Item # Description
Unit of 

Measure
Vulcan Signs

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors NO BID

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

009 Structural Signs - Type IV Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

Square 

Foot
11.75$                 14.10$                 16.45$                 1,177.35$            11.63$                 15.12$                 17.45$                 1,169.98$            12.50$                 12.50$                 12.50$                 1,237.50$            9.96$                   11.95$                 13.45$                 997.00$               

010 Structural Signs - Type IV Sheeting - 

Rush Delivery

Square 

Foot
16.75$                 16.75$                 22.10$                 22.10$                 14.00$                 14.00$                 38.36$                 38.36$                 

011 Structural Signs, Warning, Type IX or XI 

Fluorescent Sheeting - Normal Delivery

Square 

Foot
12.75$                 15.30$                 17.85$                 1,277.55$            12.39$                 16.11$                 18.59$                 1,246.43$            13.85$                 13.85$                 13.85$                 1,371.15$            11.03$                 13.24$                 14.89$                 1,104.10$            

012 Structural Signs, Warning, Type IX or XI 

Fluorescent Sheeting - Rush Delivery

Square 

Foot
17.75$                 17.75$                 26.00$                 26.00$                 15.35$                 15.35$                 42.40$                 42.40$                 

2,489.40$            2,464.51$            2,638.00$            2,181.86$            

Item # Description
Unit of 

Measure
Vulcan Signs

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors NO BID

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

009 Structural Signs - Type IV Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

Square 

Foot
12.40$                 14.88$                 17.36$                 1,242.48$            11.63$                 15.12$                 17.45$                 1,169.98$            9.96$                   11.95$                 13.45$                 997.00$               

010 Structural Signs - Type IV Sheeting - 

Rush Delivery

Square 

Foot
17.40$                 17.40$                 22.10$                 22.10$                 38.36$                 38.36$                 

011 Structural Signs, Warning, Type IX or XI 

Fluorescent Sheeting - Normal Delivery

Square 

Foot
13.40$                 16.08$                 18.76$                 1,342.68$            12.39$                 16.11$                 18.59$                 1,246.43$            11.03$                 13.24$                 14.89$                 1,104.10$            

012 Structural Signs, Warning, Type IX or XI 

Fluorescent Sheeting - Rush Delivery

Square 

Foot
18.40$                 18.40$                 26.00$                 26.00$                 42.40$                 42.40$                 

2,620.96$            2,464.51$            2,181.86$            

Structural Signs - Northwest District

Structural Signs - Northeast District

Osburn Associates Rocal, Inc. The Work Zone Interstate Highway Sign Corp

Osburn Associates Rocal, Inc. The Work Zone Interstate Highway Sign Corp

Osburn Associates

Osburn Associates Rocal, Inc. The Work Zone Interstate Highway Sign Corp

NO BID

Rocal, Inc. The Work Zone Interstate Highway Sign Corp

NO BID

Structural Signs - Kansas City District

Structural Signs - Central District



Item # Description
Unit of 

Measure
Vulcan Signs

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors NO BID

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

009 Structural Signs - Type IV Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

Square 

Foot
11.25$                 13.50$                 15.75$                 1,127.25$            11.63$                 15.12$                 17.45$                 1,169.98$            9.96$                   11.95$                 13.45$                 997.00$               

010 Structural Signs - Type IV Sheeting - 

Rush Delivery

Square 

Foot
16.25$                 16.25$                 22.10$                 22.10$                 38.36$                 38.36$                 

011 Structural Signs, Warning, Type IX or XI 

Fluorescent Sheeting - Normal Delivery

Square 

Foot
12.25$                 14.70$                 17.15$                 1,227.45$            12.39$                 16.11$                 18.59$                 1,246.43$            11.03$                 13.24$                 14.89$                 1,104.10$            

012 Structural Signs, Warning, Type IX or XI 

Fluorescent Sheeting - Rush Delivery

Square 

Foot
17.25$                 17.25$                 26.00$                 26.00$                 42.40$                 42.40$                 

2,388.20$            2,464.51$            2,181.86$            

Item # Description
Unit of 

Measure
Vulcan Signs

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors NO BID

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

009 Structural Signs - Type IV Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

Square 

Foot
11.70$                 14.04$                 16.38$                 1,172.34$            11.63$                 15.12$                 17.45$                 1,169.98$            9.93$                   11.92$                 13.41$                 993.99$               

010 Structural Signs - Type IV Sheeting - 

Rush Delivery

Square 

Foot
16.70$                 16.70$                 22.10$                 22.10$                 38.20$                 38.20$                 

011 Structural Signs, Warning, Type IX or XI 

Fluorescent Sheeting - Normal Delivery

Square 

Foot
12.70$                 15.24$                 17.78$                 1,272.54$            12.39$                 16.11$                 18.59$                 1,246.43$            11.00$                 13.20$                 14.85$                 1,101.10$            

012 Structural Signs, Warning, Type IX or XI 

Fluorescent Sheeting - Rush Delivery

Square 

Foot
17.70$                 17.70$                 26.00$                 26.00$                 42.24$                 42.24$                 

2,479.28$            2,464.51$            2,175.53$            

Item # Description
Unit of 

Measure
Vulcan Signs

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors NO BID

Standard Del. 21 

Days
14 Day Delivery 7 Day Delivery Cost factors

009 Structural Signs - Type IV Sheeting - 

Normal Delivery

Square 

Foot
11.50$                 13.80$                 16.10$                 1,152.30$            11.63$                 15.12$                 17.45$                 1,169.98$            9.93$                   11.92$                 13.41$                 993.99$               

010 Structural Signs - Type IV Sheeting - 

Rush Delivery

Square 

Foot
16.50$                 16.50$                 22.10$                 22.10$                 38.20$                 38.20$                 

011 Structural Signs, Warning, Type IX or XI 

Fluorescent Sheeting - Normal Delivery

Square 

Foot
12.50$                 15.00$                 17.50$                 1,252.50$            12.39$                 16.11$                 18.59$                 1,246.43$            11.00$                 13.20$                 14.85$                 1,101.10$            

012 Structural Signs, Warning, Type IX or XI 

Fluorescent Sheeting - Rush Delivery

Square 

Foot
17.50$                 17.50$                 26.00$                 26.00$                 42.24$                 42.24$                 

2,438.80$            2,464.51$            2,175.53$            

NO BID

Osburn Associates Rocal, Inc. The Work Zone

Structural Signs - St. Louis District

Structural Signs - Southwest District

NO BID

Osburn Associates Rocal, Inc.

Interstate Highway Sign Corp

The Work Zone Interstate Highway Sign Corp

Osburn Associates Rocal, Inc. The Work Zone Interstate Highway Sign Corp

Structural Signs - Southeast District

NO BID


