DISTRICT7 -

9-100625E

ELECTRICAL

|
JOPLIN INDUSTRIAL ELECTRIC, INC.

Area County Reg. Time OT 1.5x Holliday 2.0x
North Barton S 65.00| $ 95.00| S 120.00
North Bates S 100.00| $ 150.00| $ 200.00
North Cedar S 65.00] S 97.00| S 125.00
North Dade S 65.00| $ 95.00| S 120.00
North St. Clair S 100.00| $ 150.00| $ 200.00
North Vernon S 65.00| $ 97.00| S 125.00
South Barry S 65.00f S 97.00( S 125.00
South Jasper S 60.00| $ 90.00| S 115.00
South Lawrence S 65.00| $ 95.00| S 120.00
South McDonald S 65.00| $ 95.00| S 120.00
South Newton S 60.00| S 90.00| S 115.00
1-HOUR NORTH PER COUNTY + $100 MATERIALS W/35% MARKUP S 595.00
1-HOUR SOUTH PER COUNTY + $100 MATERIALS W/35% MARKUP S 450.00

|
WEBB ELECTRIC, INC.

Area County Reg. Time OT 1.5x Holliday 2.0x
North Barton S 56.57| S 84.86| S 113.15
North Bates no bid no bid no bid
North Cedar S 66.57| S 99.86| S 133.14
North Dade S 56.57| $ 84.86| S 113.15
North St. Clair no bid no bid no bid
North Vernon S 56.57| $ 84.96| S 113.15
South Barry no bid no bid no bid
South Jasper S 56.57| $ 84.86| S 113.15
South Lawrence S 66.57| S 99.86| S 133.14
South McDonald no bid no bid no bid
South Newton no bid no bid no bid
1-HOUR NORTH PER COUNTY + $100 MATERIALS W/10% MARKUP no bid
1-HOUR SOUTH PER COUNTY + $100 MATERIALS W/10% MARKUP no bid

|
CASH QUALITY ELECTRIC

Area County Reg. Time OT 1.5x Holliday 2.0x
North Barton S 72.50| $ 94.25] S 116.00
North Bates S 98.50| S 128.05| $ 157.60
North Cedar S 72.50| S 94.25( S 116.00
North Dade S 72.50| $ 94.25| S 116.00
North St. Clair S 72.50| S 94.25( S 116.00
North Vernon S 72.50| $ 94.25| S 116.00
South Barry S 72.50| S 94.25( S 116.00
South Jasper S 72.50| $ 94.25| S 116.00
South Lawrence S 72.50| $ 94.25| S 116.00
South McDonald S 72.50| §$ 94.25| S 116.00
South Newton S 72.50| S 94.25( S 116.00
1-HOUR NORTH PER COUNTY + $100 MATERIALS W/20% MARKUP S 581.00
1-HOUR SOUTH PER COUNTY + $100 MATERIALS W/20% MARKUP S 482.50
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SPIVEY ELECTRICAL CONTRACTING SOUTH APPARENT LOW

Area County Reg. Time OT 1.5x Holliday 2.0x
North Barton S 44.75| S 61.59| S 109.78
North Bates S 67.50| S 88.63| § 74.96
North Cedar S 44.75| S 61.59| S 74.96
North Dade S 44.75( $ 61.59| S 74.96
North St. Clair S 44.75| $ 61.59| S 74.96
North Vernon S 44.75( § 61.59| S 74.96
South Barry S 44.75| S 61.59( S 74.96
South Jasper S 44.75| S 61.59( S 74.96
South Lawrence S 44.75| S 61.59( S 74.96
South McDonald S 44.75| S 61.59| S 74.96
South Newton S 44.75| S 61.59| S 74.96
1-HOUR NORTH PER COUNTY + $100 MATERIALS W/5% MARKUP S 351.50
1-HOUR SOUTH PER COUNTY + S100 MATERIALS W/5% MARKUP ) 328.75

REINHOLD ELECTRIC, INC.

MIDWEST ELECTRIC NORTH APPARENT LOW
Area County Reg. Time OT 1.5x Holliday 2.0x
North Barton S 49.66| S 74.16| S 83.49
North Bates S 36.00( S 54.00( $ 74.16
North Cedar S 36.00| s 54.00| s 74.16
North Dade S 36.00( $ 54.00( $ 74.16
North St. Clair S 36.00| S 54.00| s 74.16
North Vernon S 36.00( S 54.00( s 74.16
South Barry no bid no bid no bid
South Jasper no bid no bid no bid
South Lawrence no bid no bid no bid
South McDonald no bid no bid no bid
South Newton no bid no bid no bid

1-HOUR NORTH PER COUNTY + $100 MATERIALS W/10% MARKUP S 339.66

1-HOUR SOUTH PER COUNTY + S100 MATERIALS W/no bid% MARKUP no bid

Area County Reg. Time OT 1.5x Holliday 2.0x
North Barton S 70.00f S 105.00| $ 130.00
North Bates S 70.00| S 105.00| S 130.00
North Cedar S 70.00( S 105.00| $ 130.00
North Dade S 70.00| S 105.00| $ 130.00
North St. Clair S 70.00f S 105.00| $ 130.00
North Vernon S 70.00| S 105.00| $ 130.00
South Barry S 70.00( S 105.00| $ 130.00
South Jasper S 70.00| S 105.00| $ 130.00
South Lawrence S 70.00| S 105.00| $ 130.00
South McDonald S 70.00| S 105.00| $ 130.00
South Newton S 70.00( S 105.00| $ 130.00
1-HOUR NORTH PER COUNTY + $100 MATERIALS W/10% MARKUP S 530.00
1-HOUR SOUTH PER COUNTY + $100 MATERIALS W/10% MARKUP S 460.00
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A.C.E. ELECTRIC, LLC

Area County Reg. Time OT 1.5x Holliday 2.0x
North Barton S 44.00 S 66.00| $ 88.00
North Bates S 65.00| $ 97.00] S 130.00
North Cedar S 44.00| S 66.00| S 88.00
North Dade S 44.001 S 66.00| $ 88.00
North St. Clair S 55.00] S 82.00| S 110.00
North Vernon S 44.001 S 66.00| $ 88.00
South Barry S 60.00| S 90.00| S 120.00
South Jasper S 44.00| S 66.00| S 88.00
South Lawrence S 44.001 S 66.00| S 88.00
South McDonald S 60.00| $ 90.00| S 120.00
South Newton S 44.00| S 66.00| S 88.00
1-HOUR NORTH PER COUNTY + $100 MATERIALS W/8% MARKUP S 404.00
1-HOUR SOUTH PER COUNTY + $100 MATERIALS W/8% MARKUP S 360.00
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