CALDWELL

CARROLL

CHARITON

DAVIES

GRUNDY

HARRISON

LINN

LIVINGSTON

MERCER

PUTNAM

SULLIVAN

% Mark-up for
Parts/Supplies

CARPENTRY SERVICES BID TABULATION
NORTHWEST DISTRICT - EAST REGION

Franklin Co.

E. L. Crawford

ller Enterprises Construction AVCO, Inc. Construction, Inc.
Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate
0.00% 45.00 65.00%| S 55.00 60.00%| S 68.00
0.00% 45.00 75.00%| $ 65.00 60.00%| $ 68.00
0.00% 45.00 75.00%| S 65.00 60.00%| S 68.00
0.00% 45.00 65.00%| $ 55.00 60.00%| $ 68.00
0.00% 45.00 75.00%| S 65.00 60.00%| S 68.00
0.00% 45.00 75.00%| $ 65.00 60.00%| $ 68.00
0.00% 45.00 75.00%| S 65.00 60.00%| S 68.00
0.00% 45.00 75.00%| $ 65.00 60.00%| $ 68.00
0.00% 45.00 80.00%| S 70.00 60.00%| S 68.00
0.00% 45.00 80.00%| $ 70.00 60.00%| $ 68.00
0.00% 45.00 80.00% 70.00 60.00% 68.00

Performance
Bond Mark-up

Yellow is first vendor.

nd vendor (contingent).




CARPENTRY SERVICES BID TABULATION
NORTHWEST DISTRICT - WEST REGION

Tee Grover
E. L. Crawford Construction
ller Enterprises Bruner Contracting Co. Construction, Inc. Company AVCO, Inc.

Maint. | Prevailing | Maint. | Prevailing Maint.
Wage % Rate Wage % Rate

Prevailing Maint. Prevailing Maint. | Prevailing
Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage %

ANDREW
COUNTY 0.00%| $ 45.00 No Bid
ATCHISON

COUNTY 0.00%

BUCHANAN
COUNTY 0.00%| $ 43.00

CLINTON
COUNTY 0.00%| S 43.00

48.30%| S 66.00 75.00%| $  65.00

45.00 No Bid 50.60%| S 67.00 75.00%| S  65.00

48.30%| S 66.00 75.00%| $  65.00

50.60%| S 67.00 75.00%| S  65.00

DEKALB COUNTY

No Bid 50.60%| S 67.00 75.00%| S  65.00

GENTRY COUNTY

No Bid 52.80%| S 68.00 75.00%| S  65.00

HOLT COUNTY No Bid

50.60%| S 67.00 75.00%| S 70.00

NODAWAY

COUNTY No Bid 52.80%| S 68.00 80.00%| S 70.00

WORTH COUNTY

% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies
Performance

Bond Mark-up

No Bid 52.80% 68.00 80.00% 70.00

Yellow is first vendor.

-d vendor (contingent).



ADAIR
COUNTY
CLARK
COUNTY

KNOX COUNTY

LEWIS
COUNTY
MACON
COUNTY
MARION
COUNTY

SCHUYLER
COUNTY
SCOTLAND
COUNTY
SHELBY
COUNTY
% Mark-up for
Parts/Supplies

CARPENTRY SERVICES BID TABULATION
NORTHEAST DISTRICT - NORTH REGION

ller Enterprises Construction Construction

Franklin Co. Schlacks

Prevailing
Wage %

Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate

Maint. | Prevailing
Rate Wage %

0.00%

0.00%

0.00%

$ 45.00 No Bid
45.00 No Bid
45.00 No Bid

0.00%

45.00 No Bid

0.00%

28.00%| S 51.00

S 45.00

0.00%

45.00 No Bid

0.00%

45.00 No Bid

0.00%

45.00

0.00%

Performance
Bond Mark-up

45.00

28.00%| $ 51.00
0.00%
0.00%

10.00%
5.00%

Yellow is first vendor.

-nd vendor (contingent).



AUDRAIN
COUNTY
LINCOLN
COUNTY
MONROE
COUNTY

MONTGOMERY
COUNTY

PIKE COUNTY

RALLS COUNTY

RANDOLPH

COUNTY
WARREN

COUNTY
% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies

CARPENTRY SERVICES BID TABULATION
NORTHEAST DISTRICT - SOUTH REGION

Iler Enterprises

Schlacks Construction

Franklin Co.
Construction

Prevailing Maint.

Wage % Rate

0.00%

S 45.00

0.00%

45.00

0.00%

45.00

0.00%

45.00

0.00%

45.00

Prevailing | Maint.

Wage %

Maint.
Rate

Prevailing
Wage %

28.00%| S 51.00

0.00%

45.00

0.00%

45.00

0.00%

Performance
Bond Mark-up

Yellow is first vendor.

45.00

-nd vendor (contingent).




LAFAYETTE
COUNTY
JOHNSON
COUNTY

PETTIS COUNTY

RAY COUNTY

SALINE COUNTY

% Mark-up for
Parts/Supplies

CARPENTRY SERVICES BID TABULATION
KANSAS CITY DISTRICT - EAST REGION

Bruner Contracting Wilson-Carr
D&M Plumbing, LLC ller Enterprises Company Construction Schlacks Construction AVCO, Inc. Buildet, LLC
Prevailing | Maint. | Prevailing Prevailing | Maint. | Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing| Maint. | Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate Wage % Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate
0.00% 35.00 0.00%| S 46.93 9.00%| $ 51.93 No Bid 75.00%| S 65.00 No Bid
0.00% 35.00 0.00%| S 46.93 9.00%| S 51.93 No Bid 80.00%| S  70.00 No Bid
0.00% 35.00 0.00%| S 45.00 9.00%| S 51.93 40.00%| S 40.00 80.00%| S  70.00 No Bid
0.00% 35.00 0.00%| S 49.10 9.00%| S 51.93 No Bid 75.00%| S  65.00 No Bid
0.00% 35.00 0.00% 45.00 9.00% 51.93 40.00%| S 40.00 80.00% 70.00 No Bid

Performance
Bond Mark-up

CASS COUNTY

CLAY COUNTY

JACKSON
COUNTY

PLATTE COUNTY

KANSAS CITY DISTRICT - WEST REGION

Bruner Contracting Wilson-Carr
D&M Plumbing, LLC ller Enterprises Company Construction Buildet, Inc AVCO, Inc. Schlacks Construction
Prevailing | Maint. Prevailing Maint. | Prevailing| Maint. | Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing| Maint. Prevailing | Maint. Prevailing [ Maint.
Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate
0.00%| S 35.00 0.00%| S 49.10 9.00%| S 54.10 90.00%| S 35.00 75.00%| S 70.00 No Bid
0.00%| S 35.00 0.00%| $ 49.10 9.00%| $ 54.10 No Bid 75.00%| S 70.00 No Bid
0.00%| S 35.00 0.00%| S 49.10 9.00%| S 54.10 No Bid 75.00%| S 70.00 No Bid
0.00%| S 35.00 0.00%| S 46.84 9.00%| $ 54.10 No Bid 75.00%| S 70.00 No Bid




% Mark-up for
Parts/Supplies

Performance
Bond Mark-up

Yellow is first vendor.
Blue is second vendor (contingent).




CARPENTRY SERVICES BID TABULATION
CENTRAL DISTRICT - NORTH REGION

Franklin Co.
Iler Enterprises Schlacks Construction Construction

Prevailing Maint. | Prevailing| Maint. | Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate

BOONE COUNTY

0.00%| S 45.00 28.00%| S 51.00

CALLAWAY

COUNTY 0.00%| S 45.00 28.00%| S 51.00

COOPER COUNTY

0.00%| S 45.00 28.00%| S 52.00

HOWARD COUNTY

0.00%| S 45.00 28.00%| S 52.00

% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies
Performance Bond

Mark-up

Yellow is first vendor.

-nd vendor (contingent).




CAMDEN
COUNTY

COLE COUNTY

GASCONADE
COUNTY

OSAGE COUNTY

MARIES
COUNTY

MILLER COUNTY

MONITEAU

COUNTY
MORGAN

COUNTY
% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies

CARPENTRY SERVICES BID TABULATION
CENTRAL DISTRICT - CENTRAL REGION

Iler Enterprises

Schlacks Construction

KA Berendzen
Construction, LLC

Franklin Co.
Construction

Maint.
Rate

Prevailing
Wage %

Prevailing | Maint.

Wage %

0.00%| S 45.00

0.00% 45.00

45.00

0.00%

0.00% 45.00

45.00

0.00%

0.00% 45.00

0.00% 45.00

0.00% 45.00

Performance
Bond Mark-up

Yellow is first vendor.

-nd vendor (contingent).

Prevailing| Maint. | Prevailing| Maint.

Wage % Rate Wage % Rate
No Bid 30.00%| S 55.00
24.00%| S 52.50 28.00%| S 54.00
No Bid 28.00%| S 60.00
24.00%| S 52.50 28.00%| S 51.00
24.00%| S 52.50 28.00%| S 51.00
24.00%| S 52.50 28.00%| S 51.00
24.00%| S 52.50 28.00%| S 53.00
No Bid 28.00% 53.00




CARPENTRY SERVICES BID TABULATION
CENTRAL DISTRICT - SOUTH REGION

Franklin Co.

Iler Enterprises Construction
Prevailing Maint. | Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate Wage % Rate

CRAWFORD COUNTY
0.00%| S 45.00

DENT COUNTY

0.00% 45.00

LACLEDE COUNTY

0.00% 45.00

PHELPS COUNTY

0.00% 45.00

PULASKI COUNTY

0.00% 45.00

WASHINGTON COUNTY

0.00% 45.00

% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies
Performance Bond

Mark-up

Yellow is first vendor.

-nd vendor (contingent).



CARPENTRY SERVICES BID TABULATION
ST. LOUIS DISTRICT - SOUTH REGION

Franklin Co. Interface Construction

Construction Schlacks Construction Corp. Lewis & Associates
Prevailing| Maint. | Prevailing| Maint. | Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate

FRANKLIN
COUNTY 35.00%| S 40.00
JEFFERSON

COUNTY No Bid
% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies
Performance Bond

Mark-up

35.00%| S 55.25 38.10%| S 65.09

38.10%| S 65.09

ST. LOUIS DISTRICT - NORTH REGION

Franklin Co. Interface Construction
Construction Corp. Lewis & Associates Schlacks Construction

Prevailing| Maint. | Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate

ST. CHARLES
COUNTY 28.00%| S 64.00 38.10%| S 65.09 No Bid
ST. LOUIS
COUNTY 28.00%| S 64.00 38.10%| S  65.09 No Bid




ST. LOUIS CITY

% Mark-up for
Parts/Supplies

Performance Bond
Mark-up

Yellow is first vendor.

-nd vendor (contingent).




BATES COUNTY
BENTON COUNTY

HENRY COUNTY

ST. CLAIR

COUNTY
% Mark-up for
Parts/Supplies

CARPENTRY SERVICES BID TABULATION
SOUTHWEST DISTRICT - NORTH REGION

Franklin Co.
D&M Plumbing, LLC Iler Enterprises Construction Buildet, Inc
Prevailing| Maint. | Prevailing Maint. | Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate Wage % Wage % Rate Wage % Rate
0.00%| $ 35.00 60.00%| S  60.00 75.00% 32.00
0.00%| S 35.00 60.00%| $  60.00 90.00% 35.00
0.00%| $ 35.00 60.00%| S  60.00 90.00% 35.00
0.00%| S 35.00 60.00% 60.00 75.00% 32.00

Performance
Bond Mark-up

Yellow is first vendor.

-nd vendor (contingent).




CARPENTRY SERVICES BID TABULATION
SOUTHWEST DISTRICT - WEST REGION

Friga Construction Franklin Co. Webster Co.

ller Enterprises Company, Inc. Buildet, Inc Construction Excavating
Prevailing Maint. | Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing| Maint. Prevailing | Maint.

Wage % Rate Wage % Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate

BARRY COUNTY

No Bid

0.00%| $ 45.00 60.00%| S 60.00 85.00%| S 45.00

BARTON
COUNTY 0.00%

No Bid

45.00 60.00%| S 55.00 85.00%| S 45.00

CEDAR COUNTY $

0.00% 45.00 35.00%| S 46.00

50.00%| $ 55.00 85.00%| S 45.00

DADE COUNTY

45.00 35.00%| S 46.00 50.00%| $ 55.00 85.00%| S 45.00

0.00%

JASPER COUNTY
90.00%| S 35.00 60.00%| S 58.00 85.00%| S 45.00

0.00% 45.00

LAWRENCE
COUNTY 0.00%
NEWTON
COUNTY 0.00%

McDONALD
COUNTY 0.00%
VERNON
COUNTY 0.00%

% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies
Performance

Bond Mark-up

45.00 90.00%| S  35.00 50.00%| S 55.00 85.00%| S 45.00

No Bid 60.00%| S 60.00 85.00%| S 45.00

45.00

No Bid 60.00%| S 60.00 85.00%| S  45.00

45.00

60.00%

45.00 60.00 85.00% 45.00

Yellow is first vendor.

-nd vendor (contingent).



CARPENTRY SERVICES BID TABULATION
SOUTHWEST DISTRICT - EAST REGION

Friga Construction Franklin Co. Webster Co.
ller Enterprises Company, Inc. Construction Buildet, Inc Excavating
Prevailing Maint. | Prevailing| Maint. | Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate Wage % Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Rate

CHRISTIAN
COUNTY 0.00%| S 45.00

50.00%| S 58.00 No Bid 85.00%| S 45.00

DAL
ALLAS COUNTY 45.00

0.00% 50.00%| S 58.00 No Bid 85.00%| S 45.00

GREENE COUNTY

0.00% 45.00 50.00%| S 58.00 90.00%| S 35.00 85.00%| S 45.00

HICKORY COUNTY

0.00% 45.00 50.00%| S 58.00 90.00%| S 35.00 85.00%| S 45.00

POLK COUNTY

0.00% 45.00 50.00%| S 58.00 90.00%| S 35.00 85.00%| S 45.00

STONE COUNTY

0.00% 45.00 60.00%| S 60.00 No Bid 85.00%| S 45.00

TANEY COUNTY

0.00% 45.00 60.00%| S  60.00 No Bid 85.00%| S 45.00

WEBSTER COUNTY

0.00% 45.00 50.00% 55.00 No Bid 85.00% 45.00

% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies 0.00%
Performance

Bond Mark-up 0.00%

Yellow is first vendor.

-nd vendor (contingent).



DOUGLAS COUNTY

HOWELL COUNTY

OREGON COUNTY

OZARK COUNTY

SHANNON COUNTY

TEXAS COUNTY

WRIGHT COUNTY

% Mark-up for
Parts/Supplies

CARPENTRY SERVICES BID TABULATION
SOUTHEAST DISTRICT - WEST REGION

Pertormance
Bond Mark-up

Yellow is first vendor.

-nd vendor (contingent).

Franklin Co. Friga Construction Webster Co.
Iler Enterprises Construction Company, Inc. Excavating
Prevailing Maint. | Prevailing| Maint. | Prevailing| Maint. | Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate Wage % Rate Wage % Wage % Rate
0.00% 45.00 50.00%| $ 55.00 85.00%| S 45.00
0.00% 45.00 85.00%| S 45.00
0.00% 45.00 No Bid 85.00%| S 45.00
0.00% 45.00 No Bid 85.00%| S 45.00
0.00% 45.00 No Bid 85.00%| S 45.00
0.00% 45.00 No Bid 85.00%| S 45.00
0.00% 45.00 85.00% 45.00




CARPENTRY SERVICES BID TABULATION
SOUTHEAST DISTRICT - SOUTH REGION

Franklin Co.
ller Enterprises Construction
Prevailing Maint. | Prevailing| Maint.

Wage % Rate Wage %

BUTLER COUNTY
0.00%

S 45.00

CARTER COUNTY
0.00%

45.00

DUNKLIN COUNTY

0.00%

45.00

MISSISSIPPI COUNTY
0.00%

45.00

NEW MADRID COUNTY
0.00%

45.00

PEMISCOT COUNTY
0.00%

45.00

RIPLEY COUNTY
0.00%

45.00

SCOTT COUNTY 0.00%

45.00

STODDARD COUNTY
0.00%

45.00

WAYNE COUNTY

0.00%

% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies
Performance Bond

Mark-up

45.00

Yellow is first vendor.

-nd vendor (contingent).



CARPENTRY SERVICES BID TABULATION
SOUTHEAST DISTRICT - NORTH REGION

ller Enterprises
Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate

BOLLINGER
COUNTY 0.00%| S 45.00

CAPE GIRARDEAU
COUNTY 0.00%| S 45.00

IRON COUNTY 0.00%| $ 45.00

MADISON
COUNTY 0.00%| S 45.00

PERRY COUNTY 0.00%| $ 45.00

REYNOLDS

COUNTY 0.00%| S 45.00

ST. FRANCIOUS

COUNTY 0.00%| $ 45.00
STE. GENEVIEVE

COUNTY 0.00%

% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies
Performance

Bond Mark-up

45.00

Yellow is first vendor.
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