. 'DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:

Computer

PRICING PGE BYCOUNTY _

Columnf

District . - County

County Seat

- City orTown. .

Prevallmg Wage -
Hourly Rate o
Multlpller

Col_ung
Moblllzatlon . _' E

Smgle sate

Column 3
Mob:lazatlon
- Site-to- s:te

¢ |Boone Coiumbla b/ X

¢ |callaway Fulton /. /% g ,25 00 §ASC0
¢ |Camden Camdenton 1. /253560 3500
¢ |cole Jefferson City L 2575y S~ 2S.C0
¢ |Cooper Boonille a __[% $34 79 183479
C |crawlord  [Steelvie L LZ $FPE 76 3SR
¢ |Dent Szlem _L _Z__g_ $76.5Y §449.87
¢ [Gasconade  {Hermamn L. 12 $49.87 183 79
¢ [Howard Fayatte _2_ _L_ $76 - 317/& $3 ‘21” -7 (?
¢ [Laclede l.ebanon _L AN $4Cf %7 B3 ‘L/' ) ?
¢ [Maries Vienna _L_Lg SY9-87 183479
¢ [Willer Tuscurnbia L /Z 345l 5$3¢-79
¢ |Moniteau Calfornia _L_,_Lg A5 GV s34 79
¢ |Morgan Versailles L L& s4/9 87 |83 79
¢ |osage Linn J /& 2500 §$3479
C  |Phelps Rolla L (¥ |49€¥7 13333
¢ |Pulaski Wayresvile L AR 74 54 (12479
¢ IWashington  [Potosi /¥ $/23 S s £9.€7
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'.':'_':._.'_:::IZ).ATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: Computer Cable Connections

-7 Column 1 ' e S s

L e _.P_(evaiiing'Wage_'} LG o0 Column3

“."County Seat -+ Hourly Rate " Mobilizati¢ " Mobilization <
L Cityor Town . - Multiplier - """ Singlessite. .~~~ Site-to-site "~ Sl

Harrisonville § 70.°
Ke |Clay Linerty o [§ N PN
K¢ |Jackson Indapsndencs ,______) $ ) § }
Kc iJohnson Warrensburg . / $ / § f
Ke |Lafayette Lexington __‘___K_ $ ( [ \
Ke  |Pettis Sedalla ,_.,__._.)_ $ \ $ )
KC |Piatte Piatle Cly AT 4
KC |Ray Ricrmend _{ s £ s |
ke |Saline Marshall __X_ 5 N $ )

9-110701A - Addendum 002
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IFB  9-1107/01A, DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: Computer Cable Connectlon_é;-
PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY 5

Column1 E : )
. L : PrevallmgWage Colung s
o T A C_ount_ySeat ) te. ;o]
District - County - .- Gity or Town' - .- Multiplier - - -
Adair Kirksvllle

NE  |Audrain Mexico $ § TN
NE |[Clark Kahoka $ $ /
NE tKnox Edina $ $ /

NE |Lewis Montiello . $ 3 ( :

NE [Lincoln Troy — A_ § \ $ \
NE |Macon Macon _____,Z__ $ \ § \
NE |Marion Palmyra _,L $ J § )
NE [Monroe Parig __,__(_ $ / $ /
NE |Monfgomery  |Montgamery City _ﬁx___ $ / $ /
NE |Plke Bowling Green _._l_ § ( $ /

NE |Ralls New London ___,L § \ § \

NE |Randolph Hurisville _(_____ $ \ $ \
NE |Schuyler Lancaster ____\'__ 18 } § )
NE |Scotiand Memphis ___,); $ / $ /
NE |Shelby Sheloyvile L s I (

NE |Warren Warranton A $ > $ D

9-110701A - Addendum 002
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IFB 9-110701A-, _DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: Computer Cable Connections
T R ICING PAGE BY COUNTY

: Column 1~ i : e o
Prevailing Wage ~ ~* Column2. ' Column3 .- [

BTN _ Co . HourlyRate - Mobilization « :  Mobilization - *
| District-~ County., - City or.Tol . Singlesite > Sitetowsite -

Bollinger

SE  [Butler Popler Bluff PN T 8 TN
SE Jackson .H_....__,Z‘ $ j .

SE |Carter Van Buran e _L_
8E [Pouglas Ava ,____L___
SE {Dunklin Kennett ____A_
$E |Howeli West Plalns ____L
SE (lron Irontan . _L

SE  [Madison Frederickiown \ L
8  {Mississippi Charleston
SE [NewMadrd  [New Madrd
SE  [Oregon Alton

/"—_‘H\

L]

"]

]

]

=]

SE |Ozark Gainesvills

SE |Pemiscot Caruthersyile - L__
SE |Pemry Perryville __[___
8E {Reynolds Centerviie _L________
$E |Ripley Boriphan _L_
SE jScoft Bentan ._..__,¥.
SE |Shannon Eminence __A_
SE |St Francois Farmington __j_
SE |Ste. Genevieve [Ste Genevieve _— _L__

8E |Stoddard Bloomfsld Vi

SE [Texas Housten- - - - t .

SE [Wayne Greenville , \ .

SE [wright Hartle - N\

—

L~

o]

/-;--.._,\

| e o o |on fer o Jan [0 Jon | e fen e oo | oo fon (o (25 [

/-\"“//_ﬁ\\
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IFB 9-110701A, DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: Computer Cable Connections
__PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY _

R B Column1 | B 5 e

evailing Wage - Column 2’

Hourly Rate. .~ Mobilization
City orTown .- Multipfier .. - Single-site’

Andrew Savannah

Nw |Atchison Rock Port e
NW  1Buchanan S, Joseph — _j_
NW  {Galdwell Kingston ol
Nw  [Carroll Carroltton __(___
NW  |Chariton Keytesvile m&_
NW |Clinton Platisburg .\
NW |Daviess Gallgtin . _}_ :
NW  {DeKalb Maysville . ,,L
NW  |Gentry Albany — _L

$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
NW  |Grundy Trenton - - ____,_\___ $
X
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$

NW |Harrison Bethany - - - ____M_A___
MW |Hott Oregon - o _1_ 3
NW |Linn Linneus -+ - i _[__
NW |Livingston  |Chilicothe VAR
NW |Mercer Princeton __{___
N  |Nodaway Maryville _\____
NW Putnam Unlonyifle ____\__
NW [Sullivan Wi A

NW  [Worth Grani City . /
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IFB 9-110701A, DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: Computer Cable Conneﬁc'tuﬁ_r"{g_".'___
_PRICING PAGEBYCOUNTY

..;Coiumn'l..:- ! R

T " Prevailing Wage Column2~ - Column3 .

M i County Seat - " Mobilization- - Mobilization -
District . County - - CityorTown’ " " * Multiplier - . - Single-site." - .. Site-to-site- . ¥
Barry
SW |Barton Lamar TN B

SW |Bates Bltler __mj___ $ )

Cassville

i
18

$

$
$W iBenton Warsaw _/_ $ / §
SW [Cedar Stockion ___L________, $ / $ /
SWw |Christian Ozark ____l_ $ ( $ /
sw |Dade Greenfield _____/____ 8 \ $ :
W |Dallas Buffalo __(___ $ \ 1y
SW |Greane Springfieid _S‘_ § \ $
8w |Henry Clinen _____}_ $ $ \
swW |Hlckory Hermitage — L $ $ \
8w [Jasper Carthage _{__ [; [; ]
8W |Lawrence Maunt Vernan ,,____&____ $ $ /
SW [McDonald  |Pinevlle .\ _Is $
Sw |Newton Neosho e _L $ 5
sW |Polk Bolivar VAR $ o\ -
SW [St Clair QOscaola _____\‘_ $ / $§ \ ]
sw [Stone Galena ,,____)_ $ $ i '
sW [Taney Forsyth _L $ $ I
sw [|Vemnon Nevada ___L__ $ ] \
sw |Webster Iarshileld .,.._,..,.:.._.. $ $ \

Aee. ANUE | | :
Ade.  SAME f
freS
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NETWORKING- INSIDE: Computer Cable Connections

_PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

R ~ - Colummd B
. Prevailing Wage . Column2 """

S . - County Séa s "Hourly Rate . -'_M_ol_)ilization_-'
f District .~ County. - CityorTown > "~ Multiplier .- .- - Single-site

Franklin Washingfon -~ - . GRD $/$ﬁ‘t’ ,
STL |Jefferson Hillsbero T Y = § N
8TL |St. Charles 8¢, Charles - o
STL |St. Louis Clayton ___\r~

STL |[St. Louis City  |St. Louis £

/
BN AN

9-110701A - Addendum 002
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IFB 9-110/01A,

District

County

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:

R.F.

Fisher

Electric Company, Inc.

PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Column 1

County Seat
City or Town

Prevailing Wage
Hourly Rate
Multiplier

Column 2
Mobilization -
Single-site

Materials
Column 3
Mobilization - 1.10

Site-to-site

¢ |Boone Columbia el $ $

¢ |Callaway Fulton el - T $

¢ |Camden Camdenton 1§ T §
¢ iCole Jefferson City el "' $ 7
¢ [Cooper Boonville 4 BE |5 loo s 7§
¢ |Crawford Steelville P | 1 - 5§~
¢ |Dent Salem e |- - $ -
¢ |Gasconade Mermann PR S $ -
¢ |Howard Fayette R |- - $ —
C |Laclede Lebanon I | 1 —— $ -
¢ [Maries Vienna I -+ e $ .
c |Miller Tuscumbia — |8 o $ -
¢ |Meoniteau California L T |8 - $ .
C [Morgan Versailles 4 68 |s foo $ 75
¢ |Osage Linn R | - $ -
¢ |Phelps Rolla P $ =
¢ |Pulaski Waynesvilie el — $ —
¢ |Washington  [Potosi s - $ —

9-110701A ~ Addendum 002
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IFB 9-110701A, DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: R.F. Fisher Electric  Company, Inc.
PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Column 1
Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column 3
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -
District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
KC [Cass Harrisonville 4L . 0% | 115 s &5
KC [Clay Liberty d_ 6% s 75 $ S
KC [Jackson Independence _[___.QE_ $ T S $ L 5
KC [Johnson Warrensourg i .08 s Is $ L5
KC |Lafayette Lexington I . 0% s 1S s 65
KC |Pettis Sedalia . e% s 19 $ (S
KC |Platte Platte City 1. 08 s 15 $ {95
KC |Ray Richmond . o3 |s 15 s (5
KC [Saline Marshall 108 s 15 $ S
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IFB 9-110/01A,

DATA NETWORKING-
PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

INSIDE:

T

R.F.

Fisher

Electric

Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column 3
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mohilization -
District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
NE |Adair Kirksville s - $ -
NE [Audrain Mexico e | R $ —
NE [Clark Kahoka s = $ -
NE [Knox Edina - . § o~ $ T
NE [Lewis Monticello e $ -
NE |[Lincoln Troy T | — $ —
NE [Macon Macon == |$ e $§
NE [Marion Palmyra T |- — $ -
NE |Monroe Paris s — $ -
NE |Montgomery Montgomery City P — $ -
NE |Pike Bowling Green R | — $ —
NE |Ralls New London - s 5 -
NE |Randoiph Huntsville o | - $
NE |Schuyler Lancaster s - $ —
NE |Scotfand Memphis Bl R | - $ -—
NE [Shelby Shelbyville R | - $ =
NE {Warren Warrenton e T $ -

9-110701A - Addendum 002
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IFB 9-110/01A,

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:

PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

R.F. Fisher

Electric

Column 1
Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column 3
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -
District County City or Town Muitiplier Single-site Site-to-site
NW |Andrew Savannah At .20 s Ise s 15
NW  |Atchison Rock Port 4 .20 5 [Iso s 7S
NW  [Buchanan St. Joseph A .20 s JSO 5 TS
NW  [Caldwell Kingston 1 .0 s (S0 $s TS
NW [Carroll Carroliton A 20 s /8o $ 1S
NW  [Chariton Keytesville A 20 s fso $ TS
NW  [Clinton Plattsburg .20 s [Ss s TS
NW |Daviess Gallatin P10 s ISso $ 1S
NW [DeKalb Maysville ! 2o s iso s 1S
NW [Genfry Albany P20 s ‘s> s 1S
Nw  |Grundy Trenton 1,20 5 /So $ 1S
NW |Harrison Bethany L. 20 s /So s TS
NW |Holt Oregon 1,20 |s /580 s 1S
NW [Linn Linneus P 20 |5 iSO s 1S
NW |Livingston Chillicothe :i_ 20 s (SO $ 1S
NW |Mercer Princeton i .20 |5 180 $ 15
NW  |Nodaway Maryville P28 s fSo $ 1S
NW |Putnam Unionville I 20 |5 IS0 s TS
NW |Sullivan Milan {20 s /so s 1S
NW |Worth Grant City _in__ 25 s /S0 s 1S

9-110701A - Addendum 002
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IFB 9-110/01A,

9-110701A - Addendum 002

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: R.F. Fisher Electric Company,

PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Column 1
Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column 3
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mebilization -

District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site

SE |Bollinger Marble Hil P | $ p

SE |Butler Poplar Bluf N s s/

SE ' Jackson _m_j} $ $ /

SE |[Carter Van Buren . \ $ $ /

SE [Douglas Ava — \ $ $ //

SE  [Dunklin Kennett _____;\_\ $ $

SE [Howell VWest Plains — \§ f/ $

SE [lron Ironton e $\ / $

SE [Madison Fredericktown P | %\ / $

SE [Mississippi Charleston T | \/ $

SE |New Madrid New Madrid - s ,/ \\ $

SE |[Oregon Alton eI / \ $

SE |Ozark Gainesville I /’ \ $

SE |Pemiscot Caruthersville i ,3{ %\z\ $

SE |Perry Perryville e / $ $

SE [Reynolds Centerville — $ §\

SE |Ripley Doniphan :_ ___,f;_ $ $ {\

SE [Scott Berton e _/___ $ $ \\

SE |Shannon Eminence R / $ $ \

SE |St. Francois Farmington __Zf__.,_. $ $

SE [Ste. Genevieve |Ste, Genevieve /" -———,— 15 5 \

SE |Stoddard Bloomfield {___,_ M ] $

SE (Texas Houston —— 15 $

SE [Wayne Greenville —— ¥ $

SE [Wright Hartville e |5 $

Inc.

N/A
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IFB 9-110/01A,

8-110701A - Addendum 002

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:
PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

County Seat

R.F.

Column 1

Pravailing Wage

Hourly Rate

Fisher

Electric

Column 2
Mobilization -

Company,

Column 3
Mobilization -

District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
STL |Frankiin Washington o S 3
STL |Jefferson Hillsbore . $ $
STL [StCharles  |St Charles P s
STL |St Louis Clayton s $
STL |5t Louis City |St Louis I $

Inc.
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IFB 9-110701A,

County Seat

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:
PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

R.F.

Column 1

Prevailing Wage

Hourly Rate

Fisher

Column 2
Mobilization -

Electric

Company,

Column 3

Mobiization -

District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
SW |Bamy Cassville - $ } $

Sw [Barten Lamar ____;""_“_‘__’j’__: $ ' $

SWw  |Bates Butler L IS s 75 $ 756
sw [Benton Warsaw 4 IS s 7S 8 1S
SW [Cedar Stockton I | 1 $ H
SW |Christian |Ozark = s |
Sw |Dade Greenfield R $ %\
sw |Dallas Buffalo Rt $ :
SW [Greene Springfield I $

SW [Henry Clinton 4 13 Is TS $ 795
SW [Hickery Hermitage e $ $

Sw |Jasper Carthage PP S $

SW [Lawrence Mount Vemon T L $

Sw  |McDonald Pineville ML $

Sw  |Newton Neosho N $

sw [Polk Bolivar Il | 3

SW St Clair Osceola Il S | % $

SW |Stone Galena T 1 $

SW {Taney Forsyth e~ 18 l 5

sw |Vernen Nevada I | } 3

SW [Wehster Marshfield P $

8-110701A - Addendum 002
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IFB 9-110/01A,

District County

DATA NETWORKING-

PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Column 1

County Seat
City or Town

INSIDE:

Prevailing Wage

Hourly Rate
Multiplier

P & D Electric,

Column 2
Mobilization -
Single-site

Inc.

Column 3
Mobilization -
Site-to-site

Boone Columbia . [ K3
c |Callaway Fulton e s 35000 ¢ 300,00
¢ |Camden Camdenton __ 179 |s  350.00 $  300.00
C |Cole Jefferson City 179 s 350.00 s 300.00
¢ |Cooper Boonville _ 157 § 35000 3 300.00
¢ |Crawford Steelville 179 § 45000 ¢ 300.00
¢ |Dent Salem 179 § 45000 |  300.00
¢ |Gasconade Hermann 179 g 450.00 §  300.00
¢ |Howard Fayette 178 $§ 35000 [¢ 300.00
C [Laclede Lebanon 1.8 $ 350.00 s  300.00
C [Maries Vienna __ 79 _ |s 35000 |§ 300.00
c  |Miller Tuscumbia _ 179 s 350.00 s 300.00
C |Moniteau California 179 $ 35000 |§ 200.00
¢ [Morgan Versailles 174 s 47500 |§  300.00
¢ |Osage Linn __t7e  lg  450.00 $  200.00
¢ |Phelps Rolla 1.7 § 45000 [s  200.00
C  |Pulaski Waynesville __1.83 __ |g 400.00 $ 300.00
¢ |Washington  |Potos: LA $ 47500 [g  300.00

9-110701A - Addendum 002
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IFB 9-110701A, DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: P & D Electric, Inc.

PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Column 1
Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column 3
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -

District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
KC |[Cass Harrisonville . $ 3
KC [Clay Liberty I | $
KC [Jackson Independence _:___ $ $
KC |Johnson Warrensburg —e I8 $
KC [|Lafayeite Lexingtan I |- $
Kc |Pettis Sedalia I8 $
KC |Platte Platte City ——— 15 $
KC |Ray Richmond —_I5 $
KC |Saline Marshall e s $
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IFB 9-110701A, DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: P & D Electric, Inc.
PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Column 1

Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column 3
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -

District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
NE |Adair Kirksville 167 $§ 30000 s 300.00
NE [Audrain Mexico __ 179 |s 850,00 | 350.00
NE |Clark Kahoka 167 § 30000 [¢  300.00
NE |Knox Edina _ 167 $ 80000 g  300.00
NE |Lewis Monticelio _ 167 s 30000 s 300.00
NE |Lincoln Troy _1re s  375.00 |[¢ 35000
NE {Macon Macon _1e7 $§ 250.00 g  250.00
NE |Marion Palmyra 187 ls 15000 I 150.00
NE [Monroe Paris 167 $ 25000 |§  250.00
NE |Montgomery |MontgomeryCity | ___ 1.87 _ ls  250.00 $ 250.00
NE |Pike Bowling Green 187 _|s 150.00 [§  150.00
NE [Ralls New London _1e7 $ 15000 [$  150.00
NE |Randolph Huntsville __ 157 __ |s 20000 |s  300.00
NE |Schuyler Lancaster __ 1867  |s 300.00 $  300.00
NE [Scotiand Memphis _:1._67 . |s 3700 |s 35000
NE |Shelby Shelbyville 187 lg 25000 |§  250.00
NE [Warren Warrenton 179 s 400.00 [ 350.00
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IFB 9-110/01A, DATA N.ETWORKING— INSIDE:

P & D Electric,

PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Inc.

Column 1
Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column 3
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -
District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
NW [Andrew Savannah . $ $
NW jAtchison Rock Port P $
NW |Buchanan St, Joseph R $
NwW [Caldwell Kingsten e I5 $
NW [Carroll Carollton R $
NW [Chariton Keytesville ——— 5 S
Nw (Clinton Plattsburg ———— I8 $
NW |Daviess Gallatin s $
Nw (DeKalb Maysville I $
NW |Gentry Albany — s $
NW |Grundy Trenton —— I8 $
Nw |Harrison Bethany ——e 15 $
Nw |Holt Oregon e Is $
NwW |Linn Linneus JE, | $
NW |Livingston Chillicothe ___w:_,,__ $ $
NW iMercer Princeton P $
NW |Nodaway Maryville —t 15 $
Nw [Putnam Unionville PR $
Nw  |Sullivan Milan — I $
NW |Worth Grant City R - $
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IFB 9-110/01A,

9-110701A - Addendum 002

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: P & D Electric,
PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Column 1
Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column 3
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -
District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
SE |Bollinger Marble Hill $ $
SE |Butler Poplar Bluff T $
SE Jackson —_ 15 $
SE |Carter Van Buren I8 $
SE |Douglas Ava B 5
SE  [Dunklin Kennett I $
SE [Howell \West Plains . Is ]
SE |Iron [ronton P 5
SE  |Madison Fredericktown N 3
SE  [|Mississippi Charleston P | S
SE |New Madrid New Madrid P | $
SE |Oregon Alton |8 $
SE |Ozark Gainesville — |8 $
SE  |Pemiscot Caruthersville P | $
SE |Perry Perryville w1 $
SE lReynoIds Centerville - I5 $
SE fRipley Doniphan .....:....... $ $
SE |Scoft Benton - I5 $
SE {Shannon Eminence |5 $
SE |St. Francois Farmington A $
SE |Ste. Genevieve |Ste, Genevieve R |3 $
SE |Stoddard Bloomfield - 1s $
SE |Texas Houston e is ]
SE [Wayne Greenville . Is $
SE  |Wright Hartville ——— 18 $

Inc.
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IFB 9-110701A, DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:
PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

9-110701A - Addendum 002

P & D Electric,

Inc.

Column 1
Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column 3
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -

District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
STL |Franklin Washington . $ $
STL |Jeffersen Hillsharo ] $ $
STL |St Charles St. Charles ] $ $
STL |[St. Louis Clayion $ $
STL |St. Louis City  |St. Louis ) $ $



hanksc4
Typewritten Text
IFB 9-110701A, DATA NETWORKING – INSIDE: P & D Electric, Inc.


IFB 9-110701A, DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: P & D Electric, Inc.
PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Column 1
Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column 3
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -
District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
sw |Bamy Cassvile . $ $
Sw [Barton Lamar —a e Is $
SW |Bates Butler I - $
SW |Benton Warsaw ———— 5 $
SW |[Cedar Stockton R -1 $
sw |Christian Ozark —— |5 $
SW |Dade Greenfield ——— 15 $
sw [Dallas Buffalo e Is $
SW |Greene Springfield e 5 3
SW |Henry Clintor: e s $
sw  |Hickory Hermitage ——— 15 $
SW [|Jasper Carthage I - S
SW {Lawrence Mount Vernon P - $
SW |McDonald Pineville I -1 $
SW |Newton Neosho ——— 15 $
sw [Polk Bolivar N $
SW |St. Clair Osceola —r I8 $
SW [Stone Galena — 15 $
SW [Taney Forsyth P, $
SW [Vernon Nevada I | $
SW [Webster Marshfield —— |5 $
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IFB 9-110701A,

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:

Reinhold

PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Electric,

Inc.

Column 1

Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column 3
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -

District County City or Town ‘Muitiplier Single-site Site-to-site

¢ |Boone Columbia . $ 194,76 |8

¢ [callaway Fultor L .30 s 194.70 |8 &£4.7%
¢ [Camden Camdenton L .30 |8 284 85 |8 £4.79
¢ [Cole Jefferson City 130 s 194,78 s 54,99
¢ |Cooper Boonville L 30 8 2 HO 8 5T, 00
¢ |Crawford Steelville 20 |5 194,70 Is BY,7G
¢ |Dent Salem L3 s 5’;{){,,?? § SY.G2
¢ |Gasconade Hermann A3 s ngq 76 s 59 37?
¢ [Howard Fayette f .30 s g54.55 |s 54,79
¢ |Laclede Lebanon {30 s 4745 I8 49.37
¢ [|Maries Vienna i3 $ 194 7T |s 54,79
¢ |Miller Tuscumbia L 30 s A5 sn s sY G
¢ |Moniteau California L 30 s Gt s mY A
¢ |Morgan Versailles L.30 s wpvi0 I8 590
C_|osage Linn L 20 s G 8 5YTY
C  |Phelps Rolla L. 30 s (9470 s 5¢.7%
¢ |Pulaski Waynesville .30 s 195,50 s 52.7710
C |Washington  |Potosi VAN (v I |- J7 57 § A '79»?

2-110701A - Addendum 002
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Reinhold

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:

PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

IFB 9-110/01A, Electric, Inc.

9-110701A - Addendum 002

Column 1
Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column 3
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -
District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
Ke |Cass Hamrisonville {20 s oL s 5%
KC [Clay Liberty L300 8 G0 s s5Ysp
KG lJackson independence L3018 49750 5 5%.10
KC |Johnson Warrensburg L 30 8 97.% 15 59.46
KC |Lafayette Lexington B0 s g9 gy s .00
KC |Pettis Sedalia {30 s <o 66 s 59.10
KC |Platte Platte City 1. 30 s £07m s =9 0
KC |Ray Richmond L3230 s 49750 8 5940
KG |Saline Marshall L3¢ s dndep s 590
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IFB 9-110/701A,

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:

Reinhold

PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Electric, '

Column 1
Prevailing Wage Colurnn 2 Column 3
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -
District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
NE |Adair Kirksville .30 s 4Epn.8718 538
NE |Audrain Mexico ! 36 s 194,78 18 54.79
NE |Clark Kahoka L 30 s 345G m |8 5305
NE [Knox Edina L 20 s 35y s 5B
NE |Lewis Monticello ___j___ﬁ(p_ $ 2,004 s 5
NE_|Lincoln Troy L.30 s 5% 8 5797
NE _|Macon Macon _L.38 s 3b% 414 |s 535
NE |Marion Palmyra L. 30 I8 19776 |8 53.i5
NE |Monroe Paris L300 s 3554 |8 53,08
NE |Montgomery  |Montgomery City 30 s {?‘7 Ve |8 5815
NE [Pike BowlingGreen | _ [ 30 Is i§7. 76 18 43.15
NE [Ralls New Loncon L3O 8T s 55
NE [Randolph Hunsville 1 .30 s 5455 8 5979
NE |Schuyler Lancaster L. 30 |8 45T 0.5 |8 5315
NE |Scotland Memphis L .30 s 45h,55 |5 53, 5
NE [Shelby Shelbyville A .30 s394 |5 3345
NE |Warren Warrenton 30 s 45,99 I8 S1.97

9-110701A - Addendum 002
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IFB 9-110/01A,

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:

PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Column 1
Prevailing Wage

County Seat

Hourly Rate

Reinhold

Column 2
Mobilization -

Electric,

Inc.

Column 3
Mobilization -

District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
Andrew Savanngh § S0 757 |8 S5 oY
NW  [Atchison Rock Port L. 20 Jgﬂ $ G |8 5297
NW |Buchanan &t. Joseph /.30 s 5975 |s 5569
NW |Caldwell Kingston 130 |5 gv9.% s smay
NW |Carroll Carroliton 1. 30 8 Yod.b3 |5 59.10
NW  |Chariton Keytesville A 30 s A459.55 s 59.7%
NW  [Clinton Plattsburg {30 s 53%.75 |5 maaY
NW |Daviess Gallatin _ L B0 s 535,75 I8 54,98
NW |DeKalb Maysvile L. 30 s 539.75 I8 53.G9
NW |Gentry Albany 1. 30 s 53975 I8 53.9Y
NW  |Grundy Trenton .20 _|s 5a%.15 s sa.0%
NW {Hamison Bethany S 30 s £9G.95 |8 3.9.6¢
Nw  |Holt Oregon L. 30 s 509,75 s 52.9Y
NW  [Linn Linneus L .30 s 436,50 Is 53,5
NW |Livingston [Chillicothe 30 s Y95 s 50,68
NW |Mercer Pringeton .20 s 53575 I8 59.6Y
NW  [Nodaway Maryville 130 s oo s sp0¢
NW |Putnam Unionville L 30 [s<50,5a3 s 535
NW  Sullivan Milan A .30 s5p,55 s 53,5
NW_[Worth Grant City L .30 s broTo s 52.9%

9-110701A - Addendum 002
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IFB 9-110701A,

9-110701A - Addendum 002

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:
PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Column 1

Reinhold

Electric,

Inc.

Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column 3
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -
District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
SE [Bollinger Marble Hil L 2O 5 dnp Y 8 5767
SE [Butler Poplar Bluff [ 20 s 397597 s 5797
SE_|Guroreloay [ackson L300 s 9¥Y 7618 5797
SE |Carter Van Buren .30 s 006, 3¢ 8§ 57,67
SE |Douglas Ava L 30 s ¢19.G s 49 37
SE  |Dunklin Kennett /.30 18 376 U s 57,97
SE |Howell West Plains L 20 18 4YY .76 I8 Y4937
SE |iron Ironton _L..30 s Job.%¢ s 57.97
SE |Madison Fredericktown L .30 5306697 I8 577.97
SE [Mississippi  {Charleston L 3o 8 30,9 8 5.9
SE |NewMadrid [New Madrd L. 30 Is gobyy 8 57,97
SE |Oregon Alton L. 30 s S9¢ T 18 4T 37
SE {Ozark Gainesville .30 I8 49,9 8 49,39
SE |Pemiscot Cartthersville L300 s 3979 |$ 377,97
SE_|Perry Permyvill .20 I 167,97 s 5797
SE |Reynolds Centerville 130 s 506,97 s 57.47
SE [Ripley Doniphan L 30 839733 15 57,97
SE [Scott Benton .30 s 3066.9Y 8 57.97
SE |Shannon Eminence £ 30 s397. %2 s #%¢.37
SE |St.Francois  [Fzrmington g 30 807,97 |8 51.97
SE |Ste. Genevieve |Ste. Genevieve 430 s 1o7.997 s 57497
SE [Stoddard Bloomfield L 20 s 2852 b osv.99
SE |Texas Houston [ 230 8 2206, 99 8 57 70y
SE  |Wayne Greenville AN Lo - QQ@5§3? $ 5797
SE_|Wright Hartvile L3S s 346.a5 s 99,37
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IFB  9-110701A,

9-110701A - Addendum 002

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:

Reinhold

Electric,

PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY
Column 1
Prevailing Wage ' Column2 Column 3
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization »
District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
Franklin Washington [ .30
STL MWefferson Hillsboro [ .30 s 57,97 s 57.97
STL |St. Charles 5t Charles [ B2 $ 59,97 $ 57,97
STL [St. Louis Clayton (L3¢ s 57,67 |s 57,97
STL [St. Louis City |5t Louis [ 20 s L5787 18 57, i}‘?

Inc.
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DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: Reinhold Inc.

PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Column 1
Prevailing Wage
Hourly Rate

IFB 9-110/01A, Electric,

Column 3
Mobilization -

Column 2
Mobilization -

County Seat

District County City or Town Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
Barry Cassville . 18
sw [Barton Lamar L. 30 08 d¥ags s ¢y.a3
SW |Bates Butler B0 8 sloo 8 SG 0
SW |Benton Warsaw L. 30 4979 I8 590
SW [Cedar Stockton L B0 s il b |8 dY.33
SW [Christian Ozark 20 s 26,95 8 49, 37
SW {Dade Greenfield L 30 |s 4l 0 [$ 99,33
sw |Dallas Buftalo 430 s 3qp.as |8 4937
SW |Greene Springfield 20 s 3¢, a5 |8 49, 37
$W |Henry Clinton 4 .30 s 497.%n s 590
SW [Hickory Hermitage 1 .30 s 246,29 |8 4% 37
SW |Jasper Carthage _/. 30 8 Yil.Bl |8 4%.33
SW |Lawrence Mount Vernon _/L .30 I8 Y Lo s Y 32
SW |McDonald Pineville _ L0 |8 3,35 |8 49,33
SW |Newton Neosho L 20 84,60 |8 99,33
sw |Polk Bolivar /.30 15419 G s #4937
SW  [st. Clair Osceola 1 .30 s 46,30 s 99.9%
SW [Stone Galena 30 s383 90 8 .0
SW_|Taney Forsyth L3018 363 %0 I8 46,10
SW [Vernon Nevada 30 gysgs |8 93,33
SW |Webster Marshfield L B0 |5 346,35 |8 49.37

8-110701A - Addendum 002
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DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:

IFB 9-110701A,

PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Column1 -

L Prevailing Wage Co[umn 2 Colurﬁn:&
- . . ... Counfy Seat . - Hourly Rate E Moblllzation . Mobilization -
District County  CityorTown ' Multiplier - . -Slngle-site .. - .~ Site-to-site . -

C |Boone Columbia .

¢ |[Callaway Fulton 1.5 598 $ (L5
¢ |Camden Camdenton 1.5 s $ (b5
¢ |Cole Jefferson City 1.5 s | 20 $ L5
¢ {Cooper Boonville 5 |s{e3 $ L5
¢ |Crawford Steelville W Y (Y7 $ (5
¢ |Dent Salern .5 s |20 $ L5
¢ |Gasconade Hermrann _l_ 5_ $[p6 $ @5
¢ [Howard Fayelte 1.5 s 163 $ L5
¢ |taclede Lehanon _|5-_ $ AAYE 3 65
¢ |Marles Vienna V.5 599 $ 05
¢ IMiler Tuscurmbia 1.5  [|sl1do A
¢ [Moniteau California _L.5  isle3 $ L5
¢ [Morgan Versailles .5 [s]95 $ (L5
¢ |Osage Linn 1.5 $ 0¢ $ 05
¢ |Phelps Rotla 1.5 I 0{ g $ L5
¢ [Pulaski Waynesville 1.5 812D $ L5
¢ |Washington  {Potosi 1.9 s ,2/ $ o 5

TELEWIRING,

Inc.

Materials
1.10

Multiplier
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(IFB 9-110/01A,

5 :._Ctiunty Seat -

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:

g C&lun}n 1'. T
Prevailing Wage

TELEWIRING,

- ZColumn 3

Inc.

7 g : HourlyRate .~ Mobilization - ) . Mobitization - :

‘District . - County . . CityorTown - - Multiplier --: - - Single-site - "~  Sife-to-site N o 6\5 d,.
KC 1Cass Hairisonvitle I $ i
KC iClay Liberty R, $
Kc [Jackson Independence I $
KC [Johnson Warrenshurg s $
KC iLafayette Lexinglon I $
KC [Pettls Sedalia I - $
Ke [Platte Platte City _ . B $
KC |Ray Richmend . | $
K¢ [Saline Marshall I |- $
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IFB 9-110/01A,

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:

TELEWIRING,

BY COUNTY
Golumn g0 R ST TR
.~ Golumn2 .-~ " Column3 -
e - _ . Mobilization -. .. Mohilization - -
Disirlct ~ County - Singlesite. .- Sitetosite -
Adalr Kirksville .
NE }Audrain Mexico .S s 578 $ 66
NE [Clark Kahoka 1.5 s A5 $L5
NE  [Knox Edina _IL $9\9\g $é5
NE |Lewis Monticello 1S 195 $G5
NE ILincoln Troy _]_5_ $ ,Q/ $GS
NE [Macon Macon __WL_ Qﬂ_ $ XY 565
NE |Marion Palmyra 1.5 ki20 $GH
NE [Monroe Paris 15 s qg $ (06
NE |Montgomery |MomgomeryCity | | . L $ (55 $ é-)5
NE {Pike Bowling Green 1.5 65 $ @5
NE |Ralls New London 1.5 B [‘] 8‘ 5(;5
NE |Randoiph Huntsvile _Li_ $ Qélg $é5
NE |Schuyler Lancaster 15 s 290 $G5H
NE iScotland Memphis _’_i $ 36. 4 36 5
NE |Shelby Shelbyville 1.5 [20% $H5
NE [Warren Warrenton i, "5_ $ Q/ $ @5

Inc.
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IFB 9-110/01A, DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: TELEWIRING, IncC.

" Cotumn 1 L Co
_ Prevailing Wage * " -Column 2 Do Colum__n3

P ._'-:.GounlyS_e_at_ - .HourlyRate .. Mohilization- - Mobilization - _: N 6
3D_istr'ict Gy Coun_ty oo CityorTown: ~ - Multiptier . _S_i_ngle-sile .- Site-to-site O
NW  |Andrew Savannah I | 1 $ T
NW |Atchison Rock Port I $
Nw (Buchanan St Joseph I $
NW [Catdwell Kingston I £ $
Nw |Carroll Carrolilon I | $
NW {Chariton Keytesville I [3
NwW [Clinton Plattsburg I | $
NW |Paviess Gallatin I ¢ $
NW |DeKalb Maysvilla R | 5
NW |Gentry Albany P | $
NW [Grundy Trenton P - $
NW |Harrison Bethany T $
NW |Holt Cregon I $
Nw  {Linn Linneus R | $
Nw {Livingston Chillicothe . |s 3
NW [Mercer Princeton N $
Nw  |Nodaway tMaryville . - $
NW |Putham Unionville R - $
NW  {Sullivan Milan $ $

$ $

NW Worth Grant City



hanksc4
Typewritten Text

hanksc4
Typewritten Text
IFB 9-110701A, DATA NETWORKING – INSIDE: TELEWIRING, Inc.


- 9-110701A, - DATA NETWORKING-_INSIDE: TELEWIRING,

Coluwmn1 P

PrevailingWage Column2 ' Column3

S " County Seat . HourlyRate - . Mobilization- - "Mobitization - -

District  ~County - .- CityorTown. .~ Multiplier . . > Single-site .. Site-to-site

Bollinger Marble Hill . s o $ L5
SE |Butler Poplar Biuff | 5 $ ,9/’ $ 65
s€  |CapeSivavanackson 1.5 s o $ o5
SE {Carter Yan Buren ! . 5 $ &~ $ é5

SE |Douglas Ava .5 s ;LO(& $ 65
SE |Punkiin Kennett . _5_ $ _,9/’ $ 635
SE |Howell West Plains 1.5 Q293 $ L5
SE |lron Ironton 1.5 s $ L5

SE [Madison Fredericktown 1. _5_ § £ $ {},5
SE  [Mississippi Charleston 1. _5_ § ,@/ $ L5
SE |NewMadrid  |New Madrid 1.5 e s L5
SE {Oregon Alton 1.5 $m $ 65
SE [Ozark Gainesville . _L $ 294 $ b5
SE |Pemiscot Caruthersville _|_L $ ,g- $ 65
st |Perry Perryville .5 |s.& $ b5
SE  |Reynolds Centervilla 1.5 s & $ 65
SE |Ripley Deniphan . 5 $ &~ $ [95

SE |Scott Benton 1.5 Is.e $ 5
SE  |Shannon Eminence 1.5 [sa2% $ L5
SE |[St Francois  |Farmington L5 s V- $ 5
SE [Ste. Genevieve Ste. Genevieve _|_ __E_____ $ ,@" $ é 5
SE |Stoddard Bloomficld .5 e $ 5
SE |[Texas Houston Ry _5__ $292 $ & 5
SE wayne Greenville 1.5 ke $ é)s
SE |Wright Hartville 1.5 529> $ Lo

Inc.
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IFB 9-110/701A,

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:

TELEWIRING,

Y - " Column 1 I _ :
D e - Prevaiting Wage . --Column 2 Column3
BT .- County Seat - - Houwrly Raté _ - Mobilization- - - Mobilization - -
:District . County .. ~CityorTown - - " Multiplier . .~ Single-site  Site-tosite -
Frankiin Washington ) s o
STL |Jefferson Hillsboro L5 $ O s L5
STL [St.Charles  [St Charles .5 $ O $ (05
STL |St. Louis Clayton .5 s o $ (D
STL [St. Louls City |St. Louis .5 s o $ (L5

Inc.
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DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:

OUNTY

IFB 9-110/01A, TELEWIRING, Inc.

PRICING PAGE BY C

Cdluin_n1 S
revalling Wage ~~  Column2 "'
ourly Rate - - Mobilization -

.- City or Town. .

‘District  County

Multiplier -~ - Single-site . """ Siteto-site - .
Sw |Barry Cassville s $ NO 6 ‘OL
sW [Barton Lamar R | 3
SW [Bates Butfer I $
SW |Benton Warsaw I $
Sw iCedar Stockton s $
SW [Christlan Ozark s $
SW |Pade Greenfield P | $
sw |Dallas Buffato . Is $
SW |Greene Springfield R $
sw IHenry Clinton P £ $
Sw [Hickory Hermitage R | $
SwW [Jasper Carthage I $
sw |Lawrence {Mount Vernon R - $
sW |McDonald Pineville [ | $
SW  iNewton Neosho I $
Sw [Polk Bolivar R $
sw  [St. Clair Oscecla T | $
Sw [Stone Galena T | $
sw [Taney torsyth R | §
sw [Vernon Nevada eI $
SW  |Webster Marshfield I $
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IFB 9-110701A, DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: TSI, Technology Solutions, Inc.
PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Column 1

Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column3 Materials Multiplier
County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -

District!  County CityorTown  Multiplier Single-site  Site-to-site 1.09

¢ |Boone Columbia 1.47 $219.56 $35.00
C |Callaway Fulton 147 |$172.51 535.00
C |Camden Camdenton 147 $627.30 $ 35.00
C |Cole Jefferson City 1.47 $235.24 $ 35.00
C |Cooper Boonville 1.29 $306.90 $35.00
C |Crawford Steelville 1.31 $156.83 $35.00
¢ |Dent Salem 131 $253.99 $ 35.00
¢ |Gasconade Hermann 131 $156.83 $ 35.00
¢ |Howard Fayette 131 $313.65 3 35.00
¢ [Laclede Lebanon 1.31 $ 397.58 $35.00
¢ [Maries Vierna 1.31 $235.24 $35.00
c  [Miller Tuscumbia 1.3 $345.02 $35.00
¢ |Moniteau Califormnia 131 $313.65 $ 35.00
¢ [Morgan Versailles 1.31 $376.38 $35.00
C |{Osage Linn 1.29 $187.55 $ 35.00
C _ {Phelps Rolla 147 $188.19 $ 35.00
C |Pulaski Waynesville 133 $272.99 $35.00
C {Washington  |Potosi 1.31 $ 88.00 $ 35.00

9-110701A - Addendum 002
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IFB 9-110/01A,

9-110701A - Addendum 002

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: TSI, Technology Solutions, Inc.
PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

~ Column1
IR S . Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column 3

T .+ County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -
| District| County . CityorTown |  .Multipier . Single-site Site-to-site

KC |Cass Harrisonville .nobid  |$no bid $ no bid

KC [Clay Liberty .nobid |$no bid $ no bid

KC |Jackson Independence .nobid |%no bid $ no bid

KC iJohnson Warrensburg .nobid  |$no bid $ no bid

KC |[Lafayette Lexington .no bid_ |%no bid $ no bid

KC |[Pettis Sedalia .nobid % no bid $ no bid

KC |[Platte Platte City .nobid |$nobid $ no bid

KC |Ray Richmond .nobid |$nobid $ no bid

KC [Saline Marshalt .nohid |$nobid $ no bid
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IFB 9-110/01A,

DATA NETWORKING-
PRICING PA

County Seat

INSIDE:

Column 1

Prevailing Wage

TSI,

Technology  Solutions,

GE BY COUNTY

Column 2

Column 3

L _ - Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization - .
District. _County CityorTown = Muliplier . Single-site _Site-to-site
NE [Adair Kirksville .nobid % no bid $ no bid
NE |Audrain Mexico -nobid 1% no bid $ no bid
NE [Clark Kahoka .nobid_|$no bid $ no bid
NE |Knox Edina .hobid |$nobid $ no bid
NE |Lewis Monticello .nobid_|$nobid $ no bid
NE |[Lin¢oln Troy .nobid |$no bid $ no bid
NE |Macon Macon -ho bid_ % no bid $ no bid
NE |Marion Palmyra .nobid |$nobid $ no bid
NE [Monroe Paris .nobid % no bid $ no bid
NE |Montgomery Montgomery City N0 bid [$nobid $ no bid
NE |Pike Bowling Green O bid. |§ no bid $ no bid
NE |[Ralls New London .nabid_  |$nobid $ no bid
NE |Randolph Huntsville ~nobid  |$nobid $no bid
NE |Schuyler Lancaster .nebid  |$nobid $no bid
NE |Scotland Memphis .nobid_  |$no bid $ no bid
NE |Shelby Shelbyville .nobid |$no bid $ no bid
NE |Warren Warrenton .nobid |$nobid $ no bid

9-110701A - Addendum 002

Inc.
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IFB 9-110/01A,

9-110701A - Addendum 002

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE: TSI, Technology Solutions, Inc.
PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY
I g “Column i -
‘ | Prevailing Wage -Column 2 Column 3

. . County '_Seaf | . HourlyRate . Mobilization - Mobilization - .
District _ County .-, City or Town _ | plier . . Singlessite _ Siteto-site
NW |Andrew Savannah .nobid |$nobid $no bid
NwW |Atchison Rock Port . no bid $ no bid $ no bid
NW [Buchanan St. Joseph .hobid [$no bid $ no bid
NW |Caldwell Kingston .nohid_  |$nobid $ no bid
NW [Carroll Carroliton .nobid {$nobid $ no bid
NW [Chariton Keytesville .nobid_ |$ no bid $ no bid
Nw |[Clinton Plattsturg .nobid  [$no bid $ no bid
NW |Daviess Gallatin .noebid |$nobid $ no bid
NW [DeKalb Maysville .nobid [$no bid $ no bid
NW |Gentry Albany .nobid I$no bid $ no bid
NW |Grundy Trenton .nobid [$nobid $no bid
Nw |Harrison Bethany .nobid 5 nobid $ no bid
NW |Holt Oregon .nobid {$no bid $ no bid
NwW |Linn Linngus .nobid |$nobid $ no bid
Nw |Livingston Chillicothe .nohid |$nobid $ no bid
NW Mercer Princaton .nobid |$no bid $ no bid
NwW |[Nodaway Maryville -no bid_ |$no bid $ no bid
Nw [Putnam Unionville .nobid_ |$no bid $ no bid
Nw [Sullivan Milan .nobid |$no bid $ no bid
NW [Worth Grant City .nobid % no bid $ no hid
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IFB 9-110701A,

9-110701A - Addendum 002

DATA NETWORKING-

INSIDE:
PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

TSI,

Column 1

Technology

Solutions,

. Prevailing Wage Column 2 Column 3
: . - County Seat Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -
District|  County | Cityor Town | Multiplier Single-site Site-to-site
SE |Bollinger Marble Hill .nobid  {$no bid $ no bid
SE iButler Poplar Bluff .nobid_ |$no bid $ no bid
SE Jackson .nobid |$nobid $ no bid
SE |Carter Van Buren .nobid |$no bid $ no bid
SE |Douglas Ava .nobid |$nobid $ no bid
SE |Dunklin Kennett .nobid [$nobid $no bid
SE  [Howell West Plains .nobid |$no bid $ no bid
SE |lron Ironton .nobid |$no bid $ no bid
SE |Madison Fredericktown .nobid_|$no bid $ no bid
SE  |Mississippi Charleston -hobid  |%no bid $ no bid
SE  |New Madrid New Madrid .nobid_ |$nobid $ no bid
SE |Oregon Alton .nobid  |$nobid $ no bid
SE |Ozark Gainesville .nobid  |$nobid $ no bid
SE |Pemiscot Caruthersville .nobid [$nobid $no bid
SE |Perry Perryville .nobid |$no bid $ no bid
SE |Reynolds Centerville .nobid [$no bid $ no bid
SE |Ripley Doniphan .nobid  {$nobid $ no bid
SE [Scott Benton .nohid_ |$no bid $ no hid
SE {Shannon Eminence .nobid |$no bid $ no bid
SE |8t Francois Farmington -nobid  |$no bid $ no bid
SE |Ste. Genevieve |Ste. Genevieve .nohid |$nobid $ no bid
SE {Stoddard Bloomfield .nobid |5nobid $ no bid
SE |Texas Houston -nobid_  [$ no bid $ no bid
SE |Wayne Greenville .nobid |$no bid $ no bid
SE |Wright Hartville .nobkid |$no bid $ no bid
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IFB 9-1107/01A,

9-110701A - Addendum 002

DATA NETWORKING- INSIDE:
PRICING PA

County Seat -

TSI, Technology Solutions,

GE BY COUNTY

Column 1

Prevailing Wage

Colurﬁﬁ 2

Column 3

Inc.

N SR . Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization - -
District "~ .County . ., CityorTown | : Multiplier ' Single-site = Siteto-site
STL |Franklin Washington 1.3 $66.00 $35.00
STL |Jefferson Hillsboro 1.35 $55.00 $35.00
STL (St Charles St. Charles 1.40 $ 0.00 $35.00
STL |St. Louis Clayion 1.47 $21.50 $35.00
STL |St Louis City  {St. Louis 147 $33.00 $35.00
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PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY
| L ::._PreS:ilz?:ma'g.e .+ Column 2 | Column 3

| CountySeat |" Hourly Rate Mobilization - Mobilization -

Distict|County | CtyorTown | _ Mulipler - Singlesite | _Sitetosit
SW |Barry Cassville .nohid_ |$no bid $no bid
$W |Barton LLamar .nobid_  |$ no bid $ no bid
Sw |Bates Butler .nobid |$no bid $no bid
Sw |Benton Warsaw .nobid |%no bid $ no bid
sw |[Cedar Stockton .nobid |$no bid $ no bid
Sw |Christian Ozark .hobid  |$nobid $ no bid
Sw |Dade Greenfield .nobid |%no bid $ no bid
sw |Dallas Buffalo .nobid % no bid $ no bid
SwW [Greene Springfield .nobid |$nobid $ no bid
SW [Henry Clinton .nobid  |$no bid $ no bid
sw [Hickory Hermitage .nobid  |$no bid $ no bid
sw [Jasper Carthage .nobid  [$nobid $ no bid
sw |Lawrence Mount Vernen . ho bid $ no bid $no bid
SwW [McDonald Pineville .nobid $nobid $ no bid
Sw  |Newton Neosho S n:l‘aid $ no bid $ no bid
sSw |Polk Bolivar .nohid  i$no bid $ no bid
sw [St Clair Osceola .nobid |$nohid $ no bid
SW |Stone Galena -nobid |$no bid $ no bid
SW |Taney Forsyth .nobid_ |5 no bid $ no bid
Sw |Vernon Nevada .nobid |$no bid $ no bid
SW |Webster Marshfield .nobid  |%no bid $ no bid

9-110701A - Addendum 002

Inc.


hanksc4
Typewritten Text
IFB 9-110701A, DATA NETWORKING – INSIDE: TSI, Technology Solutions, Inc.


	Bid Inside - CCC
	Bid Inside - Fisher
	Bid Inside - P and D
	Bid Inside - Reinhold
	Bid Inside - Telewiring
	Bid Inside - TSI



